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CHAIR: I welcome everyone here today, and especially those who have agreed to 
come and give evidence in relation to three reports of the Commission: the annual report; the 
child death review team report, which involves suicide and risk taking deaths of children and 
young people, a report of January 2003; and also the report on fatal assaults. Is there 
anything anyone wishes to raise? 

 
The Hon. MELINDA PAVEY: Is there a general time allocation? 
 
CHAIR: It depends on the length of the answers and how many more questions we 

might have as a result of that. Dr Michael Dudley will not be here today. 
 

GILLIAN ELIZABETH CALVERT, Commissioner, Commission for Children and Young People, 
Level 2, 402 Elizabeth Street, Surry Hills, affirmed and examined: 
 
 

CHAIR: As I indicated earlier, firstly we will deal with the annual report and then take 
evidence in relation to the child death review team reports. Do you wish to make an opening 
address on the Commission's annual report? 

 
Ms CALVERT: I would. I think the past 12 months has been an important five-year 

milestone for the Commission as an independent organisation acting as a voice for children in 
New South Wales. Through the legislative review children have reported that the fact that the 
Commission exists makes them feel valued and listened to by the community and the 
Government. So the mere existence of the Commission has a very positive impact on children 
and young people. I welcome the opportunity to highlight some of the ways that we have been 
working to make New South Wales a better place for them through appearing before this 
committee. 

 
In relation to building participation by children and young people in the life of New 

South Wales we have provided opportunities and support for them to get involved and have 
their voices heard and also to influence key decision-makers within the community and 
government. For example, you would all remember the summit on alcohol abuse. From that, 
47 of the 67 recommendations made by young people were adopted by the summit. I think 
they had a very positive media profile throughout the summit. We have also been able to 
produce an "Ask the children" resource on alcohol, which has been distributed to decision-
makers. 

 
We have also expanded our TAKING PARTicipation seriously kit by launching a 

module called "Meeting Together-Deciding Together". We launched that at the Australasian 
Conference on Child Abuse and Neglect that was held in September 2003. That has been 
very positively received. We have been working to promote and improve children's safety and 
welfare by promoting our child-safe, child-friendly environment. We have conducted, for 
example, 215,000 working with children checks to help reduce the risk of unsuitable people 
working with kids. We have also improved the system through reducing multiple checks. In 
the past we had to check each individual name, whereas now someone can have two or three 
names but we only have to do one check. We have also released new working with children 
check guidelines, which have been well received. 

 
We also continued with our pilot program looking at volunteers and students on 

placement, which is helping to guide our future direction. As part of that, we placed on the 
web site a series of resources that organisations could use to help them build their protective 
structures, and that has been well received as well, including piloting some training 
workshops to back up the resources. Focusing on child-safe, child-friendly organisations is 
representing a bit of a new direction for the Commission in this area. We also released the 
Child Death Review Team Report on Fatal Assault and Neglect of Children and Young People, 
which we will be talking about later. That was important for us because it contained some 
new information about fatal neglect. 
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I also chaired a very successful Australasian Conference on Child Abuse and Neglect 
that attracted over one thousand delegates, including young people, and I also co-chaired the 
Country Road Safety Summit in May 2004, which I think was in recognition of the important 
role of the Child Death Review Team in relation to motor vehicle fatalities. 

 
We also strengthened children's wellbeing. Children and young people continually tell 

me that their wellbeing is linked to having strong and supportive relationships with their 
families in particular, with their friends and with their community, and some of the ways that 
we worked to strengthen their well-being included developing Head Start for Australia: a 
national framework for the early years, in partnership with the Queensland Commission for 
Children and Young People and the National Investment for the Early Years. I think that has 
been well received and had some small part to play in some of the policies that emerged in 
the lead up to the Federal election. 

 
We also released Kids’ Stats, which is our on-line resource to measure wellbeing, and 

we have had some thousands of pages accessed between 1 July to September. That averaged 
out to be about just over 4,000 pages per month accessed as part of Kids’ Stats, which we 
were all very pleased about. We have also held a number of seminars to assist professionals 
and parents in the field to improve children's wellbeing. For example, we did one on bullying; 
we also did one on injury from neglect. 

 
We strive to be an accountable and effective organisation, and I think we have 

established quite a good track record for fulfilling our statutory obligations. We have 
conducted a series of audits and reviews that help us to improve our current practice. We 
have reviewed our professional development policy because I think our staff are what make 
the Commission work so well, and we are well set up to achieve information security 
compliance in the next 12 months' reporting period. 

 
I think the other significant thing about 2003-04 from the Commission's point of 

view is that we are at the end of our three year strategic plan 2001-2004. So during the next 
12 months we will be implementing our new strategic plan 2004-2007, which focuses on 
improving children and young people's participation, researching and raising awareness about 
important issues affecting their lives and promoting their safety and wellbeing, wherever they 
spend their time. 

 
In concluding, I would like to acknowledge the important role of the five-year 

legislative review that the Minister has undertaken in helping us to further define the role, 
objectives and direction of the Commission. I think appearing before the Committee today 
also gives us an opportunity to explore ways we can continue to work together to make New 
South Wales a better place for children and young people. 

 
CHAIR: In your annual report it is identified that the Commission is using the 

information in "Ask the children", which is the series that has been published, and, in 
particular, children and young people speak about the issues important to them to guide 
policy planning and decision making. Can you expand on how you plan to approach 
departments and agencies on the key issues of, firstly, safety and security at school and in 
communities and then, secondly, on activities of places to hang out and, thirdly, on pressures 
from families and teachers? 

 
Ms CALVERT: I guess publishing "Ask the children" is part of the process of how we 

raise the issues to assist people approach departments and agencies. By just publishing "Ask 
the children" and then forwarding it to those agencies we bring the issues to that agency's 
attention, or it is one of the ways we bring the issues to the agency's attention.  We may or 
may not pursue topics, or it may depend on whether opportunities arise that enable us to pick 
up on a particular issue that we have published in "Ask the children". 

 
Responding to issues as they arise is particularly effective, because we are talking to 

people who are already listening. We try to find opportunities to raise issues. We are some 
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presenting in the areas you mentioned. In respect to safety and security at schools, we are 
partnering with the Department of Education and Training on consultations about the future 
of education in New South Wales. I am sure that members of the Committee would be aware 
that the Department has released a discussion paper about the future of education. Also, we 
will make a submission to the Department in which we will discuss safety and security issues 
in relation to teachers, for example. Also, there are some opportunities in relation to 
communities and activities and places to hang out. 

 
We are preparing a submission to the Department of Infrastructure, Planning and 

Natural Resources on its discussion paper on the future of greater metropolitan Sydney. We 
will suggest ways to address the concerns of children and young people about feeling unsafe 
in their communities and about the lack of activities and places to hang out. We will also 
canvas some of those issues in our submission to the Roads and Traffic Authority on its 
discussion paper about improving safety for young drivers. We have highlighted our concerns 
about families in our report to the Commonwealth Department of Family and Community 
Services on the national action plan for a world fit for children. Those opportunities 
continually present themselves and we tend to take them up because we think people are 
listening if they have invited submissions or discussion papers on a particular issue. 

 
Ms VIRGINIA JUDGE: On the point you raised, very appropriately, about consulting 

with different community bodies, did you send those to the Local Government and Shires 
Associations and councils? A lot of councils provide facilities for youth. Or are you thinking 
about doing that down the track? 

 
Ms CALVERT: We send relevant ones to local councils. We quite actively pursue 

relationships with youth development officers and youth councils as a way of getting 
information out through the council system. We have certainly promoted things such as 
"Taking participation seriously" through the council system. About two weeks ago I presented 
to the Local Government and Shires Associations and the Managers of Councils Association 
on the work of the Commission, particularly on risk management. I have ongoing relationships 
with councils. 

 
Mr JOHN BARTLETT: What staff do you have, what are the numbers? 
 
Ms CALVERT: We have a number of equivalent full-time positions, but that does not 

translate to people because we have part-time positions and job-sharing arrangements. I will 
take that question on notice and provide you with the exact numbers of staff that I have. But 
it is around— 

 
The Hon. MELINDA PAVEY: You had 35½ full-time equivalent staff in 2003. 
 
Ms CALVERT: Yes, we have 35 equivalent full-time staff, thank you Melinda. 

However, I am happy to get back to the Committee with the exact number of people at a 
particular time. 

 
Mr JOHN BARTLETT: That is close enough, thank you. 
 
Mr STEVE CANSDELL: You have mentioned safety and security at school and in 

communities. Have you done any research into bullying in schools and how that reflected on 
youth suicide and associated trauma? 

 
Ms CALVERT: There has been a lot of research into bullying and we look at bullying 

in the Child Death Review Team’s Report on Suicide and Risk-Taking Deaths of Children and 
Young People (2002). We found some children who cited bullying as a cause of suicide. 
Perhaps we could address that later. We held a professional development seminar on bullying, 
at which Ken Rigby, an internationally renowned expert located in South Australia, presented 
along with a local NSW public school which had done some interesting work on bullying. 

 



     

COMMITTEE ON CHILDREN & YOUNG PEOPLE 4 TUESDAY 23 NOVEMBER 2004 

The Hon. MELINDA PAVEY: Could you comment on any legislative or administrative 
reforms that the Commission might be considering in view of the recommendations made by 
Justice Palmer in Carter v NSW Netball Association? 

 
Ms CALVERT: I am certainly aware of the judgment in Carter, and I have read the 

relevant sections of the judgment. We referred the judgment to the Legislation Review for its 
consideration and inclusion in its process. Since the Minister has not tabled the report I am 
unable to comment on its content. 

 
The Hon. MELINDA PAVEY: You sought advice from the Legislation Review 

Committee? 
 
Ms CALVERT: No, we referred it for legislative review. 
 
The Hon. MELINDA PAVEY: With some recommendations? 
 
Ms CALVERT: No, we did not make any recommendations. Because the review was 

under way it made sense for it to be considered in the context of all of it. 
 
CHAIR: The five-year review? 
 
Ms CALVERT: Yes, the five-year review of our legislation. 
 
The Hon. MELINDA PAVEY: You would be aware of the report in today's newspapers 

of a case involving a fellow on parole from Queensland working with the New South Wales 
Scottish Highland Dancing Association? Do you have any comments on that case? 

 
Ms CALVERT: Yes. 
 
CHAIR: Strictly, that question does not emanate from the annual report as such. 
 
The Hon. MELINDA PAVEY: I am asking in relation to your ability to get into the 

community groups throughout New South Wales to make them aware of their requirements for 
having people of suitable character dealing with children? 

 
Ms CALVERT: One of the positive directions the Commission is taking is that we are 

now moving much more in the direction of promoting the notion of child-safe, child-friendly 
organisations, and that arose out of our volunteers and students pilots. That new direction of 
looking at the whole issue around child-safety, child-friendly organisations is an important 
new direction. However, referring to the conviction of that person, New South Wales is the 
only State in which that the conviction could have happened. No other State has a Child 
Protection (Prohibited Employment) Act 1998 that makes it very clear that people who have a 
conviction against children are unable to work with children. It is important to note that he 
was caught, he was convicted, and he has been sentenced to three months gaol. New South 
Wales is the only State in Australia where that could have happened. 

 
Mr BARRY COLLIER: How do you get the information for "places to hang out", and 

what are the features of a good place to hang out? Some of that may be obvious, but could 
you explain? 

 
Ms CALVERT: It probably depends on whether you are a boy or a girl, what your age 

is, and whether you are in the city or the country. One of the things that children and young 
people have told us in recent consultations is that they really value Australia's natural beauty 
and the natural things that Australia provides, such as beaches and opportunities in the 
country, and also the opportunity to play with friends in the natural environment and so on. 
We know this because we have asked children what they like to do and they say they need 
more places to hang out. Teenage girls will probably say they want coffee shops where they 
can sit and talk and spend a lot of time without being hassled. Other kids will say they want 
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sporting opportunities and places to play sport and organise sport. Other kids may say they 
want a youth centre of some sort. It is as broad as there are ages and variety in the children 
and young people of New South Wales. We have continued to raise this issue because 
children themselves continue to raise the issue with us. We will raise it in local government 
forums, because they provide a lot of facilities. I will raise it when I am addressing parents 
groups and when addressing sport and recreation groups, and things like that. 

 
The Hon. JAN BURNSWOODS: I will go to the prepared questions concerning 

chapter three of the report. I notice that the Department of Community Services [DOCS] 
asked you to take over its screening function. Why did it do that? Were there screening 
problems? What sort of effect has that had on your workload? 

 
Ms CALVERT: As I understand it DOCS asked the Commission to take on its 

approved screening agency role for two reasons. First, DOCS was restructuring its human 
resources services following the transfer of some corporate functions to Bizlink; so it was 
reshaping its human resources functions and moving to a shared service called Bizlink. That 
left their Working With Children Check function a bit on its own. DOCS also wanted to focus 
on its core business so it asked us to take on the Working With Children Check function so it 
would be free to concentrate on its core business. 

 
There have been minimal impacts on the Commission as existing trained staff and 

funding were transferred to the Commission. The main impact on us was that we had to find 
some new accommodation, we have had to reshape our management structure a little and I 
have new staff. 

 
The Hon. JAN BURNSWOODS: Some of the arguments about core business and the 

department's moving out human resources functions, could they affect the screening 
agencies? Are any agencies thinking of doing a similar thing and handing it all over to you? 
DOCS was quite a substantial percentage, was it not? 

 
Ms CALVERT: It was. 
 
The Hon. JAN BURNSWOODS: What about Health, Sport and Recreation? 
 
Ms CALVERT: I am unaware of other agencies wanting to hand over their approved 

screening agency [ASA] function to the Commission. However, there would be no reason why 
they could not hand over if they wanted to. When the Working With Children Check function 
was set up we made the decision that it was probably best to spread across a number of 
agencies, because the key part of conducting a Working With Children Check is 
understanding the business that you are checking. 

 
For example, in making decisions about who to employ, who not to employ, the 

Department of Education’s understanding of what it was to be a teacher in a school, was 
important to the processes of risk assessment. But there is no reason why it could not all be 
aggregated into one or two approved screening agencies [ASAs]. I am aware that Health is 
reviewing its current structure. They are in a process of restructuring and they are looking at 
their ASA function. I have not been formally approached to take it over. 

 
The Hon. JAN BURNSWOODS: Is there any possibility of it moving in the other 

direction—for example, a department saying that it would like to do its own screening? I 
suppose the existing agencies cover most of the ones that have the necessary interaction with 
children? 

 
Ms CALVERT: If an agency wanted to become an approved screening agency we 

would consider the merits of the claim and put up a recommendation to the Minister because 
she is required to approve or authorise the screening agencies that are put in place. 
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The Hon. TONY CATANZARITI: What differences have you found this year between 
country areas versus cities? Have you found they have much the same problems and 
expectations? 

 
Ms CALVERT: I think there are differences in some of the issues. For example, 

transport is raised as an issue for a number of children. But I often hear comments from 
country kids who say, "You might be complaining there are not enough buses but at least you 
have got buses". There is not a public transport infrastructure in the country, so they are 
completely reliant on parents. There are those sorts of differences. In relation to things they 
like to do, probably country kids have more opportunity to get involved in the natural 
environment and to do things outdoors. That does not mean kids in the city do not like the 
idea of doing things outdoors and having contact with the natural environment. It is probably 
about emphasis and degree rather than really big stark differences. 

 
The Hon. TONY CATANZARITI: Has there been much talk from kids about the 

drought? 
 
Ms CALVERT: Yes, kids do raise the drought as an issue. That is certainly the case. 

But I think city kids are pretty conscious of the drought as well. They certainly will talk to me 
about the importance of water conservation and they show an awareness about the need to 
conserve water. They also talk about some anxiety about the future: What sort of world are 
they going to inherit from us adults? What shape will the world be in that they are going to 
inherit from us? One of those issues is how much water will there be and the impact of the 
drought on their quality of life. That would be for city kids as well as for country kids. 

 
Mr JOHN BARTLETT: At page 23 of your report I note that in 2000-01 112 out of 

223,000 people required assessment and this year 652 out of 215,000. Are you being more 
thorough, are you picking out more people, and should you go back and have a look at the 
statistics in 2000-01? 

 
Ms CALVERT: No, we are not being any less thorough than we were. We do not know 

why there has been an increase in the rate of risk assessments. 
 
Mr JOHN BARTLETT: You have 50,000 fewer checks. 
 
Ms CALVERT: We know why there are fewer checks. That is because we have made a 

change from name-based checking to person-based checking. In the past if someone was 
going to be checked, they would be checked against all the names they had. For example, a 
married woman who had changed her name would be checked against her married name and 
her non-married name. That would be counted as two checks. We have now changed the 
system so that that person is only counted as one check. 

 
Mr JOHN BARTLETT: You have gone from .05 in 2000-01 to .3 this year. When I 

look at those statistics I wonder why you get such a large variation. You may have to go back 
and check in the years when you think you have been having some effect. 

 
Ms CALVERT: We do not know why there has been an increase. It may just be a 

statistical blip. If it continues to rise over time we will probably have to try to find out why 
there are more people requiring risk assessments than in the past. We could speculate on the 
reasons why. I can hypothesise that it might be that initially people with relevant records 
stood back and said, "We are not even going to risk the system." Now they are seeing how the 
system operates, they are applying for jobs and we are picking them up. It might be that we 
have more records now than we did three or four years ago, and that is why more people are 
coming up requiring risk assessment. I can hypothesise about the reasons but I do not know 
the reasons why. If it continues to increase we will probably have to try and understand that a 
little bit better. At the moment, in statistical terms, it is not significant. 
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The Hon. JAN BURNSWOODS: You will not be surprised that I want to ask you 
about school toilets. After we listened to John Yu talking about his passion for improving the 
dreadful state of school toilets, I have lost track of the issue. What has happened? 

 
Ms CALVERT: I have continued to pursue the issue of school toilets. I have had 

discussions with the Director-General of the Department of Education and Training [DET]. In 
July this year I was advised that DET was addressing this issue through its school 
improvement package. In fact, in 2004-05 $364 million was provided through the 
improvement package for spending on capital projects, including the upgrading of existing 
facilities, which would include toilets. Schools will also now be in a position to access the $1 
billion that has been promised by the Federal Government to restore and build school 
buildings, including amenities. We have taken the view that given DET has recognised the 
issue and is putting in place funding arrangements to address the school toilet problem and 
there is the Commonwealth funding we would wait and see what happened, what impact that 
had on improvements to school toilets. 

 
The Hon. JAN BURNSWOODS: Is anyone looking at the non-capital works aspects? 
 
Ms CALVERT: The non-capital aspects of school toilets? 
 
The Hon. JAN BURNSWOODS: Yes. 
 
Ms CALVERT: I am not aware of that. You would have to ask DET that question. I 

could take that on notice, if you like. 
 
The Hon. JAN BURNSWOODS: What about the universities, such as the University 

of Western Sydney and the University of New South Wales, that have been involved in this 
work? 

 
Ms CALVERT: No, not that I am aware of. We did a literature review of research into 

school toilets that included capital aspects as well as non-capital aspects. We did not find a 
lot of material or information. 

 
The Hon. JAN BURNSWOODS: The use of toilets in bullying is seen as one of the 

most dreadful forms of bullying and there are issues about the increasingly young age at 
which girls menstruate and the impact of the lack of adequate facilities in primary schools. In 
the past primary schools did not generally need such facilities. It causes a huge 
embarrassment and difficulties for girls. 

 
Ms CALVERT: I have followed up the issue of bullying in school toilets with Ken 

Rigby. I asked him about his experience of bullying in school toilets. He said it was not 
identified as one of the major places of bullying in his research, which, in an odd way, I was 
somewhat reassured by. He certainly does not identify it as one of the primary sites for 
bullying in schools. 

 
The Hon. JAN BURNSWOODS: Madam Chair, I suggest we contact the department 

about that issue. 
 
CHAIR: That is a good suggestion. 
 
The Hon. JAN BURNSWOODS: It is one of those issues that when you raise it 

people tend to look at you with amazement, but it is a major issue. 
 
CHAIR: Ken Rigby is not there any more, is he? 
 
Ms CALVERT: No, he is in South Australia. 
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The Hon. MELINDA PAVEY: In your annual report you state that one of your most 
important functions is to hold inquiries or investigations into important questions relating to 
issues about children and young people. What inquiries and investigations have you 
conducted in the past 12 months or do you plan to conduct in the next 12 months into 
important issues affecting young people? I refer to issues identified in your report that need to 
be addressed including the lack of facilities for children with mental health problems, the 
over-representation of Aboriginal young people in the criminal justice system and the impact 
of State government funding on preschools in rural areas. 

 
Ms CALVERT: We have conducted one inquiry into children who have no-one to turn 

to. You will remember that we have already had a hearing regarding that. An inquiry is one 
tool that is available to me in carrying out the Commission's functions, and frankly it is an 
expensive tool. So when planning and thinking about the priorities for our work, I try to look at 
what is both effective and efficient in achieving outcomes for kids. If a special inquiry seems 
to be the best way to proceed, that is what I will do. At this stage I have not planned any 
special inquiries. 

 
The Hon. MELINDA PAVEY: Or research programs? 
 
Ms CALVERT: Yes, because I have been able to proceed using other less resource 

intensive methods. For example, we are conducting an extensive quantitative research project 
in relation to work and work-related activities with children. That will come out at the 
beginning of 2005. We are also undertaking further work in relation to the economy so that 
we can improve our understanding of the economy and its impact on children and the 
economic dimensions of social policy. I tend to use methods other than an inquiry. In terms 
of what is planned I am happy to send you our strategic plan, which will set that out. 

 
Ms VIRGINIA JUDGE: You would be fully aware of the recent success of the police 

operation focussing on the exploitation of our youth by way of pornography. As a result, 
legislation was introduced last week in Parliament to do with increased penalties and other 
regulations on the whole issue of pornography and penalties. What impact do you think that 
will have on the Commission in future? 

 
CHAIR: Are you able to answer that question or do you want to take it on notice? 
 
Ms CALVERT: I am happy to take it on notice. I would hope the impact would be that 

we are more effective in identifying people who are using child pornography, who, therefore, 
are going to be convicted and would be prohibited people. 

 
The Hon. KAYEE GRIFFIN: I refer to the approved screening agencies and the 

procedures and time taken to complete risk assessments. At page 24 of the report there are 
comments about deficiencies and how the Commission proposes to assist agencies to 
recommend them. In answer to an earlier question you spoke about other agencies. Would you 
tell us about the deficiencies and the implications of delays and lack of documentation? 

 
Ms CALVERT: The deficiencies were largely the result of the approved screening 

agencies not following procedures when entering data. The audit alerted those agencies to 
their errors in data entry. Subsequently their practices have changed. We are updating our 
service level agreements with those approved screening agencies to clarify our expectations 
for timeliness and consistency in data management. They were not delays that impacted on 
people; they were delays as a result of not completing data entry or not following data entry 
procedures. As I said, the audit has alerted them to that fact and we have now rectified it. At 
times there are delays in completing risk assessments because external agencies are unable 
to provide us with the information in a timely manner. 

 
So if we require access to records in order to finalise a risk assessment there can be 

some delays in getting those records because they have to be retrieved from archives, and 
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things like that. We are unable to impact on those delays and, as much as possible, agencies 
are willing to provide us with that but it still can take some time. 
 

The Hon. KAYEE GRIFFIN: Have those delays had any major impact on any 
particular issues? 

 
Ms CALVERT: No. Most Working With Children Checks are cleared very quickly 

because there is no record. It is only when there is a relevant record that it can take longer 
because we have to access the records in order to conduct the risk assessment, or even to see 
if it is a relevant record or not.  

 
The Hon. KAYEE GRIFFIN: In reply to questions that you took on notice for the 

2002-03 report, you indicated that automatic generation of correspondence to employers by 
fax and email would reduce turnaround times and improvements were expected to take effect 
by February 2004. Has that been the case? 

 
Ms CALVERT: Yes, automatic letter generation has commenced. Unfortunately, it 

commenced after the audit was conducted but it has now commenced. It is important to note 
that only letters where there are no records are automatically generated. So where there is a 
relevant record we do not automatically generate those letters. In fact, 99 per cent of the 
letters of clearance applies to most of the checks. So most of them are automatically 
generated but we cannot automatically generate risk assessment letters. 

 
The Hon. KAYEE GRIFFIN: In terms of the level of training and development needed 

for risk assessors and the current standards of risk assessments that have been conducted, is 
the Commission's opinion that the standards are what are needed? 

 
Ms CALVERT: We are currently undertaking an evaluation of the risk assessment 

model, and that should be completed towards the end of 2005. In the meantime we did a 
survey of risk assessors to identify their development and training needs and, in response, we 
held two training workshops for them. They covered things like effective telephone 
interviewing, update on child sex court trials and the role of the Director of Public 
Prosecution. So we have certainly started to provide them with some training and support on 
an ongoing basis. As I said, the evaluation of the risk assessment model will be completed 
towards the end of 2005 and that will further inform us as to the needs of the risk assessors 
and the effectiveness of the risk assessment model. 

 
Mrs JUDY HOPWOOD: What were the outcomes of the evaluation of the Working 

with Children: Volunteers and Students pilot program? What recommendations does the 
Commission envisage it will make to the Government for the future direction of the check for 
volunteers? 

 
Ms CALVERT: The evaluation showed that those organisations that participated in 

the pilot accepted and welcomed the Child-Safe Child-Friendly resources and the background 
checking for volunteers. However, it is important to note that 40 per cent of the organisations 
that we approached did not take up our invitation to participate. The reasons for that were 
some already had pre-employment checking in place and they wanted to continue with that 
and for others they did not have the necessary infrastructure to support background checking, 
and they just felt it would overwhelm their organisation. We are now considering that 
evaluation report and what our recommendations will be. 

 
Mrs JUDY HOPWOOD: When do you envisage that consideration will be concluded? 
 
Ms CALVERT: We have fed the information into the review of our legislation because 

if something is to occur it makes sense to bring those two things together. The independent 
reviewer has forwarded her report to the Minister so it would be up to the Minister when she 
releases that. 
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Mr BARRY COLLIER: I note on page 17 of your annual report you talk about 
planning to hold future advocacy training workshops, and given the opportunity to learn and 
practise advocacy skills. What does that involve? What advocacy skills are you talking about 
and in what forums? 

 
Ms CALVERT: We have an advocacy package called "Speak up, Speak out!" that we 

run with groups of kids and we have now licensed some other organisations to also run. It 
covers things like the role of government, the structure of government, how to participate in 
meetings effectively, how to deal with the media—a range of skills that I think you as 
parliamentarians take for granted— 

 
Mr BARRY COLLIER: Maybe we don't have them. We should attend. 
 
Ms CALVERT: We run workshops for those sorts of skills. I would be happy to provide 

a list of the contents of that workshop for you so you can get a better idea, but we do it in a 
kid-friendly way. 

 
Mr BARRY COLLIER: How will the CREATE Foundation and the Local Government 

and Shires Association use those advocacy training packages? 
 
Ms CALVERT: Certainly, the CREATE Foundation use it to train young people in care 

to advocate for themselves and for other young people in care, so they will run the workshop 
with the kids. The Local Government and Shires Association support local councils to do the 
course for kids who might be on their youth councils. A lot of local councils, as you know, 
have youth councils so they will run the workshop for the incoming youth council to prepare 
and help the kids feel more confident in their role as a member of that youth council when 
they have to attend a local council meeting or meet with the mayor or whatever it is. 

 
Mr BARRY COLLIER: Is it also about encouraging kids who do not attend the course 

to speak out? Is that part of their advocacy training? 
 
Ms CALVERT: That would be an offshoot of it but it would not be one of the primary 

things. I guess there is an assumption in the advocacy course that you are working with a 
group. Although we do also talk about individual advocacy as well, so it covers both. I think 
the skills are probably useful in both. We certainly look at things like negotiation and listening 
skills and communication skills as well in the course. 

 
The Hon. MELINDA PAVEY: It would appear from the annual report that the major 

focus of your research is asking children and young people their views, and communicating 
those views to government. We all know that the opinions put in these annual reports—
particularly on pages 18 and 19—may be looked at by government but in terms of a major 
consideration by government by way of well researched documentation to backup issues, such 
as the rural transport issue, the violence and solutions to vandalism, what cohesive research 
papers have you presented to government to help change policy direction in those areas? 

 
CHAIR: Would you like to put that on notice? 
 
Ms CALVERT: I might give a combination of answering it and taking it on notice. The 

comprehensive research reports would be reports by the Child Death Review Team that are, in 
a sense, formal research reports. The Inquiry Into No-One To Turn To would probably also fall 
into that category. The research and report we are currently completing regarding young 
people and work will also fall into that category. They would be the sorts of formal research 
papers, if you like, that we would present to Government. But I would also suggest that say, 
Ask The Children on alcohol was probably a fairly well researched piece of advice to 
Government that Government and the whole Summit took up and responded to. So they would 
be the sorts of reports that I think would fall into that category. 

 



     

COMMITTEE ON CHILDREN & YOUNG PEOPLE 11 TUESDAY 23 NOVEMBER 2004 

The Hon. MELINDA PAVEY: Your report young people and the economy is so far and 
wide and all encompassing, what do you hope to achieve? 

 
Ms CALVERT: When we were reviewing the end of our three-year strategic plan 

2001-2003 we all felt that we were not yet on top of the issues from an economic point of 
view—the issues for children, or the economic dimensions of social policy or natural 
resources policy. 

 
The Hon. MELINDA PAVEY: Are you talking about children who fall in between the 

margins in socio-economic struggling areas? 
 
Ms CALVERT: That might be one of the issues we might look at, say if you have got 

children in poverty, and the impact of poverty. We might look at whether a particular type of 
investment in children is a better investment than another sort of investment. There are also 
issues around children as consumers and the protection for children as consumers. There are 
also issues around children as producers, or children as workers. I think there are a numbers 
of ways in which children impact on the economy and the economy impacts on children. 

 
We did not feel confident that we were addressing the issue as effectively as we 

might so we have put in place a two or three year project that involves trying to develop a 
framework for understanding children and the economy, and the economy and children. We 
have started by holding a couple of small forums where we have brought people with expertise 
in the area together. In fact, I have another one this Friday where we are going to be meeting 
with some economists to talk about some of those issues. We then want to employ someone 
with economics training to start building up our knowledge and bringing that body of 
knowledge into the work of the Commission. 

 
The Hon. MELINDA PAVEY: So are you six months into a two or three year report? 
 
Ms CALVERT: We are probably three months into a two or three year activity. I would 

hope that as a result we will be more confident in addressing some of the economic issues in 
the work that we do. 

 
Mr JOHN BARTLETT: I am concerned that there are five times more people 

requiring risk assessment now than in 2000. Do you have any mechanism or feedback on 
whether your reports or checks were wrong and problems have occurred subsequently with 
people to whom you gave a tick? 

 
Ms CALVERT: Do you want to know whether our original checks missed people? 
 
Mr JOHN BARTLETT: Yes. 
 
Ms CALVERT: There would be nothing to indicate to me that we are missing any 

more or less people now than we did three years ago because we are using the same 
automated system. We are using the same databases that we have always had, so I have no 
reason to believe that we have got a higher error rate now than we had three years ago. 

 
Mr JOHN BARTLETT: What is your error rate? 
 
Ms CALVERT: I do not know what our error rate is. We would have to, in a sense, go 

back and recheck more than a million people if we were to calculate an error rate. We very 
rarely have errors thrown up in our checking. They occur but they are extremely rare. We rely 
on automated systems, as much as possible, so that we take out or try to minimise the 
potential for human error. Having said that, inevitably there always will be some small error 
rate but it is very rare. It is infinitesimal. The reason I know that is that people will get 
rechecked and extremely occasionally we will get a different result from the original result, 
but it is a very rare occurrence. 
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Mrs JUDY HOPWOOD: In 4.2 in relation to develop kids statistics, the first line 
states adding three essays. What does that mean? 

 
Ms CALVERT: At the moment Kids’ Stats is divided into what we call aspects of 

children's lives. So there is: school and child care, crime and safety and families. We have 
used statistical information only under those headings. We think that is fine, but, equally, 
essays or written papers on some of those topics would be useful as well. So we have called 
those essays. We will have a little icon that means you can go to all of the essays that, 
hopefully over time, we will put on the web site in relation to each of those domains of 
children's lives. So, for example, we may write an essay on a particular aspect of school; 
rather than relying only on the statistical information, we will add an essay on some aspect of 
school, and that would then be on the web site. 

 
Mrs JUDY HOPWOOD: Item 6.1 has the heading "Advocate on issues affecting 

children and young people so that their wellbeing is promoted: Engage in public debate and 
policy discussions to promote children and young people's interests". What areas of public 
debate are those likely to be? 

 
Ms CALVERT: Any area of children's lives. If it has "children" in it, I am asked to 

comment on it sometimes. Is that 6.1 of the strategic plan? 
 
Mrs JUDY HOPWOOD: Yes, I am sorry. 
 
CHAIR: Do you want a copy of the strategic plan? 
 
Ms CALVERT: No. It is just that I do not remember the numbers off by heart. That 

reflects our role as an advocate for children and young people. As I said, we engage in public 
debate. For example, regarding minors' consent to treatment, we will engage in that debate 
because we think it is important for children and young people to clarify the law on whether 
or not they can consent to their own medical treatment. So that reflects a heading that says 
part of our strategic plan is to actively engage in that debate. 

 
Mrs JUDY HOPWOOD: I would like to enlarge on an issue that I raised by letter with 

both the chair of the Committee and also the Commissioner, that is, illegal brothels being set 
up in residential areas. Would "engage in public debate" include the issue of illegal brothels 
in streets where children are and where schools are? 

 
Ms CALVERT: If I thought that it would advance the issue from a children and young 

people's point of view, then, yes, I would consider engaging in public debate. 
 
Mr JOHN BARTLETT: Staying with the strategic plan: 4.3 on my list is "Monitor and 

report on the extent to which the inquiry into "No-one to turn to" had been implemented". 
That was a report from this year. 

 
Ms CALVERT: No. It was a couple of years ago that the report was tabled, and I know 

that this year the Committee conducted an inquiry into my inquiry. 
 
CHAIR: I am sorry, what was the question? 
 
Mr JOHN BARTLETT: I was trying to find out which year it was. Can you give me the 

major recommendations? 
 
Ms CALVERT: There were more than 30 recommendations. 
 
Mr JOHN BARTLETT: Who was to implement those recommendations? 
 
Ms CALVERT: It ranged from the Commonwealth Government, to the State 

Government, to local government, to families and to non-government agencies. 



     

COMMITTEE ON CHILDREN & YOUNG PEOPLE 13 TUESDAY 23 NOVEMBER 2004 

 
The Hon. MELINDA PAVEY: I want to get a better understanding of how you are 

going with the volunteer organisations and their checking. First of all, what is the number of 
volunteer organisations that are registered in New South Wales? How far have you got through 
speaking with all their governing bodies about, not so much their requirements but about 
their potential to do proper checks? 

 
Ms CALVERT: There is no register of volunteer bodies in New South Wales, so I am 

unable to tell you how many there are. 
 
The Hon. MELINDA PAVEY: There is a register of associations, though, is there not? 
 
CHAIR: That is different. I think we need to clarify the question, because I think 

associations are different from volunteer bodies, and volunteer bodies are quite expansive. 
 
The Hon. MELINDA PAVEY: But most of them are incorporated in some capacity. 

Has anyone sat down, with pen and paper, and gone through all the incorporated bodies or 
associations and worked out which of those involve children? 

 
Ms CALVERT: I know during the year of volunteering there was some work done, and 

we tried to access what the number of volunteers in New South Wales and child-related 
employment might be. It was impossible to do with any degree of confidence in the result. 
Having said that, we have engaged with some of the peak associations of volunteers, such as 
Volunteering New South Wales and Covers, which is a rural-based group of volunteer peaks. 
They have both been represented on my volunteer and student reference group, which has 
advised me about the volunteer pilot project. I got very clear and strong advice early on from 
that reference group that I should not rely on checking; that in fact we should be focusing on 
trying to help build up the infrastructure within volunteer organisations, so that they had even 
simple things like position descriptions, which a lot of them do not have. One of the major 
drivers in our moving into that area of working with organisations and, in a sense, doing 
organisational development, was to improve existing practices and procedures. As I said, I got 
very strong advice from that reference group not to rely on background checking as our main 
approach to volunteering. 

 
Ms SYLVIA HALE: At 8.3 of the strategic plan is mention of electronic service for 

working with children checks. Is that contrary in any way with what you have just been 
saying? 

 
Ms CALVERT: No. Electronic service for Working With Children Checks means that, 

rather than giving us the names of the people to enter into the database to send off and do 
the check, what would happen is that the employer would automatically enter the data 
themselves. If it is clear, it would come back as clear. If it is not clear, it would then be 
referred to an ASA to sort out whether a risk assessment was required or not. So, in a sense, it 
is a way of using electronic or information technology to reduce the involvement of the middle 
person. That would then speed things up and would improve turnaround times. 

 
CHAIR: That concludes the review of the annual report, and I thank you for your 

evidence, Ms Calvert. 
 

______________ 
 


