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2. Close the loopholes that allow land-clearing under historical development 
consents that then allows for newer DAs to proceed on unsuitable land.  

3. Development Applications older than 5 years should be reviewed and 
assessed with up-to-date biodiversity data, climate modeling and ecosystem 

impacts considered. Inappropriate approvals must redesign or swap land.  

4. The NSW Planning system must rule out development in areas of high 
biodiversity value, especially with Endangered Ecological Communities and 

cultural sites and this should apply retrospectively to historical development 
consents.  

5. All wetlands must be protected, not only with buffers but by factoring in the 
ongoing stresses, pressures and cumulative impacts that adjacent developments 
are likely to have on wetlands. Coastal wetland protection must be written into 

planning laws.  

6. Strengthen the planning legislation to protect hollow-bearing habitat trees 

and koala food trees in all developments.  

7. Have a strategic approach to wildlife corridors that consider high biodiversity 
land and wildlife movement for increased protection of important connective 

corridors with a whole of town/region assessment. And linking up with a whole-
of-NSW coastal plan for climate refugia and protection of connective corridors to 

allow movement of wildlife as conditions change.  

8. Strengthen protections of parcels of land reserved as corridors as part of 

development conditions to prevent them becoming future staged lots.  

Rise Development  

The Rise Project’s development is located on Phillip Drive. It was purchased 

several years ago with a 1993 development approval for 180 villas. Kempsey 
Shire Council argued that development consent had lapsed on that DA as 

substantial works had not commenced. This development went to the LEC and 
on appeal in March 2023 the developer was awarded consent and the site was 
cleared under the 1993 DA consent. The appeal was won on the grounds that 

sulphate soil testing (to test for impacts from the nearby decommissioned oil 
terminals) was undertaken by a third party before the original development 

consent lapsed in 1998, which constituted commencement of ‘substantial works’. 
This site is home to six listed threatened species and runs adjacent to Saltwater 
Creek, an important state-significant waterway that runs from Saltwater Lagoon 

through to the ocean (when open). There have been several koala sightings in 
close proximity to the Rise development site, including the NPWS land that runs 

behind it, Brighton Park, Horseshoe Bay, German Bridge, Gregory St and around 
the South West Rocks Primary school.  

The Rise site is an important wildlife corridor. Rise stated they will plant more 

koala food trees, resulting in a net gain but koalas will not be able to use those 
trees for 20-30 years by which point the NSW government anticipates they will 

likely be extinct in NSW. Considering the proximity to the beach and ocean, this 
site is at risk of the impacts of sea level rise, storm surge and flooding. 
Predictive mapping of the area in 2100 shows that it is at significant risk of 

inundation from sea level rise and flooding.  

This 1993 DA has since been superseded by a new DA for stage 1, approved in 

August 2023. This new DA is compliant with the most current planning 



legislation, however the land was clear-felled in May 2023 under the 1993 DA, 
which allowed for the approval of the August 2023 DA as many of the hollow-

bearing and Koala food trees were cleared. It is also worth noting that the 
developer held onto and continued to do work under the 1993 development 

consent for a number of months after August 2023 DA was approved, only 
handing the old DA in when they had done all the land clearing under the 
previous development consent. The second stage of this development is 

currently being assessed. If the stage 2 development goes ahead it will 
fundamentally alter the character of our small coastal village. The developer 

seeks to build 5 x six-storey buildings and 4x 5-storey buildings in a town where 
almost all areas are zoned with an 8.5m height limit. Unfortunately the former 
KLEP didn’t specify a height limit for this land – an oversight that was addressed 

in the updated KLEP currently moving through the system – which has amended 
a height limit of 8.5m for this land. If passed, these buildings will loom far over 

the coastal heath beach foreshore that currently has no building higher than two 
storeys anywhere nearby. This development caused significant community 
backlash.  

Settlers Ridge  

Settlers Ridge is a 154 lot sub-development that was approved in 2013. This 

development was approved by the NSW Department of Planning. Construction 
commenced in 2013/2014 with the development of roughly 12 lots to ensure 

development consent didn’t lapse. No further work was undertaken until April 
2023, when all native vegetation was clear-felled, including hollow-bearing 
habitat trees. This developer has a Biodiversity Stewardship agreement with 

Kempsey Shire Council, behind the site. However, there is no guarantee that it 
will be maintained for biodiversity into the future or protected in perpetuity. The 

NSW Planning Department identified the development site at Keith Andrews Ave 
as having high biodiversity values and being "sensitive to impacts from 
development and clearing.” Yet the biodiversity of this site was destroyed. 

Seabreeze/Saltwater Estate  

Seabreeze Estate is a 221 lot sub-development adjacent to Saltwater Lagoon, a 

nationally important wetland. This development was originally challenged in the 
Land and Environment Court in 2004 on the basis that Kempsey Shire Council 
did not refer the development to the state government for development consent 

under State Planning Policy No. 71. In 2016 a new development application for 
Stage One of the revised Saltwater Estate was rejected by the Northern Joint 

Regional Planning Panel, this was then challenged and lost in Land and 
Environment court in 2019. The close proximity to Saltwater Lagoon, bushland 
that was home to threatened species, such as the Squirrel Glider and Brush-

tailed Phascogale, and the impacts of climate change, sea level rise and flooding 
continue to be key concerns for this development.  

The increasing frequency and severity of extreme weather events will have 
continued impacts on South West Rocks. Some of the key concerns include: 
Isolation during flooding. With only one road in and out, South West Rocks 

routinely becomes isolated during major flooding. This isolation usually only lasts 
a couple of days, however if severity increases, so will the length of isolation. 

Bushfire risk  

Poor air quality during bushfires  



Storm damage and coastal Storm water run-off and flash flooding. With 
increasing development and a reduction in trees, we’ve seen localised flash 

flooding around development sites  

Coastal erosion - making beach access unsafe and constant upkeep of access 

points are an increasing burden on Council and NSW NPWS Outdated historical 
development consents must be reassessed against updated planning policy and 
development must be avoided in areas that are vulnerable to bushfire, flooding, 

sea level rise, and other climate impacts.  

Saltwater Lagoon is considered a Nationally Important Wetland. There is 

increasing pressure on Saltwater Lagoon and Saltwater Creek from encroaching 
development. The impacts of increased run-off from sediment, housing, 
including garden run-off that may include synthetic fertilisers or an imbalance of 

chemicals.  

The Saltwater Creek Coastal Management Program report states: "Virtually all of 

the estuary is designated as state-significant coastal wetlands, and a significant 
biodiversity is present including notable species of birds, fish, reptiles and 
mammals." However, the estuary is facing increased pressure from urban 

development within its catchment. The South West Rocks area is projected to 
experience a 40% increase in population over the next 15 years, and a series of 

major developments are planned for the study area catchment during this 
period. Catchment run-off and urban storm water discharge are already a major 

source of water quality issues across the estuary, which as an ICOLL comprises a 
sensitive receiving system." Two of the developments linked to historical 
development consents (Rise & Seabreeze/Saltwater) in South West Rocks are 

located extremely close to the coastal wetlands of Saltwater Lagoon and 
Saltwater Creek.  

It is vital that planning legislation and controls are strengthened to conserve the 
remnant native vegetation, recognising that remnant habitat in the area has 
incredibly high biodiversity value as wildlife refuges after the 2019/20 and 2023 

bushfires.  

I acknowledge the importance of Wuumung (South West Rocks) to the 

Traditional Custodians, the Dunghutti people. I support the Dunghutti 
community’s aspirations to manage and care for Country. For too long 
Indigenous Wisdom and knowledge on caring for Country has been overlooked 

by commercial development. The historical development consents and over-
development in South West Rocks is not culturally respectful and has lacked 

genuine engagement with Traditional Custodians. In some instances the local 
Dunghutti community were not given prior notice of clearing and sites of cultural 
significance were irreversibly destroyed. Early input from First Nations 

Australians into planning solutions will lead to better outcomes for communities 
that are at the forefront of climate fuelled extreme weather events and lead to 

better planning decisions. Historical development consents ignore this knowledge 
and the deep connection that Traditional Custodians have with the land.  

I ask the Legislative Assembly Committee on Environment and Planning to 

consider the following key concerns: Historical development consents are based 
on outdated environmental science and do not address the increasingly changing 

climate. Local Environmental Plans have been changed locally to address these 
changes. Furthermore historical development consents do not reflect changes in 
community sentiment or acknowledge Indigenous Wisdom. Coastal communities 



with one road in and out have land carrying limitations that need to be factored 
into planning and that may not have been evident when historical development 

consents were first approved. Infrastructure and amenities are already stretched 
in South West Rocks and many other coastal towns, which is currently not taken 

into account when historical development consents are allowed to proceed. Many 
residents cannot readily access a local GP or have to travel significant distances 
to get a specialist medical appointment. The clearing of old growth habitat for 

development has far reaching impacts - habitat loss and species vulnerability, 
contributions to climate change, erosion and flash flooding, localised extinctions, 

detrimental impact on the mental and physical health of the community. 
Historical development consents have the biggest impacts on these old growth 
habitat sites. South West Rocks’ economy is driven by tourism. One of the key 

draw cards for visitors to South West Rocks is its untouched, natural beauty. If 
we continue to clear nature for development we will detrimentally impact our 

tourist economy.  




