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8 July 2022 
 
 
 
 
 
Mr Raymond Williams MP 
Chair 
Legislative Assembly Committee on Law and Safety 
Parliament House 
Macquarie Street  
Sydney NSW 2000 
 
 
 
Email: lawsafety@parliament.nsw.gov.au  
 
 
 
Dear Mr Williams,  
 
Re Embedded Networks in New South Wales 

Origin Energy (Origin) welcomes the opportunity to provide a response to the Legislative Assembly 
Committee on Law and Safety’s (the Committee) inquiry into embedded networks in NSW. 
 
Origin is one of Australia’s largest integrated energy companies with activities spanning electricity 
generation, energy retailing, renewable energy, battery storage and rooftop solar and energy services 
provision. Origin has 4.4 million energy accounts across Australia including over 300,000 community 
energy services or embedded network customers. Origin completed the purchase of WINConnect in March 
2022, growing our portfolio by more than 90,000 embedded electricity network and serviced hot water 
customers.  
 
Origin strongly believes that all customers in an embedded network should have access to essential 
services at a fair price and be afforded the same customer protections as other energy customers. This is 
even more important as embedded networks grow as an alternative to standard supply arrangements, not 
just in New South Wales, but also the broader national market.  
 
We understand the concerns of Government and regulators that the current regulatory framework may not 
afford customers in embedded networks the same benefits and entitlements of customers connected 
directly to the grid. For these reasons, we provide services to our embedded network customers under a 
retail licence. 
 
As a result, our customers have access to the same protections and regulatory oversight as standard supply 
customers. This includes access to all applicable residential customer rebates and concessions, hardship 
policies, and the Energy and Water Ombudsman scheme and associated dispute resolution services. While 
not obligated to do so, Origin also provides the same hardship assistance and access to the Ombudsman 
scheme and dispute resolution services to our hot water customers within embedded networks. 
 
These views extend to pricing. All customers, regardless of whether they are in an embedded network or 
connected directly to the distribution system, should have access to the best offer for their circumstances. 
Origin would like to highlight to the Committee that the best offer may not always be provided by a retail 
offer but may in fact be one that is provided by virtue of an embedded network’s scale and single buyer 
power. It is important that these benefits are not lost to customers. 
 






