
FIRST PRINT 

FREEDOM OF INFORMATION (AMENDMENT) BILL 1992 

NEW SOUTH WALES 

EXPLANATORY NOTE 

(This Explanatory Note relates to this Bill as introduced into Parliament) 

The object of this Bill is to amend the Freedom of Information Act 1989 to make the 
following changes: 

to reduce the maximum time within which an application under the Act must 
be dealt with by an agency from 45 days to 21 days; 
to provide that it is not relevant to take into account the possibility of 
embarrassment to the Government, loss of confidence in the Government or 
misunderstanding of information by the applicant when determining whether 
giving access to a document is in the public interest; 
to remove the right of an agency to refuse access to a document on the ground 
that it came into existence more than 5 years before the commencement of the 
Act; 
to allow judicial or other review of a determination of an agency to refuse to 
deal with an application on the grounds that to do so involves a substantial and 
unreasonable diversion of the agency's resources; 
to require the Minister, when issuing a Ministerial certificate that a document is 
a restricted document to which an agency must refuse access, to give reasons 
and provide particulars to support the claim that it is a restricted document; 
to provide that the Supreme Court, rather than the District Court, is to review 
determinations in relation to a document that is subject to a Ministerial 
certificate that states that it is a restricted document; 
to limit to Cabinet and Executive Council documents the power of the Minister 
to confirm a Ministerial certificate in respect of a claim for exemption that is 
not upheld by the Court; 
to provide that where the Ombudsman investigates the conduct of a person in 
connection with a determination of an agency the Ombudsman may in a report 
of the investigation include recommendations that it is in the public interest to 
give access to a document that is duly exempt from disclosure or that the 
agency change its FOI procedures; 



2 

Freedom of Information (Amendment) 1992 

to remove documents exempt under Commonwealth and Victorian Freedom of 
Information legislation from the category of restricted documents and transfer 
them to the category of ordinary exempt documents—thereby excluding the 
power of the Minister to issue a certificate for such a document; 
to allow Ministerial guidelines on an agency's policy in relation to charges for 
applications to be an element of any review of a determination as to charges; 
to reduce the number of bodies or offices that are exempt from the operation of 
the Act, and to limit the functions in relation to which other bodies or offices 
are exempt. 

Clause 1 specifies the short title of the proposed Act. 

Clause 2 provides that the proposed Act commences on a day or days to be 
appointed by proclamation. 

Clause 3 gives effect to the Schedule of amendments to the Freedom of Information 
Act 1989. 

Clause 4 deals with explanatory notes in the proposed Act. 

Schedule 1 makes the amendments referred to above. A detailed explanation of each 
amendment is set out after the amendment. 



FIRST PRINT 

FREEDOM OF INFORMATION (AMENDMENT) BILL 1992 

NEW SOUTH WALES 

TABLE OF PROVISIONS 
Short title 
Commencement 
Amendment of Freedom of Information Act 1989 No. 5 
Explanatory notes 

SCHEDULE 1—AMENDMENTS 



t 

e 

N 



FREEDOM OF INFORMATION (AMENDMENT) BILL 1992 

NEW SOUTH WALES 

No. 	, 1992 

A BILL FOR 

An Act to amend the Freedom of Information Act 1989 in relation to the 
review of agency determinations and to the exemption of documents and 
agencies from the operation of the Act; and for other purposes. 

I 



2 	 a 

Freedom of Information (Amendment) 1992 

The Legislature of New South Wales enacts: 
Short title 

This Act may be cited as the Freedom of Information (Amendment) 
Act 1992. 

5 Commencement 
This Act commences on a day or days to be appointed by 

proclamation. 

Amendment of Freedom of Information Act 1989 No. 5 
The Freedom of Information Act 1989 is amended as set out in 10 Schedule 1. 

Explanatory notes 
Matter appearing under the heading "Explanatory note" in Schedule 

1 does not form part of this Act. 

SCHEDULE 1—AMENDMENTS 
15 

	

	 (Sec. 3) 
Amendments—time limit on dealing with applications 

(1) (a) Sections 18 (3), 21 (6), 24 (2), 37 (2), 41 (3), 43 (2) and 50 
(2): 

Omit "45 days" wherever occurring, insert instead "21 
20 	 days". 

(b) Section 20 (6) (b): 
Omit "14 days", insert instead "10 days". 

Transitional provision—item (1) 
The amendments apply only to applications made after the commencement of the 25 amendments. 

Explanatory note—item (1) 
The amendments reduce from 45 days to 21 days the time in which an application for 

access to an agency's or Minister's documents, or for amendment of an agency's or 
Minister's records, must be dealt with by the agency or Minister. Item (1) (b) makes a 30 consequential amendment concerning applications transferred from one agency to 	 N. 
another. 



r 

3 

Freedom of Information (Amendment) 1992 

SCHEDULE 1—AMENDMENTS—continued 

Amendments—review of refusal to deal with certain applications 

(2) Section 22 (Agencies may refuse to continue to deal with 
applications if advance deposit not paid): 

Omit section 22 (1) and (2). 	 5 
Omit section 22 (5)—(8), insert instead: 

An agency that refuses to continue to deal with an 
application under this section must forthwith cause written 
notice of that fact to be given to the applicant. 

A refusal to continue to deal with an application under 	10 
this section is not a determination for the purposes of this 
Act. 

(3) Section 24 (Determination of applications): 
From section 24 (3), omit "refused to deal with, or to 

	

continue to deal with,", insert instead "refused to continue to 	15 
deal with". 

(4) Section 25 (Refusal of access): 
After section 25 (1) (a), insert: 
(al) if the work involved in dealing with the application for 

	

access to the document would, if carried out, 	20 
substantially and unreasonably divert the agency's 
resources away from their use by the agency in the 
exercise of its functions; or 

After section 25 (4), insert: 

	

(5) Subsection (1) (al) does not permit an agency to refuse 	25 
access to a document without first endeavouring to assist the 
applicant to amend the application so that the work involved 
in dealing with it would, if carried out, no longer 
substantially and unreasonably divert the agency's resources 

	

away from their use by the agency in the exercise of its 	30 
functions. 

Transitional provision—items (2)—(4) 
The amendments extend to applications pending on the commencement of the 

amendments but do not apply to applications that have been dealt with before the 
commencement of the amendments. 	 35 

r 



4 
	 • 

Freedom of Information (Amendment) 1992 

SCHEDULE 1—AMENDMENTS—continued 

Explanatory note—items (2)—(4) 
Section 22 empowers an agency to refuse to deal with an application on the ground 

that to do so involves a substantial and unreasonable diversion of the agency's resources 5 away from their use in the exercise of its functions. Currently, such a refusal is not 
reviewable under the Act. 

The amendments classify the refusal to deal with the application as an ordinary 
refusal of access. This will allow a person aggrieved by a refusal to apply to the agency 
concerned for review of the determination under section 34, to apply for the review of 

10 the refusal by the Ombudsman under section 52 and to appeal to the Court against the 
refusal under section 53. 

Amendments—refusal of access to old documents 
(5) Section 25 (Refusal of access): 

From section 25 (1) (d), omit "agency; or", insert instead 15 	 "agency.". 
Omit section 25 (1) (e) and (2). 

Transitional provision—item (5) 
The amendments extend to applications pending on the commencement of the 

amendments but do not apply to applications that have been dealt with before the 20 commencement of the amendments. 
Explanatory note—item (5) 

The amendments remove the right of an agency to refuse access to a document on the 
ground that the document came into existence more than 5 years before the commencement of the Act. 

25 Amendment—report by Ombudsman 
(6) Section 52 (Review by the Ombudsman): 

After section 52 (5), insert: 
(6) In a report under section 26 of the Ombudsman Act 

1974 of an investigation of a determination made by an 
30 	 agency under this Act, the Ombudsman may recommend: 

(a) that the public release of the document concerned 
would, on balance, be in the public interest even 
though access has been duly refused because it is an 	 .., exempt document; or 



• 

5 

Freedom of Information (Amendment) 1992 

SCHEDULE 1—AMENDMENTS—continued 

(b) that any general procedure of the agency in relation to 
dealing with applications made under this Act be 
changed to conform more closely to the objects and 
requirements of this Act. 	 5 

Transitional provision—item (6) 

The amendment applies to reports made after the commencement of the amendment, 
whether the investigation or application for access was made before or after that 
commencement. 

Explanatory note—item (6) 	 10 

The amendment empowers the Ombudsman, when reporting on an investigation of 
the conduct of any person or body in relation to a determination made by the agency, to 
recommend that a document should be released in the public interest (despite the fact 
that it is an exempt document) or to make recommendations for changes to the agency's 
general FOI procedures. 	 15 

Amendments—review and confirmation of Ministerial certificates for 
restricted documents 

(7) Section 57: 
Omit the section, insert instead: 
Consideration of restricted documents 	 20 

57. (1) The District Court may, on the application of the 
appellant, consider the grounds on which it is claimed that a 
document is a restricted document, but only if the document 
is not subject to a Ministerial certificate. 

(2) In any proceedings under this section, the District 	25 
Court is, on the application of the Minister administering this 
Act, or the agency or Minister concerned, to receive evidence 
and hear argument in the absence of: 

the public; 
the appellant; and 	 30 
if in the opinion of the District Court it is necessary to 
do so to prevent the disclosure of any exempt matter—
the appellant's representative. 

(3) If the District Court is not satisfied, by evidence on 
affidavit or otherwise, that there are reasonable grounds for 	35 
the claim, it may require the document to be produced in 
evidence before it. 



6 	 4 

Freedom of Information (Amendment) 1992 
II 

SCHEDULE 1—AMENDMENTS—continued 

If, after considering any document produced before it, 
the District Court is still not satisfied that there are 
reasonable grounds for the claim, the District Court is to 

	

5 	 reject the claim when determining the appeal. 
The District Court is not to reject the claim unless it 

has given the Minister administering this Act a reasonable 
opportunity to appear and be heard in relation to the matter. 

For the purposes of any proceedings under this section, 

	

10 	 the Minister administering this Act is a party to the 
proceedings. 

(8) Part 5, Division 3: 
After section 58, insert: 

Division 3—Review by the Supreme Court 

	

15 	 Review by the Supreme Court 
58A. (1) The Supreme Court may, on the application of the 

appellant in proceedings before the District Court under 
Division 2, consider the grounds on which it is claimed that a 
document that is the subject of a Ministerial certificate is a 

	

20 	 restricted document. 
(2) In any proceedings under this section, the Supreme 

Court is, on the application of the Minister administering this 
Act, or the agency or Minister concerned, to receive evidence 
and hear argument in the absence of: 

	

25 	 (a) the public; 
the appellant; and 
if in the opinion of the Supreme Court it is necessary 
to do so to prevent the disclosure of any exempt 
matter—the appellant's representative. 

	

30 	 (3) For the purposes of any proceedings under this section, 
the Minister administering this Act is a party to the 
proceedings. 
Consideration of documents the subject of a Ministerial 	 4 

certificate 

	

35 	 58B. (1) If, in proceedings under section 58A, the  
Supreme Court is not satisfied, by evidence on affidavit or 



7 

Freedom of Information (Amendment) 1992 

SCHEDULE 1—AMENDMENTS—continued 

otherwise, that there are reasonable grounds for the claim that 
the document is a restricted document, it may require the 
document to be produced in evidence before it. 

	

(2) If, after considering any document produced before it, 	5 
the Supreme Court is still not satisfied that there are 
reasonable grounds for the claim, the Supreme Court is to 
make an order to that effect and remit the matter to the 
District Court. 

	

(3) The Supreme Court is not to make such an order unless 	10 
it has given the Minister administering this Act a reasonable 
opportunity to appear and be heard in relation to the matter. 

(4) A Ministerial certificate which is the subject of an 
order under this section: 

subject to paragraph (b)—ceases to have effect when 	15 
the order takes effect; or 
in the case of a certificate that states that the document 
is a restricted document by virtue of clause 1 (Cabinet 
documents) or clause 2 (Executive Council documents) 

	

of Part 1 of Schedule 1—ceases to have effect at the 	20 
end of the period of 28 days after the order is made, 
unless the certificate is confirmed in accordance with 
section 58C. 

(5) If the Minister administering this Act withdraws the 

	

Ministerial certificate before the end of the period of 28 days 	25 
after the order is made, the Minister must, as soon as 
practicable, cause notice to be served on the appellant, and on 
the agency or Minister concerned, that the certificate is no 
longer in force. 

	

Confirmation of a Ministerial certificate for Cabinet and 	30 
Executive Council documents 

58C. (1) A Ministerial certificate that is the subject of an 
order under section 58B may be confirmed by the Minister 
administering this Act, but only if it is a certificate to which 
this section applies. 	 35 

(2) This section applies to a Ministerial certificate that 
states that the specified document is a restricted document by 
virtue of clause 1 (Cabinet documents) or clause 2 (Executive 
Council documents) of Part 1 of Schedule 1. 



8 

Freedom of Information (Amendment) 1992 

SCHEDULE 1—AMENDMENTS—continued 

(3) The Minister administering this Act must cause notice 
of the confirmation to be given to the agency or Minister 
concerned. 

	

5 	 (4) The notice must be given before the end of 28 days 
after an order is made by the Supreme Court in relation to the 
Ministerial certificate. 

(5) The notice must specify: 
the reasons for the Minister's decision to confirm the 

	

10 	 certificate; and 
the findings on any material questions of fact 
underlying those reasons, together with a reference to 
the sources of information on which those findings are 
based. 

	

15 	 (6) The Minister must cause a copy of the notice to be 
given to the appellant and a further copy to be tabled in each 
House of Parliament within 5 sitting days after the giving of 
the notice. 

(7) Nothing in this section requires any matter to be 

	

20 	 included in a notice if it is of such a nature that its inclusion 
in the notice would cause the notice to be an exempt 
document. 

Transitional provision—items (7) and (8) 
The amendments apply only to applications made after the commencement of the 

25 amendments. 

Explanatory note—items (7) and (8) 
Documents referred to in Part 1 of Schedule 1 are restricted documents. The 

categories of restricted documents at present include Cabinet documents, Executive 
Council documents, documents affecting law enforcement and public safety and 

	

30 	documents exempt under the Freedom of Information legislation of the Commonwealth 
or other States. 

Section 59 provides that when a Minister signs a certificate that states that a specified 
document is a restricted document because of a specific provision of Part 1 of Schedule 
1, the Ministerial certificate is taken to be conclusive evidence of that fact. 

	

35 	Currently, the District Court has power to consider the grounds on which a document 
is claimed to be a restricted document even if that document is the subject of a 
Ministerial certificate. 



• 	 9 

Freedom of Information (Amendment) 1992 

SCHEDULE 1—AMENDMENTS—continued 

The amendments provide for the Supreme Court to consider documents the subject of 
a Ministerial certificate and remove the District Court's power to do so. The Supreme 
Court may order that there are no reasonable grounds for the claim. Under the 

	

amendments the power of the Minister to confirm a certificate is to be limited to 	5 
restricted documents that are Cabinet documents or Executive Council documents. 

Amendments—particulars in Ministerial certificates for restricted 
documents 

(9) Section 59 (Ministerial certificates): 
From section 59 (1), omit "section 57", insert instead 	10 
"Division 3 of Part 5". 
After section 59 (1), insert: 

(1A) A certificate under this section must specify: 
the reasons for the Minister's decision that the 
document is a restricted document; and 	 15 
the findings on any material questions of fact 
underlying those reasons, together with a reference to 
the sources of information on which those findings are 
based. 

	

(1B) A copy of a certificate under this section is to be 	20 
given to an applicant seeking access to the document 
concerned. Such a copy is, for the purposes of section 28 (2) 
(e), sufficient notice to the applicant of the reasons for the 
refusal of access and the relevant findings underlying those 
reasons. 	 25 

(c) After section 59 (3), insert: 
(4) Nothing in this section requires any matter to be 

included in a certificate if it is of such a nature that its 
inclusion in the certificate would cause the certificate to be 
an exempt document. 	 30 

Transitional provision—item (9) 
The amendments apply only to certificates issued after the commencement of the 

amendments. 
Explanatory note—item (9) 

	

At present Ministerial certificates are only required to specify the provision of the 	35 
Act under which it is claimed the document is a restricted document. The amendments 
require Ministerial certificates to include details of the grounds on which the specified 
document is certified to be a restricted document. The requirement is expressed in the 



10 	 • 

Freedom of Information (Amendment) 1992 

SCHEDULE 1—AMENDMENTS—continued 

same terms as the requirement for an agency to give reasons for denying access to a 
document (s. 28 (2) (e)) and the requirement for the Minister to give reasons when 
confirming a certificate (existing s. 57 (9) and proposed s. 58C (5)). 

5 Amendment—definition of "public interest" 

(10) Section 59A: 
After section 59, insert: 
Public interest 

59A. For the purpose of determining under this Act 
10 

	

	 whether the disclosure of a document would be contrary to 
the public interest it is irrelevant that the disclosure may: 

cause embarrassment to the Government or a loss of 
confidence in the Government; or 
cause the applicant to misinterpret or misunderstand 

15 

	

	 the information contained in the document because of 
an omission from the document or for any other 
reason. 

Transitional provision—item (10) 
The amendment applies to determinations whether made before or after the 

20 commencement of the amendment. 
Explanatory note—item (10) 

Section 25 currently provides that an agency may refuse access to a document if it is 
an exempt document. Many categories of exempt documents are exempt only if on 
balance the disclosure would be contrary to the public interest. The amendment defines 

25 "public interest" to remove the possibility of embarrassment to the Government or 
confusion to the applicant caused by the disclosure being taken into account 

Amendment—review of certain determinations relating to charges 
(11) Section 67 (Fees and charges): 

After section 67 (3), insert: 
30 

	

	
(3A) The guidelines in force under this section are to be 

taken into account: 
by the District Court when reviewing a determination 
described in section 53 (3) (a) (iv) or (v); and 
by the Ombudsman when reviewing the conduct of a 

35 	 person or body in relation to such a determination. 



Y 11 

Freedom of Information (Amendment) 1992 

SCHEDULE 1—AMENDMENTS 	continued 

Transitional provision—item (11) 

The amendment applies only to an appeal from a determination made after the 
commencement of the amendment. 

Explanatory note—item (11) 	 5 
Section 53 creates a right of appeal in relation to a determination by an agency to 

impose a charge for providing access to documents which the applicant considers to be 
unreasonable or to impose a charge for dealing with the application which the applicant 
considers to have been unreasonably incurred. 

The amendment requires the District Court, in reviewing such a determination, to 	10 
have regard to any guidelines relating to fees and charges published by the Minister in 
accordance with section 67. The Ombudsman will also be required to have regard to 
those guidelines when reviewing the conduct of a person or body in relation to such a 
determination. 

Amendment—Ministerial certificates for restricted documents under 	15 
other FOI legislation 

Schedule 1 (Exempt documents): 
Omit clause 3 of Schedule 1 and insert it (re-numbered as 
clause 21) after clause 20 of that Schedule. 

Transitional provision—item (12) 	 20 
The amendment applies only to applications made after the commencement of the 

amendment. 

Explanatory note—item (12) 

Under the current Act exempt documents under the Freedom of Information 
legislation of the Commonwealth or Victoria are categorised as restricted documents. 	25 
The amendment provides that such documents are not restricted documents but are still 
exempt documents. An agency will continue to be able to deny access to the documents 
on the grounds that they are exempt, but a Ministerial certificate cannot be issued in 
relation to them. 

Amendments—revision of references to Police Force 	 30 
Schedule 1 (Exempt documents): 

From clause 4 (3) (a), omit "State Intelligence Group of the 
Police Force", insert instead "State Intelligence Group of the 
Police Service". 
From clause 4 (3) (b), omit "former Special Branch of the 	35 
Police Force", insert instead "Special Branch of the Police 
Service". 



12 

Freedom of Information (Amendment) 1992 

SCHEDULE 1—AMENDMENTS—continued 

Explanatory Note—item (13) 
The amendments revise references to the Police Service. 

Amendments—bodies and offices exempt from Act 

	

5 	(14) Schedule 2 (Exempt bodies and offices): 
From the matter relating to the Auditor-General, omit "all 
functions", insert instead "investigative, audit and report 
functions". 
From the matter relating to the Director of Public 

	

10 	 Prosecutions, omit "all functions", insert instead 
"prosecuting functions". 
From the matter relating to the Independent Commission 
Against Corruption, omit "all functions", insert instead 
"corruption prevention, complaint handling, investigative and 

	

15 	 report functions". 
Omit the matter relating to the State Bank, insert instead: 

The State Bank of New South Wales Limited and any of 
its subsidiaries—all functions. 

Omit the matter relating to GIO Australia Holdings Limited. 

	

20 	(f) Omit the matter rela„ng to State owned corporations. 
Transitional provision—item (14) 

The amendments apply only to applications made after the commencement of the 
amendments. 
Explanatory note—item (14) 

	

25 	The amendment varies the schedule of bodies and offices which are exempt from the 
operation of the Act in relation to the functions specified. The exemption for the 
Auditor-General, DPP and ICAC is being restricted to their operational functions (as is 
the case with the exemption for the Ombudsman). The general exemption for State 
owned corporations is being removed except for the State Bank on the basis that any 

30 such exemption should be limited to such a corporation that operates in a competitive 
market. The exemption for the GIO is being removed since it will not be necessary 
following its privatisation. 



MR. PRESIDENT, 

I MOVE, 

THAT THIS BILL BE NOW READ A SECOND TIME 

MR. PRESIDENT, 

THE MAIN PURPOSE OF THIS BILL IS TO AMEND THE 

FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT TO IMPROVE ITS 

OPERATION, PARTICULARLY IN RELATION TO EXEMPTION 

CATEGORIES AND REVIEW PROCEDURES UNDER THE ACT. 

THE FOI ACT HAS NOW BEEN IN PLACE FOR A LITTLE OVER 
TWO YEARS. THE GOVERNMENT INDICATED AT THE TIME 

OF ITS INTRODUCTION THAT IT WOULD BE REVIEWED IN 

LIGHT OF EXPERIENCE OF THE OPERATION OF THE 

LEGISLATION AFTER THIS PERIOD. I SHOULD SAY THAT, 
GENERALLY SPEAKING, IT APPEARS THAT THE ACT HAS 

OPERATED FAIRLY WELL DURING THIS PERIOD. THE 

FEARS ON BOTH SIDES OF THE FENCE HAVE GENERALLY 

PROVEN TO BE UNFOUNDED. THE BUREAUCRACY HAS 

NOT BEEN PARALYSED BY THE ADDITIONAL BURDENS 
PLACED ON IT AND IT DOES APPEAR THAT THE ACT HAS 

ACHIEVED ITS PURPOSE OF MAKING GOVERNMENT 

INFORMATION MORE AVAILABLE TO MEMBERS OF THE 
PUBLIC. 

THE ACT GENERALLY APPEARS TO HAVE STRUCK A 
REASONABLE BALANCE BETWEEN THE RIGHTS OF THE 





- 2 - 

PUBLIC TO ACCESS SUCH INFORMATION AND THE 
RESTRICTIONS REASONABLY NECESSARY FOR THE 

PROPER ADMINISTRATION OF THE GOVERNMENT. 

HOWEVER, THERE ARE OBVIOUSLY SOME AREAS WHERE 

THERE IS ROOM FOR IMPROVEMENT, AND THE 

GOVERNMENT IS CONFIDENT THAT THOSE MATTERS 
MOST IN NEED OF ATTENTION ARE DEALT WITH BY THIS 

BILL. 

MR. PRESIDENT, 

I SHOULD ACKNOWLEDGE AT THE OUTSET THAT MOST OF 

THE AMENDMENTS CONTAINED IN THE BILL ARE THE 

RESULT OF PROPOSALS PUT FORWARD BY THE 
INDEPENDENT MEMBERS, WHICH WERE REFINED IN 

CONJUNCTION WITH THE GOVERNMENT, AS PART OF THE 

CHARTER OF REFORM NEGOTIATIONS. THE INDEPENDENT 

MEMBERS DESERVE CREDIT FOR THE EFFORT WHICH 
THEY AND THEIR ADVISERS HAVE PUT INTO DEVELOPING 

WHAT ARE IN SOME INSTANCES FAIRLY TECHNICAL 

AMENDMENTS. 

FOR THE BENEFIT OF HONOURABLE MEMBERS, I WILL 

BRIEFLY RUN THROUGH THE MAIN PROVISIONS OF THE 

BILL. 

THE BILL REDUCES THE MAXIMUM TIME WITHIN WHICH AN 

AGENCY MUST DEAL WITH AN APPLICATION UNDER THE 

ACT FROM 45 DAYS TO 21 DAYS. IT IS CONSIDERED THAT 





- 3 - 

IN MOST CIRCUMSTANCES THIS SHOULD BE A SUFFICIENT 

TIME WITHIN WHICH TO PROCESS FOI APPLICATIONS. 

THERE MAY BE SOME DIFFICULTIES WHERE ARCHIVED 

MATERIAL IS SOUGHT OR WHERE THERE IS A NEED TO 

CONSULT PEOPLE REGARDING THEIR BUSINESS OR 

PERSONAL AFFAIRS BEFORE A DOCUMENT CAN BE 

RELEASED. THE BILL ALLOWS AGENCIES, WHEN FACED 

WITH DIFFICULTIES IN MEETING THE 21 DAY DEADLINE 

DUE TO SPECIAL CIRCUMSTANCES SUCH AS THOSE 
MENTIONED, TO EXTEND THE TIME PERIOD FOR DEALING 

WITH AN APPLICATION BY A FURTHER 14 DAYS. 

MR PRESIDENT, 

THE BILL ALSO PROVIDES SOME ADDITIONAL GUIDANCE IN 

RELATION TO MATTERS TO BE TAKEN INTO ACCOUNT IN 

DETERMINING WHAT IS IN THE PUBLIC INTEREST. THE BILL 

MAKES IT CLEAR THAT IT WILL NOT BE RELEVANT TO TAKE 

INTO ACCOUNT THE POSSIBILITY OF EMBARRASSMENT TO 
THE GOVERNMENT, LOSS OF CONFIDENCE IN THE 
GOVERNMENT, OR MISUNDERSTANDING OF INFORMATION 

BY THE APPLICANT WHEN DETERMINING WHETHER THE 

GIVING OF ACCESS TO A DOCUMENT IS IN THE PUBLIC 

INTEREST. 

HONOURABLE MEMBERS WOULD BE AWARE THAT THE 

CONCEPT OF THE PUBLIC INTEREST IS USED FAIRLY 

EXTENSIVELY IN THE FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 

AND IN OTHER LEGISLATION. WHILST IT MIGHT BE 

ARGUED THAT IT IS A CONCEPT THAT IS REASONABLY 





- 4 - 

WELL UNDERSTOOD, THE INDEPENDENTS WERE OF THE 
VIEW THAT IT'S LIMITS SHOULD BE MORE CLEARLY SPELT 
OUT. THE AMENDMENT MADE BY THIS BILL WILL ENSURE 
THAT THERE IS NO MISUNDERSTANDING AND THAT THERE 
CAN BE NO CLAIM THAT THE PUBLIC INTEREST MIGHT 
INCLUDE CONSIDERATIONS LIKE EMBARRASSMENT TO 
THE GOVERNMENT. 

MR. PRESIDENT, 

THE BILL ALSO REMOVES THE RIGHT OF AN AGENCY TO 
REFUSE ACCESS TO A DOCUMENT ON THE GROUND THAT 
IT CAME INTO EXISTENCE MORE THAN FIVE YEARS 
BEFORE THE COMMENCEMENT OF THE ACT. THIS 
PROVISION WAS ORIGINALLY INCLUDED IN THE ACT 
BECAUSE OF FEARS THAT THE FLOODGATES WOULD BE 
OPENED AND AGENCIES WOULD HAVE DIFFICULTIES 
COMPLYING WITH REQUESTS FOR DOCUMENTS WHICH 
WERE ARCHIVED AND DIFFICULT AND TIME-CONSUMING 
TO PRODUCE. THE 5 YEAR LIMIT IS, HOWEVER, A 
SOMEWHAT ARTIFICIAL BARRIER WHICH THE 
GOVERNMENT IS NOW CONVINCED SHOULD BE REMOVED. 

CURRENTLY A DETERMINATION OF AN AGENCY TO 
REFUSE TO DEAL WITH AN APPLICATION ON THE 
GROUNDS THAT IT INVOLVES A SUBSTANTIAL AND 
UNREASONABLE DIVERSION OF RESOURCES IS NOT 
TREATED AS A REVIEWABLE DETERMINATION UNDER THE 
ACT. THE BILL AMENDS THE ACT TO CLASSIFY SUCH A 
REFUSAL AS A DETERMINATION, WHICH MEANS THAT IT 





- 5 - ... 
WILL BE REVIEWABLE BY BOTH THE OMBUDSMAN AND THE 
DISTRICT COURT. THIS IS CLEARLY A DESIRABLE 
IMPROVEMENT AND WILL ENSURE THAT AGENCIES ARE 

NOT ENCOURAGED TO MAKE SPURIOUS CLAIMS ABOUT 
THE AMOUNT OF RESOURCES REQUIRED TO PROCESS 
APPLICATIONS. 

MR. PRESIDENT, 

THE USE OF MINISTERIAL CERTIFICATES IS AN ISSUE 
WHICH WAS DEBATED AT SOME LENGTH WHEN THE ACT 

WAS FIRST INTRODUCED. I AM SURE THAT MOST 
MEMBERS WOULD ACKNOWLEDGE THAT THERE WILL 
ALWAYS BE SOME LIMITED CIRCUMSTANCES IN WHICH IT 
IS NECESSARY FOR THE MINISTER TO ISSUE SUCH 
CERTIFICATES. IN FACT, SINCE THE ACT CAME INTO 
OPERATION OVER TWO YEARS AGO ONLY ONE 
MINISTERIAL CERTIFICATE HAS BEEN ISSUED. 

THE BILL WILL ENSURE THAT SUCH CERTIFICATES 
CONTINUE TO BE ISSUED ONLY FOR GOOD REASONS AND 
IN APPROPRIATE CIRCUMSTANCES. HOWEVER, IT AMENDS 
THE CURRENT PROVISIONS IN RELATION TO MINISTERIAL 

CERTIFICATES BY LIMITING THE MINSTER'S CAPACITY TO 

CONFIRM A CERTIFICATE TO THE CATEGORIES OF 
CABINET DOCUMENTS AND EXECUTIVE COUNCIL 
DOCUMENTS ONLY. 

THE BILL ALSO PROVIDES FOR THE SUPREME COURT 
RATHER THAN THE DISTRICT COURT TO DETERMINE 





- 6 - 

APPEALS IN RESPECT OF THE ISSUE OF A MINISTERIAL 

CERTIFICATE. THE DISTRICT COURT WILL CONTINUE TO 

HEAR APPEALS ON ALL OTHER MATTERS UNDER THE ACT, 

THAT IS, ON ALL SUBSTANTIVE MATTERS. THE ROLE OF 
THE SUPREME COURT WILL THEREFORE BE LIMITED TO 

CONSIDERING AND DETERMINING WHETHER THERE WERE 

REASONABLE GROUNDS FOR THE ISSUE OF THE 
MINISTERIAL CERTIFICATE. 

THE BILL ALSO PROVIDES THAT THE MINISTER WILL BE 

REQUIRED, WHEN ISSUING SUCH A CERTIFICATE, TO 

INCLUDE DETAILS OF THE GROUNDS ON WHICH THE 

DOCUMENT IS CERTIFIED TO BE RESTRICTED. 

MR PRESIDENT, 

HONOURABLE MEMBERS WILL BE AWARE OF THE 

IMPORTANT ROLE PLAYED BY THE OMBUDSMAN IN 
RELATION TO THE REVIEW OF FREEDOM OF INFORMATION 

DETERMINATIONS. THE BILL RECOGNISES THIS BY 

AMENDING THE EXISTING ACT TO PROVIDE THAT WHERE 

THE OMBUDSMAN INVESTIGATES THE CONDUCT OF A 
PERSON IN RELATION TO A DETERMINATION HE MAY 

INCLUDE RECOMMENDATIONS THAT IT IS IN THE PUBLIC 

INTEREST TO GIVE ACCESS TO AN EXEMPT DOCUMENT 

DESPITE THE FACT THAT IT IS EXEMPT. IT ALSO 

PROVIDES THAT HE MAY INCLUDE RECOMMENDATIONS 

THAT THE AGENCY SHOULD CHANGE ITS FOI 

PROCEDURES. THESE SORTS OF RECOMMENDATIONS 

SHOULD ASSIST IN IDENTIFYING DIFFICULTIES IN 





- 7 - 

PARTICULAR AGENCIES AND SHOULD ENSURE THAT THEY 
ARE ADDRESSED. THE AMENDMENTS RECOGNISE THE 
BROADER ROLE WHICH IS AND SHOULD BE PLAYED BY THE 
OMBUDSMAN IN REVIEWING FOI DETERMINATIONS. 

MR. PRESIDENT, 

THE BILL ALSO REMOVES DOCUMENTS WHICH ARE 
EXEMPT UNDER COMMONWEALTH AND VICTORIAN FOI 
LEGISLATION FROM THE CATEGORY OF RESTRICTED 
DOCUMENTS FOR WHICH A MINISTERIAL CERTIFICATE 
CAN BE ISSUED, AND MAKES THEM ORDINARY EXEMPT 
DOCUMENTS. NO CERTIFICATES HAVE BEEN ISSUED SO 
FAR IN RELATION TO THIS CATEGORY OF DOCUMENTS 
AND IT IS CONSIDERED THAT IT OUGHT NOT BE 
NECESSARY FOR MINISTERIAL CERTIFICATES TO BE 
ISSUED FOR THESE TYPES OF DOCUMENTS. 

MR PRESIDENT, 

THE COSTS AND CHARGES IMPOSED FOR FREEDOM OF 
INFORMATION REQUESTS IS ANOTHER ISSUE WHICH BOTH 
THE GOVERNMENT AND THE INDEPENDENTS HAVE BEEN 
CONCERNED WITH. SO  FAR IT APPEARS THAT MOST 
AGENCIES ARE BEHAVING REASONABLY IN TERMS OF 
GRANTING HARDSHIP APPLICATIONS AND ADMINISTERING 
THE FOI (FEES AND CHARGES) ORDER AND THE 
GUIDELINES WHICH HAVE BEEN PUT OUT ON THE 
SUBJECT. THE BILL MAKES IT EXPLICIT, HOWEVER, THAT 
THE ORDERS AND THE GUIDELINES MUST BE TAKEN INTO 





- 8 - 

ACCOUNT IN CARRYING OUT ANY REVIEW OF A 

DETERMINATION ABOUT THE LEVEL OF CHARGES. THIS 

PROVISION WILL GIVE STATUTORY FORCE TO A 
DESIRABLE PRACTICE WHICH IS ALREADY LARGELY IN 

PLACE AND WILL REINFORCE THE IMPORTANCE OF 

MAKING FOI ACCESSIBLE TO THE AVERAGE CITIZEN. 

FINALLY, MR. PRESIDENT, THE BILL REDUCES THE 
NUMBER OF BODIES OR OFFICES THAT ARE EXEMPT FROM 

THE OPERATION OF THE ACT AND LIMITS THE FUNCTIONS 

IN RELATION TO WHICH OTHER BODIES OR OFFICES ARE 

EXEMPT. THE BODIES REMAINING IN THE SCHEDULE ARE 

STATE AGENCIES WHICH COMPETE WITH THE PRIVATE 
SECTOR SUCH AS THE STATE BANK. IT IS CONSIDERED 

THAT THERE ARE GOOD ARGUMENTS IN FAVOUR OF 

EXEMPTING GOVERNMENT BODIES WHICH COMPETE ON 

COMMERCIAL TERMS WITH THE PRIVATE SECTOR. IF 

THEIR COMPETITORS ARE GIVEN ACCESS TO 
INFORMATION WHICH THE STATE BODY COULD NOT GET 
FROM THEM, IT WOULD CLEARLY PLACE THE STATE BODY 

AT A DISADVANTAGE. 

ALSO, THE BLANKET EXEMPTION WHICH NOW EXISTS IN 

RELATION TO THE ICAC, THE DPP, THE OMBUDSMAN AND 

THE AUDITOR GENERAL WILL BE REMOVED AND BE 
REPLACED BY A MORE LIMITED EXEMPTION. IN FUTURE, 

THOSE BODIES WILL BE EXEMPT ONLY IN RESPECT OF 

THEIR OPERATIONAL AND NOT THEIR ADMINISTRATIVE 

FUNCTIONS. IT IS CONSIDERED THAT THIS MORE LIMITED 

EXEMPTION OUGHT TO BE SUFFICIENT TO PROTECT THE 





- 9 - 

SENSITIVE INFORMATION WHICH THEY HOLD WHILST AT 
THE SAME TIME MAKING THEM SUBJECT TO FOI IN 
RELATION TO ADMINISTRATIVE TYPE DOCUMENTS. THERE 
WOULD APPEAR TO BE NO PARTICULAR JUSTIFICATION 
FOR THOSE AGENCIES TO HAVE A BROADER EXEMPTION 
FOR ADMINISTRATIVE DOCUMENTS THAN THAT APPLYING 
TO ANY OTHER AGENCY. 

MR. PRESIDENT, 

THE GOVERNMENT IS CONFIDENT THAT THE 
AMENDMENTS PROPOSED BY THE BILL WILL RESULT IN AN 
IMPROVEMENT IN THE OPERATION OF THE FREEDOM OF 
INFORMATION LEGISLATION. 

I COMMEND THE BILL TO THE HOUSE. 





1 

SECOND PRINT 

FREEDOM OF INFORMATION (AMENDMENT) BILL 1992 

NEW SOUTH WALES 

TABLE OF PROVISIONS 
Short title 
Commencement 
Amendment of Freedom of Information Act 1989 No. 5 
Explanatory notes 

SCHEDULE 1—AMENDMENTS 



,, 



This PUBLIC BILL, originated in the LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY and, 
having this day passed, is now ready for presentation to the LEGISLATIVE 
COUNCIL for its concurrence. 

Clerk of the Legislative Assembly. 
Legislative Assembly 

NEW SOUTH WALES 

Act No. 	, 1992 

An Act to amend the Freedom of Information Act 1989 in relation to the 
review of agency determinations and to the exemption of documents and 
agencies from the operation of the Act; and for other purposes. 



2 

Freedom of Information (Amendment) 1992 	 • 

The Legislature of New South Wales enacts: 
Short title 

This Act may be cited as the Freedom of Information (Amendment) 
Act 1992. 

5 Commencement 
This Act commences on a day or days to be appointed by 

proclamation. 

Amendment of Freedom of Information Act 1989 No. 5 
The Freedom of Information Act 1989 is amended as set out in 

10 Schedule 1. 

Explanatory notes 
Matter appearing under the heading "Explanatory note" in Schedule 

1 does not form part of this Act*. 

SCHEDULE 1—AMENDMENTS 
15 

	

	 (Sec. 3) 
Amendments—time limit on dealing with applications 

(1) (a) Sections 18 (3), 21 (6), 24 (2), 37 (2), 41 (3), 43 (2) and 50 
(2): 
Omit "45 days" wherever occurring, insert instead "21 

20 	 days". 
Section 20 (6) (b): 
Omit "14 days", insert instead "10 days". 
Section 59B: 
Before section 60, insert: 

25 	 Extension of 21 day period for dealing with applications 
59B. (1) This section applies to a period of 21 days 

referred to in section 18 (3), 21 (6), 24 (2), 37 (2), 41 (3), 43 
(2) or 50 (2). 

The matter marked "t" in the explanatory notes was inserted after the introduction of the Bill in the 30 Legislative Assembly to explain amendments to the Bill that were moved in Committee. 



3 

. 	 Freedom of Information (Amendment) 1992 

SCHEDULE 1—AMENDMENTS—continued 

(2) If the person dealing with an application under this Act 
determines in writing that the special circumstances of the 
case make it necessary to extend any such period of 21 days: 

the period is taken to be extended by a further period 	5 
of 14 days; and 
the person must, as soon as practicable, inform the 
applicant that the period has been so extended. 

(3) The only special circumstances that may be relied on to 
extend any such period of 21 days are as follows: 	10 

the necessity to consult any other person or body under 
Division 2 of Part 3; 
the necessity to locate and retrieve the relevant 
document from archived documents; 
any other special circumstances prescribed by the 	15 
regulations. 

Transitional provision—item (1) 
The amendments apply only to applications nude after the commencement of the 

amendments. 

Explanatory note—item (1) 	 20 
The amendments reduce from 45 days to 21 days the time in which an application for 

access to an agency's or Minister's documents, or for amendment of an agency's or 
Minister's records, must be dealt with by the agency or Minister. Item (1) (b) makes a 
consequential amendment concerning applications transferred from one agency to 
another. 	 25 
t The amendments also allow the reduced period to be extended by a further 14 days in 
certain special circumstances. 

Amendments—review of refusal to deal with certain applications 

(2) Section 22 (Agencies may refuse to continue to deal with 
applications if advance deposit not paid): 	 30 

Omit section 22 (1) and (2). 
Omit section 22 (5)—(8), insert instead: 

(5) An agency that refuses to continue to deal with an 
application under this section must forthwith cause written 
notice of that fact to be given to the applicant. 	 35 



4 

Freedom of Information (Amendment) 1992 

SCHEDULE 1—AMENDMENTS—continued 

(6) A refusal to continue to deal with an application under 
this section is taken to be a determination that is subject to 
internal review under Part 3 and external review under Part 5, 

	

5 	 and the provisions of those Parts apply accordingly. 

(3) Section 24 (Determination of applications): 
From section 24 (3), omit "refused to deal with, or to 
continue to deal with,", insert instead "refused to continue to 
deal with". 

	

10 	(4) Section 25 (Refusal of access): 
After section 25 (1) (a), insert: 
(al) if the work involved in dealing with the application for 

access to the document would, if carried out, 
substantially and unreasonably divert the agency's 

	

15 	 resources away from their use by the agency in the 
exercise of its functions; or 

After section 25 (4), insert: 
(5) Subsection (1) (al) does not permit an agency to refuse 

access to a document without first endeavouring to assist the 

	

20 	 applicant to amend the application so that the work involved 
in dealing with it would, if carried out, no longer 
substantially and unreasonably divert the agency's resources 
away from their use by the agency in the exercise of its 
functions. 

25 Transitional provision—items (2)—(4) 

The amendments extend to applications pending on the commencement of the 
amendments but do not apply to applications that have been dealt with before the 
commencement of the amendments. 

Explanatory note—items (2)—(4) 

	

30 	Section 22 empowers an agency to refuse to deal with an application on the ground 
that to do so involves a substantial and unreasonable diversion of the agency's resources 
away from their use in the exercise of its functions. Currently, such a refusal is not 
reviewable under the Act. 

The amendments classify the refusal to deal with the application as an ordinary 

	

35 	refusal of access. This will allow a person aggrieved by a refusal to apply to the agency 
concerned for review of the determination under section 34, to apply for the review of 
the refusal by the Ombudsman under section 52 and to appeal to the Court against the 
refusal under section 53. 



e 

5 

Freedom of Information (Amendment) 1992 

SCHEDULE 1—AMENDMENTS—continued 

t The amendments also enable a review or appeal to be made in the case of a refusal of 
an agency to deal with an application because of the applicant's failure to pay an 
advance deposit. 

Amendments—refusal of access to old documents 	 5 

(5) Section 25 (Refusal of access): 
From section 25 (1) (d), omit "agency; or", insert instead 
"agency.". 
Omit section 25 (1) (e) and (2). 

Transitional provision—item (5) 	 10 

The amendments extend to applications pending on the commencement of the 
amendments but do not apply to applications that have been dealt with before the 
commencement of the amendments. 

Explanatory note—item (5) 

	

The amendments remove the right of an agency to refuse access to a document on the 	15 
ground that the document came into existence more than 5 years before the 
commencement of the Act. 

Amendment—report by Ombudsman 

(6) Section 52 (Review by the Ombudsman): 
After section 52 (5), insert: 	 20 

(6) In a report under section 26 of the Ombudsman Act 
1974 of an investigation of a determination made by an 
agency under this Act, the Ombudsman may recommend: 

that the public release of the document concerned 

	

would, on balance, be in the public interest even 	25 
though access has been duly refused because it is an 
exempt document; or 
that any general procedure of the agency in relation to 
dealing with applications made under this Act be 

	

changed to conform more closely to the objects and 	30 
requirements of this Act. 

(7) Any part of a report under section 26 of the 
Ombudsman Act 1974 of an investigation of a determination 
made by an agency under this Act (except any part of such a 

	

report on a question of law or containing a recommendation 	35 



6 

Freedom of Information (Amendment) 1992 

SCHEDULE 1—AMENDMENTS—continued 

referred to in subsection (6)) is admissible in evidence in any 
proceedings before the Supreme Court or District Court 
under this Act if that part of the report is relevant to the 

	

5 	 proceedings. 
Transitional provision—item (6) 

The amendment applies to reports made after the commencement of the amendment, 
whether the investigation or application for access was made before or after that 
commencement. 

10 Explanatory note—item (6) 

The amendment empowers the Ombudsman, when reporting on an investigation of 
the conduct of any person or body in relation to a determination made by the agency, to 
recommend that a document should be released in the public interest (despite the fact 
that it is an exempt document) or to make recommendations for changes to the agency's 

15 general FOI procedures. 

t The amendment also provides for certain reports of the Ombudsman relating to a 
review under the Act to be admissible in evidence in proceedings on an appeal to the 
Supreme Court or District Court concerning the matter. 

Amendments—review and confirmation of Ministerial certificates for 
20 restricted documents 

(7) Section 57: 
Omit the section, insert instead: 
Consideration of restricted documents 

57. (1) The District Court may, on the application of the 

	

25 	 appellant, consider the grounds on which it is claimed that a 
document is a restricted document, but only if the document 
is not subject to a Ministerial certificate. 

(2) In any proceedings under this section, the District 
Court is, on the application of the Minister administering this 

	

30 	 Act, or the agency or Minister concerned, to receive evidence 
and hear argument in the absence of: 

the public; 
the appellant; and 
if in the opinion of the District Court it is necessary to 

	

35 	 do so to prevent the disclosure of any exempt matter— 
the appellant's representative. 



7 

Freedom of Information (Amendment) 1992 

SCHEDULE 1—AMENDMENTS—continued 

If the District Court is not satisfied, by evidence on 
affidavit or otherwise, that there are reasonable grounds for 
the claim, it may require the document to be produced in 
evidence before it. 	 5 

If, after considering any document produced before it, 
the District Court is still not satisfied that there are 
reasonable grounds for the claim, the District Court is to 
reject the claim when determining the appeal. 

The District Court is not to reject the claim unless it 	10 
has given the Minister administering this Act a reasonable 
opportunity to appear and be heard in relation to the matter. 

For the purposes of any proceedings under this section, 
the Minister administering this Act is a party to the 
proceedings. 	 15 

(8) Part 5, Division 3: 
After section 58, insert: 

Division 3—Review by the Supreme Court 
Review by the Supreme Court 

58A. (1) The Supreme Court may, on the application of the 	20 
appellant in proceedings before the District Court under 
Division 2, consider the grounds on which it is claimed that a 
document that is the subject of a Ministerial certificate is a 
restricted document. 

(2) In any proceedings under this section, the Supreme 	25 
Court is, on the application of the Minister administering this 
Act, or the agency or Minister concerned, to receive evidence 
and hear argument in the absence of: 

the public; 
the appellant; and 	 30 
if in the opinion of the Supreme Court it is necessary 
to do so to prevent the disclosure of any exempt 
matter—the appellant's representative. 

(3) For the purposes of any proceedings under this section, 
the Minister administering this Act is a party to the 	35 
proceedings. 



I 
8 

Freedom of Information (Amendment) 1992 	 • 

SCHEDULE 1—AMENDMENTS—continued 

Consideration of documents the subject of a Ministerial 
certificate 

58B. (1) If, in proceedings under section 58A, the 

	

5 	 Supreme Court is not satisfied, by evidence on affidavit or 
otherwise, that there are reasonable grounds for the claim that 
the document is a restricted document, it may require the 
document to be produced in evidence before it 

(2) If, after considering any document produced before it, 

	

10 	 the Supreme Court is still not satisfied that there are 
reasonable grounds for the claim, the Supreme Court is to 
make an order to that effect and remit the matter to the 
District Court. 

(3) The Supreme Court is not to make such an order unless 

	

15 	 it has given the Minister administering this Act a reasonable 
opportunity to appear and be heard in relation to the matter. 

(4) A Ministerial certificate which is the subject of an 
order under this section: 

subject to paragraph (b)—ceases to have effect when 

	

20 	 the order takes effect; or 
in the case of a certificate that states that the document 
is a restricted document by virtue of clause 1 (Cabinet 
documents) or clause 2 (Executive Council documents) 
of Part 1 of Schedule 1—ceases to have effect at the 

	

25 	 end of the period of 28 days after the order is made, 
unless the certificate is confirmed in accordance with 
section 58C. 

(5) If the Minister administering this Act withdraws the 
Ministerial certificate before the end of the period of 28 days 

	

30 	 after the order is made, the Minister must, as soon as 
practicable, cause notice to be served on the appellant, and on 
the agency or Minister concerned, that the certificate is no 
longer in force. 
Confirmation of a Ministerial certificate for Cabinet and 

	

35 	 Executive Council documents 
58C. (1) A Ministerial certificate that is the subject of an 

order under section 58B may be confirmed  by the Minister 
administering this Act, but only if it is a certificate to which 
this section applies. 



9 

4 	 Freedom of Information (Amendment) 1992 

SCHEDULE 1—AMENDMENTS—continued 

(2) This section applies to a Ministerial certificate that 
states that the specified document is a restricted document by 
virtue of clause 1 (Cabinet documents) or clause 2 (Executive 
Council documents) of Part 1 of Schedule 1. 	 5 

(3) The Minister administering this Act must cause notice 
of the confirmation to be given to the agency or Minister 
concerned. 

(4) The notice must be given before the end of 28 days 
after an order is made by the Supreme Court in relation to the 	10 
Ministerial certificate. 

(5) The notice must specify: 
the reasons for the Minister's decision to confirm the 
certificate; and 
the findings on any material questions of fact 	15 
underlying those reasons, together with a reference to 
the sources of information on which those findings are 
based. 

(6) The Minister must cause a copy of the notice to be 
given to the appellant and a further copy to be tabled in each 	20 
House of Parliament within 5 sitting days after the giving of 
the notice. 

(7) Nothing in this section requires any matter to be 
included in a notice if it is of such a nature that its inclusion 
in the notice would cause the notice to be an exempt 	25 
document. 

Transitional provision—items (7) and (8) 

The amendments apply only to applications made after the commencement of the 
amendments. 

Explanatory note—items (7) and (8) 	 30 
Documents referred to m Part 1 of Schedule 1 are restricted documents. The 

categories of restricted documents at present include Cabinet documents, Executive 
Council documents, documents affecting law enforcement and public safety and 
documents exempt under the Freedom of Information legislation of the Commonwealth 
or other States. 	 35 

Section 59 provides that when a Minister signs a certificate that states that a specified 
document is a restricted document because of a specific provision of Part 1 of Schedule 
1, the Ministerial certificate is taken to be conclusive evidence of that fact. 



10 

Freedom of Information (Amendment) 1992 

SCHEDULE 1—AMENDMENTS—continued 

Currently, the District Court has power to consider the grounds on which a document 
is claimed to be a restricted document even if that document is the subject of a 
Ministerial certificate. 

	

5 	The amendments provide for the Supreme Court to consider documents the subject of 
a Ministerial certificate and remove the District Court's power to do so. The Supreme 
Court may order that there are no reasonable grounds for the claim. Under the 
amendments the power of the Minister to confirm a certificate is to be limited to 
restricted documents that are Cabinet documents or Executive Council documents. 

10 Amendments—particulars in Ministerial certificates for restricted 
documents 

(9) Section 59 (Ministerial certificates): 
(a) From section 59 (1), omit "section 57", insert instead 

"Division 3 of Part 5". 

	

15 	(b) After section 59 (1), insert: 
(1A) A certificate under this section must specify: 

the reasons for the Minister's decision that the 
document is a restricted document; and 
the findings on any material questions of fact 

	

20 	 underlying those reasons, together with a reference to 
the sources of information on which those findings are 
based. 

(1B) A copy of a certificate under this section is to be 
given to an applicant seeking access to the document 

	

25 	 concerned. Such a copy is, for the purposes of section 28 (2) 
(e), sufficient notice to the applicant of the reasons for the 
refusal of access and the relevant findings underlying those 
reasons. 

(c) After section 59 (3), insert: 

	

30 	 (4) Nothing in this section requires any matter to be 
included in a certificate if it is of such a nature that its 
inclusion in the certificate would cause the certificate to be 
an exempt document. 

Transitional provision—item (9) 

	

35 	The amendments apply only to certificates issued after the commencement of the 
amendments. 



11 

Freedom of Information (Amendment) 1992 

SCHEDULE 1—AMENDMENTS—continued 

Explanatory note—item (9) 

At present Ministerial certificates are only required to specify the provision of the 
Act under which it is claimed the document is a restricted document The amendments 

	

require Ministerial certificates to include deiails of the grounds on which the specified 	5 
document is certified to be a restricted document. The requirement is expressed in the 
same terms as the requirement for an agency to give reasons for denying access to a 
document (s. 28 (2) (e)) and the requirement for the Minister to give reasons when 
confirming a certificate (existing s. 57 (9) and proposed s. 58C (5)). 

Amendment—definition of "public interest" 	 10 

(10) Section 59A: 
After section 59, insert: 
Public interest 

59A. For the purpose of determining under this Act 

	

whether the disclosure of a document would be contrary to 	15 
the public interest it is irrelevant that the disclosure may: 

cause embarrassment to the Government or a loss of 
confidence in the Government; or 
cause the applicant to misinterpret or misunderstand 

	

the information contained in the document because of 	20 
an omission from the document or for any other 
reason. 

Transitional provision—item (10) 

The amendment applies to determinations whether made before or after the 
commencement of the amendment. 	 25 

Explanatory note—item (10) 

Section 25 currently provides that an agency may refuse access to a document if it is 
an exempt document. Many categories of exempt documents are exempt only if on 
balance the disclosure would be contrary to the public interest The amendment defines 

	

"public interest" to remove the possibility of embarrassment to the Government or 	30 
confusion to the applicant caused by the disclosure being taken into account. 

Amendment—review of certain determinations relating to charges 

(11) Section 67 (Fees and charges): 
After section 67 (3), insert: 

	

(3A) The guidelines in force under this section are to be 	35 
taken into account: 



12 

Freedom of Information (Amendment) 1992 

SCHEDULE 1—AMENDMENTS—continued 

by the District Court when reviewing a determination 
described in section 53 (3) (a) (iv) or (v); and 
by the Ombudsman when reviewing the conduct of a 

5 	 person or body in relation to such a determination. 
(3B) A charge under this Act for dealing with an 

application or for giving access to a document is not to 
include any amount for additional time spent in searching for 
a document that was lost or misplaced. 

10 Transitional provision—item (11) 

The amendment applies only to an appeal from a determination made after the 
commencement of the amendment. 

Explanatory note—item (11) 

Section 53 creates a right of appeal in relation to a determination by an agency to 
15 impose a charge for providing access to documents which the applicant considers to be 

unreasonable or to impose a charge for dealing with the application which the applicant 
considers to have been unreasonably incurred. 

The amendment requires the District Court, in reviewing such a determination, to 
have regard to any guidelines relating to fees and charges published by the Minister in 

20 accordance with section 67. The Ombudsman will also be required to have regard to 
those guidelines when reviewing the conduct of a person or body in relation to such a 
determination. 

t The amendment also provides that a charge may not be made by an agency under the 
Act for additional time spent in searching for a document that was lost or misplaced. 

25 Amendment—Ministerial certificates for restricted documents under 
other FOI legislation 

(12) Schedule 1 (Exempt documents): 
Omit clause 3 of Schedule 1 and insert it (re-numbered as 
clause 21) after clause 20 of that Schedule. 

30 Transitional provision—item (12) 

The amendment applies only to applications made after the commencement of the 
amendment. 

Explanatory note—item (12) 

Under the current Act exempt documents under the Freedom of Information 
35 legislation of the Commonwealth or Victoria are categorised as restricted documents. 

The amendment provides that such documents are not restricted documents but are still 



13 

Freedom of Information (Amendment) 1992 

SCHEDULE 1—AMENDMENTS—continued 

exempt documents. An agency will continue to be able to deny access to the documents 
on the grounds that they are exempt, but a Ministerial certificate cannot be issued in 
relation to them. 

Amendments—revision of references to Police Force 	 5 

(13) Schedule 1 (Exempt documents): 
From clause 4 (3) (a), omit "State Intelligence Group of the 
Police Force", insert instead "State Intelligence Group of the 
Police Service". 
From clause 4 (3) (b), omit "former Special Branch of the 	10 
Police Force", insert instead "Special Branch of the Police 
Service". 

Explanatory Note—item (13) 

The amendments revise references to the Police Service. 

Amendments—bodies and offices exempt from Act 	 15 

(14) Schedule 2 (Exempt bodies and offices): 
From the matter relating to the Auditor-General, omit "all 
functions", insert instead "investigative, audit and report 
functions". 
From the matter relating to the Director of Public 	20 
Prosecutions, omit "all functions", insert instead 
"prosecuting functions". 
From the matter relating to the Independent Commission 
Against Corruption, omit "all functions", insert instead 
"corruption prevention, complaint handling, investigative and 	25 
report functions". 
Omit the matter relating to the State Bank, insert instead: 

The State Bank of New South Wales Limited and any of 
its subsidiaries—all functions. 

Omit the matter relating to GIO Australia Holdings Limited. 	30 
Omit the matter relating to State owned corporations. 

Transitional provision—item (14) 

The amendments apply only to applications made after the commencement of the 
amendments. 



14 

Freedom of Information (Amendment) 1992 

SCHEDULE 1—AMENDMENTS—continued 

Explanatory note—item (14) 
The amendment varies the schedule of bodies and offices which are exempt from the 

operation of the Act in relation to the functions specified. The exemption for the 
5 Auditor-General, DPP and ICAC is being restricted to their operational functions (as is 

the case with the exemption for the Ombudsman). The general exemption for State 
owned corporations is being removed except for the State Bank on the basis that any 
such exemption should be limited to such a corporation that operates in a competitive 
market. The exemption for the GIO is being removed since it will not be necessary 

10 following its privatisation. 



FREEDOM OF INFORMATION (AMENDMENT) ACT 1992 
No. 38 

NEW SOUTH WALES 

TABLE OF PROVISIONS 
Short title 
Commencement 
Amendment of Freedom of Information Act 1989 No. 5 
Explanatory notes 

SCHEDULE 1—AMENDMENTS 

[16] 





FREEDOM OF INFORMATION (AMENDMENT) ACT 1992 
No. 38 

$ 

NEW SOUTH WALES 

Act No. 38, 1992 

An Act to amend the Freedom of Information Act 1989 in relation to the 
review of agency determinations and to the exemption of documents and 
agencies from the operation of the Act; and for other purposes. [Assented 
to 19 May 1992] 



2 

Freedom of Information (Amendment) Act 1992 No. 38 

The Legislature of New South Wales enacts: 
Short title 

This Act may be cited as the Freedom of Information (Amendment) 
Act 1992. 

Commencement 
This Act commences on a day or days to be appointed by 

proclamation. 

Amendment of Freedom of Information Act 1989 No. 5 
The Freedom of Information Act 1989 is amended as set out in 

Schedule 1. 

Explanatory notes 
Matter appearing under the heading "Explanatory note" in Schedule 

1 does not form part of this Act*. 

SCHEDULE 1—AMENDMENTS 
(Sec. 3) 

Amendments—time limit on dealing with applications 

(1) (a) Sections 18 (3), 21 (6), 24 (2), 37 (2), 41 (3), 43 (2) and 50 
(2): 
Omit "45 days" wherever occurring, insert instead "21 
days". 
Section 20 (6) (b): 
Omit "14 days", insert instead "10 days". 
Section 59B: 
Before section 60, insert: 
Extension of 21 day period for dealing with applications 

59B. (1) This section applies to a period of 21 days 
referred to in section 18 (3), 21 (6), 24 (2), 37 (2), 41 (3), 43 
(2) or 50 (2). 

* The matter marked "t- in the explanatory notes was inserted after the introduction of the Bill in the 
Legislative Assembly to explain amendments to the Bill that were moved in Committee. 

• 



3 

Freedom of Information (Amendment) Act 1992 No. 38 

SCHEDULE 1—AMENDMENTS—continued 

(2) If the person dealing with an application under this Act 
determines in writing that the special circumstances of the 
case make it necessary to extend any such period of 21 days: 

the period is taken to be extended by a further period 
of 14 days; and 
the person must, as soon as practicable, inform the 
applicant that the period has been so extended. 

(3) The only special circumstances that may be relied on to 
extend any such period of 21 days are as follows: 

the necessity to consult any other person or body under 
Division 2 of Part 3; 
the necessity to locate and retrieve the relevant 
document from archived documents; 
any other special circumstances prescribed by the 
regulations. 

Transitional provision—item (1) 

The amendments apply only to applications made after the commencement of the 
amendments. 

Explanatory note—item (1) 

The amendments reduce from 45 days to 21 days the time in which an application for 
access to an agency's or Minister's documents, or for amendment of an agency's or 
Minister's records, must be dealt with by the agency or Minister. Item (1) (b) makes a 
consequential amendment concerning applications transferred from one agency to 
another. 

t The amendments also allow the reduced period to be extended by a further 14 days in 
certain special circumstances. 

Amendments—review of refusal to deal with certain applications 

(2) Section 22 (Agencies may refuse to continue to deal with 
applications if advance deposit not paid): 

Omit section 22 (1) and (2). 
Omit section 22 (5)—(8), insert instead: 

(5) An agency that refuses to continue to deal with an 
application under this section must forthwith cause written 
notice of that fact to be given to the applicant. 



4 

Freedom of Information (Amendment) Act 1992 No. 38 

SCHEDULE 1—AMENDMENTS 	continued 

(6) A refusal to continue to deal with an application under 
this section is taken to be a determination that is subject to 
internal review under Part 3 and external review under Part 5, 
and the provisions of those Parts apply accordingly. 

(3) Section 24 (Determination of applications): 
From section 24 (3), omit "refused to deal with, or to 
continue to deal with,", insert instead "refused to continue to 
deal with". 

(4) Section 25 (Refusal of access): 
After section 25 (1) (a), insert: 
(al) if the work involved in dealing with the application for 

access to the document would, if carried out, 
substantially and unreasonably divert the agency's 
resources away from their use by the agency in the 
exercise of its functions; or 

After section 25 (4), insert: 
(5) Subsection (1) (al) does not permit an agency to refuse 

access to a document without first endeavouring to assist the 
applicant to amend the application so that the work involved 
in dealing with it would, if carried out, no longer 
substantially and unreasonably divert the agency's resources 
away from their use by the agency in the exercise of its 
functions. 

Transitional provision—items (2)—(4) 
The amendments extend to applications pending on the commencement of the 

amendments but do not apply to applications that have been dealt with before the 
commencement of the amendments. 

Explanatory note—items (2)—(4) 

Section 22 empowers an agency to refuse to deal with an application on the ground 
that to do so involves a substantial and unreasonable diversion of the agency's resources 
away from their use in the exercise of its functions. Currently, such a refusal is not 
reviewable under the Act. 

The amendments classify the refusal to deal with the application as an ordinary 
refusal of access. This will allow a person aggrieved by a refusal to apply to the agency 
concerned for review of the determination under section 34, to apply for the review of 
the refusal by the Ombudsman under section 52 and to appeal to the Court against the 
refusal under section 53. 



5 

Freedom of Information (Amendment) Act 1992 No. 38 

SCHEDULE 1—AMENDMENTS--continued 

t The amendments also enable a review or appeal to be made in the case of a refusal of 
an agency to deal with an application because of the applicant's failure to pay an 
advance deposit. 

Amendments—refusal of access to old documents 

(5) Section 25 (Refusal of access): 
From section 25 (1) (d), omit "agency; or", insert instead 
"agency.". 
Omit section 25 (1) (e) and (2). 

Transitional provision—item (5) 

The amendments extend to applications pending on the commencement of the 
amendments but do not apply to applications that have been dealt with before the 
commencement of the amendments. 

Explanatory note—item (5) 

The amendments remove the right of an agency to refuse access to a document on the 
ground that the document came into existence more than 5 years before the 
commencement of the Act. 

Amendment—report by Ombudsman 

(6) Section 52 (Review by the Ombudsman): 
After section 52 (5), insert: 

(6) In a report under section 26 of the Ombudsman Act 
1974 of an investigation of a determination made by an 
agency under this Act, the Ombudsman may recommend: 

that the public release of the document concerned 
would, on balance, be in the public interest even 
though access has been duly refused because it is an 
exempt document; or 
that any general procedure of the agency in relation to 
dealing with applications made under this Act be 
changed to conform more closely to the objects and 
requirements of this Act. 

(7) Any part of a report under section 26 of the 
Ombudsman Act 1974 of an investigation of a determination 
made by an agency under this Act (except any part of such a 
report on a question of law or containing a recommendation 



6 

Freedom of Information (Amendment) Act 1992 No. 38 

SCHEDULE 1—AMENDMENTS 	continued 

referred to in subsection (6)) is admissible in evidence in any 
proceedings before the Supreme Court or District Court 
under this Act if that part of the report is relevant to the 
proceedings. 

Transitional provision—item (6) 

The amendment applies to reports made after the commencement of the amendment, 
whether the investigation or application for access was made before or after that 
commencement. 

Explanatory note—item (6) 

The amendment empowers the Ombudsman, when reporting on an investigation of 
the conduct of any person or body in relation to a determination made by the agency, to 
recommend that a document should be released in the public interest (despite the fact 
that it is an exempt document) or to make recommendations for changes to the agency's 
general FOI procedures. 

t The amendment also provides for certain reports of the Ombudsman relating to a 
review under the Act to be admissible in evidence in proceedings on an appeal to the 
Supreme Court or District Court concerning the matter. 

Amendments—review and confirmation of Ministerial certificates for 
restricted documents 

(7) Section 57: 
Omit the section, insert instead: 
Consideration of restricted documents 

57. (1) The District Court may, on the application of the 
appellant, consider the grounds on which it is claimed that a 
document is a restricted document, but only if the document 
is not subject to a Ministerial certificate. 

(2) In any proceedings under this section, the District 
Court is, on the application of the Minister administering this 
Act, or the agency or Minister concerned, to receive evidence 
and hear argument in the absence of: 

the public; 
the appellant; and 
if in the opinion of the District Court it is necessary to 
do so to prevent the disclosure of any exempt matter—
the appellant's representative. 



7 

Freedom of Information (Amendment) Act 1992 No. 38 

SCHEDULE 1—AMENDMENTS—continued 

If the District Court is not satisfied, by evidence on 
affidavit or otherwise, that there are reasonable grounds for 
the claim, it may require the document to be produced in 
evidence before it. 

If, after considering any document produced before it, 
the District Court is still not satisfied that there are 
reasonable grounds for the claim, the District Court is to 
reject the claim when determining the appeal. 

The District Court is not to reject the claim unless it 
has given the Minister administering this Act a reasonable 
opportunity to appear and be heard in relation to the matter. 

For the purposes of any proceedings under this section, 
the Minister administering this Act is a party to the 
proceedings. 

(8) Part 5, Division 3: 
After section 58, insert: 

Division 3—Review by the Supreme Court 
Review by the Supreme Court 

58A. (1) The Supreme Court may, on the application of the 
appellant in proceedings before the District Court under 
Division 2, consider the grounds on which it is claimed that a 
document that is the subject of a Ministerial certificate is a 
restricted document. 

(2) In any proceedings under this section, the Supreme 
Court is, on the application of the Minister administering this 
Act, or the agency or Minister concerned, to receive evidence 
and hear argument in the absence of: 

the public; 
the appellant; and 
if in the opinion of the Supreme Court it is necessary 
to do so to prevent the disclosure of any exempt 
matter—the appellant's representative. 

(3) For the purposes of any proceedings under this section, 
the Minister administering this Act is a party to the 
proceedings. 



8 

Freedom of Information (Amendment) Act 1992 No. 38 

SCHEDULE 1—AMENDMENTS--continued 

Consideration of documents the subject of a Ministerial 
certificate 

58B. (1) If, in proceedings under section 58A, the 
Supreme Court is not satisfied, by evidence on affidavit or 
otherwise, that there are reasonable grounds for the claim that 
the document is a restricted document, it may require the 
document to be produced in evidence before it. 

(2) If, after considering any document produced before it, 
the Supreme Court is still not satisfied that there are 
reasonable grounds for the claim, the Supreme Court is to 
make an order to that effect and remit the matter to the 
District Court. 

(3) The Supreme Court is not to make such an order unless 
it has given the Minister administering this Act a reasonable 
opportunity to appear and be heard in relation to the matter. 

(4) A Ministerial certificate which is the subject of an 
order under this section: 

subject to paragraph (b)—ceases to have effect when 
the order takes effect; or 
in the case of a certificate that states that the document 
is a restricted document by virtue of clause 1 (Cabinet 
documents) or clause 2 (Executive Council documents) 
of Part 1 of Schedule 1—ceases to have effect at the 
end of the period of 28 days after the order is made, 
unless the certificate is confirmed in accordance with 
section 58C. 

(5) If the Minister administering this Act withdraws the 
Ministerial certificate before the end of the period of 28 days 
after the order is made, the Minister must, as soon as 
practicable, cause notice to be served on the appellant, and on 
the agency or Minister concerned, that the certificate is no 
longer in force. 
Confirmation of a Ministerial certificate for Cabinet and 
Executive Council documents 

58C. (1) A Ministerial certificate that is the subject of an 
order under section 58B may be confirmed by the Minister 
administering this Act, but only if it is a certificate to which 
this section applies. 



9 

Freedom of Information (Amendment) Act 1992 No. 38 

SCHEDULE 1—AMENDMENTS 	continued 

(2) This section applies to a Ministerial certificate that 
states that the specified document is a restricted document by 
virtue of clause 1 (Cabinet documents) or clause 2 (Executive 
Council documents) of Part 1 of Schedule 1. 

(3) The Minister administering this Act must cause notice 
of the confirmation to be given to the agency or Minister 
concerned. 

(4) The notice must be given before the end of 28 days 
after an order is made by the Supreme Court in relation to the 
Ministerial certificate. 

(5) The notice must specify: 
the reasons for the Minister's decision to confirm the 
certificate; and 
the findings on any material questions of fact 
underlying those reasons, together with a reference to 
the sources of information on which those findings are 
based. 

(6) The Minister must cause a copy of the notice to be 
given to the appellant and a further copy to be tabled in each 
House of Parliament within 5 sitting days after the giving of 
the notice. 

(7) Nothing in this section requires any matter to be 
included in a notice if it is of such a nature that its inclusion 
in the notice would cause the notice to be an exempt 
document. 

Transitional provision—items (7) and (8) 

The amendments apply only to applications made after the commencement of the 
amendments. 

Explanatory note—items (7) and (8) 

Documents referred to in Part 1 of Schedule 1 are restricted documents. The 
categories of restricted documents at present include Cabinet documents, Executive 
Council documents, documents affecting law enforcement and public safety and 
documents exempt under the Freedom of Information legislation of the Commonwealth 
or other States. 

Section 59 provides that when a Minister signs a certificate that states that a specified 
document is a restricted document because of a specific provision of Part 1 of Schedule 
1, the Ministerial certificate is taken to be conclusive evidence of that fact. 



10 

Freedom of Information (Amendment) Act 1992 No. 38 

SCHEDULE 1—AMENDMENTS—continued 

Currently, the District Court has power to consider the grounds on which a document 
is claimed to be a restricted document even if that document is the subject of a 
Ministerial certificate. 

The amendments provide for the Supreme Court to consider documents the subject of 
a Ministerial certificate and remove the District Court's power to do so. The Supreme 
Court may order that there are no reasonable grounds for the claim. Under the 
amendments the power of the Minister to confirm a certificate is to be limited to 
restricted documents that are Cabinet documents or Executive Council documents. 

Amendments—particulars in Ministerial certificates for restricted 
documents 

(9) Section 59 (Ministerial certificates): 
From section 59 (1), omit "section 57", insert instead 
"Division 3 of Part 5". 
After section 59 (1), insert: 

(1A) A certificate under this section must specify: 
the reasons for the Minister's decision that the 
document is a restricted document; and 
the findings on any material questions of fact 
underlying those reasons, together with a reference to 
the sources of information on which those findings are 
based. 

(1B) A copy of a certificate under this section is to be 
given to an applicant seeking access to the document 
concerned. Such a copy is, for the purposes of section 28 (2) 
(e), sufficient notice to the applicant of the reasons for the 
refusal of access and the relevant findings underlying those 
reasons. 

(c) After section 59 (3), insert: 
(4) Nothing in this section requires any matter to be 

included in a certificate if it is of such a nature that its 
inclusion in the certificate would cause the certificate to be 
an exempt document. 

Transitional provision—item (9) 
The amendments apply only to certificates issued after the commencement of the 

amendments. 



11 

Freedom of Information (Amendment) Act 1992 No. 38 

SCHEDULE 1—AMENDMENTS—continued 

Explanatory note—item (9) 

At present Ministerial certificates are only required to specify the provision of the 
Act under which it is claimed the document is a restricted document. The amendments 
require Ministerial certificates to include details of the grounds on which the specified 
document is certified to be a restricted document. The requirement is expressed in the 
same terms as the requirement for an agency to give reasons for denying access to a 
document (s. 28 (2) (e)) and the requirement for the Minister to give reasons when 
confirming a certificate (existing s. 57 (9) and proposed s. 58C (5)). 

Amendment—definition of "public interest" 

(10) Section 59A: 
After section 59, insert: 
Public interest 

59A. For the purpose of determining under this Act 
whether the disclosure of a document would be contrary to 
the public interest it is irrelevant that the disclosure may: 

cause embarrassment to the Government or a loss of 
confidence in the Government; or 
cause the applicant to misinterpret or misunderstand 
the information contained in the document because of 
an omission from the document or for any other 
reason. 

Transitional provision—item (10) 

The amendment applies to determinations whether made before or after the 
commencement of the amendment. 

Explanatory note—item (10) 
Section 25 currently provides that an agency may refuse access to a document if it is 

an exempt document. Many categories of exempt documents are exempt only if on 
balance the disclosure would be contrary to the public interest. The amendment defines 
"public interest" to remove the possibility of embarrassment to the Government or 
confusion to the applicant caused by the disclosure being taken into account. 

Amendment—review of certain determinations relating to charges 

(11) Section 67 (Fees and charges): 
After section 67 (3), insert: 

(3A) The guidelines in force under this section are to be 
taken into account: 



12 

Freedom of Information (Amendment) Act 1992 No. 38 

SCHEDULE 1—AMENDMENTS 	continued 

by the District Court when reviewing a determination 
described in section 53 (3) (a) (iv) or (v); and 
by the Ombudsman when reviewing the conduct of a 
person or body in relation to such a determination. 

(3B) A charge under this Act for dealing with an 
application or for giving access to a document is not to 
include any amount for additional time spent in searching for 
a document that was lost or misplaced. 

Transitional provision—item (11) 

The amendment applies only to an appeal from a determination made after the 
commencement of the amendment. 

Explanatory note—item (11) 

Section 53 creates a right of appeal in relation to a determination by an agency to 
impose a charge for providing access to documents which the applicant considers to be 
unreasonable or to impose a charge for dealing with the application which the applicant 
considers to have been unreasonably incurred. 

The amendment requires the District Court, in reviewing such a determination, to 
have regard to any guidelines relating to fees and charges published by the Minister in 
accordance with section 67. The Ombudsman will also be required to have regard to 
those guidelines when reviewing the conduct of a person or body in relation to such a 
determination. 

t The amendment also provides that a charge may not be made by an agency under the 
Act for additional time spent in searching for a document that was lost or misplaced. 

Amendment—Ministerial certificates for restricted documents under 
other FOI legislation 

(12) Schedule 1 (Exempt documents): 
Omit clause 3 of Schedule 1 and insert it (re-numbered as 
clause 21) after clause 20 of that Schedule. 

Transitional provision—item (12) 

The amendment applies only to applications made after the commencement of the 
amendment. 

Explanatory note—item (12) 

Under the current Act exempt documents under the Freedom of Information 
legislation of the Commonwealth or Victoria are categorised as restricted documents. 
The amendment provides that such documents are not restricted documents but are still 



13 

Freedom of Information (Amendment) Act 1992 No. 38 

SCHEDULE 1—AMENDMENTS—continued 

exempt documents. An agency will continue to be able to deny access to the documents 
on the grounds that they are exempt, but a Ministerial certificate cannot be issued in 
relation to them. 

Amendments—revision of references to Police Force 

(13) Schedule 1 (Exempt documents): 
From clause 4 (3) (a), omit "State Intelligence Group of the 
Police Force", insert instead "State Intelligence Group of the 
Police Service". 
From clause 4 (3) (b), omit "former Special Branch of the 
Police Force", insert instead "Special Branch of the Police 
Service". 

Explanatory Note—item (13) 

The amendments revise references to the Police Service. 

Amendments—bodies and offices exempt from Act 

(14) Schedule 2 (Exempt bodies and offices): 
From the matter relating to the Auditor-General, omit "all 
functions", insert instead "investigative, audit and report 
functions". 
From the matter relating to the Director of Public 
Prosecutions, omit "all functions", insert instead 
"prosecuting functions". 
From the matter relating to the Independent Commission 
Against Corruption, omit "all functions", insert instead 
"corruption prevention, complaint handling, investigative 
and report functions". 
Omit the matter relating to the State Bank, insert instead: 

The State Bank of New South Wales Limited and any of 
its subsidiaries—all functions. 

Omit the matter relating to GIO Australia Holdings Limited. 
Omit the matter relating to State owned corporations. 

Transitional provision—item (14) 

The amendments apply only to applications made after the commencement of the 
amendments. 



14 

Freedom of Information (Amendment) Act 1992 No. 38 

SCHEDULE 1—AMENDMENTS 	continued 

Explanatory note—item (14) 

The amendment varies the schedule of bodies and offices which are exempt from the 
operation of the Act in relation to the functions specified. The exemption for the 
Auditor-General, DPP and ICAC is being restricted to their operational functions (as is 
the case with the exemption for the Ombudsman). The general exemption for State 
owned corporations is being removed except for the State Bank on the basis that any 
such exemption should be limited to such a corporation that operates in a competitive 
market. The exemption for the GIO is being removed since it will not be necessary 
following its privatisation. 

[Minister's second reading speech made in— 
Legislative Assembly on 5 	Ma,cl. 1992 	7-6 Marr....\-, 161c1.2. 
Legislative Council on 6 May 1992] 

BY AUTHORITY 
R. I. MILLIGAN, ACTING GOVERNMENT PRINTER-I992 


