
FIRST PRINT 

CATTLE COMPENSATION (AMENDMENT) BILL 1993 

NEW SOUTH WALES 

EXPLANATORY NOTE 

(This Explanatory Note relates to this Bill as introduced into Parliament) 

The object of this Bill is to amend the Cattle Compensation Act 1951 so as: 
to authorise payments to be made from the Cattle Compensation Fund to finance 
research and other programs benefiting the cattle industry; and 
to provide for the establishment of an Advisory Council to advise the Minister in 
relation to certain expenditure proposed to be made from the Fund (including 
research grants) and in relation to the extension of the provisions of the Act to 
any particular disease, condition or infestation of cattle to which the Act does not 
currently apply; and 
to require that a review of the purposes and operations of the Fund be undertaken 
in 5 years' time. 

Clause 1 specifies the short title of the proposed Act. 

Clause 2 provides for the commencement of the proposed Act on the date of assent. 

Clause 3 gives effect to Schedule 1 which contains amendments to the Cattle 
Compensation Act 1951. 

Clause 4 provides that the amendment relating to the reduction of administration 
costs payable out of the Fund extends to the payment due in the year commencing 1 
July 1993 in relation to the 12 month period ending on 30 June 1993. 

SCHEDULE 1—AMENDMENTS 

Research funding 

Currently, money can be paid from the Cattle Compensation Fund only for the 
purpose of compensating owners of certain cattle and carcasses and for meeting the 
costs of administering the Act. The latter costs amount to 5% of the amount paid into 
the Fund each year. 



2 

Cattle Compensation (Amendment) 1993 

Schedule 1 (2) amends section 12 (3) to reduce the administration costs payable to 
1% of the Fund's yearly income. That amendment applies to the payments due in the 
year commencing 1 July 1993 and in later years. Section 12 is also amended to permit 
money to be paid from the Fund for the purposes of research or other programs which 
the Minister considers are of benefit to the cattle industry. All such payments from the 
Fund are to be authorised by the Minister with the concurrence of the Premier. 

Advisory Council 

Schedule 1 (3) inserts proposed section 161 which provides for the establishment of 
an Advisory Council. The function of the Council is to advise the Minister in relation to 
payments proposed to be made from the Fund in response to requests for research 
funding and other grants and in relation to whether the operation of the Act should be 
extended to provide for the payment of compensation in relation to any disease, 
condition or infestation of cattle to which the Act does not apply. 

Review of Fund 
Schedule 1 (3) also inserts proposed section 16J which requires the Minister to 

conduct a review of the operation of the Fund 5 years after the commencement of the 
proposed Act. 



FIRST PRINT 

CATTLE COMPENSATION (AMENDMENT) BILL 1993 

NEW SOUTH WALES 

TABLE OF PROVISIONS 
Short title 
Commencement 
Amendment of Cattle Compensation Act 1951 No. 26 
Transitional 

SCHEDULE 1—AMENDMENTS 

w 

t 





CATTLE COMPENSATION (AMENDMENT) BILL 1993 

NEW SOUTH WALES 

No. 	, 1993 

A BILL FOR 

An Act to amend the Cattle Compensation Act 1951 in relation to the 
Cattle Compensation Fund; and for other purposes. 

i 



2 

Cattle Compensation (Amendment) 1993 

The Legislature of New South Wales enacts: 
Short title 

This Act may be cited as the Cattle Compensation (Amendment) 
Act 1993. 

5 Commencement 
This Act commences on the date of assent. 

Amendment of Cattle Compensation Act 1951 No. 26 
The Cattle Compensation Act 1951 is amended as set out in 

Schedule 1. 

10 Transitional 
The amendment to section 12 (3) of the Cattle Compensation Act 

1951 made by Schedule 1 (2) (b) to this Act starts to operate in relation to 
the payment out of the Fund for the year commencing 1 July 1993 (such 
payment being calculated by reference to the sum paid to the credit of the 

15 Fund during the 12 month period ending on 30 June 1993) but does not 
extend to earlier payments. 

SCHEDULE 1—AMENDMENTS 
(Sec. 3) 

Section 2 (Division into Parts): 
20 	 Omit the section. 

Section 12 (Establishment of Fund): 
After section 12 (3) (a), insert: 

(b) amounts authorised under subsection (6); and 
From section 12 (3), omit "5 per cent", insert instead "1 per 

25 	 cent". 
After section 12 (5), insert: 

(6) The Minister may, with the concurrence of the Premier, 
authorise the Fund to be applied for: 

(a) the conduct by any person of research, inquiries, 
30 	 investigations, surveys and tests in relation to the cattle 

industry; and 



3 

Cattle Compensation (Amendment) 1993 

SCHEDULE 1—AMENDMENTS—continued 

(b) any other purpose which is, in the opinion of the 
Minister, of benefit to the cattle industry. 

(3) Part 3, Division 4: 
After section 16H, insert: 	 5 

Division 4—Miscellaneous matters 
Advisory Council 

161. (1) The Minister may establish a Cattle Compensation 
Advisory Council. 

The regulations may make machinery provisions for or 	10 
with respect to the constitution and procedure of the 
Advisory Council, including the appointment of members, 
the term of office of members and the vacation of office by 
members. 

The functions of the Advisory Council are, when 	15 
requested by the Minister: 

to advise the Minister in relation to payments made, or 
proposed to be made, out of the Fund for the purposes 
referred to in section 12 (6); and 
to advise the Minister as to whether the provisions of 	20 
this Act should be extended to any particular disease, 
condition or infestation of cattle. 

Review of the Fund 
16J. The Minister is to review the purposes and operation 

of the Fund as soon as possible after the period of 5 years 	25 
from the date of assent to the Cattle Compensation 
(Amendment) Act 1993. 



i 

t 



CATTLE COMPENSATION (AMENDMENT) ACT 1993 No. 21 

NEW SOUTH WALES 

TABLE OF PROVISIONS 
Short title 
Commencement 
Amendment of Cattle Compensation Act 1951 No. 26 
Transitional 

SCHEDULE 1—AMENDMENTS 

!8] 



I 



CATTLE COMPENSATION (AMENDMENT) ACT 1993 No. 21 

NEW SOUTH WALES 

Act No. 21, 1993 

An Act to amend the Cattle Compensation Act 1951 in relation to the 
Cattle Compensation Fund; and for other purposes. [Assented to 8 June 
1993] 



2 

Cattle Compensation (Amendment) Act 1993 No. 21 

The Legislature of New South Wales enacts: 
Short title 

This Act may be cited as the Cattle Compensation (Amendment) 
Act 1993. 

Commencement 
This Act commences on the date of assent. 

Amendment of Cattle Compensation Act 1951 No. 26 
The Cattle Compensation Act 1951 is amended as set out in 

Schedule 1. 

Transitional 
The amendment to section 12 (3) of the Cattle Compensation Act 

1951 made by Schedule 1 (2) (b) to this Act starts to operate in relation to 
the payment out of the Fund for the year commencing 1 July 1993 (such 
payment being calculated by reference to the sum paid to the credit of the 
Fund during the 12 month period ending on 30 June 1993) but does not 
extend to earlier payments. 

SCHEDULE 1—AMENDMENTS 
(Sec. 3) 

Section 2 (Division into Parts): 
Omit the section. 

Section 12 (Establishment of Fund): 
After section 12 (3) (a), insert: 

(b) amounts authorised under subsection (6); and 
From section 12 (3), omit "5 per cent", insert instead "1 per 
cent". 
After section 12 (5), insert: 

(6) The Minister may, with the concurrence of the Premier, 
authorise the Fund to be applied for: 

the conduct by any person of research, inquiries, 
investigations, surveys and tests in relation to the cattle 
industry; and 
any other purpose which is, in the opinion of the 
Minister, of benefit to the cattle industry. 



3 

Cattle Compensation (Amendment) Act 1993 No. 21 

SCHEDULE 1—AMENDMENTS—continued 

(3) Part 3, Division 4: 
After section 16H, insert: 

Division 4—Miscellaneous matters 
Advisory Council 

161. (1) The Minister may establish a Cattle Compensation 
Advisory Council. 

The regulations may make machinery provisions for or 
with respect to the constitution and procedure of the 
Advisory Council, including the appointment of members, 
the term of office of members and the vacation of office by 
members. 

The functions of the Advisory. Council are, when 
requested by the Minister: 

to advise the Minister in relation to payments made, or 
proposed to be made, out of the Fund for the purposes 
referred to in section 12 (6); and 
to advise the Minister as to whether the provisions of 
this Act should be extended to any particular disease, 
condition or infestation of cattle. 

Review of the Fund 
16J. The Minister is to review the purposes and operation 

of the Fund as soon as possible after the period of 5 years 
from the date of assent to the Cattle Compensation 
(Amendment) Act 1993. 

[Minister's second reading speech made in—
Legislative Assembly on 12 May 1993 
Legislative Council on 21 May 1993] 

BY AUTHORITY 
R. J. MILLIGAN. ACTING GOVERNMENT PRINTER-1993 





FIRST PRINT 

CATTLE COMPENSATION (AMENDMENT) BILL 1993 

NEW SOUTH WALES 

EXPLANATORY NOTE 

(This Explanatory Note relates to this Bill as introduced into Parliament) 

The object of this Bill is to amend the Cattle Compensation Act 1951 so as: 
to authorise payments to be made from the Cattle Compensation Fund to finance 
research and other programs benefiting the cattle industry; and 
to provide for the establishment of an Advisory Council to advise the Minister in 
relation to certain expenditure proposed to be made from the Fund (including 
research grants) and in relation to the extension of the provisions of the Act to 
any particular disease, condition or infestation of cattle to which the Act does not 
currently apply; and 
to require that a review of the purposes and operations of the Fund be undertaken 
in 5 years' time. 

Clause 1 specifies the short title of the proposed Act. 

Clause 2 provides for the commencement of the proposed Act on the date of assent. 

Clause 3 gives effect to Schedule 1 which contains amendments to the Cattle 
Compensation Act 1951. 

Clause 4 provides that the amendment relating to the reduction of administration 
costs payable out of the Fund extends to the payment due in the year commencing 1 
July 1993 in relation to the 12 month period ending on 30 June 1993. 

SCHEDULE 1—AMENDMENTS 

Research funding 

Currently, money can be paid from the Cattle Compensation Fund only for the 
purpose of compensating owners of certain cattle and carcasses and for meeting the 
costs of administering the Act. The latter costs amount to 5% of the amount paid into 
the Fund each year. 



2 

Cattle Compensation (Amendment) 1993 

Schedule 1 (2) amends section 12 (3) to reduce the administration costs payable to 
1% of the Fund's yearly income. That amendment applies to the payments due in the 
year commencing 1 July 1993 and in later years. Section 12 is also amended to permit 
money to be paid from the Fund for the purposes of research or other programs which 
the Minister considers are of benefit to the cattle industry. All such payments from the 
Fund are to be authorised by the Minister with the concurrence of the Premier. 

Advisory Council 

Schedule 1 (3) inserts proposed section 161 which provides for the establishment of 
an Advisory Council. The function of the Council is to advise the Minister in relation to 
payments proposed to be made from the Fund in response to requests for research 
funding and other grants and in relation to whether the operation of the Act should be 
extended to provide for the payment of compensation in relation to any disease, 
condition or infestation of cattle to which the Act does not apply. 

Review of Fund 
Schedule 1 (3) also inserts proposed section 16J which requires the Minister to 

conduct a review of the operation of the Fund 5 years after the commencement of the 
proposed Act. 



FIRST PRINT 

CATTLE COMPENSATION (AMENDMENT) BILL 1993 

NEW SOUTH WALES 

TABLE OF PROVISIONS 
Short title 
Commencement 
Amendment of Cattle Compensation Act 1951 No. 26 
Transitional 

SCHEDULE 1—AMENDMENTS 

w 

t 





CATTLE COMPENSATION (AMENDMENT) BILL 1993 

NEW SOUTH WALES 

No. 	, 1993 

A BILL FOR 

An Act to amend the Cattle Compensation Act 1951 in relation to the 
Cattle Compensation Fund; and for other purposes. 

i 



2 

Cattle Compensation (Amendment) 1993 

The Legislature of New South Wales enacts: 
Short title 

This Act may be cited as the Cattle Compensation (Amendment) 
Act 1993. 

5 Commencement 
This Act commences on the date of assent. 

Amendment of Cattle Compensation Act 1951 No. 26 
The Cattle Compensation Act 1951 is amended as set out in 

Schedule 1. 

10 Transitional 
The amendment to section 12 (3) of the Cattle Compensation Act 

1951 made by Schedule 1 (2) (b) to this Act starts to operate in relation to 
the payment out of the Fund for the year commencing 1 July 1993 (such 
payment being calculated by reference to the sum paid to the credit of the 

15 Fund during the 12 month period ending on 30 June 1993) but does not 
extend to earlier payments. 

SCHEDULE 1—AMENDMENTS 
(Sec. 3) 

Section 2 (Division into Parts): 
20 	 Omit the section. 

Section 12 (Establishment of Fund): 
After section 12 (3) (a), insert: 

(b) amounts authorised under subsection (6); and 
From section 12 (3), omit "5 per cent", insert instead "1 per 

25 	 cent". 
After section 12 (5), insert: 

(6) The Minister may, with the concurrence of the Premier, 
authorise the Fund to be applied for: 

(a) the conduct by any person of research, inquiries, 
30 	 investigations, surveys and tests in relation to the cattle 

industry; and 



3 

Cattle Compensation (Amendment) 1993 

SCHEDULE 1—AMENDMENTS—continued 

(b) any other purpose which is, in the opinion of the 
Minister, of benefit to the cattle industry. 

(3) Part 3, Division 4: 
After section 16H, insert: 	 5 

Division 4—Miscellaneous matters 
Advisory Council 

161. (1) The Minister may establish a Cattle Compensation 
Advisory Council. 

The regulations may make machinery provisions for or 	10 
with respect to the constitution and procedure of the 
Advisory Council, including the appointment of members, 
the term of office of members and the vacation of office by 
members. 

The functions of the Advisory Council are, when 	15 
requested by the Minister: 

to advise the Minister in relation to payments made, or 
proposed to be made, out of the Fund for the purposes 
referred to in section 12 (6); and 
to advise the Minister as to whether the provisions of 	20 
this Act should be extended to any particular disease, 
condition or infestation of cattle. 

Review of the Fund 
16J. The Minister is to review the purposes and operation 

of the Fund as soon as possible after the period of 5 years 	25 
from the date of assent to the Cattle Compensation 
(Amendment) Act 1993. 



i 

t 



CATTLE COMPENSATION (AMENDMENT) ACT 1993 No. 21 

NEW SOUTH WALES 

TABLE OF PROVISIONS 
Short title 
Commencement 
Amendment of Cattle Compensation Act 1951 No. 26 
Transitional 

SCHEDULE 1—AMENDMENTS 

!8] 



I 



CATTLE COMPENSATION (AMENDMENT) ACT 1993 No. 21 

NEW SOUTH WALES 

Act No. 21, 1993 

An Act to amend the Cattle Compensation Act 1951 in relation to the 
Cattle Compensation Fund; and for other purposes. [Assented to 8 June 
1993] 



2 

Cattle Compensation (Amendment) Act 1993 No. 21 

The Legislature of New South Wales enacts: 
Short title 

This Act may be cited as the Cattle Compensation (Amendment) 
Act 1993. 

Commencement 
This Act commences on the date of assent. 

Amendment of Cattle Compensation Act 1951 No. 26 
The Cattle Compensation Act 1951 is amended as set out in 

Schedule 1. 

Transitional 
The amendment to section 12 (3) of the Cattle Compensation Act 

1951 made by Schedule 1 (2) (b) to this Act starts to operate in relation to 
the payment out of the Fund for the year commencing 1 July 1993 (such 
payment being calculated by reference to the sum paid to the credit of the 
Fund during the 12 month period ending on 30 June 1993) but does not 
extend to earlier payments. 

SCHEDULE 1—AMENDMENTS 
(Sec. 3) 

Section 2 (Division into Parts): 
Omit the section. 

Section 12 (Establishment of Fund): 
After section 12 (3) (a), insert: 

(b) amounts authorised under subsection (6); and 
From section 12 (3), omit "5 per cent", insert instead "1 per 
cent". 
After section 12 (5), insert: 

(6) The Minister may, with the concurrence of the Premier, 
authorise the Fund to be applied for: 

the conduct by any person of research, inquiries, 
investigations, surveys and tests in relation to the cattle 
industry; and 
any other purpose which is, in the opinion of the 
Minister, of benefit to the cattle industry. 



3 

Cattle Compensation (Amendment) Act 1993 No. 21 

SCHEDULE 1—AMENDMENTS—continued 

(3) Part 3, Division 4: 
After section 16H, insert: 

Division 4—Miscellaneous matters 
Advisory Council 

161. (1) The Minister may establish a Cattle Compensation 
Advisory Council. 

The regulations may make machinery provisions for or 
with respect to the constitution and procedure of the 
Advisory Council, including the appointment of members, 
the term of office of members and the vacation of office by 
members. 

The functions of the Advisory. Council are, when 
requested by the Minister: 

to advise the Minister in relation to payments made, or 
proposed to be made, out of the Fund for the purposes 
referred to in section 12 (6); and 
to advise the Minister as to whether the provisions of 
this Act should be extended to any particular disease, 
condition or infestation of cattle. 

Review of the Fund 
16J. The Minister is to review the purposes and operation 

of the Fund as soon as possible after the period of 5 years 
from the date of assent to the Cattle Compensation 
(Amendment) Act 1993. 

[Minister's second reading speech made in—
Legislative Assembly on 12 May 1993 
Legislative Council on 21 May 1993] 

BY AUTHORITY 
R. J. MILLIGAN. ACTING GOVERNMENT PRINTER-1993 




