INCLOSED LANDS PROTECTION (AMENDMENT) ACT 1989
No. 199

NEW SOUTH WALES

TABLE OF PROVISIONS
1. Short title
2. Commencement
3. Amendment of Inclosed Lands Protection Act 1901 No. 33

SCHEDULE 1 - AMENDMENTS

(4]






INCLOSED LANDS PROTECTION (AMENDMENT) ACT 1989
No. 199

NEW SOUTH WALES

Fay.
SEL
S o o U

‘v‘

30

Act No. 199, 1989

An Act to amend the Inclosed Lands Protection Act 1901 in relation
to penalties for offences against that Act. [Assented to 21 December
1989]




Inclosed Lands Protection ( Amendment) 1989

The Legislature of New South Wales enacts: ‘

Short title
1. This Act may be cited as the Inclosed Lands Protection
(Amendment) Act 1989.
Commencement '
2. This Act commences on a day or days to be appointed by
proclamation.
Amendment of Inclosed Lands Protection Act 1901 No. 33

3. The Inclosed Lands Protection Act 1901 is amended as set out in
Schedule 1.

SCHEDULE 1 - AMENDMENTS
(Sec. 3)

(1) Section 4 (Penalty for unlawful entry upon inclosed lands):
From section 4 (1), omit "$100", insert instead "$500".

(2) Section 4A (Offensive conduct while upon inclosed lands):
From section 4A (1), omit "$500", insert instead "$1,000".

(3) Section 5 (Penalty on leaving gate open):
Omit "$100" wherever occurring, insert instead "$200".

[ Minister's second reading speech made in -
Legislative Assembly on 28 November 1989
Legislative Council on 8 December 1989]

BY AUTHORITY ‘

G. J. COSTELLOE, ACTING GOVERNMENT PRINTER - 1989



FIRST PRINT

INCLOSED LANDS PROTECTION (AMENDMENT) BILL 1989

NEW SOUTH WALES

. a

l"

*J"‘l

F“« M

EXPLANATORY NOTE
(This Explanatory Note relates to this Bill as introduced into Parliament)

This Bill is cognate with the Crimes (Amendment) Bill 1989.

The object of this Bill is to amend the Inclosed Lands Protection Act 1901, so as
to increase certain penalties.

Clause 1 specifies the short title of the proposed Act.
Clause 2 provides for the proposed Act to commence by proclamation.
Clause 3 is a formal provision giving effect to the Schedule of amendments.

SCHEDULE 1 - AMENDMENTS
Schedule 1 (1) increases the penalty for unlawful entry on inclosed lands.
Schedule 1 (2) increases the penalty for offensive conduct while on inclosed lands.
Schedule 1 (3) increases the penalty for leaving certain gates open.







' FIRST PRINT
INCLOSED LANDS PROTECTION (AMENDMENT) BILL 1989
|
|

1. Short title
2. Commencement
3. Amendment of Inclosed Lands Protection Act 1901 No. 33

SCHEDULE 1 - AMENDMENTS

TABLE OF PROVISIONS
\






INCLOSED LANDS PROTECTION (AMENDMENT) BILL 1989

NEW SOUTH WALES

A BILL FOR

An Act to amend the Inclosed Lands Protection Act 1901 in relation
to penalties for offences against that Act.




Inclosed Lands Protection ( Amendment) 1989

The Legislature of New South Wales enacts:

Short title

1. This Act may be cited as the Inclosed Lands Protection
(Amendment) Act 1989.
Commencement

2. This Act commences on a day or days to be appointed by
proclamation.
Amendment of Inclosed Lands Protection Act 1901 No. 33

3. The Inclosed Lands Protection Act 1901 is amended as set out in
Schedule 1.

SCHEDULE 1 - AMENDMENTS
(Sec. 3)

(1) Section 4 (Penalty for unlawful entry upon inclosed lands):
From section 4 (1), omit "$100", insert instead "$500".

(2) Section 4A (Offensive conduct while upon inclosed lands):
From section 4A (1), omit "$500", insert instead "$1,000".

(3) Section 5 (Penalty on leaving gate open):
Omit "$100" wherever occurring, insert instead "$200".

A —



