
FIRST PRINT 

DRUG MISUSE AND TRAFFICKING (AMENDMENT) BILL 
1988 

NEW SOUTH WALES 

EXPLANATORY NOTE 

(This Explanatory Note relates to this Bill as introduced into Parliament) 

The object of this Bill is to amend the Drug Misuse and Trafficking Act 1985 so as— 
to redefine the term "cannabis resin" for the purposes of that Act by restricting 
it to separated resin; and 
to increase penalties for indictable offences under that Act when they are dealt 
with by Local Courts; and 
to provide graded penalties for offences involving commercial quantities of 
prohibited plants or drugs; and 
to permit suitably qualified persons to give certificate evidence of the identity 
and quantity of cannabis plants and cannabis leaf; and 
to vary the quantities of prohibited plants and drugs in different categories, the 
result generally being to increase the "traffickable", "small" and "indictable" 
quantities and to reduce the "commercial" quantities of those plants and drugs 
for the purposes of that Act; and 
to establish an additional category of "large commercial quantity" for prohibited 
plants and drugs for the purpose of the graded penalties referred to above. 

The proposed "commercial quantity" of a prohibited plant or drug will be a 
considerably smaller amount than that presently fixed. The present "commercial 
quantity" will become the new "large commercial quantity". 

The Bill also makes minor amendments for the purpose of statute law revision. 

Clause 1 specifies the short title of the proposed Act. 

Clause 2 provides that the proposed Act is to commence on a day or days to be 
appointed by proclamation. 

Clause 3 defines the term "Principal Act". 

71119-25038[884] 	71— 	(24) 



2 

Drug Misuse and Trafficking (Amendment) 1988 

Clause 4 is a formal provision giving effect to the Schedule of amendments. 

Clause 5 declares that amendments to be made by the proposed Act do not apply to 
offences alleged to have been committed before the amendments commence. The only 
exception will allow certificate evidence to be given under amended provisions for the 
purpose of identifying substances or plants concerned in offences. 

SCHEDULE 1—AMENDMENTS 

"Cannabis resin" redefined 
The Bill restricts the meaning of "cannabis resin" in the Principal Act to separated 

resin obtained from cannabis leaf by substituting the definition of that term in section 
3 (Definitions) of that Act. The effect of the amendment is to exclude plants and parts 
of plants which contain more than 3% of tetrahydrocannabinol from being cannabis resin. 
They will continue to be cannabis plant or cannabis leaf for the purposes of that Act. 
(Schedule 1 (1) (a)). 

Increased penalties for indictable offences when dealt with by Local Courts 
The Bill amends section 30 (Indictable offences punishable summarily without consent 

of accused) and section 31 (Indictable offences punishable summarily with consent of 
accused) of the Principal Act so as to increase the maximum fine that may be imposed 
for those offences when dealt with by Local Courts from $2,000 to $5,000 and from 
$5,000 to $10,000 respectively. The increased penalties are expressed in penalty units, 
each of which is equivalent to $100. (Schedule 1 (3) and (4)). 

Graded penalties for offences related to commercial quantities 
The Bill replaces section 33 of the Principal Act (Penalties for offences involving 

commercial quantities). 

The penalties for an offence under that Act involving the proposed new commercial 
quantity of a prohibited drug or prohibited plant will be respectively a fine of up to 
$350,000 or imprisonment for up to 20 years, or both, and (where cannabis is involved) 
a fine of up to that amount or imprisonment for up to 15 years, or both. (Because of 
changes to be made to that Act by Schedule 1 (9), the new commercial quantities will 
be considerably lower than the present commercial quantities.) 

The penalties for an offence under that Act involving what is referred to in the 
proposed section as the "large commercial quantity" of a prohibited drug or prohibited 
plant will be respectively a fine of up to $500,000 or imprisonment for life, or both, and 
(where cannabis is involved) a fine of up to $500,000 or imprisonment for 20 years, or 
both. (These penalties apply to offences involving the present commercial quantities 
which will be equivalent to the proposed large commercial quantities.) (Schedule 1 (6)). 
The proposed monetary penalties are each expressed in penalty units. 

Evidence of cannabis plant and cannabis leaf 
The Bill amends section 43 (Certificate evidence) of the Principal Act so that analysts, 

who may now give certificate evidence of the identification of substances, will be able 
to give certificate evidence of the identification of plants. 

The Bill will also amend that section so as to provide for the appointment (by the 
Director-General of the Department of Agriculture and Fisheries) of suitably qualified 
persons who will be able to give certificates which may be used as evidence of the 
identification of cannabis plant or cannabis leaf (Schedule 1 (8)). 



3 

Drug Misuse and Trafficking (Amendment) 1988 

Variation of quantities of plants and drugs in different categories 
The Bill substitutes Schedule 1 to the Principal Act in which are set out the quantities 

of a prohibited plant or drug treated for the purposes of that Act as the "traffickable", 
"small", "indictable" and "commercial" quantities. The most important effects of the 
proposed Schedule 1 to that Act will be to increase traffickable, small and indictable 
quantities and to reduce commercial quantities (Schedule 1 (9)). 

Large commercial quantities 
The proposed Schedule 1 to the Principal Act introduces a new category of "large 

commercial quantity" as Column 5 of that Schedule. That category is essentially the same 
as the present "commercial quantity" category and is required so that courts can establish 
which penalty is applicable in sentencing for an offence involving prohibited plants or 
drugs in excess of the proposed new commercial quantities (Schedule 1 (9)). 

Because of the consequential re-numbering of Column 6 of Schedule 1 to the Principal 
Act, a minor change is made to the definition of "discrete dosage unit" in section 3 (1) 
of that Act (Schedule 1 (1) (b)). 

Minor statute law revision 
The Bill updates the reference to the Director-General of Agriculture in section 38 of 

the Principal Act (Schedule 1 (7)) and changes into penalty units the penalties expressed 
in sections 21 and 32 of the Principal Act as amounts of money. (A penalty unit is the 
equivalent of $100.) (Schedule 1 (2) and (5)). 





DRUG MISUSE AND TRAFFICKING (AMENDMENT) BILL 
1988 

NEW SOUTH WALES 

itl 

TABLE OF PROVISIONS 

Short title 
Commencement 
Meaning of "Principal Act" 
Amendment of Drug Misuse and Trafficking Act 1985 No. 226 
Operation of amendments 

SCHEDULE 1—AMENDMENTS 

71119-25038[884] 	71— 





DRUG MISUSE AND TRAFFICKING (AMENDMENT) BILL 
1988 

NEW SOUTH WALES 

No. 	, 1988 

A BILL FOR 

An Act to amend the Drug Misuse and Trafficking Act 1985 with respect 
to the categories of prohibited plants and drugs under that Act, to increase 
penalties for certain offences and for other purposes. 



2 

Drug Misuse and Trafficking (Amendment) 1988 

The Legislature of New South Wales enacts: 

Short title 
This Act may be cited as the Drug Misuse and Trafficking 

(Amendment) Act 1988. 

5 Commencement 
This Act commences on a day or days to be appointed by 

proclamation. 

Meaning of "Principal Act" 
The Drug Misuse and Trafficking Act 1985 is referred to in this Act 

10 as the Principal Act. 

Amendment of Drug Misuse and Trafficking Act 1985 No. 226 

The Principal Act is amended as set out in Schedule 1. 

Operation of amendments 
(1) An amendment made to the Principal Act by this Act does 

15 not apply to an offence alleged to have been committed before 
the commencement of the amendment, except as provided by 
subsection (2). 

(2) Section 43 (Certificate evidence) of the Principal Act, as amended by 
this Act, applies to the production of a certificate under that section after 

20 the commencement of Schedule 1 (8) whether the offence to which the 
certificate relates is alleged to have been committed before or after that 
commencement. 

SCHEDULE 1—AMENDMENTS 

(Sec. 4) 

25 	(1) Section 3 (Definitions)— 
(a) Section 3 (1), definition of "cannabis resin"— 

Omit the definition, insert instead: 

"cannabis resin" means the separated resin (whether crude or 
purified) obtained from cannabis leaf, but does not include 

30 	 cannabis oil; 



3 

Drug Misuse and Trafficking (Amendment) 1988 

SCHEDULE 1—AMENDMENTS—continued 

(b) Section 3 (1), definition of "discrete dosage unit"— 

Omit "Column 5", insert instead "Column 6". 

(2) Section 21 (Penalties)— 

Omit "$2,000", insert instead "20 penalty units". 

	

5 	(3) Section 30 (Indictable offences punishable summarily without consent 
of accused)— 

Section 30 (3)— 

Omit the subsection, insert instead: 

(3) The penalty for an offence dealt with under this section is 

	

10 	a fine of 50 penalty units or imprisonment for 2 years, or both. 

Section 31 (Indictable offences punishable summarily with consent of 
accused)— 

Section 31 (3)— 

Omit the subsection, insert instead: 

	

15 	 (3) The penalty for an offence dealt with under this section is 
a fine of 100 penalty units or imprisonment for 2 years, or both. 

Section 32 (Penalty for offences dealt with on indictment not involving 
commercial quantities)— 

Section 32 (g), (h)- 

	

20 	Omit "$200,000" wherever occurring, insert instead "2,000 
penalty units". 

Section 33— 

Omit the section, insert instead: 

Penalties for offences involving commercial quantities 

	

25 	 33. (1) This section applies to the following offences: 

an offence under section 23 (2), 24 (2) or 25 (2); 
an offence under section 26 of conspiring to commit an 
offence referred to in paragraph (a); 
an offence under section 27 of aiding, abetting, counselling, 

	

30 	 procuring, soliciting or inciting the commission of an 
offence referred to in paragraph (a); 



4 

Drug Misuse and Trafficking (Amendment) 1988 

SCHEDULE 1—AMENDMENTS—continued 

(d) an offence under section 28 of conspiring to commit, or of 
aiding, abetting, counselling or procuring the commission 
of, an offence under a law in force outside New South 
Wales which corresponds to section 23 (2), 24 (2) or 25 

	

5 	 (2). 
(2) The penalty for an offence is— 

except as provided by paragraph (b), a fine of 3,500 
penalty units or imprisonment for 20 years, or both; or 
where the offence relates to cannabis plant or cannabis leaf, 

	

10 	 a fine of 3,500 penalty units or imprisonment for 15 years, 
or both. 

(3) Despite subsection (2), if the court is satisfied that the 
offence involved not less than the large commercial quantity of 
the prohibited plant or prohibited drug concerned, the penalty for 

	

15 	the offence is— 
except as provided by paragraph (b), a fine of 5,000 
penalty units or imprisonment for life, or both; or 
where the offence relates to cannabis plant or cannabis leaf, 
a fine of 5,000 penalty units or imprisonment for 20 years, 

	

20 	 or both. 
(4) In this section— 
"large commercial quantity", in relation to a prohibited plant 

or prohibited drug, means the number or amount, if any, 
specified opposite the plant or drug in Column 5 of 

	

25 	 Schedule 1. 

Section 38 (Destruction of prohibited plants by Director-General)— 
Section 38 (1), definition of "Director-General"— 
Omit the definition, insert instead: 

"Director-General" means the Director-General of the 

	

30 	 Department of Agriculture and Fisheries. 

Section 43 (Certificate evidence)— 
Section 43 (1), (2)— 
Before "substance" wherever occurring, insert "plant or". 
Section 43 (3)—(6)- 

	

35 	Omit section 43 (3), insert instead: 
(3) Any appointed person analysing any plant submitted to the 

person may give a certificate of the result of the analysis. 



5 

Drug Misuse and Trafficking (Amendment) 1988 

SCHEDULE 1—AMENDMENTS—continued 

In any legal proceedings under this Act, the production of 
a certificate, purporting to be signed by an appointed person, is 
prima facie evidence of— 

(a) the identity of the plant analysed; and 

	

5 	 (b) the quantity or mass of that plant, 
without proof of the signature or appointment of the person 
appearing to have signed the certificate, but only if the plant 
identified is cannabis plant or cannabis leaf. 

The Director-General of the Department of Agriculture and 

	

10 	Fisheries may appoint a person to give certificates for the purposes 
of this section if the Director-General considers the person to be 
suitably qualified. 

In this section— 
"analyst" means- 

	

15 	 (a) any person employed by the Government of New South 
Wales as an analyst; and 

(b) any person who is an analyst within the meaning of the 
Therapeutic Goods and Cosmetics Act 1972; 

"appointed person" means a person appointed under subsection 

	

20 	 (5); 
"plant" includes any part of a plant, and the achene and seed 

of a plant. 
(9) Schedule I— 

Omit the Schedule, insert instead: 



e 
E 
6 

E 
E 
O 
U 

>. 

0 

szr 

O 
U 

M 

E 
6 

<La 
.7 

CO 
*Cc; 
a 

C 
E 

(S
ec

s.  
3 

(1
),  

33
  (

4)
,  4

4)
  

S
C

H
E

D
U

LE
 1

  

CO 
C cO 

"7 7 
C 

= CO E. 
E 

6 

Drug Misuse and Trafficking (Amendment) 1988 

wt9), 0,3 
0 

1111111111111111111110 0 

00 00 est) MO ea 
X X X -SC  

op trf op co 00 00 oo co V1) o0 00 00 DO Ca Ot) Oa DO 04 .14 
00 

0-1CXXXXXOOX -NC X ..SC -NC 0 0 ..1C X X X ,n of 
000000eNtN000000(70000000 
N 6 ri <-4 N 6 6 6 6 6 vi vi v-; 0 0 vi 0 

ea 00 00 00 ea 
X X X X .14 04 00 
tes tis vs vs tes .14 -14 
N ea ea eV r'J 00 op 00 t".1 r1 el) 00 00 ea ,n vs 

00 -• 00 ea ea a) .14 ...NC •-• .--, .N4 00 X ..14 --. --. -SE X X X eV eV 
X 0 -SE .14 X -SE v1 v1 0 0 ,r1 eta -SE ,r1 .11 0 0 of of tes vs -, -- 
vs 0 vs trs of tr. 0 0 0 0 e-4 0 vs ri N 0 Ca N N N N 0 0 
6 6 c:i 6 6 (-4 6 6 6 6 sci 6 (-4 •-• -, 6 6 -; - - ., 6 6 vs 

00 04 to a° 04 
vs vs vs v.) vl op 00 c) ..,, 0. — 00 00 00 et0 00 ea - -• GO otb 00 04 ea -• -• 00 ea OD ea ,-. eV ,.., eV 

0 0 0 0 0 0 trs vs Ca 0 (e( o c:. ,... (,e. o c) un (.-. (.1 vl 6.4 6. ''' (A 6 (,-; ,ri ..-; kr; 6 6 6 6 (-4 v-i ..-; (-4 (-4 6 6 (-4 (-4 (-4 (-4 ..r. 0 6 ,r) 0 6 
CI v:J eN -.. -. .-. -. .... -. e4 r.,1 

00  vs vl 00  vs vs 04 00 04 vs 
rl NI (V eN el 1::) 00 C 00 00 0 00 DO 00 ea DO 04 0 0 WS o0 ea 00 00 0 0 ea Oa op ea ,-, r•I ,-, es4 
p 0 0 0 0, -. .... 0 0 tn O p vs trs 0 0 vs trs ti1 vs 1.-I 0 I-I 0 

--0 - vi 6 6 6 6 (-4 - (ri (-4 (-4 6 6 r4 (-4 (-4 (-4 er  007   O" 6 .... 

00 vii vii ea 00 
v. vs v. vs vs op 00 
r <--- t.--- 1--- r 0 v.) 0 v..) 

oi) 0 Do 00 00 00 Da op 0 0 00 00 ea 00 ea og 0 ea 00 00 00 ,.., I-- I-- 
0 p p o p p en en p 0 vs 0 0 v1 v1 ogo 0 v1 vs vs vs 6-1  ̀ O A   i..  0 
en 6 ei ei ei (.-; C C C C r-: e; of r-: N C C N N N N ,r) o C ,n o 6 ,... re, .—, — .... 

— 
   cO 

o. 
E 
CO 

C O 0-4 

6 
cts E o — N 

cO 4-
Br

om
o-

3,
5-

d i
m

et
ho

xy
am

ph
et

am
in

e  

7,  0
E 

e 
 E cv 

c ..  7-, e c 7   N ,  0.) 
Cc c (.... 
4, (1)  A 7, = ,..... c 	-;, -4 -..,.e, -6 c (.2 c  

'.3.-; -a g q :5-4., CO ct 0  al ,3..) .-. . - C ss tl) en tl) E 8 7) "c  -c  8' 5 5 ,... Ts 15.  .,5 ..,,, ,... ,., 4) ..., .e 5,.. .., c  — 

C as .1:1  cu co E o 07:-.=•Ecetxxi,"°0 
° = >-• -° ° " -c -c ft I E '— E 4 0  0 12  — = z.). :.;_•,-• , Ca. •-• .-. , ID o

p, 
t.... , , Le G 

i --c? 'V E 'P'., P. , " g g g 8 Ei . V .„ . e: _ _ .8 T  ' : .c arts7  afrig 
.2  7, .5, -5., cl. .3 CO CO CO CO 0: .c nu >, t,,  E E " 

11 t 15.s. t. "co. t. -co. t. t.  Ea  `41  '41  '  CO CO   cl m"  u Q La c.) <La V V (1.) Ls Q Q .1.) 
< < < < < < < < < < < C7 cO c0 oZ oz co oz co 



0  0 
 0 

0 u. 
0 
3  
F. 

  

  

3-
B

ro
m

o-
4-

m
et

ho
xy

am
ph

et
am

in
e  

rc; A 00 00 00 00 04 00 00 04 00 00 00 00 04 00 00 00 
CD CD CD 	CD CD 	C) 	C5 CD CD C) CD 	vl v-1 CD 	qD . 

I C5 r•-; r-: 	v, M WI 0 0 M kr) 

.c 
A 	t0 ; 
'u 6 II% f..". 
0000 
tea  .0 .0 .0 e c e c c c e 
UuuU 

0 

Z• o  
E C 

a.) 0 '0.0 
U U

0 

0 

7 

a.) 
v) a.) 

c a.) t- - CL 
E 3 co 
0  .-. 

.10 el 
01 

17 7 
C 

Cd, O. 

S
C

H
E

D
U
L
E

 1—
co

nt
in

ue
d 

- 
0 0 
E o 

0  

Y (.) 
EE 
H 

7 

Drug Misuse and Trafficking (Amendment) 1988 

00 
bo 

1111111 11111 111 1 

oo -se OD 	oo ..1) 00 1.2 lo lo 00 00 00 00 00 	
.
14) 00 00 	 00 ..r, -se O o oc) oc)oo 00oc)c) oc>o Tr 

6 esi 00  N 6 e,i kr; - 6 6 6 N N v1er; N6 0 -•    - o 

00 
-IC 
en 00 00 00 
CA 

6 6 6 6 

00 00 00 .-SC 00 00 00 00 04 .Y ...NC 00 00 
-. On 8 „so 	zg rg ,, p  ,-)1  oo .m ..se Y ...N4 ...x v-, v.) ...Ne ...%4 
0 C v1 v'1 vl ..el 4.1 (-.1 (-1 kr) 

6 (-4 
--, 

8 tr; 0 o r‘i 6 6 --; N c,i (•-i .-. --; .0.0 v-t  tr., v.', r-4 (-4 

C 
A 00 00 00 00 04 00 00 04 00 00 00 00 00 00 00 00 

O00 00e/10 00000 en vn0 0 
en 0 en C) C) CD C5 vi csi vi 	vi vi vi vi vi 	r,i c,i vi _ (0 --. v1) cr. _. CV C ,̂1 r4 __. ., 

o 

• 00 
A g o o c• rag) aa. 	0 a 00 04 00 04 

0000  
04 04

e
n 0.0 o 00 00 

0•• 0 o Tr 0 o o (N) kr) tel N v1 V1 V1 e•i - 



2,
5-

D
im

et
ho

xy
am

ph
et

am
in

e  

3,
4-

D
im

et
ho

xy
-5

-e
th

ox
ya

m
ph

et
am

in
e  

-D
im

et
ho

xy
-4

-e
th

ox
ya

m
ph

et
am

in
e  

3,
4-

D
im

et
ho

xy
am

ph
et

am
in

e  

4,
  5-

D
im

e t
ho

xy
-2

- e
th

ox
ya

m
ph

et
a  

2,
5-

D
im

et
ho

xy
-4

-e
th

yl
am

ph
et

am
in

e  

8 

Drug Misuse and Trafficking (Amendment) 1988 

00 00 00 

00 00 00 00 00 00 00 ...NC 0 ..hd 0 ...14 0 ..Y 0 —NG 0 —1C 0 SC 0 
6 

00 

6 .... 

00 

6 ... 

00 

6 --, 

00 

N 

00 

N 

00 
-X 

N 

00 AC vi —SE 
,r1 ...1C ...td —1E ,r, ,r) kr) ,r) -se ,r, 

N t•Ni t.-.1 (-4 6 6 6 

00 

N.... 

00 oo op 00 ..sc ..1.4 .x ..* 0 0 0 0 
N 	N 

00 00 00 00 
..sE —NC ..14 ,r) .4., ,r, ,r, 

6 6 6 6 

121 (Z) OD DO DO OD DO SI  0 • 	0° C) 0° 0 0 0 0 
,n
0 ▪ 0.  a ow a c 0 .-; Y+Y+ 0 kr, h 8 4"; 	 8 • 	kr) 8 kr; kn 8 

NNNNN 

00 00 CO 013 
0000 

kei kr; kr; 
o• te . .,° °tun °tun au, c.-07 " 667 . . . Troo•zroo-zr 8 6 .zroo.toovr oo 

.0 .0 .0 .0 ,• -, .0 .0 0 0 0 0 u-4 0 0 • a a 0 a cso 0 
V1 V1 Vf ,r; v., 8 oi 8 vi 8 eei kr) 8 ‘r, 8 en w, 8 ee; 0 en 

 
to 
a. 
.c 

4.?" 

4) 

0. 
E 40 >, 
O 

E . _ 
CZ 
4 

SC
H

ED
U

L
E

 1—
co

nt
in

ue
d 

E 
6 U 

 

E 

6 
U 

N 

0 
6 

6 
U 

 

.42 1J n 
0.0 
cr) 
0 

CO

0  

E:1.  u 
e `°~ E

co 
 

E 
0 7 

7.3 
0.) 
E g z 0 

.6 = 
• 
'V 
C CP 

= 

E 40  col o 

.0 • > 

eO 
co 
I" 7 

  

    



E 

6 

C To 
E co 

6 	CID 7 

C 
E 
6 
U 

SC
H

E
D

U
L

E
 1—

co
nt

in
ue

d
 

N 
a
00 b 

 

r•-• 
X '4) 0 

>-, 
E 

-c 0 

E 
a  

(-••3 

M 

> 
..- 	• as 	• 
> 

rti • I./ • or t o.) 
0 o 0. 

 CO 04 
Q.. 0 
— 

— > u •  E .c 
7o.  oo  ;: 

Z t'z' 

3,
4-

D
im

et
ho

xy
ph

en
yl

et
hy

la
m

in
e  

9 

Drug Misuse and Trafficking (Amendment) 1988 

N oo oo N N 00 
(^1 

	

OD 00 OD 	 00 	 00 	 00 44 	.Y 	.-SC 	 ...,e 	- 	-Ee 	 ..w o o 	o o 	o 	o 
(Ni 	6 	e,i 	c,i 	rsi 	f,i 	r,i 

CV 

00 _Ne 	00 	00 	on 	00 	00 	00 _Nc O 	 ten 
Ci 	6 

00 0 0 Q , tdf?  Q w 0 oo 	 oo 	 ao 
r, 0 	,n 0 kr; 	VI ‘C7).  tr; 	10- 	u^1 8  0 (-4 	c•••1 	c‘i 	 r‘i 	(NI 

a• °  O ci c 14  a 00 c 00 c 

	

ci 	6 6 .3r 8 6 	Tr 6 	-4. 8 o ••:r od d  

c c c c c c Ca .0 .0 0 0 c .0 a .0 — 0 1-1 00 0 c .0 0 c 84  ,... ,.. . ,n 0' n 0 	,n,  OM 	,n 0-  O M ,n OM 	w-, 8 ,-.-; 	, 8 ,-; —, rn .-. 	—• 	 — 	—, 
• 

C 6" . E ' E 
17 'CI OD C.1 

CO .... I) C14 , , I-. ,10 00 
"." Cl.) 	0 C io .....  
E 	C 

C.). C 
ca ›,•"" Z 

E 7,3, 	u .0 6. a3 = C - 0. 0 >,  E t -5 co 	c 	Ea .c 	I.1 	15 7, , 7.% 	.c 

	

cu  ..; Efz. 	
.c = '" 	c 	 0. .L. 

NFL 
   4 E E o fa 	.9.  - CO,, 	c••• cp?, <-) 	8 	= 1 x 	I x  '7 C x c 	..0 >e, 0 	>, 0 '2 	ce:s 

	

E x ..,3 	x •- v ..= .- 
-0 5 :8 ., 	co 0  - 	

9  
0 	0 '0 =  

	

' -c 
t 4 	.... c 

Z.). 	cr, t 	 CU ILI 
E 0  .-E vu 0 	E 	E ..c  5:•• 
- 	, 0. 	

>,>, 	.-  
Q .c 0  0 2 	ti c z c 15 ,;,0 ,..,...- -..F.0. 	E 4-, E 	. E 

A c-xt 	(-4 



 

0 

O 

.zr 
0 

c5 

0 

0 
U 

rsi 
0 

O 
U 

0 

0 
U 

>• 

E 
E 
U 0 

  

10 

Drug Misuse and Trafficking (Amendment) 1988 

I II to 	immi o m 

oo 
..le 

OD 	00 OD 	OD OD 	OD 	00 00 OA OD OD 'f  OD 00 	00 	00 00 OD 00 OD 
.-N C - S C -N IC -1 C -S C -1 C - 1 C  X ...N C - 1 4 ..N L 0 ..N C -1 C -S C .-S4 -SC ..14 -1C -NC 
0 0 0 0 0 0 00000000 0 00000 

t-4 6 6 r‘i 	6 (-4 v1 kr; vi N 6 — •-• N N N <-4 vi N 
   

OD ... 
VI 

OD OD OD 	n1 00 	 00 
00 	00 00 	00 00 	OD 	 X 	00 	o0 00 00 X OD OD 00 X X ...)4 p --. 

.14 	..Y „Y 	..Y ..W 	.NC 	.)4 kr) ,r) )r, ..).e 0 V1 00 	-.SC 	..NE -SC ..SL ,n ...14 
VI 	,n ,n 	,n V1 V, kr, r.) r).) e-4 v-, Or N0 	kr, 	V1 V1 V1 n1 kr, 
6 	ON NO 	es' 6 -4 .--, -0000- 	6 	6 6 Ci —; 6 kra r-i 

oo tr. 
("4  

00 	OD OD OD ,..., 000 000 000 ,00 ,01:1 OD a 0- no  a C:i 	.0 00 00 00 00 *0 
0 00 0 i--I 0 0 0 0 .e) 0 
kr; 	kr; v-; 	kr; v-, 0 kr, v-, 	ne; c-4 ri r.i kr; 6 r).) v.; 	kr, 0 kr, kr, v-, v-, el kr, 

N n1 n1 	n1 	... ... ... 	 n1 	 -.. 

oo 
,f1 

ra) 
00 	OD 00 	00 rz 	OA 00 	OD 00 OD 00 OD 0 OD OD c) 0000 	csD 	cs0 co? 

0 0 oo 0 0.  kr, kr, kr, o 0 kr, 0 
vi 	kr; .4- 0 6 V1 — rsi r)i esi 	6 6 ^ 	7 8 6 	kr; -4 

60 
WI 

	

0 	 n• 	a 
00 	00 60 	00 e-, 	OA 00 	CO OD OD 00 00 0 OD DO CI OD OD OD OD OD OD 
0 	0 0 0 /-1 0 0 0 rk kr, kr, 0 0 kr. 0 0000.r.0 
ri ri vi 	 kr; ke-a 0 en v-, 	r,-; ir-: (-4 r-: e•; 6 — re.; 	kr. 0 en en en en r-- en ..... 	....  

.0 6" . )1)) 

.9. 0 .E o Li. 	.0 ..c.,-, E 
a.) 3 o  u os .- 0 c..) 9.) 
'0 	> 

4.,
'0 0 .C, 

V 
.0 	..ft.  {C, E 
c c 	.> ,i, cA 

L. 	 x 
U.̂  4.7 • C -. 0 I..  6) a. v0.01 
.0 0. 

el 	"V 
u  
0 0 co 

0 E 
a;til 	0 ..1...' 	u 

,,, o A 
1- L, 
>-• x c 	..1.!. u ,e 

a.) u = 	co '''' .  a.) 	. 0 	v, E -,3 a' .`'' 5, 3 u •?.. V g .-. >. c > wi 
44  x 0 a; = --= 
.

......
00 .6. 3

". 
 . 

LL] 

8 . .- . 
CO0. 0, - 0, 0 u , . „•-• 
Of .0 c... • .. 	, 6,1 

0. 0 0. 00 CO IA 
a 0 0 I.L] ,:i 

0 	  
3 	

 6 Et 
• 	  ,.. c I-   .o  

	

'.At r),    >••• ,.., 

	

0 •-    .c ci„ 
 , oo 

	

4.)   ... .. 

	

CI 
.0 

CX «+ ,.... 

	

   O o 

	

0, - 	  _ N 
1.. ,_I 
0) 	 0,-  05 

	

0,„ 
3° 
 4 	   

	

c    .0 •- 

	

a) .    r-: 7 

	

0 .0- -e," 	  ;-. X )).  

	

E L4 .1.1 	  2 7., 

	

- .c 	   0, 

	

..c c 4..... 	  ›... z., 
-5..,. 12  0 0 u 	a., 	L E 

a..) .c 0 	.° ..c E. . 5 0 8 0._ 1 ...,._ 7,. "o_  

	

9 E IA. 	.0 t... ›, 0 = .9 7:<.4,... 

.I"'  .c.5% 8 O 	 2 
x ,... 0, ,0 

Ill lil III Ill WL. LI
E
. = A 9 2 8 8 u 



-44 
OD 	n4 
X 0 
C). 0 
— 6 

M
et

ha
do

ne
  

4-
M

et
ho

xy
m

et
hy

la
m

ph
et

am
in

e  

4-
M

et
ho

xy
am

ph
 

M
et

az
oc

in
e  

C)  00 
o 

E 
E O 
U 

$2, 
CO 

•-• 
C 
 

CT -• 

sic 
C 

0 

CC 

O 
U 

.zr 
C 

O 
U 

C 

O 
U 

4.1 
C 

0 

U 

C 

0 
O U 

0 
E rID 

11 

Drug Misuse and Trafficking (Amendment) 1988 

00 00 
CI CV 
0 	0 	00 
0 	0 	WI 0.0 	on 	on 

I 	
6 
6 	

o 
6 	

r-- 
6 	

cv 

	

I 1 6 	0 0 

on 	oo ...+4 4-4 on 00 00 00 00 00 
0 0 
6 

X kr, 
r•- 

X X X 0 0 0 
r--: 	(",i 	rsi 

X 0 
r.i 

X 0 
r-i 

00 
..n on  

00 6 0 0 01) 
0 
0 
6 

r 
00 V1

c 
kr) X X r-- 	kr, 	kr)   . 	. — c) o 

X 
kr.) 

6 
X 

6 

00 00 
CZ 00 

8 
't&1' ,,10 OW a CI 

00 00 

"C 0 0 
 0 vi kn 0 vi 	kr, 8 0 ,0 00 r--: 	tr) 

C,1 V1 

00 	0000 
c 

Q 8 n 8 Q OD  viOD 0 , O Q 00 
i• 0 0 	Tr 0 0 	'et 0 en M— .zr 0 0 V 00 	00 

00 00 
Q 00 

Op ( t,t)  C9 
eko 

fFil 0 oc''  vi 0 0 ,C,?, 8 mc''  
i Q 

9' 0 cc; .en kr) 8 — 6 	^ 



12 

Drug Misuse and Trafficking (Amendment) 1988 

SC
H

E
D

U
L

E
  1

 —
co

nt
in

ue
d  

 

 

 

E 

E 
 

U 

E 

vs cr 

c..) • 

CP 

00 	00 	00 	OD 	00 	OD 
N 	N 	 N 

6 	d 	6 	6 	6 	1 1 1 1 1 1 

OD 
00 	00 	OD 	00 	00 	04 	00 60 OD 00 OD , X n - 	...N4 	.x 	X 	.o 	..4 	-  ...,4 - X X 0 
0 	0 	0 	0 	0 	0 	O 0  0 kr, tin 0 

N 	N 	N 	N 	N 	-, N N 6 6 d 

OA 
X 

00 OD ,r) 00 	X X N 
00 	00 	OD 	OA 	00 	00 	X 00 00 ,n ,r,  ^' X 	X 	X 	X 	X 	'In „s4 ...Nt eq fl 00 ."-) 	Len 	VI 	 VI 	V") 	N VI Cr? - --, 0 
6 	6 	d 	cS 	6 	d 	6 d 6 6 ci d 

0 	 0 	 CO v..) a a a a a oo oo r4 oo 0 	0 	oo 	 oo 	 00 	OD 	oo ao oo op ,r) ,r1 --. 0 1-i c000ry N 0 
vl 0 ..r;.. 0 

	0 k... 0 	
o 

.... 0  A 	r., 

Cr?0, 0  kr, 	100 V, 	Cr? 0 V1 	..r) 0 Cr? ,r1 0 Cl'l ../I VI Cr? .-1 .-• 0 
N N N N N N 

00 

a OD OD N 
00• 	13 A 6. 0

0(
0

) t-N 	0 C) al 	
" 	o. 
  • 	

00 (:) 
00 

 CD  
OD 

 C! (1 
OD 	,n 

▪ 6 4 o 6 	o 	8 6 .4. 0 CD "I' 0 CD 	CD CD C5 

OD 
a OD OD 8• 	) 8 csd) a a la 8) <S4  a a ‘̀-'2 r 0 „, r.-; ., re; (.4i 	C5 C5 v-1 8 f--; 	,r) 0 In 	,r) 8 f--; 	0 en 

V 
C -
E 

N I'S .0 
E E 

.0 G• .0 
c E 
:a R E 

	

ti 	.0 

	

C 	C 

	

4) 	 V 	E 	
- 
E 

	

C 	 C 	as 	CO 
E' 	0 = 0 	

..... 
 

	

E 	 E 	.0 ▪ 	.0 C 

	

'E. "O 	0 

	

1.1 	
as 

	

a.) 	
as 

	

*4.1 	ti 

	

-5. 	'al 
7-. 

	

.0 .0 	.0 	.0 	.c 
:.1..). 8 	0. 	0. 	0 	c 

	

ku 	c 
.16  

	

as 	E 

	

as 	E 

	

as 	.0 

	

0. 	.0 
0. 

	

..E ..0- 	>, 	>. 	>, 	>, 	>-. 0 	. x 	. x 	. x 	. x 	. x 
4-.. 	Lei. 	

.4.1 0 

,:t. 'au 	

'r, 0 . . . - 

	

-4: -ct, 	
en O 

	

N 'C 	
Tr 0 

	

M 'C 	
Vl 0 

. . . - 
Tr TJ 

	

. CU 	. V 	. 4) 

	

>., C 	>1 C 	P.• = 	>s 0 	>, C 

	

X 0) 	X V 	X 0 	X 0.1 	X 4) 

	

O -5.., 	o -5, 	o 7_,. 	o,. 	o 7., 

	

-= .0 	.-c .0 	..0 .0 	.0 ..c 	-0 = 

	

a.i t' 	5 t' 	71.1 t 	II t 17..) t. 

	

2 E 	2 E 	2 E 	2 E 	2 E 
,..,.., N 	 4 	eN 	en 4-

M
et

ho
xy

ph
en

y l
et

hy
la

m
  

C.) 
C 
'E C 0 0 0 

c0 • E o 
V 0. 
.0 F. 'C V V 
0. 9

,  ›, 
E as -a b t 
>, 	>, 2 2 _0 ..0 t 4 4 
2 2 2 e•-i 

C C 

C (Li 



SC
H

ED
U

L
E

 1—
co

nt
in

ue
d 

00 
ea  
0.  -0 E 
-0 .0 

0 .— 
X) .0 
.0 0 0 

fO 

V *✓
  

r.• 
E 
E 

CO  

U 

00 
00 000 0  0 

00 

13 

Drug Misuse and Trafficking (Amendment) 1988 

1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 I I I I I I 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 

00 40 .4.1 0D 00 
-14 •a 	-se 0 0 0 0 0 
(-4 6 6 N^ 

on 04 00 OD 00 00 04 00 00 00 04 00 00 00 ..)e -se 0 o 0 0 o 0 -se 0 0 0 0 ..%e 0 0 -s4 0 0 
^ N^—O r‘i N N N N N ,r; 6 6 

00 
00 00 00 00 '41 s 0 0 o 0 0 0 

7 ,r; (NI 6 

V1 	 V1 

	

00 	00 	04 00 	 04 	40 	N 
00 OD ^ 04 X -X 04 X X 04 00 00 00 04 04 00 X OD 00 00 04 X OD 

	

0 X vi 	v1 eN4 	.AE -X -X ...%4 Y Y vi X ...NC -X X ,n,  X 0 
Vl ,r) O kn 	 N 0 	 vl <-4 o ,rt o O r•.1 

6 6 6 0000 vi 6 000 6 — 	 c; 

04 

	

01) 04 ^ ▪ 04 04 	00 00 00 00 00 	00 	00 00 00 	00 40 00 04 00 01) 00 04 04 
00000 00000 0 000 00,n0000,n00 

	

Vl ,f; O ,r; ,r; 	,r; 	 vi h tri Vl to tr; rsi O Le-; 6 6 r‘i ."-; 
(-4 	 ,n 

00 ,e1 

	

00 QD 	OA 00 OD 00 OD 	04 	00 04 04 	00 00 00 00 00 04 00 00 00 0 
go 00000 0 000 oovl0000 ,noo 

— 	 6 .r; 6 ci — 6 

00 

r- 
04 04 0 04 00 	04 00 00 00 04 	00 	00 00 04 	40 00 00 00 00 04 OD 04 04 0 
00000 00000 0 000 00 on 0 0 0 0 ." 0 0 

vi O er; er; 	re-; rr; rr; eri O 	rn 	rr; rr; M 	rn M r- 6 ,r; 6 6 r-: en 6 M en 

a) L. '. o t- u V. 0 3 0  

	

..... 	.0 . 	0 H 	0  1:7 0.  ' ill u '1 [--,  0 0. .-. ..c  0. .0 0.. c •- u 0. c •''' >, oz 7., ..0 co 

	

X 	C I. 	 -0 a  ify rch,  ,_. a? ,  
u — f., E ..e ,, ,,, 

,... rn ..... .-.1 t4 .-. 
o. a) 0 0 .- .- 

c „ •- c: 
c, 2 :"  

0 
4.,‘.. -1 ..c 0 

u  .E.....> .0 0 0 0 • .c v, 	 

	

L 0. •- a.) 
4 ->-, 0  - 0 ri 5 3 g  . .... CO  . io to. 0  (..) ... - ta. a 

«It C E. 	  E ;I; • x-. 4) x ,, o 0 ta. _ 
o:, .c c.- - o. o 
co cu o .3% io u  ° 0.%)  ..c u  <•-= : u  .c :o c x .0 4.,  	0 z 4) a c 4, u  
c 4,  i::, z ..... co— — ,,,,...., c 

u u , ' - = 0 ,..... ."' 0 
-0  .. - = 5 ''''' cv .c c c  •- •- 0 = u ,., 8 - E. E -- 0 E" ''' e. = 

-o 7-, v ,.. 0 c v c 0. 0 -0 v  0 z 
it.  c ..c <-0 e• 0 

.5;  = = a cc t, 
2 ..E. :E. fr „._ 0  , .0 0 0 ,,, ,... .... 

.cr)to 0 0r," a p. n—  c..,  = 13"BUOZ> U 0 .1:I- l' ° = o 
7j22t 02C0000>.QLL.858 v 2 LE i' E °•=='-'ET,s 0 c) ... 1..- c - o 0 
2 -LeA22 ,:0 22 ..i i zzz    ' Z Z 2 2 Oa  . Oa  E E ia. 



0 
.0 V t+0 
O0 0 
C• - • C u JD 

_ 
a) 0 
> 

CD 
0,0 

• 
1.) • 

c•-", 
..0 

C u" 
cC > ai 

173' 
- 0 
a) 0, =  

T
et

ra
hy

dr
oc

an
na

bi
no

l 

- 03 
c  0 Li) 
C. 

E 
 
U 

E 
6 
U 

0 
 
U 

e. H 0  a 'O 

E 
0 

CC 

cr 

E 
-6 
U 

G 	00 
E 

0. ID 
77 77 <1J 8 2  
:13 ...IS 

0 

5 
0 -.0 c •- 

a 

14 

Drug Misuse and Traf ficking (Amendment) 1988 

00 	O0 

	

1111111111 	111111 

01)0000000.00,00.00000c.0 o0c.0(400 00 oo -14 ..Y ..1C X X ..s4 -SG ... X -SC -SE ... -SC -SG ..SC 1:40 CO -NG CD CD CD 0 CD CD 0 CD CD CD CD C) CD 0 CD C) CD CD --, 6 O-  ... vi .,-; ,r; - 6 ,..., O--   O v-; 	O 6 	N  - 	- 0 el CD CD - 	- 

X 110 4:0eG) ol:1 CO CO GO -SG ol) of) X -Se . -14 . OD -SG pi) -NG ..Y -SG on in ...sG ,..N4 un pp ..r) v.) v") vn X .n X un .n v.) oD oD X N vn vn el 0 eV (NI eV ev vl ev vn el el (NI 0 0 Lon ' • • • • . . . . 

	

6 N N 6 cc ---    0 (-4 -- el CD 0 o sO vi vi 6 .r) Len e‘l eV N es1 

• oo n • 04 

	

OD 00 OD 00 OD OD GO OD 00 04 	OD 04 00 OD 	OD 	un 
v 0 Cr)0 Cr) C- ~ cv4n a O Cr)un Cr)v'+ CD n Cr)un .n un 0 

vi vi vi eV vi eV N N Nwi e,i wi e.i N CD eV v18 
el  
6 h 8 cs ,,-; N rA --- ry - r.4 wl ).0 	el el 

• 03 0 • 00 00o0(24(21)e.OGOoDo.OoDot) obot)04o0 ao 
CI g 	, 	-i- .. c? 0 0 un 0.  kr, v-, tr) v-) 0 kr) 0 v-) vn v-, '-' t. °. C'. 1... . -• un v-; O- r,i rj rj d Lr; en' v-; 0 6 .-, r•.i of 0 0 ver 0 0 --, 

.. a ,n 0 • op oow000n000acoop0000 04 oo ea CO on r--.. 
v"  8 

-.
) 0 0 c) Cr) 0 Cr) u.) un )r) CD 	un C) hwn un 0 0 IC) 

rei vi vi . M1.-: r4 r-: •-• v.; e4 v-; -4 Cr) --- I r-: .r) 8 6 vn 8 6 e•-; 
- - - rn -. -, 

 

8  
0  

 

 
 

C 
- 7 • 

	 6) 
cn  
C.) 

 - 
 CL a) • 

   X V 
 0 C 
 t 0 cr) 

a) el) I a ,.? -0 = 0 a9 , .,.. ?: 2 , <c. ) . C  0 °J E0.,00.-..0.- >, t) ..c c .- u.. N o 2 .= -0 - c. E. 0 -,E . 	cia  . , .0 ox f ,  2, .75.--  E ',1 E° • Le,c: '1.-• .; ‘6... .13- - .0 c N >, -0000u43000,,00 
:E000000 .0  .,....alyouvuuuco Ei..L., 
a., .0 .0 .c .0 .c .0 .0 , . - 
a. a. a. a. 6, 6. 6, 0. 0. - 6, Ct. 

.0 03 , 
c .0  03 u,G3 

	

C 	> 0.) .0 
CC .C. 

01 op 
> C 

i•• • ...I 
tp 1••• 
= 0.)  

45 
-0 CC .0 

..: VI 
C . ... V) 

	

03 	C) 

	

6) -2, -0 
0 c 0 Q. a) > v)  
"0 'RI '0 .0 0 •••!m  ":....i...  

0 

0.) ij" 
E a. .-•

§: .- 
c•> ,t):.,,,. 

* 
-. .0 .0 o. o 0 ,.... 
:i..: 2 2 2 77", lv cL 
a. a. a. a. a. 



CO 
0.-3 >. 

— 
E g 
E 
U 

CI) 

C.) •—• 
Q' 

= 
cct 

CID 7 
V 

E 

E 

U 

C 

= 
O 
U 

C 

O 
U 

N 
C 

0 

C 

U 
6 
U 

SC
H

ED
U

L
E

 1—
co

nt
in

ue
d 

2,
4,

5-
T

ri
m

et
ho

xy
am

ph
et

  

2,
3,

5-
T

ri
m

et
ho

xy
am

ph
et

am
in

e  

1 -
(  3

,4
,5

-T
ri

m
et

ho
xy

ph
en

y1
)-2

-a
m

in
ob

ut
am

e  

2,
3,

6-
T

ri
m

et
ho

xy
am

ph
et

am
in

e  

2,
4,

6-
T

ri
m

et
ho

xy
am

ph
et

am
in

e  

3,
4,

  5-
T

ri
m

et
ho

xy
am

ph
et

am
  in

e  

2,
4,

5-
T

ri
m

et
ho

xy
ph

en
yl

et
hy

la
m

in
e  

15 

Drug Misuse and Trafficking (Amendment) 1988 

00 
N 
O O 

00 	00 	00 	00 	00 	MD 	00 N N N N N N N 
O O c; O c; 

co ..4 
00 	oo  cow, 0000 	00 	oo 	00 	00 	00 	00 	00 -k 	X X 0 X X X 	X 	X 	X 	-k 	X 	X 0 	CD 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

N N ci ci (-i 	N 	N 	N 	N 	N 	N 	N 

00 -14 kr1 
N 

00 	00 00 ^. 00 01) 	00 	0.0 	OD 	00 	00 	00 	00 X 	X X 0 X X 	X 	-k 	X 	X 	...k 	...4 	-14 
un 	)1.1 vi 0 kr1 kr) 	kr) 	kon 	kr) 	,r) 	,r) 	kr) 	cr) 
C; 	666c,i6 	c; 	c; 	c; 	c; 	c; 	c; 	c; 

AD 
N (2)  a • al • a a a a • a a) 	acsoa,...- a r, 	bl) " 	00 " 	0.0" a c)  a ,-, 	oa ,-, 	to ,-, 	00 

	

0 i-i 	c, ,--, 	0 	 0 6-, 	0 ,-.., 	0 -, , . 
CO wi ,r) 5 wi kr) 8 kr; kr, 8 •,-; kr'-: 8 kr; v., 18 )r; kr) CO wi ,n 0 vi VC cfl C=) Cll c/1 0 ,r) VI 

N 	t,1 CV 	N 	N 	N 	N 	N 	N 	N 

A° 0 

	

n 	• 0 " 	00 00 000 00" 00" • MO" 00,-N 00" OD" 00" • 00 n 
C oo 

a.) 
.0 >, 

kr) ..4 • •-• N 7 	0 	C 0 • 0 • 0 0 0 0 • 0 EEM 	0 00 OA 00 0 OD " 00 0 0 0 0 0 6-1 .0 an am am wn -n wn - . . c„ . ,... 	. ,... C 	wlommmo.nwlom ,elom ,nomwlor,;4nom,r,8c,;,-,8,,8,i I—. 	— 	— 	_     

2,
3,

4,
  5

-T
et

ra
m

et
ho

xy
am

ph
et

am
in

e  

'a' 	 00 m E 
a -a 
-a 	-0 Co. 
:15 	.;f3 

0 0 

C) 
C - 
E 
CO 

 
001 

BY AUTHORITY 
D. WEST, GOVERNMENT PRINTER, NEW SOUTH WALES-1988 





NO6 



• 



DRUG MISUSE AND TRAFFICKING (AMENDMENT) ACT 
1988 No. 17 

NEW SOUTH WALES 

TABLE OF PROVISIONS 

Short title 
Commencement 
Meaning of "Principal Act" 
Amendment of Drug Misuse and Trafficking Act 1985 No. 226 
Operation of amendments 

SCHEDULE I —AMENDMENTS 

80531-32929 (20) 



• 
• 

• 
• 



DRUG MISUSE AND TRAFFICKING (AMENDMENT) ACT 1988 
No. 17 • 

• 
NEW SOUTH WALES 

Act No. 17, 1988 

An Act to amend the Drug Misuse and Trafficking Act 1985 with respect 
to the categories of prohibited plants and drugs under that Act, to increase 
penalties for certain offences and for other purposes. [Assented to 21 June 
1988] 

• 
• 



2 

Drug Misuse and Trafficking (Amendment) 1988 

The Legislature of New South Wales enacts: 

Short title 
This Act may be cited as the Drug Misuse and Trafficking 

(Amendment) Act 1988. 

Commencement 
This Act commences on a day or days to be appointed by 

proclamation. 

Meaning of "Principal Act" 
The Drug Misuse and Trafficking Act 1985 is referred to in this Act 

as the Principal Act. 

Amendment of Drug Misuse and Trafficking Act 1985 No. 226 
The Principal Act is amended as set out in Schedule 1. 

Operation of amendments 
(1) An amendment made to the Principal Act by this Act does 

not apply to an offence alleged to have been committed before 
the commencement of the amendment, except as provided by 
subsection (2). 

(2) Section 43 (Certificate evidence) of the Principal Act, as amended by 
this Act, applies to the production of a certificate under that section after 
the commencement of Schedule 1 (8) whether the offence to which the 
certificate relates is alleged to have been committed before or after that 
commencement. 

SCHEDULE 1—AMENDMENTS 

(Sec. 4) 

(1) Section 3 (Definitions)— 
(a) Section 3 (1), definition of "cannabis resin"— 

Omit the definition, insert instead: 

"cannabis resin" means the separated resin (whether crude or 
purified) obtained from cannabis leaf, but does not include 
cannabis oil; 



3 

Drug Misuse and Trafficking (Amendment) 1988 

SCHEDULE 1—AMENDMENTS—continued 

(b) Section 3 (1), definition of "discrete dosage unit"—

Omit "Column 5", insert instead "Column 6". 

Section 21 (Penalties)— 

Omit "$2,000", insert instead "20 penalty units". 

Section 30 (Indictable offences punishable summarily without consent 
of accused)— 

Section 30 (3)— 

Omit the subsection, insert instead: 

(3) The penalty for an offence dealt with under this section is 
a fine of 50 penalty units or imprisonment for 2 years, or both. 

Section 31 (Indictable offences punishable summarily with consent of 
accused)— 

Section 31 (3)— 

Omit the subsection, insert instead: 

(3) The penalty for an offence dealt with under this section is 
a fine of 100 penalty units or imprisonment for 2 years, or both. 

Section 32 (Penalty for offences dealt with on indictment not involving 
commercial quantities)— 

Section 32 (g), (h)— 

Omit "$200,000" wherever occurring, insert instead "2,000 
penalty units". 

Section 33— 

Omit the section, insert instead: 

Penalties for offences involving commercial quantities 

33. (1) This section applies to the following offences: 
an offence under section 23 (2), 24 (2) or 25 (2); 
an offence under section 26 of conspiring to commit an 
offence referred to in paragraph (a); 
an offence under section 27 of aiding, abetting, counselling, 
procuring, soliciting or inciting the commission of an 
offence referred to in paragraph (a); 



4 

Drug Misuse and Trafficking (Amendment) 1988 

SCHEDULE 1—AMENDMENTS—continued 

(d) an offence under section 28 of conspiring to commit, or of 
aiding, abetting, counselling or procuring the commission 
of, an offence under a law in force outside New South 
Wales which corresponds to section 23 (2), 24 (2) or 25 
(2). 

(2) The penalty for an offence is— 
except as provided by paragraph (b), a fine of 3,500 
penalty units or imprisonment for 20 years, or both; or 
where the offence relates to cannabis plant or cannabis leaf, 
a fine of 3,500 penalty units or imprisonment for 15 years, 
or both. 

(3) Despite subsection (2), if the court is satisfied that the 
offence involved not less than the large commercial quantity of 
the prohibited plant or prohibited drug concerned, the penalty for 
the offence is— 

except as provided by paragraph (b), a fine of 5,000 
penalty units or imprisonment for life, or both; or 
where the offence relates to cannabis plant or cannabis leaf, 
a fine of 5,000 penalty units or imprisonment for 20 years, 
or both. 

(4) In this section— 
"large commercial quantity", in relation to a prohibited plant 

or prohibited drug, means the number or amount, if any, 
specified opposite the plant or drug in Column 5 of 
Schedule 1. 

Section 38 (Destruction of prohibited plants by Director-General)— 
Section 38 (1), definition of "Director-General"— 
Omit the definition, insert instead: 

"Director-General" means the Director-General of the 
Department of Agriculture and Fisheries. 

Section 43 (Certificate evidence)— 
Section 43 (1), (2)— 
Before "substance" wherever occurring, insert "plant or". 
Section 43 (3)—(6)— 
Omit section 43 (3), insert instead: 

(3) Any appointed person analysing any plant submitted to the 
person may give a certificate of the result of the analysis. 



5 

Drug Misuse and Trafficking (Amendment) 1988 

SCHEDULE 1—AMENDMENTS—continued 

(4) In any legal proceedings under this Act, the production of 
a certificate, purporting to be signed by an appointed person, is 
prima facie evidence of— 

the identity of the plant analysed; and 
the quantity or mass of that plant, 

without proof of the signature or appointment of the person 
appearing to have signed the certificate, but only if the plant 
identified is cannabis plant or cannabis leaf. 

(5) The Director-General of the Department of Agriculture and 
Fisheries may appoint a person to give certificates for the purposes 
of this section if the Director-General considers the person to be 
suitably qualified. 

(6) In this section— 
"analyst" means— 

any person employed by the Government of New South 
Wales as an analyst; and 
any person who is an analyst within the meaning of the 
Therapeutic Goods and Cosmetics Act 1972; 

"appointed person" means a person appointed under subsection 
(5); 

"plant" includes any part of a plant, and the achene and seed 
of a plant. 

(9) Schedule 1— 
Omit the Schedule, insert instead: 

• 
I 



6 

Drug Misuse and Trafficking (Amendment) 1988 

OD 00kel 
0 0 

d 

OD OA OD 00 OD -SC .1C ..1C Jg ..Y DO 01) OD gel pp pp to 00 to 0,0 iiI WI OD OA OD ea OD wl on OD OD OD OD ...N4 ...NE ...Y 0 X X X X X ..NC 0 0 X ..sC X X X 0 0 ...NC „IC -SC ..Nd ,r, VI 000000rsitN00000000000000 0 
N 6 N N N 6 6 6 6 6 kr; - 6 kr; kr; 6 6 kr; kr; kr; kr; 6 6 --. lN .--. 

00 ea ea 00 Da ...le ...1C .ba -NC -IC ea ea wl .11 tn trl til ..1d ..Y 
N 	 OA pa r•I el 00 50 bo N r4 OD OD OA OD ,r) ." 

O0— 00 0,0 OD OD Y ..1C .--. .--. ...1C 00 ..IC ..NC ..--. .--. ..1g .SC ..N4 -.V N N .1g 0 -IC -14 .ht .NE .el vl 0 0 ul OD SC VI WI 0 0 ,r) kr) kr1 .el —, —. kr.) p un ‘r) trl ,r) 0 0 0 0 es1 0 VI el el 0 0 el e•I CI (NO 0 
6 6 6 6 6 N 6 6 6 6 ,x:.; 6 r‘i -. -, © © .- •-• -, -, 6 6 (r1 

N 

oo oo onD°  kinDa co N NN NN 
on on 0 on 0 on oo- 

kr 
▪ b0000000t000-..-.b000co OD OD ". 00 OD OD 00 ^ N al N poopopvlonootr)00 ,r1v100.rikr) ,r) 1-1 

; 0 kr; vivi vi 6 6 6 6 c4 v1viN6 6 es/ r4 v1 0" 6 kr) 0 N 1O (N 	 N 

OD 00 O0 DO 00 vl ,,I .11 VI tfl D D ev el (NI (-4 ev A 	*0 A 	430 a) 0 OD 00 00 0,0 ea 00 0 0 ea ea ea 00 00 0 0 ea ea ea ea 0 4-4 0 eN 0 0 0 0 0 0 --. --. 0 0 4.1 0 0 wn 4-1 0 0 wl u'l 4'1 'el 0 0 
- 6 ^^ -, kr; 6 6 6 6 esi -• kr; e,i esi 6 ci csi r4 csi r4 .o. 8 6 .o. 8 6 

OD Oa OD 00 OA vI WI ,f1 ,r1 .11 0,0 a co 
co 0 et) oo 00 OD 00 DO 0 0 00 00 00 00 00 0 0 OD OA OD OD ^ I"- ^ r---0 0 0 0 0 0 e•') en 0 0 vi 0 0 ,e) vl 0 0 kr1 krt vn ,/-1 1-1 „ 0 ii " 0 
e•-; 0 Ni Ni ej kr; cj 0 c:i 0 r-: en kr; t--: N 6 6 r.: r--: c- N ,r) 0 Ci ,r) 0 6 en — — — 

V C  
 -Fs  

t`   0 - .  E 0  7..,' e co  -;:-. hi tu ,..- c O 4.4 (IJ .. . C ,....  O.+ , .e, .T. .0  t C  T. ' t .0 - v 	
15' 
lco o, 	La 0  

C , 	m•-•4)..11 i9 ZE 
E$  o Z "5 9. 7> t...,E,  -2 4, 0 0 v eel a.) 

v Ai 4,)- lii u °E' 2 Iii js  3% X 0 U 1E .° '5'. . 0 .0_ V K X 1:1 = .= >, .0 C ..0 •.- --' C c. 
..E fil t .--g.  ..., attg0c.,:o , >, -0 T3 O. 

0 ... t_. I... ,_, P 0 0 0 .." -10 E • 
e., T '6 E 8 E E E C E. Z -E  c ... a. a.. 4..) 

>. -5, 7., a co co co co co os .c a, "7-. 8 -c = E N '.' t T.; r,  P.,  fx.E.-2.11-2,.-Ert N  c c."   mi to co C... C.,  — 0  4.,  tIJ CD 4..) 6. 11.1 .1.) 
<<<<<<<<<<<<COLOCOCCOnCat:00:01 ,7 

(S
ec

s.  
3 

( I
),

  3
3 

(4
),  

44
)  

E 

U 

E 

U 

.cr 

E 

N 

O 
 
U 

E 
6 U 

 

 

S
C

H
E

D
U

L
E

 1
  

 

0 .0 
ti 

g e 

To .8 
co co5) ce 

.0 • >. 

EE co 

  

    

N 

4-
Br

om
o-

3,
5-

di
m

et
ho

xy
am

ph
et

am
in

e  



to 
O `0* ' 

O 
	 3  

	 a 
0. 

	 CJ •-• 	 cn 

.0 0 

0 
as 

6./ 

0 61 0) 
C C 

0 
0 0 

ti 

E, 

co co 
c c 
G c 
(a 0 

(.." 

5 
R vi 

co co 
c 
G c 
co co 

(..) 3-
B
ro

m
o-

4-
m

et
ho

xy
am

ph
et

am
in

e  

4' CU 
00 4.) •••• 

E a: 	co 
E z 
o 
C./ 

7a.  

E 
E 
o 

S C
H

ED
U

L
E

 1—
co

nt
in

ue
d 

Drug Misuse and Trafficking (Amendment) 1988 

00 ‘r, 
0 	oo N 
6 	6 	IIIIIII 	11111 	Ili 	1 

co a 	00 	00 00 	00 00 00 00 	00 00 00 00 00 	04 00 00 	00 
,i% 	a 	a .4 a a a a a a a a a a a a a 
0 	0 	0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 V* 
6 	ri 	00 

N 	6 N 4,-; — 6 6 6 N e-,1 .r; ..r; N 6 
o o — 	_ _  
— o 

00 

/1.1 	 00 	 04 04 
00 	 00 00 a 	on 00 00 04 en a a 00 	00 

00 	 00 a a 	00 aaaaa cr1 cv1 a a 
0 	0 	0 0 	of of toi 0 	of cr. cr.ut ut 	fV CV of — 
O N O 

(.„1
..r) 

d
wi 
	eV O 	 N CD CD 	6 6 

00 0 
CI ,r1 0 

el CI on oo co op oo to co on 0.0 04 04 04 	00 on on 	0.0 000 00on0 00000 o-1.110 0 .... 
on 0 0 	wl 0 crl CD 0) c) 6 w; e4 wi 	w.; vi vi ,e; wi 	e.i e4 wi 	— 
cni 	 col 	0 — on  Co 	•-• 	col N N 	— ...• 

o _ 

A 	00 
c) X a a 	00 00 00 en 00 on 00 04 04 	00 00 00 	00 

OOrnO 00 000 h kra O Col 
7 0 o o est tel 	esi — vt vi vt — fV fV — 6 

,."-) 	.5 v-,  
,... 0 2 OD 00 00 

0 0 0 
00 00 CO 00 en en on en en 	on 00 en 	en 
00 ,10 00000 ./1.ri 0 '0 

0 6 ,r, 8 ,-, O' I 6 M r-: M 	v-; of ,r; e•-; e•-; r— r— N1 	6 — — o rn — en 

• 
• 

• 



E 

V 
0. 

-6 CO 
coO L  ..- 

E 0. . 
E Tr 

esi 2.
5-

D
im

et
ho

xy
am

ph
et

am
in

e  

3.
4-

D
im

e t
ho

xy
am

ph
et

am
in

e  

3.
4-

D
im

et
ho

xy
-5

-e
th

ox
ya

m
ph

et
am

in
e  

2,
5-

D
im

et
ho

xy
-4

-e
th

ox
ya

m
ph

et
am

in
e  

4,
5-

D
im

et
ho

xy
-2

-e
th

ox
y a

m
ph

et
am

in
e  

2,
5-

D
im

et
ho

xy
-4

-e
th

yl
am

ph
et

am
in

e  

8 

Drug Misuse and Trafficking (Amendment) 1988 

• 

OD 1011 00 
NNN esi 

O 

00 00 00 00 00 OD 00 00 OD 00 00 X X X X -X -X X -X X -X -X 
00000 0 0 0 0 0 o 
0 d ci co; r.i 	N 	N 	N 	N 	N 	N - -• - - 

00 00 OD 00 OA OA -X 00 OD 00 OD 00 -X -X -X ..14 ..14 ..1G ..Y .14 ..14 ...NG .el trt tr) WI kin ..r) .11 ../1 WI WI le) 
e`i CV ej r-i c; 	c; 	d 	c; 	d 	6 	6 

0 0 a a n 0 0 OD 00 00 00 lc) 00 es 00 es OD (:) 	bo 00 — 00 00 0 CI 0 0 0 i-I 0 I-1 0 0 0 0 I-1 0 0 0 1... . 1... . 1... . te . 1... s... . v"; vi .41 vi vl 0 vi ,t1 8 ,r; ,r, 0 vi ,r, 0 vi .el 0 vi .4.1 0 vi .4") 0 vi CA IN e.4 CV CA N N N N N N 

A oo 00 oo A or, a 00 ° :30  a a° ° oc: 0000 ‘r; 	Tr 16 	NI- 8 	‘t m
oo
(6 .d• 8 	.tr 	m oo

d 

	

2 	 2 
A 	 A A C 	 2 OA 00 OD 00 	00 ir:) 	OD es 	00 es 	00 	c,,) a2 	..0 a 	DO 0 0 0 0 0 0 A 0 1-1 o C::1  o o 

V1 vi vi vi ,,, 8 <-; ,... 0 -, 
kn 0 en ‘r) 6 en' .., 8 <-,i , - . 0 -; ,,-, O -; ,... 0. .,-, 0 -) _   

-5 .2)- 0 v  
v c.) 

CJ 
.L 

O 

tl.,1 
L' 

O 
0 c 

O -c 
' 0 E,  -0Ca 	- 

-0
6 Li. 0  

E O O o 0  
u  

.c 	 E .c •- o 

 

E 

U 

tn 

-6 U 

Tr 
O 
E 
-6 
U 

0 
0 
U 

N 

6 

O 
E 0 
6 

 

SC
H

ED
U

L E
 1—

co
nt

in
ue

d 

 

..-
E Po  
E U cr 

 

  

C 	OD 

-6. .8 
.0 4 as 
:6 :6 ._ • - 

0 
'15% 

    



SC
H

E
D

U
L

E
 1—

co
nt

in
ue

d 

C 

E 
0 

E 

C 
E a 

U 
O 

C 

C 

0 
C.) 

E 
E 

. 
co 

Z 
.2 5  u 
c 

= 
E co 
1 a a 

9 

Drug Misuse and Trafficking (Amendment) 1988 

00 

O 

00 	00 	 00 	00 	00 
N (-A 

00 00 00 	00 00 	00 	00 
...Y 	.14 	-Y 	_,e .. ... ...,e co o o o o o o 
r-i 	c; r i 	r i 	r i 	r i 	 Cl 

r.i 

	

oo oo oo 	op oo 	oo .14 	-NC 	-SC 	-14 	 .1L krk 	o 	.11 	kr) 	ki•) 	 kr) 	 kr) 
C 

C C C C C C 
CI 

	

oo 0oo 0 	0 	0 	0 
0 0 A g o a 	slo r  , cso A go u• o   
cr) o ," o ,r, 	c•sc Lel wi 	,n  i...... — 

	

0 on ,n 8 ,r; 	 . .,-, c, ,11 	on 	,,-; 
N n4 	Cl 	Cl 	r-c 

za 	" 0_0 0 40 0 je 

	

0O 	• 	0.0 00 
o• o o o 	o o 7 o o R o O 	7 5 6 	R5 6 

a 0 0 

	

. 	 . 
kr) 8 	5„5 ▪ 0 	v.) o 	OM 	v1 OM 	8

• 	00 

rn 

01 
E e . - 

E CO 

	

V 	01 

-c  

	

cu , a 	
.0 0. 

tel E . E u 	• ,,c  
R c.- V., a . ).,   

	

4:' ›-• o 	>. 
E o '4 	0 "0 '-' 	)4 .2 
cv 	v , ..c u 	..c u 

-c ,i E a • u  t 	,,, E 	t 5 	*,-,' 5 
E t- u u 	->• E 3% 	EL .0 . - .c 
6- . I,  0E ow,  ea 	'5 0 r... 	a r, 
!0C 0.ra. 	E ,.!, E 	cA, E 

(- i5 Cl CI 

  

0 

00 • 	:t 

aTC 4, 

.c 
• 

as
CJ 

-;„ 
-= 6 J C 
E 
6" 
r!i 

to .0 

441 

  

3.
4-

D
im

et
ho

xy
ph

en
yl

et
hy

la
m

in
e  

• 



cC 

O 

 

C 
S 

,5 

C 
S 

O 

PN 

S 
C 
75 

C 
S 

75 

 

P. 
E 
E 

c• d  
CP 

cu 
.75 - 

-ss 
'0 7 
C CP 

co 5 
E7 

.10 

EE 
cr 

 

   

	

00 	 00 

	

i I to" 	MIMI ec 

OD 
00 	OD 00 	OD 00 	00 	OD 0.0 00 00 00 'PI 00 00 	0.0 	OA OA OA es0 00 

	

-%4 X X -NC 	-%4 -NC X X X XOX X X 	.-N4 	..)4 X X 
CD 	CD CD 	CD CD 	C) 	CD CD 0 CD C) CD CD CD 	CD 	CD CD CD CD CD 

r'j 6 6 N 6 Ni V1 vt ,r; eNi O^^ r‘i N c‘i N .r; 

00 
..)4 
,r) 

01) 00 	co 	 oA 00 	00 og 	oD on 	00 	00 X 
OA 

.-% C ...% C 00 - 
(`) 

. -1 4 	Us 	00 OD 00 X OD 
.) 	-14 -14 	.14 -14 	.) 	-14 cr) kr) cr) . 0 ..r) 00 	-1L 	. 	-14 .) cr., ..se 
ce1 	kr, sn 	Li) sn 	srl 	Ill e,1 eV 1,1 )/1 C) IN 0 	V) 	VI tr) 4'1 CA )r) 
6 6 (-4 (--,i 6 c‘i 6 - - ., 6 6 6 6 6 6 6 6 - 6 

crl 
CN 

00 
)r) 

C 	 N 	0 
OA 	OD ao 	oD ps, 	co co 	oo oo mo oo co 	Vii 0 	to ao 00 00 00 00 
0 0 Cs 0 ,s•-• 0 Cs c= sa-s s.r) kr1 0 0 kn 0 n ,..0000,,0 u. 
cr; 	cr; cr; 	kr; cn 0 cr.; kr; 	cr; ri r‘i esi cr; 0 cNi cr; 	crl 0 kr; kr; kr; kr; c--.i cr; 

"I 	"I "I 	cl 	--- 	 IN  

0 
OA OA 	

" ,00C 
	0.0 0.0 00 o0 Oh 0 • 00 OD cz, 0.6. cs. sn 	Lrs 0 0 sr) 0 

- sti 	tr; Tr 0 o c-4 c‘i - - Tr 6 

ii 
OA 	OA 00 	04 rh 	OA 00 	OA 04 04 CO Oh 0 00 OD 	OD 00 00 OD 00 OA 

CD 	CD CD 	CD 6-4 1 CD CD 	C) .11 wl v1 0 CD 4n 0 	CI 	C) CD 0 CD 4-1 CD 
I,) 	C."; ,r; 	 ,r; VI (:) rn WI 	c...; t- r-: r-: r....i c=i .-- r•-; 	,n 0 M con en c•-) r- r.-1 

0 t., _ 0 _ 3    O ' 
..0 , • 7-.1 E 	(-, 	 , C  -0 V 

(.1 co 	<1.) ch   ›. >. 
C. 

	

0   .0 

	

H• (.. 4.) 	.3 . U 	  R' 

	

1D a 	0 
7 a 	  I... 'V 

. -., 0 	

. 
.0 CI 	  1-1; .6 

	

,.T3.  CI E  «.0  czt  ›. 0  ,.mi rn -  8 0  
,... = x       
V 	,_] 	  s C 

	

'0 C C 	 V 
O 	=  

 0,  Cs 
'01 

	

0D cu 	V = ' 	  • ..in 

	

= 	  "0 

	

c (411 E 	a, 	‘9,   r--- 

	

,,, 0 c•-, 	= 0. • 5 	  >, = 

	

.-- , 	43 8 o.    x qi,  u 0  >-• E x 0  2 '3,' -E ,.). 0
c..• 

. - o • cz  ,:, .0 0 :0 cu a., ..'' ..... . - 

	

73 	1E ,a,  z 	 ,, •,-; ,,, ,. 	 '. .... .. . s ,.., .- ,.., •2 	7,2 0 ai a) a) " E c 

	

C= > „., a.) o E. e• 7°) 1:1 c '7 17. -0 o o a .-- o 6 c 	-= e'' " 5 ,L,  .= = _ 0 ›, ..- t 0 < N . F. -0 	>, 7:3  

	

,,,, . - Cs ..c 	 >s , t., E E <' E 
0. = u ,•:-; E E 4. c.2 -c . a 7.,  c .E . c x • 

	

5 t, so 	0000.c , , ‘...  
O. co co ..i 

	

s• , 	.C.c0002=C" s- x ,6 	....'-' 
>. >s U,-. U-s Ls L, 	 c., v 7 0 

O CU 	Ti: al Li) al al al.1 L.L. u. u. 1 4-1 i = T i aC 

0 

<1.) 
C 
6.) 

(-) 
V) 

10 

Drug Misuse and Trafficking (Amendment) 1988 

SC
H

ED
U

LE
 1—

co
nt

in
ue

d
 

• 



4-
M

et
ho

xy
m

et
hy

la
m

ph
et

am
in

e  

E 
r, 
0. 
E 

0 

X CC.. 
0 ›, 
.0 

r, 
E 

4-
M

e t
ho

xy
am

ph
et

am
in

e  

M
et

az
oc

in
e  

M
et

ha
do

ne
  

C 

6 
CJ 

E 

-6 

71
C  
E 

O 

- 

E 
O 
(-) 

E 

0 
U 

SC
H

E
D

U
L

E
 1—

co
n t

in
ue

d 

E 0 7 
U 

cu 

12 7-I 
'0 - 7 0 CT 

ccs 
(I) co 

• 
• 

S 

11 

Drug Misuse and Trafficking (Amendment) 1988 

00 	OA tN 	CI 0 0 o0 o tr) 	Cl) 	0.0 	o0 0 	0 	r- 	eN 	n1 	N 
O 	d 	d 	l I d 	6 	6 

CO 	oo Y 	Y 
00 fl el 

..1[ 0 	C 
C'. 	0 	0 
— 6,  0 

CO m m o0 	of) 
cr) 0 0 0 
I- r N N ri ri 

CO 00 ...x 	-x 	on o0 un tn y ol) 
- 	 ,n 0 0 , Y CD CD 00 CO 
t" 1 0 0 00 r- ,n ,r, tn ..... 
6 d ci  

	

— O 0 	c; 	6 

oo oo D D C tr, a vn 2 bp a C C) co 0 0 0 	o 	0 o 	2 w 	 t-4.2 vID° OW 0 	1-1 CO .-. 	on 	on ., 	 0 0 21  o 
(-4 	v, 8 0 	,r) 8 6 	 I.. 	. 	)... 	. 	i... 	. 0 0 oo r- cr; ken 0 tr) ,e) 0 cr% 	.11 0 kr, N 	el 	tn 	..... ..... 	<V 	tN 	eN 

,„`O' q 0 
2 0 —9 ao on on 	

a*. 
rz 8 00 cm on 	

0
on n  00 

o o 1.• .1- 8 6 	v o 	— ao o v o o v `) 

00 op  
0 en 0 en C oo 	2 0 	0 CO 0 9 CI kr. ot) co cz nl tr. 0  0 ,—, oll © a) .i, O ..,, 

—  F?-, 8 0
8. 

,.,1 8 ;: 	,... . 	 8 r,-; vl O— 0 vi .r, 8 ,-- , 8 ,-; 	‘r, 
--. — — —• — 

••`-' 	au 	>. L.,  
u 0 0 0 Tti •- .= a) 

:ow  . . ..9°w 
.c a) ".  .- on 	0 t., O t 7., on C .= 

U  .47 0 .0 7 	
,..,2 -=._. 41 . t.. -- 

4.1 74'—' an 71 6 CJ  + = , 
.0 = 

> v '''' .0 2 8 	.... 	co ,,,. 0..r..... 	•r 	co > m an >, 0 X L. V • -. = E 
.3., a.. > . ,..  -0 .5.• 	 v,  .4 , 

VI cp .0 tv Z.; DA r.: c ,)) -= V 0 .= E c -0 	 .- .- 	 G E 0 CI 
-6 

 r 	9 1 	'0  o — 
t 	c > 	> r.,, 	c R.— ._ cu 	L @    ,4 t-, = 

R c 
-;.-- • - 

C 	c.. 7,3" E . -c . 
u> c.., :v > . a C . > . OO k.. 0 F.4 .i: 01 7.: i •,.7. 7 t, a.. C... 	,, a) ,_ 	u c.., co w, 
>, 0-0 0. 	,.., .0 0. 	, I= ..c >-. -.1 -.1 2 

O 

0. 
0 



C 

CO 

o. 
E co 

M 0_ 
4N1 

I) 
C 

X (L) 
07. 
"s5 

E 
Tr 

_ 
CO 

o. 
E 
>•, 

VI 0 . - 
TT 
> I C cU 

QJ 
° .0 

T.; 
2 E 

E 

C 

C 

O 
U 

E 
U 

SC
H

ED
U

L
E

 1—
co

nt
in

ue
d 

C 

C 
U 

CO = 

Cl, 7 

12 

Drug Misuse and Trafficking (Amendment) 1988 • 
• 

• 

00 	00 	OD 	00 	OD 	OD rs1 	CV 	r‘l 	CV 	CV 	CV 
6 	6 	6 	6 	6 	O1 1 1 1 1 1 

Of) 
00 	00 	01) 	00 	OD 	00 	OA OD 01) OD OD 

.54  
kr) 

-NC ...1C ..1C 0 0 0 ,n , 1 
esi 	 esi r4 6 6 6 

OD 
..Y 

01) OD ,r, 
Y 00 	On 	00 	00 	00 	X • 00 00  _ 	-IC 	..Y 	..1C 	...)E 	...V 	kr) ..x .54 IN IN 0 v-, 	,e, 	kr, 	kr, 	,e, 	kr, 	IN kr, kr, — — 0 C; 	6 	c; 	6 	6 	6 	6 6 6 6 6 6 

00 

A A A 
. 

• OA 
• . O 0 

01) 
 0  

OD 
 0  

01) 
 0  

OD 
 1-gel  
1r1b0  kr0f)  

° ,n 0 h ▪ 8 Cf .11 0 v.', 	v.) 8 CfC 	kr 8 ,r; 	0 	CF kr kr) 	•• 0 
IN 	N 	 CV 

00 
kr1 

A 00 
 00 00 CV " 	• 01) 0 A▪ D 0 AD 

0%
.8) 8)anna), 09 o o 	Tr 0 6 	o 	.1-  8 6 .1- ic5 6 'Et 8 6 	6 6 6 

OD 
OA 00 r-- c • 	OD c cSA cr:) OD r9 OD OD 00 OD 	0 A a 0 ▪ 00 

	

0 	0 	 0 k-+ 0 0 0 0 r- r--  

	

.4.1  1.. . 	1... . kr, 8 en.  ,,, 0 en en en en 0 0 0 kr, 8 r.-; 	0 en 	,,, 0 ,..., 	, 8 eei .-. 	..... 	.-. 	.... 	.... 	.--. 

4-
M

et
ho

xy
ph

en
yl

et
hy

la
m

in
e  

CO 

c 
E E  

CO 

E 
>. E 

E- F 0 0 0 E 
:13..Eout,c 

ta, 1- C 	CO 
"" o > > 7„.  f, 

E 6 
viztt 

7.>, "5:. 2 2 .c„ 
CJ CJ r, cU 

2 2 2 r,-; e•-; A 



SC
H

ED
U

L
E

 1—
co

nt
in

ue
d 

E = 

vY 

= 
13 

e 

O 

E 

= 
0 
C.) 

1; i;  
pppp

u  E 
E O 

L .40 

E R  
U 

.13 - as 

,6 • 5 cr 

C 
O. 

13 

Drug Misuse and Trafficking (Amendment) 1988 

1 	1 	1 	1 	1 	1 	1 	1 	1 	1 	1 	III 	1111111111 

	

oa 	 on 
4e 

	

0,0 Y to OD 	OD OD OD OD 04 	Oh 	04 00 04 	CO OD 04 OD OD OD OD OD OD wl 

	

CD -Id -Id 	-Id ..14 	-Id -Id 	-Id 	-Id -1C 	...)d 	...IC -Id -Id -IC 	CD 
0 CD CD 0 0 CD CD CD CD 0 CD CD CD 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 C) CD 
6 6 r4 	-- 6 ri ri ri N ri ri vi 6 6 4 4 vl N c5 

-Y 

	

oa 	 OD 
...Y 

	

WI 	 ul 

	

CA 	04 	00 	04 OD 	 OD 	 04 	rA 

	

04 OA --. OD -Id 	..IC OD -IC -Id OD 	OD 	04 04 00 	00 00 -Id OD OD OD 00-Id 00 -- 

	

-Id -Id 0 -IC WI 	WI -Nd of wl -Nd 	-Id 	-Id -Id .IC 	..14 -NG h -Id ..Y -Nd -Id WI -Id 0 

	

WI In 0 ,r1 N 	N ,r1 ri ri 0 	,n 	in ,r, in 	in in el 0 ,r1 <0 co el v1 r0 
6 csi 6 6 c5 6 6 6 6 v; 6 000 ci 6 -4 vi e4 -- -- -4 6 6 

	

OD 04 • 00 OD 	OD 04 OD OD OD 	04 	on 00 00 	04 	00 OD 00 00 00 04 00 
00000 0000 0 000 ociO4 incoc000inoci 

n 6 in in vi in in in c5 vi vi vi vi vi vi ri 6 in  6 e5 
es1 	 rsi 4r4 4/1 

	

OD 	 OD 

	

.11 	 4r4 

	

r4 	 4-1 

	

OD opCD Oa OD 	OD OD OD OD OD 	OD 	OD OD OD 	OD OD OD 00 OD OD OD OD OD CD 
CD CD CD CD C) CD CD CD CD CD CD 000 CD CD 4" 0 C) 0 0 un CD 0 

	

..- ,n 6 - -. _. - - _. 6 	 - .... Csi 6 vi 6 6 N -- O 

DO DO 

	

kr) 	 kr) 

	

r- 	 r- 

	

on OD 0 04 0,0 	00 04 00 00 OD 	op 	c0 00 00 OD OD OD OD OD OD OD 03 00 0 
00000 00000 0 000 00 ,r0000 4n 0 0 
ri vi 0 re: ri ri ri r6 ee; 6 re; ri ri ri e6 ri r 0 vi 0 0 	ri 0 

M -. rn on 

• 
• 

• 
O 

— IC •C Z 
-C 

C.. 09 CJ CJ C 
u 0'3  C:c 

— L .c 0. c .0 .0 	0. 
.0 C.+ Z.; 0 	" 	" 0 15 2 2 N g 2 C 16 8 5 I>, 

2 2 o 2222 

4... o 1... 
3 o  
i-i • o  

3 3  
F.' 	V 61 	t .  Z ... CD CO v .0 	t) CA 
3• ?i o 5.• 	."' ic  -6 .• ..e c "0 a 
cu u  
.c CI  N 4". , R 	 ., .0 

c... 
cA  

tn  ... 11.; -1 (I) 7, 

::1
" V y 
..0 = 	1... ,...1 

tU 0 C.0 
.0 ‘A V, .0 ..' 

8 as 	30 
.6..5 . .-• CA 

a • .... 
4.) a.  X ,J 	15 e.,  AD co 	cp ..e 	ic  c., - 
it '-' 0 e c  t o., c  x e., 

C _o ',J .0  
0 •-' • — .Z r, c6,  - 

.....51 t 13 5 E E -5 o 
8 	6" - . • i 3=  u -0. 2 7,  , • 1  : :8' = 
u° i 2 8 8 ° ' '° ._ 	.,., 8 80- z z z z z 

io 

R 0 C 
:E" 

I,- 	C R 
CI E E 	 ° _E• EE'5. == o5= 1.. 

z• zzz0000n. 



0 

U 

E 
0 

U 

SC
H

ED
U

LE
 1  —

co
n  t

  in
  tie

d 

,t1 

E 
0 
O 

0 
U 

0 
O 
U 

.3 (• 

C - 
71 
C 

= 

E id 
5/)

0 

14 

Drug Misuse and Trafficking (Amendment) 1988 

OD 

IIIIIIIIII 	1 	1 	1111 

00 00 00 00 00 00 0.0 00 00 00 	00 00 00 00 	00 	 00 
.AC .-NC •a -NC .-%E .-%4 .-%a -.NE AC -Sa 	X ..* X .X 	..sa 	00 	00 	_Y 
0 0 00000000 0000 o o 	o o 
.-. 6 6 -. -. .r; vi vi -. 6 	vi 6 -.. - o (ri 	ci 	d 

0 	0 	
(.-; - 	- 	_ o N 

	

0 	- 	- 

Y 	to C  00 00 	0.0 	00 00 	00 0.0 00 	 00 	-IC 00 -14 	 00 
Vl _%e _%E 	00 we we we we _NC 	V1 .-eg en we 	we 	00 	00 	Y 
ni 	we (,) 0 eV N C•1 ni 	ni h ni CN 
O • • • • r‘i r‘i O ci 	csi 	c-1 o o o 	 d 

	

(in 	N 	IN IN 

	

eD 0 c) 	eD 	en en en 0 ..f1 0 01 01 0) 
V1 V1 Vi N V1 (-4 N N N (4-; 	r‘i N o N 	,r) 0 6 	in 0 6 

	

IN 	 lf ,4:1 	0.4 

	

0.0 00 00 00 00 00 00 00 00 00 	00 00 00 00 	00 
O O o (r) o en en en en 0 we 0 en we we 

en en O- N N N O vo rsi v1  O O 4r) 

00  
w' In • 00 

	

00 00 00 00 00 0.0 00 00 00 00 	00 00 00 00 	00 	 cs
„ ,, we ...,o ere ere ere 0 ere 0 en en 	, 	a r6 0 ..„ 

	

,; w; w; - r.-; N: N: : -: ,A 	N: ,,-; -: -: I r ..n 8 d 	.4,1 0 0 en --. .--. .--. .--. col ._., - 

00 • 00 ‘ra 00 00 00 OD 00 00 OD 00 00 00 	00 00 00 00 	0.0 

• 00 a 
of8 6 

00 71- 0 0 
0 0 

0  
6. 	

It VI 6) • .. 	V) Q 6) 
• 
Q 
" 

0 	  03 	0 = 
. 	.0 0 U 	

0 C 
eLe 

C. 	et. 00 	.-• 00 
I-t 	at,  ._ 	0 00 c 	00 0 

	  el) te 1/1 
-• 0.1 	

.0 CC1 
C .... • •-• 

 C 3 • •-• C  
.0 	.0 0 

	  3 	 ea C 	° 
en 

	  e- .0 	u 	en 0 	6.) 0 

ca 	 ..1 	03 
	  j!", 

u :I 	IS 	03 00 	> 00 
,_ CA 	 Um 	> = 

^. .... 	.17 c 
   0 ...- 0 	0.) 	1... 	u ' 

 t „R . 6) > 13 CO 0 MI 
0..1 ... . - 	 T5 	.0 	(A .0 

6) T 0.  .... 	
... ... 

'0 	0 	,i. a, 0., . C.) C • -- cn 	 "0 ul _ -- x re„) 
°-' 	E 5., e 0 • - =  0 >, .1-)  .0 	a) 4., 	-0 ,L, 	= al 
• 0 c • 	,...-' N 0.-0..C,.-• 01-)0JC -‘•C)C .> r, CV > 0 ..- CU 

C •'-' t a , 	_x (=.   c. ,   : _ .7 ,° • ' 2 o' .1 76 _t . E " 3 • . • g :1" . r-i 7 4-;;; ..--...: .,,,..... E  >, 74 	E .-. .-. . a 	co 	›...> al E N 	>. • - 	O. c 0 I- 0 	c. '74 c: . - 	 C. "0 03 CO CO C., -Cf E 0 0 (I, c, 0 c ,... u -0 52 u .'T.  cci 	0 

	

ccc0Ccc..c-to•- •-...0:c .0.0v.- 	0 a) 1... .0 .... 0) Q ,,, 0 0. ... 0., .0 .0 ..c .0 ..c _a .0 .0 , .0 	.- .- 4... ,... (... (A U. -0 ca. 
a. a. o. a. a. a. a. a. 	- a. 	o. o. a. a. a. O. 	 O. T

e
tr

ah
yd

ro
ca

n
n
ab

in
ol

  

• 
• 

• 



CC 

E CC  
E 
U 

ER 
cr 

I  -
(3

.4
.5

-T
ri

m
et

ho
xy

ph
en

yI
)-2

-a
m

in
ob

ut
am

e  

2.
4.

5-
Tr

im
et

ho
xy

ph
en

yl
et

hy
la

m
in

e  

E 

C 
E 

 

C 
E 

en 
C 

E 

N 
C 
E 

 
U 

C 
E 

U 

SC
H

E
D

U
L
E

 1—
con

tin
ue

d 
15 

Drug Misuse and Trafficking (Amendment) 1988 

00 on 	of) oP of) of) 
r.4 r r I 

6 

oD -Y 
op 00 Do kr) op 00 00 op oo oP OP oP op 

...14 -NC -t L C ) -1C -IC ..Y _1 e ..N e ..N C .1 C Y ..x 
0 00000 0 0 0 0 0 0 C 
r-i Cl Cl ci c; (-,i Cl e-,i (-i (-i (-,i c‘i r i 

Do ..4e ,r, rA oo oo oo — Do oo oo Do o0 co oP oil 00 
Y Y Y 0 Y Y Y y y _X y -X y 
Cr! 	ken Cr! .0. ken v.) 	Cr! 	Cr! 	Cr! 	Cr! 	Cr) 	kr) 	to 
6 6 6 6 t-i 6 6 6 0 0 0 0 0 

1.) ›, 

t
as 

g c) N• Q CI a 	a 	CI C 0 0 
00 oP of) —. OP n OD OD r‘ of) r, 	oar, 	oA 	an an 	00 

'0 7 	00000 1-1  L00  0 I-1 	0 1-1  LO CH 	 0 
7 0' 	ken 0 kn Cr! vi 0 kel kr) 	..; ..r, 8 .-; ." 8 'D.; ",,, 8 ,..; .r. 	vi ,r) 8 Cr! ..., 8 vi kin 8 Cr! — eV r4 r4 el " r4 r4 r4 r4 

A A A A A A 
A 	o• ve 8°8 ea L oo0 o%°0 L atin 0%40 oO°C 1°0 o°o°0 o°o° 
er 8 6 6 vi .7  d  Oder   ci et 8 6 er er er 8 ci er 8 ci 

A Ao A A A A A A A 
A 	r• C A A A GI A A a 
Ca 	aeas  an  ac  cson  en c<>0r:)  ,,,,00 Low  .0, 0 ,..... .0 o 
Cr! 0 en en en C.) kr) Cr! 0 en .r) 0 en kr) 0 en .-, o tel 4.% o vi ..-) d en .n 8 .-; w-, C. 

 .._ ._.  

2,
3,

4,
5-

Te
tr

am
et

ho
xy

am
ph

et
am

in
e  

6.1 6J 
C C 

E E E E E E 
C., .0 
E 

C.., .0 
E 

CJ .0 
E 

(... .0 
E 

a., .0 
E 

co -c 
E co 

>. 
X 

Cc; 
T 
X 

cel 
T. 
X 

ea 
T 
X 

tel T 
X 

el 
>, 
X 

(LJ o — c -c >..-,.; t 
0 .c 
t 

0 ..c 
Z1 

o ..c 
t 

0 .c 
r, 

0 -c 
711 

E • = e 	0 	co 	.... E E E E E 
C = 11-J C 
01 • •-. 6.1 C:'.  H 
/::)  O 0  E -4- 

C- 

..1 
C. 
H 
.D 

C 
17 ,r, 

C 
H 4, 

17. 
17 
,r, 

C .0 .0 L en 
I— l—,  I— I— r-i 

r•i 
Cl 

M 
t-.4 

7Ti 
ri Cl 

4 
44-; 



16 

' Drug Misuse and Trafficking (Amendment) 1988 

BY AUTHORITY 
D. WEST, GOVERNMENT PRINTER, NEW SOUTH WALES-I988 

• 
• 



• 
• 

• 
• 



• 
• 

• 
S 


