
THE GREAT SYNAGOGUE, SYDNEY (AMENDMENT) 
BILL, 1979 

EXPLANATORY NOTE 

(This Explanatory Note relates to this Bill as introduced into Parliament) 

The object of this Bill is to amend The Great Synagogue, Sydney, Act, 1931— 

to increase the number of Vice-Presidents of the Board of Management 
of The Great Synagogue, Sydney, from 1 to 2 (Schedule 1 (1) (a)); 

to increase the maximum number of life members who may be appointed 
to the Board of Management, from 2 to 4 (Schedule 1 (1) (d)); 

to allow the appointment to the Board of Management of an additional 
member or 2 additional members (Schedule 1 (1) (e)); 

to alter the procedures relating to the passing of special resolutions at 
meetings of the members of The Great Synagogue, Sydney (Schedule 1 
(5)); and 

to make other provisions of a minor, consequential or ancillary nature. 

69420E 	166— 



1 



THE GREAT SYNAGOGUE, SYDNEY (AMENDMENT) 
BILL, 1979 

No. 	, 1979. 

A BILL FOR 

An Act to amend The Great Synagogue, Sydney, Act, 1931, with 
respect to the constitution and certain meetings of the Board 
of Management of The Great Synagogue, Sydney. 

[MR F. J. WALKER-21 November, 1979.] 

69420F 	166— 



Act No. , 1979. 2 

The Great Synagogue, Sydney (Amendment). 

BE it enacted by the Queen's Most Excellent Majesty, by and with 
the advice and consent of the Legislative Council and Legislative 
Assembly of New South Wales in Parliament assembled, and by the 
authority of the same, as follows :- 

5 1. This Act may be cited as "The Great Synagogue, Sydney shot t title.  
(Amendment) Act, 1979". 

(1) Except as provided in subsection (2), this Act shall Commence- 
commence on the date of assent to this Act. meat. 

(2) Section 3 and Schedule 1 shall commence on such 
10 day as may be appointed by the Governor in respect thereof and 

as may be notified by proclamation published in the Gazette. 

3. The Great Synagogue, Sydney, Act, 1931, is amended in Amendment 
the manner set forth in Schedule 1. of The Great 

Synagogue, 
Sydney, Act, 
1931. 

SCHEDULE 1. Sec. 3. 

15 AMENDMENTS TO THE GREAT SYNAGOGUE, SYDNEY, ACT, 1931. 

(1) (a) Section 12 (1)— 

Omit "Vice-President Treasurer", insert instead ", two 
Vice-Presidents, a Treasurer". 

Section 12 (1)- 

20 Omit "section fourteen hereof", insert instead "section 
15". 

Section 12 (1)— 

After "life members", insert ", or additional member 
or members,". 



Act No. 	, 1979. 	 3 

The Great Synagogue, Sydney (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE 1—continued. 

AMENDMENTS TO THE GREAT SYNAGOGUE, SYDNEY, ACT, 
1931—continued. 

Section 12 (4)- 

	

5 	 Omit "two life members", insert instead "four life 
members". 

Section 12 (5A)— 
After section 12 (5), insert :— 

(5A) Subject to the rules in force for the time 

	

10 	 being, the Board of Management may from time to 
time appoint as an additional member of the Board of 
Management a person who has been a member of the 
body corporate for a continuous period of not less 
than five years immediately preceding the date of his 

	

15 	 appointment: Provided that there shall not be at any 
time more than two additional members of the Board 
of Management. 

(2) (a) Section 14 (1)— 
Omit "The President Vice-President Treasurer and 

	

20 	 other members of the Board of Management of the 
Association (other than any life member of the Board 
of Management of the Association) in office at the 
date of the passing of this Act shall be first President 
Vice-President Treasurer and ordinary members 

	

25 	 respectively of the Board of Management and they 
shall hold office until the first general meeting of the 
members and at such meeting and thereafter at", insert 
instead "At". 

(b) Section 14 (1)— 

	

30 
	 Before "shall be elected", insert "or additional 

member appointed under section 12 (5A)". 



Act No. , 1979. 4 

The Great Synagogue, Sydney (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE 1—continued. 

AMENDMENTS TO THE GREAT SYNAGOGUE, SYDNEY, ACT, 

1931—continued. 

Section 14 (1)- 
5 After "then in office", insert "other than any additional 

member appointed under section 12 (5A)". 

Section 14 (1)— 
Omit "appointed", insert instead "elected". 

(e) Section 14 (2)- 
10 Omit "re-election", insert instead "election or 

appointment". 

Section 14 (3) — 
Omit the subsection. 

(3) (a) Section 1 5- 

1 5 Omit "office of a member", insert instead "office of the 
President, a Vice-President, the Treasurer or an 
ordinary member". 

(b) Section 15— 
Omit "a person qualified to be a member thereof', 

20 insert instead "another member of the Board of 
Management or a person qualified under the 
provisions of this Act and of the rules for the time 
being to become a member thereof'. 

Section 17- 

25 Omit "Vice-President" where firstly occurring, insert instead 
"or one of its Vice-Presidents". 



Act No. , 1979. 5 

The Great Synagogue, Sydney (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE 1—continued. 

AMENDMENTS TO THE GREAT SYNAGOGUE, SYDNEY, ACT, 
1931—continued. 

(5) (a) Section 19- 
5 Omit "two meetings", insert instead "a meeting". 

(b) Section 19 (a)— 

Omit "and one weekly newspaper", insert instead 
"newspapers". 

Section 19 (a)- 
10 Omit "first of such meetings", insert instead "meeting". 

(d) Section 19 (b)— 

Omit "first meeting and that if it be passed it will be 
submitted for confirmation as a special resolution to a 
second meeting which will be subsequently held", 

15 insert instead "meeting". 

Section 19 (c), (d)— 

Omit the paragraphs. 

Section 19 (e)— 

Omit "each meeting", insert instead "the meeting". 

20 (g) Section 19 (e)— 
Omit "of either such meetings". 

(h) Section 19 (f)— 

Omit "either meeting", insert instead "the meeting". 



 
 

Act No. 	, 1979. 	 6 

 
  

  

 

The Great Synagogue, Sydney (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE 1—continued. 

AMENDMENTS TO THE GREAT SYNAGOGUE, SYDNEY, ACT, 
1931—continued. 

(i) Section 19 (i)- 

	

5 	 Omit "first of such meetings and duly confirmed at the 
second thereof", insert instead "meeting". 

(a) Section 20 (1)— 

Omit "Vice-President", insert instead "a Vice-
President". 

	

10 	(b) Section 20 (2) (a)— 

Omit "Vice-President" where firstly occurring, insert 
instead "a Vice-President". 

Section 23— 
Omit "Vice-President or Treasurer" where firstly occurring, 

	

15 	insert instead "a Vice-President or the Treasurer". 

BY AUTHORITY 
D. WEST, GOVERNMENT PRINTER. NEW SOUTH WAI RS-I979 

[16c] 



• 
THE GREAT SYNAGOGUE SYDNEY 

(AMENDMENT) ACT, 1979, No. No. 180 

• 

Attu 	 'outI) dini; ate5 

ANNO VICESIMO OCTAVO 

ELIZABETHIE II REGIME 
* * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * 

Act No. 180, 1979. 

An Act to amend The Great Synagogue, Sydney, Act, 1931, with 
respect to the constitution and certain meetings of the Board 
of Management of The Great Synagogue, Sydney. [Assented 
to, 14th December, 1979.] 

• 
• 	P 73436G 	[16c] 



2 	 Act No. 180, 1979. 

The Great Synagogue, Sydney (Amendment). 

BE it enacted by the Queen's Most Excellent Majesty, by and with 
the advice and consent of the Legislative Council and Legislative 
Assembly of New South Wales in Parliament assembled, and by the 
authority of the same, as follows :— 

Short title. 	1. This Act may be cited as "The Great Synagogue, Sydney 
(Amendment) Act, 1979". 

Commence-
ment. 

2. (1) Except as provided in subsection (2), this Act shall 
commence on the date of assent to this Act. 

(2) Section 3 and Schedule 1 shall commence on such 
day as may be appointed by the Governor in respect thereof and 
as may be notified by proclamation published in the Gazette. 

Amendment 3. The Great Synagogue, Sydney, Act, 1931, is amended in 
of The Great the manner set forth in Schedule 1. Synagogue, 
Sydney, Act, 
1931. 

Sec. 3. SCHEDULE 1. 

AMENDMENTS TO THE GREAT SYNAGOGUE, SYDNEY, ACT, 1931. 

(1) (a) Section 12 (1)— 
Omit "Vice-President Treasurer", insert instead ", two 
Vice-Presidents, a Treasurer". 

 

 

Section 12 (1)— 
Omit "section fourteen hereof", insert instead "section 
15". 

Section 12 (1)— 
After "life members", insert ", or additional member 
or members,". 

• 
• 

• 
• 



• 
• 

• 
• 

Act No. 180, 1979. 	 3 

The Great Synagogue, Sydney (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE 1—continued. 

AMENDMENTS TO THE GREAT SYNAGOGUE, SYDNEY, ACT, 
1931—continued. 

Section 12 (4)— 
Omit "two life members", insert instead "four life 
members". 

Section 12 (5A)— 
After section 12 (5), insert :— 

(5A) Subject to the rules in force for the time 
being, the Board of Management may from time to 
time appoint as an additional member of the Board of 
Management a person who has been a member of the 
body corporate for a continuous period of not less 
than five years immediately preceding the date of his 
appointment: Provided that there shall not be at any 
time more than two additional members of the Board 
of Management. 

(2) (a) Section 14 (1)— 
Omit "The President Vice-President Treasurer and 
other members of the Board of Management of the 
Association (other than any life member of the Board 
of Management of the Association) in office at the 
date of the passing of this Act shall be first President 
Vice-President Treasurer and ordinary members 
respectively of the Board of Management and they 
shall hold office until the first general meeting of the 
members and at such meeting and thereafter at", insert 
instead "At". 

(b) Section 14 (1)---- 
Before "shall be elected", insert "or additional 
member appointed under section 12 (5A)". 



4 	 Act No. 180, 1979. 

The Great Synagogue, Sydney (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE 1—continued. 

AMENDMENTS TO THE GREAT SYNAGOGUE, SYDNEY, ACT, 
1931—continued. 

Section 14 (1) — 
After "then in office", insert "other than any additional 
member appointed under section 12 (5A)". 

Section 14 (1)— 
Omit "appointed", insert instead "elected". 

(e) Section 14 (2)— 
Omit "re-election", insert instead "election or 
appointment". 

Section 14 (3)— 
Omit the subsection. 

(3) (a) Section 15— 
Omit "office of a member", insert instead "office of the 
President, a Vice-President, the Treasurer or an 
ordinary member". 

(b) Section 15— 
Omit "a person qualified to be a member thereof', 
insert instead "another member of the Board of 
Management or a person qualified under the 
provisions of this Act and of the rules for the time 
being to become a member thereof'. 

Section 17— 

Omit "Vice-President" where firstly occurring, insert instead 
"or one of its Vice-Presidents". 

• 
• 

• 
• 



• 
• 

• 

Act No. 180, 1979. 	 5 

The Great Synagogue, Sydney (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE 1—continued. 

AMENDMENTS TO THE GREAT SYNAGOGUE, SYDNEY, ACT, 
1931—continued. 

(5) (a) Section 19— 
Omit "two meetings", insert instead "a meeting". 

(b) Section 19 (a)— 
Omit "and one weekly newspaper", insert instead 
"newspapers". 

Section 19 (a)— 
Omit "first of such meetings", insert instead "meeting". 

(d) Section 19 (b)— 
Omit "first meeting and that if it be passed it will be 
submitted for confirmation as a special resolution to a 
second meeting which will be subsequently held", 
insert instead "meeting". 

Section 19 (c), (d)— 
Omit the paragraphs. 

Section 19 (e)— 
Omit "each meeting", insert instead "the meeting". 

Section 19 (e)— 
Omit "of either such meetings". 

Section 19 (f)— 
Omit "either meeting", insert instead "the meeting". 

• 



6 	 Act No. 180, 1979. 

The Great Synagogue, Sydney (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE 1—continued. 

AMENDMENTS TO THE GREAT SYNAGOGUE, SYDNEY, ACT, 
1931—continued. 

(i) Section 19 (i)— 
Omit "first of such meetings and duly confirmed at the 
second thereof', insert instead "meeting". 

(a) Section 20 (1)— 
Omit "Vice-President", insert instead "a Vice-
President". 

(b) Section 20 (2) (a)— 
Omit "Vice-President" where firstly occurring, insert 
instead "a Vice-President". 

Section 23— 
Omit "Vice-President or Treasurer" where firstly occurring, 
insert instead "a Vice-President or the Treasurer". 

In the name and on behalf of Her Majesty I assent to this Act. 

A. R. CUTLER, 
Governor. 

Government House, 
Sydney, 14th December, 1979. 

BY AUTHORITY 
D. WEST, GOVERNMENT PRINTER, NEW SOUTH WALES-1980 

• 
• 



• 
• 

1 
• 
• 



• 
• 

• 
• 


