-

—— L -

STOCK DISEASES (SWINE BRANDING) AMENDMENT

BILL, 1981

EXPLANATORY NOTE

(This Explanatory Note relates to this Bill as introduced into Parliament)

The Swine Compensation (Swine Branding) Amendment Bill, 1981, is cognate

with this Bill.

The objects of this Bill are to amend the Stock Diseases Act, 1923 (“the Act”),

so as to—

(a)

(b)

(c)

(d)

(e)

85774K

provide for the appointment under the Act of a registrar and deputy
registrars who will be responsible for the allotment of particulars of
identification required to be used on tags attached to cattle and brands
impressed upon swine for the purposes of the Act (Schedule 1 (2));

require that, on and from a date to be proclaimed, a person who sells
swine or sends or delivers swine to an abattoir for slaughter or to a
saleyard or any other place for sale must ensure that the swine are
identified by a brand comprised of particulars specified in a certificate
of registration issued under the Act to the owner of the swine (Schedule
1 (3) and Schedule 2 (1) (a)-(c) and (2) (¢));

except—

(i) owners of swine who hold and comply with the conditions of
licenses to be granted under section 198 of the Act, as amended
by the proposed Act; and

(ii) any persons exempted by the regulations made under the Act,

from the requirement referred to in paragraph (b) (Schedule 2 (1)
()3

empower the issue of licenses referred to in paragraph (c¢) by an officer
specified in regulations made under the Act (Schedule 1 (4));

create an offence if—

(i) swine are branded with particulars of identification allotted under
the Act, as amended by the proposed Act, to be used as a brand
on swine and those particulars have not been allotted to the
owner of the swine; or

211 —




(f)

(2)

(h)

(§))

(k)

)

(m)

2

(ii) use of the branding iron or other device by which swine are
branded with particulars so allotted results in the swine being
branded with other particulars

(Schedule 2 (2) (e));

provide for the allotment and registration of particulars of identification
to be used as a brand on swine (Schedule 1 (5) (¢));

provide for the cancellation or amendment of particulars of identification
to be used as a brand on swine (Schedule 1 (6));

require renewal, for successive periods, of the registration of particulars
of identification allotted under the Act, if they are to continue to be used
as a brand on swine (Schedule 1 (6) (b));

require any manufacturer of branding irons or other devices intended
for use in identifying swine in pursuance of Division 6 of Part IV of the
Act to be authorised by the Minister and that orders for any such
branding irons or other devices be certified by prescribed officers
(Schedule 1 (8));

ensure that records are kept of swine which are not identified in the
manner required under the Act and which are slaughtered at abattoirs
(Schedule 2 (3));

expand the power to make regulations under the Act for the purpose of
facilitating the tracing of the movement of diseased swine by requiring
the giving of certain notices under those regulations (Schedule 1 (10)
(a) and (b));

state that compensation for certain stock or property that is destroyed
and for stock certified to have died from a special disease, within the
meaning of the Act, shall not be payable by the Crown, unless it is
compensation payable under the Act (Schedule 3 (10)); and

increase the maximum monetary penalties that may be imposed for a
breach or continuing breach of the regulations made under the Act to
$1,000, and $100 per day, respectively (Schedule 3 (17)).

The proposed Act also contains provisions—

(a)
(b)
(c)

dividing the Stock Diseases Act, 1923, into Parts;
for the repeal of the Swine Branding Act, 1940; and

of a minor, consequential, saving or transitional nature.










STOCK DISEASES (SWINE BRANDING) AMENDMENT

BILL, 1981
No. , 1981.
A BILL FOR

An Act to amend the Stock Diseases Act, 1923, so as to require
swine to be branded in certain circumstances; to repeal the
Swine Branding Act, 1940; and for other purposes.

[MR DAY—27 November, 1980.]

See also Swine Compensation (Swine Branding) Amendment Bill, 1981.

85774K 211 —




Act No. , 1981.

Stock Diseases (Swine Branding) Amendment.

BE it enacted by the Queen’s Most Excellent Majesty, by and with
the advice and consent of the Legislative Council and Legislative
Assembly of New South Wales in Parliament assembled, and by
the authority of the same, as follows :—

5 Short title.

1. This Act may be cited as the “Stock Diseases (Swine
Branding) Amendment Act, 1981.

Commencement.

2. (1) Except as provided in subsections (2)—(4), this Act
10 shall commence on the date of assent to this Act.

(2) Section 5 shall, in its application to a provision of
Schedules 1-3, commence on the day on which that provision
commences.

(3) Schedule 1 shall commence on such day as may be
15 appointed by the Governor in respect thereof and as may be noti-
fied by proclamation published in the Gazette.

(4) Section 6 and Schedules 2 and 4 shall commence on
such day (being a later day than that appointed and notified under
subsection (3)) as may be appointed by the Governor in respect

20 thereof and as may be notified by proclamation published in the
Gazette.

Principal Act.

3. The Stock Diseases Act, 1923, is referred to in this Act
as the Principal Act.

25 Schedules.
4. This Act contains the following Schedules :—

SCHEDULE 1.—AMENDMENTS TO THE PRINCIPAL ACT
RELATING TO THE IDENTIFICATION OF STOCK.




Act No. , 1981. 3

Stock Diseases (Swine Branding) Amendment.

SCHEDULE 2.—FURTHER AMENDMENTS TO THE PRIN-
CIPAL ACT RELATING TO THE IDENTIFICATION OF

STtocCK.

SCHEDULE 3.—MISCELLANEOUS AMENDMENTS TO THE
5 PRINCIPAL ACT.

SCHEDULE 4.—REPEALS.

SCHEDULE 5.—SAVINGS AND TRANSITIONAL PROVISIONS.

Amendment of Act No. 34, 1923.
S. The Principal Act is amended in the manner set forth in
10 Schedules 1-3.

Repeals.

6. Each Act specified in Column 1 of Schedule 4 is, to the
extent specified opposite that Act in Column 2 of Schedule 4,

repealed.

15 Savings and transitional provisions.
7. Schedule 5 has effect.

SCHEDULE 1.
(Sec. 5.)
AMENDMENTS TO THE PRINCIPAL AcT RELATING TO
20 THE IDENTIFICATION OF STOCK.

(1) (a) Section 3 (1), definition of “Registrar”—
Omit the definition, insert instead :—

“Registrar” means any person appointed for the
time being as registrar or deputy registrar
25 under section 3A.




10

15

20

25

Act No. , 1981.

Stock Diseases (Swine Branding) Amendment.

SCHEDULE 1—continued.

AMENDMENTS TO THE PRINCIPAL ACT RELATING TO
THE IDENTIFICATION OF STOCK—continued.
(b) Section 3 (1), definition of “Swine”—
After the definition of “Stock”, insert :—

“Swine” includes boar, sow, barrow and pig of any
age, sex or breed.

(2) Section 3A—

After section 3, insert :(—

Appointment of registrar and deputy registrars.

3A. (1) The Minister may, by order under his hand,
appoint a registrar and deputy registrars for the purposes
of this Act from among the officers and temporary
employees of the Department of Agriculture.

(2) A person appointed under subsection (1)
ceases to hold his office as registrar or deputy registrar if
he ceases to be an officer or temporary employee of the
Department of Agriculture.

(3) Section 19A—

Omit “kind” wherever occurring, insert instead “class”.

(4) (a) Section 198 (1)—

Omit “The Chief of the Division of Animal Health”,
insert instead “A prescribed officer”.

(b) Section 198 (1)—

Omit “any kind of stock, not exceeding the number
prescribed”, insert instead “, at any one time, not
more than the prescribed number of stock of the kind
specified in the license”.



Act No. , 1981.

Stock Diseases (Swine Branding) Amendment.

SCHEDULE 1—-continued.

AMENDMENTS TO THE PRINCIPAL ACT RELATING TO
THE IDENTIFICATION OF STOCK—continued.

(c) Section 198 (2) (c)—

5 Omit “the Chief of the Division of Animal Health”,
insert instead “a person empowered under subsection
(1) to grant licenses of the class to which the license
belongs”.

(5) (a) Section 19p (1)—

10 After “stock”, insert “, not being swine,”.

(b) Section 19p (1)—

Omit “to the registrar, to have allotted to him”, insert
instead “, to have allotted to him by the registrar”.

(c) Section 19p (1A)—
15 After section 19p (1), insert :—

(1A) Any person who is the occupier of a holding
or, not being the occupier of a holding, is the owner of
any swine, is entitled, upon application, in a form in
or to the effect of the prescribed form and accom-

20 panied by the prescribed fee, to have allotted to him
by the registrar particulars of identification to be used
as a brand on swine in accordance with the provisions
of this Act.

(d) Section 19p (3)—
25 After “(1)”, insert “or (1A)”.

(6) (a) Section 19 (2) (b)—

Omit “in accordance with the provisions of section
1907, insert instead “by the registrar”.




10

15

Act No. , 1981.

Stock Diseases (Swine Branding) Amendment.

SCHEDULE 1—-continued.

AMENDMENTS TO THE PRINCIPAL ACT RELATING TO
THE IDENTIFICATION OF STOCK—continued.

(b) Section 19 (2A)—

After section 19 (2), insert :—

(2A) Where the holder of a certificate issued under
section 19p pursuant to an application under section
190 (1A) fails, before the expiration of any of the
prescribed periods following the issue of the certificate
to him, to make an application, in a form in or to the
effect of the prescribed form accompanied by the
prescribed fee, for renewal of the registration of the
particulars allotted to him and specified in the certifi-
cate, the registrar may exercise, with respect to the
certificate, the powers conferred by subsection (2) (¢)
and (d).

(c¢) Section 19 (3) (b)—

Before “issuing”, insert “under section 19p (2) and
in pursuance of this paragraph,”.

20 (d) Section 19 (4)—

Omit “under” where secondly occurring, insert instead
“in pursuance of”.

(7) Section 19eA (2)—

After “stock” where firstly occurring, insert “, not being
25 swine,”.

(8) (a) Section 19F (1)—

b

branding iron or other device intended for use in
identifying swine with particulars of identification
allotted under section 19D or any spare numbers
designed to be fitted to any such branding iron or
other device”.

After “Act” where firstly occurring, insert “, any



10

15

20

25

Act No. , 1981.

Stock Diseases (Swine Branding) Amendment.

(9)

(10)

SCHEDULE 1—continued.

AMENDMENTS TO THE PRINCIPAL ACT RELATING TO

THE IDENTIFICATION OF STOCK—continued.

(b) Section 19F (1)—

(c)

(d)

(a)

(b)

(b)

(c)

After “such tag”, insert “, branding iron, device or
spare numbers, as the case may require,”.

Section 19% (1) (a)—

After “tag”, insert “or brand”.

Section 19F (1) (a)—

Omit “the Chief of the Division of Animal Health”,
insert instead “a prescribed officer”.

Section 20 (1) (j1)—
After “stock” where firstly and lastly occurring, insert
“, not being swine,”.

Section 20 (1) (j3)—

Omit “or to the Chief of the Division of Animal
Health”, insert instead “, to an officer or temporary
employee of the Department of Agriculture”.

Section 23 (1) (m)—

After “of stock”, insert “, or persons to or by whom
stock is or has been delivered,”.

Section 23 (1) (m)—

After “furnish”, insert “or otherwise give, in accord-
ance with the regulations and at such times or in such
circumstances as are prescribed, notices or”.

Section 23 (1) (w), (x)—

After “tag,” wherever occurring, insert “brand,”.




Act No. , 1981.

Stock Diseases (Swine Branding) Amendment.

SCHEDULE 1—continued.

AMENDMENTS TO THE PRINCIPAL ACT RELATING TO
THE IDENTIFICATION OF STOCK—continued.

(d) Section 23 (1) (x)—

) Omit “any cattle”, insert instead “or otherwise used
to identify any cattle, swine”.

SCHEDULE 2.
(Sec. 5.)
FURTHER AMENDMENTS TO THE PRINCIPAL ACT RELATING TO
10 THE IDENTIFICATION OF STOCK.

(1) (a) Section 19a (1)—
Omit the subsection, insert instead :—

(1) The provisions of this section apply to—
(a) cattle of or above the age of 3 months;
15 (b) swine weighing 25 kilograms or more; and

(c) any other stock to which the provisions of
this section are applied in accordance with
subsection (2).

(b) Section 19a (3) (a), (b)—
20 After “cattle” wherever occurring, insert “or swine”.
(c) Section 19A (3)—
After “cattle” where lastly occurring, insert “, swine”.
(d) Section 19a (3)—

Omit “referred to in section 19c¢”, insert instead

25 “prescribed with respect to it in section 19c (1) or
(1A)”.



Act No. , 1981. 9

Stock Diseases (Swine Branding) Amendment.

SCHEDULE 2—continued.

FURTHER AMENDMENTS TO THE PRINCIPAL ACT RELATING TO
THE IDENTIFICATION OF STOCK—continued.

(e) Section 19A (3A)—

S Omit “or stock are offered for sale by auction they”,
insert instead ¢, swine or other stock is offered for
sale by auction it”.

(f) Section 19a (4) (a) (i), (ii)—

After “cattle” wherever occurring, insert “, swine”.

10 (g) Section 19A (4) (b)—

After “stock”, insert “, not being swine to which this
section applies,”.

(2) (a) Section 19c (1)—

After “any stock”, insert “, other than swine,”.

15 (b) Section 19c (1)—

After “identification” wherever occurring, insert “to
be used on tags, being particulars”.

(c) Section 19c (1A)—
After section 19c¢ (1), insert :(—

20 (1A) For the purposes of section 19A (3), the
manner of identifying swine shall be by identifying
the swine, in accordance with the regulations, with
particulars of identification to be used as a brand on
swine, being particulars specified in a certificate issued

25 by the registrar to the owner of the swine in accord-
ance with section 19p.



Act No. , 1981.

Stock Diseases (Swine Branding) Amendment.

SCHEDULE 2—continued.

FURTHER AMENDMENTS TO THE PRINCIPAL ACT RELATING TO
THE IDENTIFICATION OF STOCK—continued.

(d) Section 19c (2)—

5 After “registrar” where firstly occurring, insert “to be
used on tags”.

(e) Section 19c (2A)—

After section 19c (2), insert :—

(2A) No person shall brand any swine with
10 particulars of identification allotted by the registrar to
be used as a brand on swine unless—

(a) those particulars were allotted to the owner
of the swine by the registrar and the
certificate of registration specifying those

15 particulars has not, since they were last
allotted, been cancelled under section 19E;
and

(b) use of the branding iron or other device by

which the swine is branded does not result

20 in the swine being branded with any other
particulars.

(3) Section 196 (1)—

After “cattle”, insert “, swine”.

10




5

10

15

25

30

Act No. ,. 1981. 11

Stock Diseases (Swine Branding) Amendment.

SCHEDULE 3.
(Sec. 5.)
MISCELLANEOUS AMENDMENTS TO THE PRINCIPAL ACT.

(1) Part I, heading—

Before section 1, insert :—

PART 1.

PRELIMINARY.

(2) Section 1A—

After section 1, insert :—

Arrangement.
1a. This Act is divided as follows :—
PART I.—PRELIMINARY—ss. 1-4.
PART II.—BoARrRD OF Tick CONTROL—s. 5.
PART III.—INSPECTORS—ss. 6-8C.

PART IV.—CoONTROL OF DISEASES IN STOCK—ss.
9-19a.

DivisioN 1.—Notification of Diseases—s. 9.

DivisioN 2.—Quarantine Areas and Protected
Areas—ss. 10-15.

DivisioN 3.—Destruction of Certain Stock—ss.
16—-17A.

DivisioN 4.—Compensation and the Foot and
Mouth Disease Eradication Fund—ss. 17B—
171.

DivisioN 5.—Further Powers of Inspectors, etc.—
ss. 18, 19.

DivisioN 6.—Identification of Certain Stock—ss.
19a-19G.

PART V.—OFFENCES—s. 20.
PART VI.—MISCELLANEOUS—ss. 21-23.




Act No. , 1981. 12

Stock Diseases (Swine Branding) Amendment.

SCHEDULE 3—continued.

MISCELLANEOUS AMENDMENTS TO THE PRINCIPAL
AcT—continued.

(3) Part II, heading—
5 After section 4, insert :—
PART II.

BoARD OF Tick CONTROL.

(4) Part III, heading—
After section 5, insert :—
10 PART III.

INSPECTORS.

(5) Part IV, heading—
After section 8c, insert :—
PART IV.

15 CONTROL OF DISEASES IN STOCK.
DivisioN 1.—Notification of Diseases.
(6) Part IV, Division 2, heading—
After section 9, insert :—
DivisioN 2.—Quarantine Areas and Protected Areas. §
20 (7) Part IV, Division 3, heading—
After section 15, insert :—

DivisioN 3.—Destruction of Certain Stock.
(8) Part IV, Division 4, heading—
After section 17A, insert :—

25 DivisioN 4.—Compensation and the Foot and Mouth
Disease Eradication Fund.




Act No. ; 1981.

Stock Diseases (Swine Branding) Amendment.

SCHEDULE 3—continued.

MISCELLANEOUS AMENDMENTS TO THE PRINCIPAL
AcT—continued.

(9) Section 17F (4)—

5 Omit the subsection.

(10) Section 17HA—

After section 17H, insert :—

Compensation limited.

17HA. Notwithstanding the provisions of any other Act—

10 (a) no compensation, other than the compensation, if
any, payable under this Act, is payable by the
Crown for or in respect of any stock or property
referred to in section 17c; and

(b) no compensation is payable under any other Act
15 for or in respect of any stock or property for or
in respect of which compensation has been or

may be paid under this Act.

(11) Part IV, Division 5, heading—
After section 171, insert :—

20 DivisioN 5.—Further Powers of Inspectors, etc.

(12) Part IV, Division 6, heading—
After section 19, insert :—

DivisioN 6.—Identification of Certain Stock.

(13) Section 19a (4) (a) (i)—

25 Omit “issued;”, insert instead “issued; or”.

13




(14)

W

(15)

10 (16)

(17)

Act No. , 1981. 14

Stock Diseases (Swine Branding) Amendment.

SCHEDULE 3—continued.

MISCELLANEOUS AMENDMENTS TO THE PRINCIPAL
AcTt—continued.

Section 19B (2) (b)—

Omit “license;”, insert instead “license; and”.

Part V, heading—
Before section 20, insert :—
PART V. v

OFFENCES.

Part VI, heading—
After section 20, insert :—
PART VL

MISCELLANEOUS.

(a) Section 23 (3) (a)—
Omit “$400”, insert instead “$1,000”.

(b) Section 23 (3) (b)—
Omit “$20”, insert instead “$100”.

(c) Section 23 (3A)—

Omit “offence under”, insert instead “breach of”.
(d) Section 23 (3A)—

Omit “$5007, insert instead “$1,000”.




10

15

20

25

Act No. , 1981.

Stock Diseases (Swine Branding) Amendment.

SCHEDULE 4.
(Sec. 6.)
REPEALS.
Column 1. ‘ Column 2.
Year and \
number of Act. { Short title of Act. \ Extent of repeal.
_ S Y U A PR ST -
1940, No. 5 ..| Swine Branding Act, 1940 . ..! The whole Act.
1978, No. 67 ..| Metric Conversion Act, 1978 0 .. Ttem 45 of Schedule 1.
SCHEDULE 5.
(Sec. 7.)

SAVINGS AND TRANSITIONAL PROVISIONS.

Interpretation: Sch. 5.

1. In this Schedule, “the commencement” means the commencement of
Schedule 1.

Saving of certain proclamations, licenses and applications.

2. (1) Any proclamation applying the provisions of section 19A of the
Principal Act to a kind of stock that was—

(a) published in the Gazette pursuant to section 19A (2) of that
Act; and

(b) in force immediately before the commencement,

shall, on the commencement, be deemed to be a proclamation published
under section 19A (2) of that Act, as amended by this Act, applying the
provisions of section 19a of that Act, as so amended, to the class of stock
specified in the proclamation.

(2) A license granted under section 198 (1) of the Principal Act,
being a license in force immediately before the commencement, shall, on
the commencement, be deemed to be a license granted under section 198
(1) of that Act, as amended by this Act.

(3) Any application made under section 19p (1) of the Principal
Act which has not been finally disposed of before the commencement shall
be deemed to be an application made under section 19p (1) of that Act,
as amended by this Act.

15




10

15

20

2.5

30

35

Act No. , 1981.

Stock Diseases (Swine Branding) Amendment.

SCHEDULE 5—continued.

SAVINGS AND TRANSITIONAL PROVISIONS—continued.

Savings of certain certificates, etc.
3. (1) Any—

(a) certificate or new certificate issued under section 19p (2) or 19
(3) (b) of the Principal Act, being a certificate that was in force
immediately before the commencement; or

(b) particulars of identification or amended particulars of identifica-
tion specified in any such certificate,

shall, on the commencement, be deemed to be respectively a certificate
specifying particulars of identification allotted for use on tags or particulars
of identification for use on tags issued or allotted under section 19D of that
Act, as amended by this Act.

(2) Any—
(a) certificate of registration of a brand issued; or
(b) brand allotted,

under section 7 of the Swine Branding Act, 1940, after 27th February,
1980, and before the commencement shall, on the commencement, be
deemed to be respectively a certificate specifying particulars of identification
allotted for use as a brand on swine or particulars of identification for use
as a brand on swine issued or allotted under section 19p of the Principal
Act, as amended by this Act, but only if the brand was registered under
the Swine Branding Act, 1940, immediately before the commencement.

(3) Any particulars of identification allotted under section 19ea (1)
of the Principal Act before the commencement shall, on the commencement,
be deemed to be allotted under section 19eA (1) of that Act, as amended
by this Act.

Saving of certain authorisations.

4. Any written authorisation issued before the commencement by the

Registrar within the meaning of the Swine Branding Act, 1940, being an
authorisation—

(a) that had not been revoked by him before the commencement:;
and

(b) that purported to authorise its holder to manufacture—

(i) branding irons or other devices intended for impressing
brands allotted under section 7 of that Act; and

(ii) spare numbers designed to be fitted thereto,

16




Act No. , 1981.

Stock Diseases (Swine Branding) Amendment.

SCHEDULE 5—continued.
SAVINGS AND TRANSITIONAL PROVISIONS—continued.

shall, on the commencement, be deemed to be an authority issued by the
Minister under section 19 (1) of the Principal Act, as amended by this
5 Act, to manufacture branding irons or other devices intended for use in
identifying swine with particulars of identification allotted under section 19D
of that Act, as so amended, and spare numbers designed to be fitted thereto.

Saving of certain orders.
5. Any order—

10 (a) that was, after 27th February, 1980, and before the commence-
ment, signed by a person who had, during that period, been
allotted a brand under section 7 of the Swine Branding Act,
1940;

(b) that requested the manufacture, by the holder of an authorisation
15 referred to in clause 4 issued by the Registrar for the purposes
of that Act, of—

(i) a branding iron or other device intended for use in identi-
fying swine with the brand so allotted; or

(ii) any spare numbers designed to be fitted thereto; and
20 (c) that had not been complied with before the commencement,

shall, on the commencement, be deemed to be an order that complies with
the requirements prescribed with respect to orders by section 19¢ (1) (a)
of the Principal Act, as amended by this Act.

Saving of certain approvals.

25 6. Any person who was, immediately before the commencement,
approved under section 19F (1) (a) of the Principal Act by the Chief,
Division of Animal Health, Department of Agriculture, shall, on the com-
mencement, be deemed to be approved by a prescribed officer under section
19¥ (1) (a) of that Act, as amended by this Act.

30 Transitional provisions.

7. (1) Where, on or after the commencement and before the day
appointed and notified under section 2 (4), a person is the holder of a
certificate issued to him under section 19D of the Principal Act, as amended
by this Act, being a certificate that specifies particulars of identification

35 allotted for use as a brand on swine and that is in force—

(a) the particulars of identification specified in the certificate shall
be deemed to be a brand allotted and registered under section
7 of the Swine Branding Act, 1940: and

211—B

17




Act No. 51981

Stock Diseases (Swine Branding) Amendment.

SCHEDULE 5—continued.
SAVINGS AND TRANSITIONAL PROVISIONS—continued.

(b) the person shall be deemed to be the proprietor, within the mean-
ing of that Act, of that brand.

5 (2) Nothing in subclause (1) prevents a certificate referred to in
that subclause from being treated as a certificate issued under section 19D
of the Principal Act, as amended by this Act, for the purposes of that Act,
as so amended, during the period referred to in that subclause.

Further transitional provision and saving.

10 8. (1) On and from the day appointed and notified under section 2
(4)—

(a) any certificate of registration of a brand issued; or
(b) any brand allotted,

under section 7 of the Swine Branding Act, 1940, on or before 27th Febru-
15 ary, 1980, shall (if the brand was registered under that Act immediately

before the day so appointed and notified) be deemed to be respectively a

certificate specifying particulars of identification allotted for use as a brand

on swine or particulars of identification for use as a brand on swine issued

or allotted under section 19D of the Principal Act, as amended by this Act,
20 until—

(c) the expiration of 6 months after the day so appointed and notified;
or

(d) the certificate or the certificate specifying those particulars, as
the case may require, is cancelled under section 19 of the Prin-
25 cipal Act, as so amended,

whichever first occurs.

(2) Any license issued under section 6 of the Swine Branding Act,

1940, before the day appointed and notified under section 2 (4) shall,

on and from that day but subject to section 198 (2) (b) and (c) of the

30 Principal Act, as amended by this Act, be deemed to be a license granted
under section 198 (1) of that Act, as so amended.

Saving relating to certain penalties.

9. Notwithstanding section 23 of the Principal Act, as amended by

this Act, a person who, on or after the date of assent to this Act, is

35 found guilty of a breach of the regulations made under the Principal

Act which occurred before that date shall not be liable to any greater

penalty than that to which he would have been liable if he had been found
guilty of the breach immediately after he committed it.




Act No. , 1981.

Stock Diseases (Swine Branding) Amendment.

SCHEDULE 5—continued.
SAVINGS AND TRANSITIONAL PROVISIONS—continued.

Saving relating to certain references.

10. Where the Swine Branding Act, 1940, an instrument made under

5 that Act or any provision of that Act or of any such instrument is referred

to in any other Act or any instrument made under any other Act, the

reference shall, on and from the day appointed and notified under section

2 (4), extend to the Principal Act, as in force for the time being, to any

corresponding instrument made under that Act, as so in force, or to any

10 corresponding provision of that Act or of an instrument made under that
Act, as so in force.

BY AUTHORITY
D. WEST, GOVERNMENT PRINTER, NEW SOUTH WALES—1981
(45¢)

19






e O

STOCK DISEASES (SWINE BRANDING)
‘ AMENDMENT ACT, 1981, No. 10

ANNO TRICESIMO

ELIZABETHZ 11 REGINA

€k % ok ok sk sk sk ko k ok ok ok ok k Kk ok % ok k ok koK K % Kk %k ok k%
Act No. 10, 1981.

An Act to amend the Stock Diseases Act, 1923, so as to require
swine to be branded in certain circumstances; to repeal the

Swine Branding Act, 1940; and for other purposes. [Assented
‘ to, 22nd April, 1981.]
\

See also Swine Compensation (Swine Branding) Amendment Act, 1981.

‘ P93597K  (80c)




Act No. 10, 1981.

Stock Diseases (Swine Branding) Amendment.

BE it enacted by the Queen’s Most Excellent Majesty, by and with
the advice and consent of the Legislative Council and Legislative
Assembly of New South Wales in Parliament assembled, and by
the authority of the same, as follows :—

Short title.

1. This Act may be cited as the “Stock Diseases (Swine
Branding) Amendment Act, 19817,

Commencement.

2. (1) Except as provided in subsections (2)—(4), this Act
shall commence on the date of assent to this Act.

(2) Section 5 shall, in its application to a provision of
Schedules 1-3, commence on the day on which that provision
commences.

(3) Schedule 1 shall commence on such day as may be
appointed by the Governor in respect thereof and as may be noti-
fied by proclamation published in the Gazette.

(4) Section 6 and Schedules 2 and 4 shall commence on
such day (being a later day than that appointed and notified under
subsection (3)) as may be appointed by the Governor in respect
thereof and as may be notified by proclamation published in the
Gazette.

Principal Act.

3. The Stock Diseases Act, 1923, is referred to in this Act
as the Principal Act.

Schedules.
4. This Act contains the following Schedules :—

SCHEDULE 1.—AMENDMENTS TO THE PRINCIPAL ACT
RELATING TO THE IDENTIFICATION OF STOCK.




Act No. 10, 1981.

Stock Diseases (Swine Branding) Amendment.

SCHEDULE 2.—FURTHER AMENDMENTS TO THE PRIN-
CIPAL AcCT RELATING TO THE IDENTIFICATION OF
STOCK.

SCHEDULE 3.—MISCELLANEOUS AMENDMENTS TO THE
PRINCIPAL ACT.

SCHEDULE 4.—REPEALS.

SCHEDULE 5.—SAVINGS AND TRANSITIONAL PROVISIONS.

Amendment of Act No. 34, 1923.

5. The Principal Act is amended in the manner set forth in
Schedules 1-3.

Repeals.

6. Each Act specified in Column 1 of Schedule 4 is, to the
extent specified opposite that Act in Column 2 of Schedule 4,
repealed.

Savings and transitional provisions.

7. Schedule 5 has effect.

SCHEDULE 1.
(Sec. 5.)
AMENDMENTS TO THE PRINCIPAL AcCT RELATING TO
THE IDENTIFICATION OF STOCK.

(1) (a) Section 3 (1), definition of “Registrar”—

Omit the definition, insert instead :—

“Registrar” means any person appointea for the
time being as registrar or deputy registrar
under section 3A.




Act No. 10, 1981.

Stock Diseases (Swine Branding) Amendment.

SCHEDULE 1—continued.

AMENDMENTS TO THE PRINCIPAL ACT RELATING TO
THE IDENTIFICATION OF STOCK—Ccontinued.
(b) Section 3 (1), definition of “Swine”—
After the definition of “Stock”, insert :—

“Swine” includes boar, sow, barrow and pig of any
age, sex or breed.

(2) Section 3A—

After section 3, insert :—

Appointment of registrar and deputy registrars.

3A. (1) The Minister may, by order under his hand,
appoint a registrar and deputy registrars for the purposes
of this Act from among the officers and temporary
employees of the Department of Agriculture.

(2) A person appointed under subsection (1)
ceases to hold his office as registrar or deputy registrar if
he ceases to be an officer or temporary employee of the
Department of Agriculture.

(3) Section 19A—

Omit “kind” wherever occurring, insert instead “class”.

(4) (a) Section 198 (1)—

Omit “The Chief of the Division of Animal Health”,
insert instead “A prescribed officer”.

(b) Section 198 (1)—

Omit “any kind of stock, not exceeding the number
prescribed”, insert instead “, at any one time, not
more than the prescribed number of stock of the kind
specified in the license”.




Act No. 10, 1981.

Stock Diseases (Swme Brandmg) Amena’menr

SCHEDULE 1——c0ntmued

AMENDMENTS TO THE PRINCIPAL ACT RELATING TO
THE IDENTIFICATION OF STOCK—continued.

(c) Section 198 (2) (¢)—

Omit “the Chief of the Division of Animal Health”,
insert instead “a person empowered under subsection
(1) to grant licenses of the class to which the license
belongs™.

(5) (a) Section 19D (1)—

After “stock”, insert , not being swine,”

(b) Section 19D (1)—

Omit “to the registrar, to have allotted to him”, insert
instead , to have allotted to him by the registrar”.

(c) Section 19D (1A)—

After section 19D (1), insert :—

(1A) Any person who is the occupier of a holding
or, not being the occupier of a holding, is the owner of
any swine, is entitled, upon application, in a form in
or to the effect of the prescribed form and accom-
panied by the prescribed fee, to have allotted to him
by the registrar particulars of identification to be used
as a brand on swine in accordance with the provisions
of this Act.

(d) Section 19p (3)—
After “(1)”, insert “or (1A)”.

(6) (a) Section 19€ (2) (b)—

Omit “in accordance with the provisions of section
19p”, insert instead “by the registrar”.




Act No. 10, 1981.

Stock Diseases (Swine Branding) Amendment.

SCHEDULE 1—continued.

AMENDMENTS TO THE PRINCIPAL ACT RELATING TO
THE IDENTIFICATION OF STOCK—continued.

(b) Section 19 (2A)—

After section 19 (2), insert :—

(2A) Where the holder of a certificate issued under
section 19D pursuant to an application under section
19p (1A) fails, before the expiration of any of the
prescribed periods following the issue of the certificate
to him, to make an application, in a form in or to the
effect of the prescribed form accompanied by the
prescribed fee, for renewal of the registration of the
particulars allotted to him and specified in the certifi-
cate, the registrar may exercise, with respect to the
certificate, the powers conferred by subsection (2) (c)
and (d).

(c) Section 19 (3) (b)—

Before “issuing”, insert “under section 19p (2) and
in pursuance of this paragraph,”.

(d) Section 19 (4)—

Omit “under” where secondly occurring, insert instead
“in pursuance of”.

(7) Section 19eA (2)—

After “stock” where firstly occurring, insert “, not being
swine,”.

(8) (a) Section 19% (1)—

After “Act” where firstly occurring, insert “, any
branding iron or other device intended for use in
identifying swine with particulars of identification
allotted under section 19p or any spare numbers
designed to be fitted to any such branding iron or
other device”.




Act No. 10, 1981.

Stock Diseases (Swine Branding) Amendment.

(9)

(10)

SCHEDULE 1—continued.

AMENDMENTS TO THE PRINCIPAL ACT RELATING TO

(b)

(c)

(d)

(a)

(b)

(b)

(c)

THE IDENTIFICATION OF STOCK—continued.

Section 197 (1)—

After “such tag”, insert “, branding iron, device or
spare numbers, as the case may require,”.

Section 19F (1) (a)—

After “tag”, insert “or brand”.

Section 19¥ (1) (a)—

Omit “the Chief of the Division of Animal Health”,
insert instead “a prescribed officer”.

Section 20 (1) (j1)—
After “stock” where firstly and lastly occurring, insert
“, not being swine,”.

Section 20 (1) (j3)—

Omit “or to the Chief of the Division of Animal
Health”, insert instead “, to an officer or temporary
employee of the Department of Agriculture”.

Section 23 (1) (m)—

After “of stock”, insert “, or persons to or by whom
stock is or has been delivered,”.

Section 23 (1) (m)—

After “furnish™, insert “or otherwise give, in accord-
ance with the regulations and at such times or in such
circumstances as are prescribed, notices or”.

Section 23 (1) (w), (x)—

After “tag,” wherever occurring, insert “brand,”.




Act No. 10, 1981.

Stock Diseases (Swine Branding) Amendment.

SCHEDULE 1—continued.

AMENDMENTS TO THE PRINCIPAL ACT RELATING TO
THE IDENTIFICATION OF STOCK—-continued.

(d) Section 23 (1) (x)—

Omit “any cattle”, insert instead “or otherwise used
to identify any cattle, swine”.

SCHEDULE 2.
(Sec:5.)

FURTHER AMENDMENTS TO THE PRINCIPAL ACT RELATING TO
THE IDENTIFICATION OF STOCK.
(1) (a) Section 19a (1)—
Omit the subsection, insert instead :(—

(1) The provisions of this section apply to—
(a) cattle of or above the age of 3 months;
(b) swine weighing 25 kilograms or more; and

(c) any other stock to which the provisions of
this section are applied in accordance with
subsection (2).

(b) Section 19a (3) (a), (b)—

After “cattle” wherever occurring, insert “or swine”.
(c) Section 19a (3)—

After “cattle” where lastly occurring, insert “, swine”.

(d) Section 19a (3)—

Omit “referred to in section 19c”, insert instead
“prescribed with respect to it in section 19c¢ (1) or
(1A)*.




Act No. 10, 1981.

Stock Diseases (Swine Branding) Amendment.

SCHEDULE 2—continued.

FURTHER AMENDMENTS TO THE PRINCIPAL ACT RELATING TO
THE IDENTIFICATION OF STOCK——continued.
(e) Section 19a (3A)—

Omit “or stock are offered for sale by auction they”,
insert instead “, swine or other stock is offered for
sale by auction it”.

(f) Section 19a (4) (a) (i), (ii)—

After “cattle” wherever occurring, insert “, swine”.

(g) Section 194 (4) (b)—

After “stock™, insert “, not being swine to which this
section applies,”.

(2) (a) Section 19c (1)—

After “any stock”, insert “, other than swine,”.

(b) Section 19¢ (1)—

After “identification” wherever occurring, insert “to
be used on tags, being particulars”.

(c) Section 19c (1A)—

After section 19c¢ (1), insert :—

(1A) For the purposes of section 19a (3), the
manner of identifying swine shall be by identifying
the swine, in accordance with the regulations, with
particulars of identification to be used as a brand on
swine, being particulars specified in a certificate issued
by the registrar to the owner of the swine in accord-
ance with section 19p.




10 Act No. 10, 1981.

Stock Diseases (Swine Branding) Amendment.

SCHEDULE 2——continued.

FURTHER AMENDMENTS TO THE PRINCIPAL ACT RELATING TO
THE IDENTIFICATION OF STOCK—continued.

(d) Section 19c (2)—

After “registrar” where firstly occurring, insert “to be
used on tags”.

(e) Section 19c (2A)—

After section 19c¢ (2), insert :—

(2a) No person shall brand any swine with
particulars of identification allotted by the registrar to
be used as a brand on swine unless—

(a) those particulars were allotted to the owner
of the swine by the registrar and the
certificate of registration specifying those
particulars has not, since they were last
allotted, been cancelled under section 19Eg;
and

(b) use of the branding iron or other device by
which the swine is branded does not result
in the swine being branded with any other
particulars.

(3) Section 196 (1)—

After “cattle”, insert “, swine”.




Act No. 10, 1981. 11

Stock Diseases (Swine Branding) Amendment.

SCHEDULE 3.
(Sec. 5.)
MISCELLANEOUS AMENDMENTS TO THE PRINCIPAL ACT.
(1) Part I, heading—

Before section 1, insert :—

PART I

PRELIMINARY.

(2) Section 1A—

After section 1, insert :—

Arrangement.
1A. This Act is divided as follows :—

PART I.—PRELIMINARY—ss. 1-4.
PART II.—BoArD oF Tick CONTROL—s. 5.
PART IIl.—INSPECTORS—ss. 6-8cC.

PART IV.—CONTROL OF DISEASES IN STOCK—ss.
9-19¢.

DivisioN 1.—Notification of Diseases—s. 9.

DivisioN 2.—Quarantine Areas and Protected
Areas—ss. 10-15.

DivisioN 3.—Destruction of Certain Stock—ss.
16-17A.

DivisioN 4.—Compensation and the Foot and

Mouth Disease Eradication Fund—ss. 17B—
li7A ¢

DivisioN 5.—Further Powers of Inspectors, etc.—
ss. 18, 19.

DivisioN 6.—Identification of Certain Stock—ss.
19a-19¢G.

PART V.—OFFENCES—s. 20.
PART VI.—MISCELLANEOUS—ss. 21-23.




Act No. 10, 1981.

Stock Diseases (Swine Branding) Amendment.
SCHEDULE 3—continued.

MISCELLANEOUS AMENDMENTS TO THE PRINCIPAL
AcT—continued.

(3) Part II, heading—
After section 4, insert :—
PART II. 3]

BoARrRD oF Tick CONTROL.

(4) Part III, heading—

After section 5, insert :—

PART III.
INSPECTORS.
(5) Part 1V, heading—
After section 8c, insert :—
PART IV.

CONTROL OF DISEASES IN STOCK.

Division 1.—Notification of Diseases.

(6) Part IV, Division 2, heading—
After section 9, insert :— ¢

DivisioN 2.—Quarantine Areas and Protected Areas.

(7) Part IV, Division 3, heading—
After section 15, insert :—

DivisioN 3.—Destruction of Certain Stock.

(8) Part IV, Division 4, heading—
After section 17A, insert :—

DivisioN 4.—Compensation and the Foot and Mouth
Disease Eradication Fund.




Act No. 10, 1981. 13

Stock Diseases (Swine Branding) Amendment.

SCHEDULE 3—continued.

MISCELLANEOUS AMENDMENTS TO THE PRINCIPAL
AcTt—-continued.
(9) Section 17F (4)—

Omit the subsection.

(10) Section 17HA—

After section 17H, insert :—

Compensation limited.
17HA. Notwithstanding the provisions of any other Act—

(a) no compensation, other than the compensation, if
any, payable under this Act, is payable by the
Crown for or in respect of any stock or property
referred to in section 17c¢; and

(b) no compensation is payable under any other Act
for or in respect of any stock or property for or
in respect of which compensation has been or
may be paid under this Act.

(11) Part 1V, Division 5, heading—
After section 171, insert :—

DivisioN 5.—Further Powers of Inspectors, efc.

(12) Part IV, Division 6, heading—
After section 19, insert :—

DivisioN 6.—Identification of Certain Stock.

(13) Section 19a (4) (a) (i)—

Omit “issued;”, insert instead “issued; or”.




14

Act No. 10, 1981.

Stock Diseases (Swine Branding) Amendment.

(14)

(15)

(16)

(17)

SCHEDULE 3—continued.

MISCELLANEOUS AMENDMENTS TO THE PRINCIPAL
AcT—continued.

Section 198 (2) (b)—

Omit “license;”, insert instead “license; and”.

Part V, heading—

Before section 20, insert :—

PART V.
OFFENCES.
Part VI, heading—
After section 20, insert :—
PART VI.
MISCELLANEOUS.

(a) Section 23 (3) (a)—
Omit “$400”, insert instead “$1,0007.
(b) Section 23 (3) (b)—
Omit “$207, insert instead “$1007”.
(c) Section 23 (3A)—
Omit “offence under”, insert instead “breach of”.
(d) Section 23 (3A)—
Omit “$500”, insert instead “$1,000”.




Act No. 10, 1981.

Stock Diseases (Swine Branding) Amendment.

SCHEDULE 4.
(Sec. 6.)
REPEALS.
Column 1. 1 Column 2.
Year and 1
number of Act. Short title of Act. | Extent of repeal.

|
|
1978, No. 67 ..| Metric Conversion Act, 1978 i ! Item 45 of Schedule 1.

i
1940, No. 5 . { Swine Branding Act, 1940 The whole Act.

SCHEDULE 5.
(Sec. 7.)
SAVINGS AND TRANSITIONAL PROVISIONS.

Interpretation: Sch. 5.

1. In this Schedule, “the commencement” means the commencement of
Schedule 1.

Saving of certain proclamations, licenses and applications.

2. (1) Any proclamation applying the provisions of section 19a of the
Principal Act to a kind of stock that was—

(a) published in the Gazette pursuant to section 19a (2) of that
Act; and

(b) in force immediately before the commencement,

shall, on the commencement, be deemed to be a proclamation published
under section 19a (2) of that Act, as amended by this Act, applying the
provisions of section 19A of that Act, as so amended, to the class of stock
specified in the proclamation.

(2) A license granted under section 198 (1) of the Principal Act,
being a license in force immediately before the commencement, shall, on
the commencement, be deemed to be a license granted under section 198
(1) of that Act, as amended by this Act.

(3) Any application made under section 190 (1) of the Principal
Act which has not been finally disposed of before the commencement shall
be deemed to be an application made under section 19p (1) of that Act,
as amended by this Act.

15




16

Act No. 10, 1981.

Stock Diseases (Swine Branding) Amendment.

SCHEDULE 5—continued.
SAVINGS AND TRANSITIONAL PROVISIONS—continued.
Savings of certain certificates, etc.
3. (1) Any—

(a) certificate or new certificate issued under section 19p (2) or 19E
(3) (b) of the Principal Act, being a certificate that was in force
immediately before the commencement; or

(b) particulars of identification or amended particulars of identifica-
tion specified in any such certificate,

shall, on the commencement, be deemed to be respectively a certificate
specifying particulars of identification allotted for use on tags or particulars
of identification for use on tags issued or allotted under section 19D of that
Act, as amended by this Act.

(2) Any—
(a) certificate of registration of a brand issued; or
(b) brand allotted,

under section 7 of the Swine Branding Act, 1940, after 27th February,
1980, and before the commencement shall, on the commencement, be
deemed to be respectively a certificate specifying particulars of identification
allotted for use as a brand on swine or particulars of identification for use
as a brand on swine issued or allotted under section 190 of the Principal
Act, as amended by this Act, but only if the brand was registered under
the Swine Branding Act, 1940, immediately before the commencement.

(3) Any particulars of identification allotted under section 19eA (1)
of the Principal Act before the commencement shall, on the commencement,
be deemed to be allotted under section 19eA (1) of that Act, as amended
by this Act.

Saving of certain authorisations.

4. Any written authorisation issued before the commencement by the
Registrar within the meaning of the Swine Branding Act, 1940, being an
authorisation—

(a) that had not been revoked by him before the commencement;
and

(b) that purported to authorise its holder to manufacture—

(i) branding irons or other devices intended for impressing
brands allotted under section 7 of that Act; and

(ii) spare numbers designed to be fitted thereto,




Act No. 10, 1981.

Stock Diseases (Swine Branding) Amendment.

SCHEDULE 5—-continued.
SAVINGS AND TRANSITIONAL PROVISIONS—continued.

shall, on the commencement, be deemed to be an authority issued by the
Minister under section 19F (1) of the Principal Act, as amended by this
Act, to manufacture branding irons or other devices intended for use in
identifying swine with particulars of identification allotted under section 19D
of that Act, as so amended, and spare numbers designed to be fitted thereto.

Saving of certain orders.
5. Any order—

(a) that was, after 27th February, 1980, and before the commence-
ment, signed by a person who had, during that period, been
allotted a brand under section 7 of the Swine Branding Act,
1940;

(b) that requested the manufacture, by the holder of an authorisation
referred to in clause 4 issued by the Registrar for the purposes
of that Act, of—

(i) a branding iron or other device intended for use in identi-
fying swine with the brand so allotted; or

(ii) any spare numbers designed to be fitted thereto; and
(c) that had not been complied with before the commencement,

shall, on the commencement, be deemed to be an order that complies with
the requirements prescribed with respect to orders by section 19r (1) (a)
of the Principal Act, as amended by this Act.

Saving of certain approvals.

6. Any person who was, immediately before the commencement,
approved under section 19F (1) (a) of the Principal Act by the Chief,
Division of Animal Health, Department of Agriculture, shall, on the com-
mencement, be deemed to be approved by a prescribed officer under section
19¥ (1) (a) of that Act, as amended by this Act.

Transitional provisions.

7. (1) Where, on or after the commencement and before the day
appointed and notified under section 2 (4), a person is the holder of a
certificate issued to him under section 19D of the Principal Act, as amended
by this Act, being a certificate that specifies particulars of identification
allotted for use as a brand on swine and that is in force—

(a) the particulars of identification specified in the certificate shall
be deemed to be a brand allotted and registered under section
7 of the Swine Branding Act, 1940; and

17




Act No. 10, 1981.

Stock Diseases (Swine Branding) Amendment.

SCHEDULE 5—continued.
SAVINGS AND TRANSITIONAL PROVISIONS—continued.

(b) the person shall be deemed to be the proprietor, within the mean-
ing of that Act, of that brand.

(2) Nothing in subclause (1) prevents a certificate referred to in
that subclause from being treated as a certificate issued under section 19D
of the Principal Act, as amended by this Act, for the purposes of that Act,
as so amended, during the period referred to in that subclause.

Further transitional provision and saving.
8. (1) On and from the day appointed and notified under section 2
(4)—
(a) any certificate of registration of a brand issued; or

(b) any brand allotted,

under section 7 of the Swine Branding Act, 1940, on or before 27th Febru-
ary, 1980, shall (if the brand was registered under that Act immediately
before the day so appointed and notified) be deemed to be respectively a
certificate specifying particulars of identification allotted for use as a brand
on swine or particulars of identification for use as a brand on swine issued
or allotied under section 19D of the Principal Act, as amended by this Act,
until—

(¢) the expiration of 6 months after the day so appointed and notified;
or

(d) the certificate or the certificate specifying those particulars, as
the case may require, is cancelled under section 19 of the Prin-
cipal Act, as so amended,

whichever first occurs.

(2) Any license issued unrder section 6 of the Swine Branding Act,
1940, before the day appointed and notified under section 2 (4) shall,
on and from that day but subject to section 198 (2) (b) and (c¢) of the
Principal Act. as amended by this Act, be deemed to be a license granted
under section 198 (1) of that Act, as so amended.

Saving relating to certain penralties.

9. Notwithstardine section 23 of the Principal Act, as amended by
this Act. a person who. on or after the date of assent to this Act, is
found ouilty of a breach of the regulations made under the Principal
Act which occurred before that date shall not be liable to any greater
penalty than that to which he wou!d have been liable if he had been found
gui'ty of the breach immediately after he committed it.




L3S

Act No. 10, 1981.

Stock Diseases (Swine Branding) Amendment.

SCHEDULE 5—continued.
SAVINGS AND TRANSITIONAL PROVISIONS—continued.

Saving relating to certain references.

10. Where the Swine Branding Act, 1940, an instrument made under
that Act or any provision of that Act or of any such instrument is referred
to in any other Act or any instrument made under any other Act, the
reference shall, on and from the day appointed and notified under section
2 (4), extend to the Principal Act, as in force for the time being, to any
corresponding instrument made under that Act, as so in force, or to any
corresponding provision of that Act or of an instrument made under that
Act, as so in force.

In the name and on behalf of Her Majesty I assent to this
Act.

J.A. ROWLAND,
Governor.
Government House,
Sydney, 22nd April, 1981.

BY AUTHORITY
D. WEST, GOVERNMENT PRINTER, NEW SOUTH WALES, 1981

19






