PROOF

MACQUARIE UNIVERSITY (AMENDMENT) BILL, 1980

EXPLANATORY NOTE

(This Explanatory Note relates to this Bill as introduced into Parliament)

This Bill is cognate with the University of Newcastle (Amendment) Bill,

1980.

The objects of this Bill are—

(a)

(b)

(c)

(d)

(e)

to substitute section 22 (1) of the Macquarie University Act, 1964 (“the
Principal Act”), to enable the Council of the Macquarie University (“the
University”) to delegate certain of its powers and functions to any
member of the Council of the University (“the Council”), to the
Academic Senate of the University (‘“‘the Academic Senate”), to any
committee of the Council or Academic Senate or to any officer or
officers of the University (Schedule 1 (2));

to amend section 23 (1) of the Principal Act to enable the Council to
constitute a body to be called the Academic Senate, to constitute
committees of the Council or Academic Senate and to regulate meetings
thereof (Schedule 1 (3));

to insert a new section, 234, in the Principal Act to provide that persons
who are not members of the Council may be members of the Academic
Senate and that persons who are not members of the Council or
Academic Senate may be members of any committee of the Council or
Academic Senate respectively (Schedule 1 (4)—proposed section 23A);

to substitute section 31 (1) of the Principal Act to impose further
limitations on the eligibility of certain persons for exemption from fees
(Schedule 1 (5));

to amend the Principal Act by way of statute law revision (Schedule 2);
and

(f) to make other provisions of a minor, consequential or ancillary nature.

762378

348—







MACQUARIE UNIVERSITY (AMENDMENT) BILL,

1980
No. , 1980.
A BILL FOR

An Act to amend the Macquarie University Act, 1964, with respect
to the delegation of powers and functions of the Council of
the University; and for certain other purposes.

[MR BEDFORD—2 April, 1980.]

76237E 348—



Act No. , 1980.

Macquarie University (Amendment).

BE it enacted by the Queen’s Most Excellent Majesty, by and with
the advice and consent of the Legislative Council and Legislative
Assembly of New South Wales in Parliament assembled, and by

the authority of the same, as follows :—

5 1. This Act may be cited as the “Macquarie University Short title.
(Amendment) Act, 1980”.

2. This Act contains the following Schedules :— Schedules.

SCHEDULE 1.—AMENDMENTS TO THE MACQUARIE

UNIVERSITY AcCT, 1964.

10 SCHEDULE 2.—AMENDMENTS TO THE MACQUARIE
UNIVERSITY AcCT, 1964, BY WAY OF STATUTE LAW

REVISION.

3. The Macquarle University Act, 1964, is amended in the Amendment
manner set forth in Schedules 1 and 2. 25“13‘61;“

15 4. Any delegation made under section 22 of the Macquarie Savings
University Act, 1964, as in force immediately before the com- Provision.
mencement of this Act, shall be deemed to have been made under

that section, as amended by this Act.




Act No. , 1980.

Macquarie University (Amendment).

SCHEDULE 1.
AMENDMENTS TO THE MACQUARIE UNIVERSITY ACT, 1964.

(1) Section 3, definitions of “Academic Senate” and “by-laws”—
Omit the definition of “By-laws”, insert instead :—

5 “Academic Senate” means the Academic Senate of the
University constituted in accordance with the by-
laws;

“by-laws” means the by-laws made under this Act;

(2) Section 22 (1)—
10 Omit the subsection, insert instead :—

(1) The Council may, in relation to any matter or class
of matters, or in relation to any activity or function of the
University, by resolution, delegate any or all of its powers
or functions under this Act (except this power of delega-

15 tion and its powers in relation to the making of by-laws)
to—

(a) any member of the Council;
(b) any committee of the Council;
(c) the Academic Senate;
20 (d) any committee of the Academic Senate; or

(e) any officer or officers of the University.

(3) Section 23 (1) (f), (f1)—
Omit section 23 (1) (f), insert instead :—

(f) the constitution, powers and functions of a body to
25 be called the Academic Senate or of committees
of the Council or Academic Senate;

Sec. 3.




Act No. , 1980.

Macquarie University (Amendment).

SCHEDULE 1—continued.

AMENDMENTS TO THE MACQUARIE UNIVERSITY
AcT, 1964—continued.

(f1) the convening and holding of meetings of, and the
5 conduct of proceedings of, the Academic Senate

or of any committee of the Council or Academic
Senate;

(4) Section 23A—

After section 23, insert :(—

10 23A. Without limiting the generality of section 23 (1) Membership
f of Academic

(H— Senate or
committees.

(a) the Academic Senate may, if the by-laws so
provide, be constituted so as to include among
its members, persons who are not members of

15 the Council; and

(b) a committee of the Council or Academic Senate
may, if the by-laws so provide, be constituted so
as to include among its members, persons who
are not members of the Council or Academic

20 Senate.

(5) Section 31 (1)—
Omit the subsection, insert instead :—

(1) The Council shall allow such persons as are—

(a) teachers in schools established under the Public

25 Instruction Act of 1880 or members of the
Public Service of New South Wales approved

by the Minister;



10

15

Act No. , 1980.

Macquarie University (Amendment).

AMENDMENTS TO THE MACQUARIE UNIVERSITY ACT,

SCHEDULE 1—continued.

AMENDMENTS TO THE MACQUARIE UNIVERSITY
AcTt, 1964—continued.

(b) qualified in such manner as may be prescribed
by the by-laws to be enrolled as students of the
University;

(c) selected by the University for admission to the
University; and

(d) not otherwise excluded from the University,

to attend University lectures, or to enrol as external
students, for the purpose of proceeding to a first degree
and to receive tuition for the period required for admission
to that degree without payment of lecture, class or tuition
fees.

SCHEDULE 2.

WAY OF STATUTE LAW REVISION.

(1) Section 3, definition of “Council”—

Omit “University.”, insert instead “University;”.

20 (2) (a) Section 8 (1)—

Omit “Act:”, insert instead “Act.”.

(b) Section 8 (1), proviso—

Omit the proviso.

1964, BY

Sec. 3.



Act No. , 1980.

Macquarie University (Amendment).

SCHEDULE 2—continued.

AMENDMENTS TO THE MACQUARIE UNIVERSITY ACT, 1964, BY
WAY OF STATUTE LAW REVISION—continued.

(3) Section 10 (11)—

3 Omit “three years”, insert instead “3 years”.

(4) Section 12 (¢c)—

Omit “three consecutive meetings”, insert instead “3
consecutive meetings”.

(5) (a) Section 15 (1)—

10 Omit “and the first Chancellor shall be elected by the
persons referred to in subsections (2) to (9), both
inclusive, of section 10, and subsequent Chancellors”,
insert instead “who”.

(b) Section 15 (2)—

15 Omit “three years”, insert instead “3 years”.

(6) Section 16 (2)—

Omit “one year”, insert instead “1 year”.

(7) Section 21 (1) (g), proviso—

Omit “twenty-one years”, insert instead “21 years”.

20 (8) Section 24 (1), (2)—

Omit “the first day of January” wherever occurring, insert
instead “1st January”.




Act No. , 1980.

Macquarie University (Amendment).

SCHEDULE 2—continued.

AMENDMENTS TO THE MACQUARIE UNIVERSITY ACT, 1964, BY
WAY OF STATUTE LAW REVISION—continued.

(9) Section 26—

5 Omit “the thirty-first day of December”, insert instead “31st
December”.

(10) (a) Section 28 (1)—

Omit “the thirty-first day of December”, insert instead
“31st December”.

10 (b) Section 28 (1)—

Omit “twelve months”, insert instead “12 months”.

BY AUTHORITY
D. WEST, GOVERNMENT PRINTER, NEW SOUTH WALES—1980













MACQUARIE UNIVERSITY (AMENDMENT) BILL, 1980

EXPLANATORY NOTE

(This Explanatory Note relates to this Bill as introduced into Parliament)

1980.

This Bill is cognate with the University of Newcastle (Amendment) Bill,

The objects of this Bill are—

(a)

(b)

(c)

(d)

(e)

(f)

76237E

to substitute section 22 (1) of the Macquarie University Act, 1964 (“the
Principal Act”), to enable the Council of the Macquarie University (“the
University”) to delegate certain of its powers and functions to any
member of the Council of the University (“the Council”’), to the
Academic Senate of the University (“the Academic Senate”), to any
committee of the Council or Academic Senate or to any officer or
officers of the University (Schedule 1 (2));

to amend section 23 (1) of the Principal Act to enable the Council to
constitute a body to be called the Academic Senate, to constitute
committees of the Council or Academic Senate and to regulate meetings
thereof (Schedule 1 (3));

to insert a new section, 23A, in the Principal Act to provide that persons
who are not members of the Council may be members of the Academic
Senate and that persons who are not members of the Council or
Academic Senate may be members of any committee of the Council or
Academic Senate respectively (Schedule 1 (4)—proposed section 23A);

to substitute section 31 (1) of the Principal Act to impose further
limitations on the eligibility of certain persons for exemption from fees
(Schedule 1 (5));

to amend the Principal Act by way of statute law revision (Schedule 2);
and

to make other provisions of a minor, consequential or ancillary nature.

348







MACQUARIE UNIVERSITY (AMENDMENT) BILL,

1980
No. , 1980.
A BILL FOR

An Act to amend the Macquarie University Act, 1964, with respect
to the delegation of powers and functions of the Council of
the University; and for certain other purposes.

[MR BEDFORD—2 April, 1980.]

76237E 348—




Act No. , 1980. 2

Macquarie University (Amendment).

BE it enacted by the Queen’s Most Excellent Majesty, by and with
the advice and consent of the Legislative Council and Legislative
Assembly of New South Wales in Parliament assembled, and by

the authority of the same, as follows :—

5 1. This Act may be cited as the “Macquarie University Short title.
(Amendment) Act, 1980”.

2. This Act contains the following Schedules :— Schedules.

SCHEDULE 1.—AMENDMENTS TO THE MACQUARIE
UNIVERSITY AcT, 1964.

SCHEDULE 2.—AMENDMENTS TO THE MACQUARIE

10
UNIVERSITY ACT, 1964, BY WAY OF STATUTE LAwW
REVISION.
3. The Macquarie University Act, 1964, is amended in the Amendment
manner set forth in Schedules 1 and 2. gg";g‘&m'

15 4. Any delegation made under section 22 of the Macquarie savings
University Act, 1964, as in force immediately before the com- Pprovision.
mencement of this Act, shall be deemed to have been made under
that section, as amended by this Act.




Act No. , 1980.

Macquarie University (Amendment).

SCHEDULE 1.
AMENDMENTS TO THE MACQUARIE UNIVERSITY AcCT, 1964.

(1) Section 3, definitions of “Academic Senate” and “by-laws”—
Omit the definition of “By-laws”, insert instead :—

5 “Academic Senate” means the Academic Senate of the
University constituted in accordance with the by-
laws;

“by-laws” means the by-laws made under this Act;

(2) Section 22 (1)—
10 Omit the subsection, insert instead :—

(1) The Council may, in relation to any matter or class
of matters, or in relation to any activity or function of the
University, by resolution, delegate any or all of its powers
or functions under this Act (except this power of delega-

15 tion and its powers in relation to the making of by-laws)
to—

(a) any member of the Council;
(b) any committee of the Council;
(c) the Academic Senate;
20 (d) any committee of the Academic Senate; or

(e) any officer or officers of the University.

(3) Section 23 (1) (f), (f1)—
Omit section 23 (1) (f), insert instead :—

(f) the constitution, powers and functions of a body to
25 be called the Academic Senate or of committees
of the Council or Academic Senate;

Sec. 3.




Act No. , 1980. 4

Macquarie University (Amendment).

SCHEDULE 1—continued.

AMENDMENTS TO THE MACQUARIE UNIVERSITY
AcT, 1964—continued.

(f1) the convening and holding of meetings of, and the
] conduct of proceedings of, the Academic Senate

or of any committee of the Council or Academic
Senate;

(4) Section 23A—

After section 23, insert :—

10 23A. Without limiting the generality of section 23 (1) Membership
(f) of Academic

_ Senate or
committees.

(a) the Academic Senate may, if the by-laws so
provide, be constituted so as to include among
its members, persons who are not members of

15 the Council; and

(b) a committee of the Council or Academic Senate
may, if the by-laws so provide, be constituted so
as to include among its members, persons who
are not members of the Council or Academic

20 Senate.

(5) Section 31 (1)—
Omit the subsection, insert instead :—

(1) The Council shall allow such persons as are—

(a) teachers in schools established under the Public
25 Instruction Act of 1880 or members of the
Public Service of New South Wales approved

by the Minister;




10

15

Act No. , 1980.

Macquarie University (Amendment).

AMENDMENTS TO THE MACQUARIE UNIVERSITY ACT,

SCHEDULE 1—continued.

AMENDMENTS TO THE MACQUARIE UNIVERSITY
Acrt, 1964—continued.

(b) qualified in such manner as may be prescribed
by the by-laws to be enrolled as students of the
University;

(c) selected by the University for admission to the
University; and

(d) not otherwise excluded from the University,

to attend University lectures, or to enrol as external
students, for the purpose of proceeding to a first degree
and to receive tuition for the period required for admission
to that degree without payment of lecture, class or tuition
fees.

SCHEDULE 2.

WAY OF STATUTE LAW REVISION.

(1) Section 3, definition of “Council”—

Omit “University.”, insert instead “University;”.

20 (2) (a) Section 8 (1)—

Omit “Act:”, insert instead “Act.”.

(b) Section 8 (1), proviso—

Omit the proviso.

1964, BY

Sec. 3.




Act No. , 1980.

Macquarie University (Amendment).

SCHEDULE 2—continued.

AMENDMENTS TO THE MACQUARIE UNIVERSITY AcCT, 1964, BY
WAY OF STATUTE LAW REVISION—continued.

(3) Section 10 (11)—

5 Omit “three years”, insert instead “3 years”.

(4) Section 12 (¢)—

Omit “three consecutive meetings”, insert instead “3
consecutive meetings”.

(5) (a) Section 15 (1)—

10 Omit “and the first Chancellor shall be elected by the
persons referred to in subsections (2) to (9), both
inclusive, of section 10, and subsequent Chancellors”,
insert instead “who”.

(b) Section 15 (2)—

15 Omit “three years”, insert instead “3 years”.

(6) Section 16 (2)—

Omit “one year”, insert instead “1 year”.

(7) Section 21 (1) (g), proviso—

Omit “twenty-one years”, insert instead “21 years”.

20 (8) Section 24 (1), (2)—

Omit “the first day of January” wherever occurring, insert
instead “1st January”.



Act No. , 1980.

Macaquarie University (Amendment).

SCHEDULE 2—continued.

AMENDMENTS TO THE MACQUARIE UNIVERSITY ACT, 1964, BY
WAY OF STATUTE LAW REVISION—continued.

(9) Section 26—

5 Omit “the thirty-first day of December”, insert instead “31st
December”.

(10) (a) Section 28 (1)—

Omit “the thirty-first day of December”, insert instead
“31st December”.

10 (b) Section 28 (1)—

Omit “twelve months”, insert instead “12 months”.

BY AUTHORITY
D. WEST, GOVERNMENT PRINTER, NEW SOUTH WALES—1980

(20¢)













MACQUARIE UNIVERSITY (AMENDMENT) ACT,
1980, No. 101

PNew South Tlales

SIMO NONO

ELIZABETHZ 11 REGINA

% sk %k %k % % % % >k %k % %k ¥k %k k * k % *k %k ¥k k ¥ X% % k %k Xk *k *k ¥ ‘

Act No. 101, 1980.

An Act to amend the Macquarie University Act, 1964, with respect
to the delegation of powers and functions of the Council of
the University; and for certain other purposes. [Assented to,
1st May, 1980.]

P 78672L (20c)




2 Act No. 101, 1980.

Macquarie University (Amendment).

BE it enacted by the Queen’s Most Excellent Majesty, by and with
the advice and consent of the Legislative Council and Legislative
Assembly of New South Wales in Parliament assembled, and by
the authority of the same, as follows :—

Short title. 1. This Act may be cited as the “Macquarie University
(Amendment) Act, 1980”.

Schedules. 2. This Act contains the following Schedules :—

SCHEDULE 1.—AMENDMENTS TO THE MACQUARIE
UNIVERSITY ACT, 1964.

SCHEDULE 2.—AMENDMENTS TO THE MACQUARIE
UNIVERSITY AcCT, 1964, BY WAY OF STATUTE LAw
REVISION.

Amendment 3. The Macquarie University Act, 1964, is amended in the

of Act No. 5
29, 1964, manner set forth in Schedules 1 and 2.

Savings 4. Any delegation made under section 22 of the Macquarie

provision.  University Act, 1964, as in force immediately before the com-
mencement of this Act, shall be deemed to have been made under
that section, as amended by this Act.




Act No. 101, 1980. 3

. Macquarie University (Amendment).

- SCHEDULE 1. Sec. 3.
AMENDMENTS TO THE MACQUARIE UNIVERSITY AcCT, 1964.

‘ (1) Section 3, definitions of “Academic Senate” and “by-laws”—
Omit the definition of “By-laws”, insert instead :—

“Academic Senate” means the Academic Senate of the
University constituted in accordance with the by-
laws;

“by-laws” means the by-laws made under this Act;

(2) Section22 (1)—
Omit the subsection, insert instead :—

(1) The Council may, in relation to any matter or class
of matters, or in relation to any activity or function of the
University, by resolution, delegate any or all of its powers
or functions under this Act (except this power of delega-
tion and its powers in relation to the making of by-laws)
to—

(a) any member of the Council;

(b) any committee of the Council;

(c) the Academic Senate;

(d) any committee of the Academic Senate; or

(e) any cfficer or officers of the University.

(3) Section 23 (1) (f), (f1)—

Omit section 23 (1) (f), insert instead :—

(f) the constitution, powers and functions of a body to
‘ be called the Academic Senate or of committees
of the Council or Academic Senate;




Membership
of Academic
Senate or
committees.

Act No. 101, 1980.

Macquarie University (Amendment).

SCHEDULE 1—-continued.

AMENDMENTS TO THE MACQUARIE UNIVERSITY
Act, 1964——continued.

(f1) the convening and holding of meetings of, and the
conduct of proceedings of, the Academic Senate
or of any committee of the Council or Academic
Senate;

(4) Section 23A—
After section 23, insert :—

23A. Without limiting the generality of section 23 (1)
(£}~

(a) the Academic Senate may, if the by-laws so
provide, be constituted so as to include among
its members, persons who are not members of
the Council; and

(b) a committee of the Council or Academic Senate
may, if the by-laws so provide, be constituted so
as to include among its members, persons who
are not members of the Council or Academic
Senate.

(5) Section 31 (1)—
Omit the subsection, insert instead :—

(1) The Council shall allow such persons as are—

(a) teachers in schools established under the Public
Instruction Act of 1880 or members of the
Public Service of New South Wales approved
by the Minister;




Act No. 101, 1980. 5

. Macquarie University (Amendment).

SCHEDULE 1—continued.

AMENDMENTS TO THE MACQUARIE UNIVERSITY
‘ Act, 1964—continued.

(b) qualified in such manner as may be prescribed
by the by-laws to be enrolled as students of the
University;

' (c) selected by the University for admission to the
University; and

‘ (d) not otherwise excluded from the University,

to attend University lectures, or to enrol as external
students, for the purpose of proceeding to a first degree
and to receive tuition for the period required for admission
to that degree without payment of lecture, class or tuition
fees.

SCHEDULE 2. Sec. 3.

-

f AMENDMENTS TO THE MACQUARIE UNIVERSITY ACT, 1964, BY
WAY OF STATUTE LAW REVISION,

(1) Section 3, definition of “Council”—

Omit “University.”, insert instead “University;”.
(2) (a) Section 8 (1)—
Omit “Act:”, insert instead “Act.”.

’ (b) Section 8 (1), proviso—

Omit the proviso.



6 Act No. 101, 1980.

Macquarie University (Amendment).

SCHEDULE 2—continued.

AMENDMENTS TO THE MACQUARIE UNIVERSITY ACT, 1964, BY
WAY OF STATUTE LAW REVISION—continued.

(3) Section 10 (11)—

Omit “three years”, insert instead “3 years”.

(4) Section 12 (¢)—

Omit “three consecutive meetings”, insert instead “3
consecutive meetings”.

(5) (a) Section 15 (1)—

Omit “and the first Chancellor shall be elected by the
persons referred to in subsections (2) to (9), both
inclusive, of section 10, and subsequent Chancellors”,
insert instead “who”.

(b) Section 15 (2)—

Omit “three years”, insert instead “3 years”.

(6) Section 16 (2)—

Omit “one year”, insert instead “1 year”.

(7) Section 21 (1) (g), proviso—

Omit “twenty-one years”, insert instead “21 years”.

(8) Section 24 (1), (2)—

Omit “the first day of January” wherever occurring, insert
instead “lIst January”.




Act No. 101, 1980.

Macquarie University (Amendment).

SCHEDULE 2—continued.

AMENDMENTS TO THE MACQUARIE UNIVERSITY ACT, 1964, BY
WAY OF STATUTE LAW REVISION—-continued.

(9) Section 26—

Omit “the thirty-first day of December”, insert instead “31st
December”.

(10) (a) Section 28 (1)—

Omit “the thirty-first day of December”, insert instead
“31st December”.

(b) Section 28 (1)—

Omit “twelve months”, insert instead “12 months”.

In the name and on behalf of Her Majesty I assent to this
Act.

A. R. CUTLER,

Governor.
Government House,
Sydney, 1st May, 1980.

BY AUTHORITY
D. WEST, GOVERNMENT PRINTER, NEW SOUTH WALES—1980







