GAMING AND BETTING (POKER MACHINES)
AMENDMENT BILL, 1979

EXPLANATORY NOTE
(This Explanatory Note relates to this Bill as introduced into Parliament)

This Bill is cognate with the Gaming and Betting (Poker Machines) Taxation
Amendment Bill, 1979.

The objects of this Bill are—

(a) to amend the Gaming and Betting Act, 1912, as a consequence of the
enactment of the Gaming and Betting (Poker Machines) Taxation
Amendment Act, 1979 (Schedule 1 (2));

(b) to provide that a club is, in certain circumstances, entitled to a refund
of poker machine taxes paid by the club, that refund being proportional
to the club’s expenditure on community welfare (Schedule 1 (1) and
(4)); and

(c) to make certain alterations in the particulars required to be furnished
by a club in its poker machine tax returns (Schedule 1 (3) and (5)).

60423k 216—







GAMING AND BETTING (POKER MACHINES)
AMENDMENT BILL, 1979

No. , 1979.

A BILL FOR

An Act to amend the Gaming and Betting Act, 1912, as a
consequence of the enactment of the Gaming and Betting
(Poker Machines) Taxation Amendment Act, 1979, to
provide for tax refunds in proportion to expenditure by clubs
on community welfare, and for certain other purposes.

[MR RENSHAW—28 February, 1979.]

See also Gaming and Betting (Poker Machines) Taxation Amendment Bill, 1979.

60423k 216—




Act No. , 1979. 2

Gaming and Betting (Poker Machines) Amendment.

BE it enacted by the Queen’s Most Excellent Majesty, by and with
the advice and consent of the Legislative Council and Legislative
Assembly of New South Wales in Parliament assembled, and by
the authority of the same, as follows :—

5 1. This Act may be cited as the “Gaming and Betting (Poker Short
Machines) Amendment Act, 1979”. title.

2. The Gaming and Betting Act, 1912, is amended in the Amendment

manner set forth in Schedule 1. S§,A1°9‘1§,°'
SCHEDULE 1. Sec. 2.

10 AMENDMENTS TO THE GAMING AND BETTING Acr, 1912.

(1) Section 1, matter relating to Division 3 of Part TTIA—

Omit “50r”, insert instead “50FB”.




Act No. , 1979.

Gaming and Betting (Poker Machines) Amendment.

SCHEDULE 1—-continued.

AMENDMENTS TO THE GAMING AND BETTING Act, 1912—
continued.

(2) (a) Section S0E (1B) (b)—

5 Omit “seventy-six”, insert instead “seventy-nine”.

(b) Section 50 (1B) (b)—

Omit “$60,000”, insert instead “$65,000".

(c) Section 50 (2)—

Omit “subsections one and (1A)”, insert instead
10 “subsection (1)”.

(3) Section 50EB (1)—

Omit “In any case where the return required by this
subsection to be sent to the Minister not later than the
twenty-first day of December, in the year one thousand
15 nine hundred and seventy-five, or in any subsequent year,
is made in respect of a club which has been relieved of
the obligation to pay the whole or any part of the
supplementary license tax in accordance with paragraph
(b) of subsection (1B) of section 50E of this Act or whose
20 aggregate net revenue from poker machines for the twelve
months ended the thirtieth day of November immediately
preceding is less than $60,000”, insert instead “In the case
of the return required by this subsection to be sent by a
club to the Minister not later than 21st December in
25 1979 or in any subsequent year”.




Act No. , 1979. 4

Gaming and Betting (Poker Machines) Amendment.

SCHEDULE 1—continued.

AMENDMENTS TO THE GAMING AND BETTING AcCT, 1912—

continued.
(4) Section S0FB—
5 After section SOFA, insert :—
50FB. (1) In this section— Tax refunds
for welfare
expenditure
by clubs.

“amount disbursed” does not include any amount of
money disbursed for an approved welfare

purpose—
10 (a) if the money consists of donations, or any
proceeds of donations, collected by a
club; or

(b) which, in the opinion of the Minister, is

the proceeds of any special sporting,

15 social, gambling, cultural or other activity
conducted by a club to raise money,

for that approved welfare purpose;

“approved welfare purpose” means a purpose which—
(a) promotes community welfare; and
20 (b) is approved by the Minister for the

purposes of this section, either generally
or in a particular case;

“relevant period” means the period of 12 months
ending on 30th November in 1979 or in any
25 subsequent year.




10

15

20

25

30

Act No. , 1979.

Gaming and Betting (Poker Machines) Amendment.

SCHEDULE 1—-continued.

AMENDMENTS TO THE GAMING AND BETTING AcT, 1912—

continued.

(2) Where the Minister is satisfied that the
amount disbursed during a relevant period for approved
welfare purposes by a club is not less than 5 per cent
of the aggregate net revenue from poker machines derived
by the club during that relevant period, the club shall be
entitled to a refund of taxes paid by it under section SOE
(1)and (1B) equivalent to—

(a) one third of the amount which the Minister is
satisfied was so disbursed; or

(b) the sum of those taxes actually paid by the club
during the period of 12 months ending 21st
December next following the end of the relevant
period,

whichever is the lesser amount.

(3) A club is not entitled to a refund under
subsection (2) in respect of a relevant period unless the
club has made an application to the Minister for the
refund—

(a) on or before 21st December next following the
end of the relevant period or on or before such
later date as the Minister may in any particular
case allow; and

(b) in the form approved by the Minister for the
purposes of this section.

(4) Any refund to which a club is entitled under
subsection (2) shall be paid out of the Gaming and Betting
(Poker Machines) Account in the Special Deposits
Account established at the Treasury.




, 1979.

Act No.

Gaming and Betting (Poker Machines) Amendment.

SCHEDULE 1—continued.
AMENDMENTS TO THE GAMING AND BETTING AcT, 1912

continued.

(5) Sixth Schedule and Seventh Schedule—

instead :

, insert

Omit the Schedules

‘qn ay1 £q paresado pue pasn jday ase samydrwu 1ax0d Y3 YOIy Japun AU Y1 ur payads
SUONIPUOD PUE SULIdY AYI YIIM DUEBPIODE Ul pajerado awayoss snuoq Aue jo jied se qnpd 3y} Aq udA13 10 pred sazud jo anpea [Bj03 Ay L§

“A1EP 1BY] 1B SB 31es2do puk asn ‘dady 03 Pasuadi| ST gn[d 9yl Yoigm duryorew ayod
U9ED 10} 00T$ JO 211 3Y1 1B PAAT[NO[ED JUNOWE UR IBIA AUB Ul JIOQWIGAON YIQE SUIPUS SYIUOW g 2y} 4O 199dSal UI UINJAI B UL A[UO MOYSes

‘qnjd ay1 Aq payesado pue pasn “3doy a1e sauryoew tayod a1 YoIym Jdapun asuadi| ayl ut

PayIdads suonipuod pue SWid) ) YIIM DUBPIOIDE Ul pare1ado awayss snuoq Aue jo 1red se qn|d dy3 £q UAIS 10 pred sozad Aue Jo anjea dyi
Surpnpour jou nq ‘sauryoewr ayod oy Aq AI0211p Paseajal SJUNOWE Y} 0) [BUONIPPE GNId Y} Aq udA13 10 pred saziid jo senjea [e10) oyt
( 61-TI-1 40 1=9=]) SAIB2I UIMIAI SIY) YOIym O} pourad a1 Suruuidoq 218p Moys IH )
‘(61=S-1€ 10 GI-T1-0€) SAIT|2I WINIAL S Yd1ym 01 poriad U3 SUIPUS }BP MOYS I3 4

|
sauiyorw Jayod Wolj anuaAdl 1aN

§ sozud snuoq jJo an[eA ssa|

*S[moL

|
|

sozud snuoq
Jo uononpap
210jJ2q sauryseur
Jayod woiy
ANUIAI 10N

*$0UBMO[R
uonenaidap pue
2OURUIUIBIA

PLHENTERTT
auiydewr
yoq

fsozad
snuoq Jurpnjoxa
sazuid jo anjep

(sdzud snuoq Surpn|dxa) suonanpaCy

saurgoew sayod

_ WOIJ INUIAJL SSOID)

—e pajesado 10 pasn ‘yday
sauryorw 19)0d Jo 1quinN

saurgorw 1axod
Jo uoneunwous(y

SSAIPPY

qn[o Jo sweN

*

Surpua syjuow 9 9y} Jo 303dsar ul ‘716 ‘Y Sunjeg pue Suiwen 91 JO gdQ§ uonods o3 juensind winioy
‘HTNAIHOS HIXIS




10

15

20

25

30

Gam

Act No. , 1979.

SCHEDULE 1—continued.

ing and Betting (Poker Machines) Amendment.

AMENDMENTS TO THE GAMING AND BETTING AcT, 1912—

Plus

Less

continued.

SEVENTH SCHEDULE.

Particulars of Aggregate Net Revenue and Supplementary
License Tax thereon.

(A)

(B)

(©)

(D)

(E)

Net revenue from poker machines for 6
months  taxing period ended 30th
November (as shown in return under
Sixth Schedule) ....................

Net revenue from poker machines for
preceding 6 months taxing period ended
31st May (as shown in previous return)

Aggregate net revenue from poker
machines for 12 months ended 30th
November (A+B) ..................

SUPPLEMENTARY LICENSE TAX
PAYABLE—

*(i) if the amount in (C) does not
exceed $50,000 ...............

OR

*(ii) at the rate of 65 cents for each
dollar that the amount in (C)
exceeds $50,000 if the amount in
(C) exceeds $50,000 but does not
exceed $65,000 ..............

OR
*(iii) at the rate of 15% on the amount

in (C) if the amount in (C)
exceeds $65,000 ..............

SUPPLEMENTARY LICENSE TAX
PAID in respect of preceding taxing
period ended 31st May ..............

$

NIL




Act No. , 1979.

Gaming and Betting (Poker Machines) Amendment.

SCHEDULE 1—continued.

AMENDMENTS TO THE GAMING AND BETTING AcT, 1912—
continued.

*(F) NET SUPPLEMENTARY LICENSE
5 TAX PAYABLE FOR PERIOD OF 12
MONTHS ENDED 30tH NOVEMBER

(D_E) -------------------------- —_——

*(G) NET SUPPLEMENTARY LICENSE

10 TAX REFUND CLAIMED FOR
PERIOD OF 12 MONTHS ENDED

30tH NOVEMBER (E—D) .........

* Delete whichever is not applicable.

BY AUTHORITY
D. WEST, GOVERNMENT PRINTER, NEW SOUTH WALES—1979

[16c]










GAMING AND BETTING (POKER MACHINES)
AMENDMENT ACT, 1979, No. 17

Petw %auib Uilaleg

ANNO VICESIMO OCTAVO

ELIZABE E’HAL El REGIN/E

®okok sk ok sk sk sk ok sk ok ok % SRR R S I

Act No. 17, 1979.

An Act to amend the Gaming and Betting Act, 1912, as a
consequence of the enactment of the Gaming and Betting
(Poker Machines) Taxation Amendment Act, 1979, to
provide for tax refunds in proportion to expenditure by clubs

on community welfare, and for certain other purposes.
[Assented to, 20th April, 1979.]

See also Gaming and Betting (Poker Machines) Taxation Amendment Act, 1979.

P 63226A [16c]




Short
title.

Amendment
of Act No.
25,1912.

Sec. 2.

Act No. 17, 1979.

Gam/nu and Betting (Polwr Machmes) Ammdmuzr

BE it enacted by the Queen’s Most Excellent Majesty, by and w1th
the advice and consent of the Legislative Council and Legislative
Assembly of New South Wales in Parliament assembled, und by
the authority of the same, as follows :—

1. This Act may be cited as the “Gaming and Betting (Poker
Machines) Amendment Act, 19797,

2. The Gaming and Betting Act, 1912, is amended in the
manner set forth in Schedule 1.

SCHEDULE 1.

AMENDMENTS TO THE GAMING AND BETTING AcT, 1912.

(1) Section 1, matter relating to Division 3 of Part IIIa—

Omit “50r”, insert instead “50FB”.




GAMING AND BETTING (POKER MACHINES)
AMENDMENT ACT, 1979, No. 17

Pew South Cliales

ANNO VICESIMO GCTAVO

ELIZABETH/A Il REGINA,

k% ok ok ok sk sk sk sk ok ok ok ok

ok ¥ ok ok ok ok ok %k

Act No. 17, 1979.

An Act to amend the Gaming and Betting Act, 1912, as a
consequence of the enactment of the Gaming and Betting
(Poker Machines) Taxation Amendment Act, 1979, to
provide for tax refunds in proportion to expenditure by clubs

on community welfare, and for certain other purposes.
[Assented to, 20th April, 1979.]

See also Gaming and Betting (Poker Machines) Taxation Amendment Act, 1979.

P 63226A [16c]




Short
title.

Amendment
of Act No.
25, 1912.

Sec. 2.

Act No. 17, 1979.

Gamm” and Betting (Polwr Machmes) Amelzdmuzt

BE it enacted by the Queen’s Most Excellent Majesty, by and with
the advice and consent of the Legislative Council and Legislative
Assembly of New South Wales in Parliament assembled, and by
the authority of the same, as follows :—

1. This Act may be cited as the “Gaming and Betting (Poker
Machines) Amendment Act, 1979”.

2. The Gaming and Betting Act, 1912, is amended in the
manner set forth in Schedule 1.

SCHEDULE 1.

AMENDMENTS TO THE GAMING AND BETTING AcT, 1912.

(1) Section 1, matter relating to Division 3 of Part IIIa—

Omit “50r”, insert instead “50FB”.




Act No. 17, 1979.

Gaming and Betting (Poker Machines) Amendment.

SCHEDULE 1—-continued.

AMENDMENTS TO THE GAMING AND BETTING AcT, 1912—
continued.

(2) (a) Section S0E (1B) (b)—

Omit “seventy-six”, insert instead “seventy-nine”.

(b) Section 50 (1B) (b)—

Omit “$60,000”, insert instead “$65,000”.

(¢) Section 50 (2)—

Omit “subsections one and (1A)”, insert instead
“subsection (1)”.

(3) Section 50EB (1)—

Omit “In any case where the return required by this
subsection to be sent to the Minister not later than the
twenty-first day of December, in the year one thousand
nine hundred and seventy-five, or in any subsequent year,
is made in respect of a club which has been relieved of
the obligation to pay the whole or any part of the
supplementary license tax in accordance with paragraph
(b) of subsection (1B) of section SOE of this Act or whose
aggregate net revenue from poker machines for the twelve
months ended the thirtieth day of November immediately
preceding is less than $60,000, insert instead “In the case
of the return required by this subsection to be sent by a
club to the Minister not later than 21st December in
1979 or in any subsequent year”.




4 Act No. 17, 1979

Gaming and Betting (Poker Machines) Amendment. .

SCHEDULE 1—continued.

AMENDMENTS TO THE GAMING AND BETTING AcT, 1912—

continued. ‘

After section 50FA, insert :—

(4) Section 50FB—

Tax refunds 50FB. (1) In this section—
for welfare
expenditure 4
by clubs. « . . .
amount disbursed” does not include any amount of

money disbursed for an approved welfare
purpose—

(a) if the money consists of donations, or any
proceeds of donations, collected by a
club; or

(b) which, in the opinion of the Minister, is
the proceeds of any special sporting,
social, gambling, cultural or other activity
conducted by a club to raise money,

for that approved welfare purpose; '

“approved welfare purpose” means a purpose which—
(a) promotes community welfare; and

(b) is approved by the Minister for the ‘
purposes of this section, either generally
or in a particular case;

“relevant period” means the period of 12 months

ending on 30th November in 1979 or in any '
subsequent year.



Act No. 17, 1979.

Gaming and Betting (Poker Machines) Amendment.

SCHEDULE 1—-continued.

AMENDMENTS TO THE GAMING AND BETTING AcT, 1912—
continued.

(2) Where the Minister is satisfied that the
amount disbursed during a relevant period for approved
welfare purposes by a club is not less than 5 per cent
of the aggregate net revenue from poker machines derived
by the club during that relevant period, the club shall be
entitled to a refund of taxes paid by it under section 50E
(1)and (1B) equivalent to—

(a) one third of the amount which the Minister is
satisfied was so disbursed; or

(b) the sum of those taxes actually paid by the club
during the period of 12 months ending 21st
December next following the end of the relevant
period,

whichever is the lesser amount.

(3) A club is not entitled to a refund under
subsection (2) in respect of a relevant period unless the
club has made an application to the Minister for the
refund—

(a) on or before 21st December next following the
end of the relevant period or on or before such
later date as the Minister may in any particular
case allow; and

(b) in the form approved by the Minister for the
purposes of this section.

(4) Any refund to which a club is entitled under
subsection (2) shall be paid out of the Gaming and Betting
(Poker Machines) Account in the Special Deposits
Account established at the Treasury.




Act No. 17, 1979.

Gaming and Betting (Poker Machines) Amendment.

SCHEDULE 1—continued.
AMENDMENTS TO THE GAMING AND BETTING AcCT, 1912

continued.

(5) Sixth Schedule and Seventh Schedule—

Omit the Schedules, insert instead

‘qnd> 9y £q pajviado pue pasn “1day a1e sauiyorw Jayod 2y IIYyM 1apun asuadi] ay) ul payroads
M 9CUEBPIOIDE Ui palesado dwayds snuoq Aue Jo jied se gnpd ayl Aq udAIS 10 pied sazud jo anjea |Biol y]§

IPUOD pue SWid) Ay}

*21EP 1BY1 1€ Sk d1eiado pur asn *daad 01 Pasuad(| S N ) YIIYM duryorw 1axod

OB 10J (0T$ JO 2IBI AY) 1B PIR|ND[ED JUNOWE UR JLdA AUB Ui JAQUWIAACN] YIO§ SUIPUD SYIUOW G Y] 4O 193dSal Ul UINJAI B Ul A[UO MOUS4 s

‘qnjd 2y £q paresado pue pasn ‘3dey a1e SAUIYIEW J2x0d Y] YIIYM JIPUN ISUDI| 2] Ul

payads SuOnipuod pue SULId]} Al IIM SDUBPIOIIR UT PaIRIddo dwayds snuoqg Aue Jo 1ued se qnio a4yl AqQ uaAIS 10 pred saznd Aue Jo anjea ayl

110U nq ‘sauryorw 1axod 3y) Aq A[10aIIp paseajal sjunowe 2yl o) [eucnippe qnd ayl Aq uaAI3 1o pied sazud jo senjea (w101 Yyl
( 61-TI-1 10  61-9-1) sdr[aI wInjar siy) yarym o3 porad ayy SuiuuiSeq a1ep moys U9 )
( 61-S—1€ 10 GI-11—0€) SAIR[2I WINIAI SIY) Yorym 03 poriad ay) SUIpU2 23BP MOYS dIH

saulyorW Joyod WoIj dnUdAI 1N

§ sazuad snuoq jo anjea ssa|

tUos[eIoL

wx20UBMO[[R PIENTERTT] W isozud |

saziid snuoq
Jo Npap
210J2q saulyorw

uvoneasdop pue auiyorvw snuoq §

| 12%0d

njXd

sozud jo anjeA

Ja30d wody
onuaAdl 1aN |
|

(soz11d snuoq FuIpnjdXd) suonINPI

|

sauiyoewu 1ayod
WOIJ 9NUIAL SSOIN)

|—
_, —e pajesado 10 pasn ‘ydoy
| sauryoew 1ayod Jo requinnN

sauryorw 1a30d
| JO uoneurwouz(y

SSOIPPY

=N JO QWEN

3

Suipud syjuow 9 Ay} Jo 32adsar ul‘gIg] OV Suniag pue Sunuen dy) Jjo €90¢ uondas o3 juensind uanoYy

HTNAIHDS HLIXIS




‘ Gaming and Betting (Poker Machines) Amendment.

Act No. 17, 19709.

SCHEDULE 1—continued.

AMENDMENTS TO THE GAMING AND BETTING AcCT, 1912—

Plus

Less

Particulars

continued.

SEVENTH SCHEDULE.

of Aggregate Net Revenue and Supplementary
License Tax thereon.

(A) Net revenue from poker machines for 6

months

taxing period ended 30th

November (as shown in return under
Sixth Schedule) «:uveuiesamoenams o

(B) Net revenue from poker machines for
preceding 6 months taxing period ended
31st May (as shown in previous return)

(C) Aggregate
machines

(D)

net revenue from poker

12 months ended 30th

November (A+B) .................. e

SUPPLEMENTARY LICENSE TAX

PAYABLE—

*(i) if the amount in (C) does not NIL

exceed $50,000 ...............

OR

*(ii) at the rate of 65 cents for each

#(ifi)

dollar that the amount in (C)
exceeds $50,000 if the amount in
(C) exceeds $50,000 but does not

$65,000 . .cwedinsiaons
OR

at the rate of 15% on the amount

if the amount in (C)

exceeds $65,000 ..............

(E) SUPPLEMENTARY LICENSE TAX
PAID in respect of preceding taxing
period ended 31st May ..............



Act No. 17, 1979

Gaming and Betting (Poker Machines) Amendment. .

SCHEDULE 1—continued.

AMENDMENTS TO THE GAMING AND BETTING Acr, 1912—
continued.

*(F) NET SUPPLEMENTARY LICENSE
TAX PAYABLE FOR PERIOD OF 12
MONTHS ENDED 30TH NOVEMBER
(D—E)

*(G) NET SUPPLEMENTARY LICENSE
TAX REFUND CLAIMED FOR
PERIOD OF 12 MONTHS ENDED
30tTH NOVEMBER (E—D)

* Delete whichever is not applicable.

In the name and on behalf of Her Majesty I assent to this Act.

A. R. CUTLER,

Governor. ‘
Government House,

Sydney, 20th April, 1979.

BY AUTHORITY ‘

D. WEST, GOVERNMENT PRINTER, NEW SOUTH WALES—1979



