
GAMING AND BETTING (POKER MACHINES) 
AMENDMENT BILL, 1978 

EXPLANATORY NOTE 

(This Explanatory Note relates to this Bill as introduced into Parliament) 

THE objects of this Bill are— 
to reduce by one-quarter the rates of additional supplementary license 
tax payable by clubs in respect of the keeping, use and operation of 
poker machines in respect of the period of 12 months ending 31st May, 
1979, and any subsequent period of 12 months; and 
to make other provisions of an ancillary or consequential character. 

53157B 
	

4— 



1 



GAMING AND BETTING (POKER MACHINES) 
AMENDMENT BILL, 1978 

No. , 1978. 

A BILL FOR 

An Act to reduce the additional supplementary license tax payable 
by clubs under the Gaming and Betting (Poker Machines) 
Taxation Act, 1956; and to amend the Gaming and Betting 
Act, 1912, consequentially. 

[MR RENSHAW-8 November, 1978.1 

5315713 4 



Act No. , 1978. 2 

Gaming and Betting (Poker Machines) Amendment. 

BE it enacted by the Queen's Most Excellent Majesty, by and with 
the advice and consent of the Legislative Council and Legislative 
Assembly of New South Wales in Parliament assembled, and by 
the authority of the same, as follows :- 

5 1. This Act may be cited as the "Gaming and Betting (Poker Short title. 
Machines) Amendment Act, 1978". 

This Act contains the following Schedules :— Schedules. 

SCHEDULE 1.—AMENDMENTS TO THE GAMING AND 
BETTING (POKER MACHINES) TAXATION ACT, 1956. 

10 SCHEDULE 2.—AMENDMENTS TO THE GAMING AND 
BETTING ACT, 1912. 

3. The Gaming and Betting (Poker Machines) Taxation Act, Amendment 
1956, is amended in the manner set forth in Schedule 1. of Act No. 

18, 1956. 

The Gaming and Betting Act, 1912, is amended in the Amendment 
15 manner set forth in Schedule 2. of Act No.

25, 1912. 

SCHEDULE 1. Sec. 3. 

AMENDMENTS TO THE GAMING AND BETTING (POKER MACHINES) 
TAXATION ACT, 1956. 

Section 6 (1), proviso- 

20 Omit "seventy-eight", insert instead "seventy-nine". 

Section 6 (1), Schedule— 

Omit "2%" wherever occurring, insert instead "1+%". 



Act No. , 1978. 3 

Gaming and Betting (Poker Machines) Amendment. 

SCHEDULE 1—continued. 

AMENDMENTS TO THE GAMING AND BETTING (POKER MACHINES) 
TAXATION ACT, 1956—continued. 

Section 6 (1) , Schedule- 

5 Omit "4%" wherever occurring, insert instead "3%". 

Section 6 (1) , Schedule— 
Omit "8%" wherever occurring, insert instead "6%". 

Section 6 (1) , Schedule— 
Omit "9.33%", insert instead "7%". 

10 SCHEDULE 2. Sec. 4. 

AMENDMENTS TO THE GAMING AND BETTING ACT, 1912. 

Tenth Schedule— 
Omit "2%", insert instead "Fro". 

Tenth Schedule- 

15 Omit "4%", insert instead "3%". 

Tenth Schedule— 
Omit "8%", insert instead "6%". 

Tenth Schedule— 
Omit "9.33%", insert instead "7%". 

BY AUTHORITY 
D. WEST, GOVERNMENT PRINTER, NEW SOUTH WALES-1978 

[8c] 



1 

o 

i 



I. 



I 



GAMING AND BETTING (POKER MACHINES) 
AMENDMENT ACT, 1978, No. 109 

iipouth 

ANNO VICES! MO SEPTIMO 

ELIZABETHIE II REGINA', 
* * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * 

Act No. 109, 1978. 

An Act to reduce the additional supplementary license tax payable 
by clubs under the Gaming and Betting (Poker Machines) 
Taxation Act, 1956; and to amend the Gaming and Betting 
Act, 1912, consequentially. [Assented to, 20th December, 
1978.1 

• 
• P 58329H (8c) 

• 
• 



2 	 Act No. 109, 1978. 

Gaming and Betting (Poker Machines) Amendment. 

BE it enacted by the Queen's Most Excellent Majesty, by and with 
the advice and consent of the Legislative Council and Legislative 
Assembly of New South Wales in Parliament assembled, and by 
the authority of the same, as follows :— 

Short title. 	1. This Act may be cited as the "Gaming and Betting (Poker 
Machines) Amendment Act, 1978". 

Schedules. 	2. This Act contains the following Schedules :— 

SCHEDULE 1.—AMENDMENTS TO THE GAMING AND 
BETTING (POKER MACHINES) TAXATION ACT, 1956. 

SCHEDULE 2.—AMENDMENTS TO THE GAMING AND 
BETTING ACT, 1912. 

Amendment 3. The Gaming and Betting (Poker Machines) Taxation Act, 
of Act No. 1956, is amended in the manner set forth in Schedule 1. 18, 1956. 

Amendment 4. The Gaming and Betting Act, 1912, is amended in the 
of Act No. manner set forth in Schedule 2. 25, 1912. 

Sec. 3. 	 SCHEDULE 1. 

AMENDMENTS TO THE GAMING AND BETTING (POKER MACHINES) 
TAXATION ACT, 1956. 

Section 6 (1), proviso— 
Omit "seventy-eight", insert instead "seventy-nine". 

Section 6 (1), Schedule— 
Omit "25" wherever occurring, insert instead "115". 



• 
• 

• 
• 

Act No. 109, 1978. 	 3 

Gaining and Betting (Poker Machines) Amendment. 

SCHEDULE 1—continued. 

AMENDMENTS TO THE GAMING AND BETTING (POKER MACHINES) 
TAXATION ACT, 1956—continued. 

Section 6 (1), Schedule— 
Omit "4%" wherever occurring, insert instead "35". 

Section 6 (1), Schedule— 
Omit "85" wherever occurring, insert instead "65". 

Section 6 (1), Schedule— 
Omit "9.33%", insert instead "75". 

SCHEDULE 2. 	 Sec. 4. 

AMENDMENTS TO THE GAMING AND BETTING ACT, 1912. 

Tenth Schedule— 
Omit "2%", insert instead "115". 

Tenth Schedule— 
Omit "45", insert instead "35". 

Tenth Schedule— 
Omit "85", insert instead "65". 

Tenth Schedule— 
Omit "9.33%", insert instead "75". 

In the name and on behalf of Her Majesty I assent to this Act. 

A. R. CUTLER, 
Governor. 

Government House, 
Sydney, 20th December, 1978. 

BY AUTHORITY 
D. WEST, GOVERNMENT PRINTER, NEW SOUTH WALES-1979 



• 
• 

• 
• 


