
GAMING AND BETTING (POKER MACHINES) 
FURTHER AMENDMENT BILL, 1977 

No. , 1977. 

A BILL FOR 

An Act to reduce the additional supplementary license tax 
payable by clubs under the Gaming and Betting (Poker 
Machines) Taxation Act, 1956; and to amend the 
Gaming and Betting Act, 1912, consequentially. 

[MR RENSHAW-26 October, 1977.] 

BE 

36599 266— 



Act No. 	, 1977. 	 2 

Gaming and Betting (Poker Machines) Further Amendment. 

BE it enacted by the Queen's Most Excellent Majesty, by and 
with the advice and consent of the Legislative Council and 
Legislative Assembly of New South Wales in Parliament 
assembled, and by the authority of the same, as follows :- 

	

5 	1. This Act may be cited as the "Gaming and Betting short 
(Poker Machines) Further Amendment Act, 1977". 	title. 

This Act contains the following Schedules :— 	Schedules. 

SCHEDULE 1.—AMENDMENTS TO THE GAMING AND 
BETTING (POKER MACHINES) TAXATION ACT, 

	

10 	1956. 
SCHEDULE 2.—AMENDMENTS TO THE GAMING AND 

BETTING ACT, 1912. 

The Gaming and Betting (Poker Machines) Taxation Amendment 
Act, 1956. is amended in the manner set forth in Schedule 1. of Act No.

18, 1956. 

	

15 	4. The Gaming and Betting Act, 1912, is amended in Amendment 
the manner set forth in Schedule 2. 	 of Act No.

25, 1912. 

SCHEDULE 1. 	 Sec. 3. 

AMENDMENTS TO THE GAMING AND BETTING (POKER 
MACHINES) TAXATION ACT, 1956. 

20 (1) Section 6 (1) , proviso— 
Omit "seventy-seven", insert instead "seventy-eight". 

(2) Section 6 (1), Schedule— 
Omit "2170" wherever occurring, insert instead "2%". 

SCHEDULE 



Act No. 	, 1977. 	 3 

Gaming and Betting (Poker Machines) Further Amendment. 

SCHEDULE 1—continued. 

AMENDMENTS TO THE GAMING AND BETTING (POKER 
MACHINES) TAXATION ACT, 1956—continued. 

Section 6 (1), Schedule- 

5 	Omit "5%" wherever occurring, insert instead "4%" 

Section 6 (1), Schedule— 

Omit "105" wherever occurring, insert instead "85". 

Section 6 (1), Schedule— 

Omit "11.67%", insert instead "9.33%". 

10 	 SCHEDULE 2. 	 Sec. 4. 

AMENDMENTS TO THE GAMING AND BETTING ACT, 1912. 

Tenth Schedule— 

Omit "24-%", insert instead "2%". 

Tenth Schedule- 

15 	Omit "55", insert instead "45". 

SCHEDULE 



 
 

Act No. , 1977. 4 

 
      

 

Gaming and Betting (Poker Machines) Further Amendment. 

SCHEDULE 2—continued. 

AMENDMENTS TO THE GAMING AND BETTING 

ACT, 1912—continued. 

Tenth Schedule- 

5 Omit "10% ", insert instead "8% ". 

Tenth Schedule— 

Omit "11.67%", insert instead "9.33%". 

BY AUTHORITY 
D. WEST, GOVERNMENT PRINTER, NEW SOUTH WALES-1977 

[8c] 



PROOF 

GAMING AND BETTING (POKER MACHINES) FURTHER 
AMENDMENT BILL, 1977 

EXPLANATORY NOTE 

(This Explanatory Note relates to this Bill as introduced into Parliament) 

THE objects of this Bill are— 

to reduce by one-fifth the rates of additional supplementary license tax 
payable by clubs in respect of the keeping, use and operation of poker 
machines in respect of the period of 12 months ending 31st May, 1978, 
and any subsequent period of 12 months; and 

to make other provisions of an ancillary or consequential character. 

36599 	266— 



ol 

V. 



PROOF 
GAMING AND BETTING (POKER MACHINES) 

FURTHER AMENDMENT BILL, 1977 

No. 	, 1977. 

A BILL FOR 

An Act to reduce the additional supplementary license tax 
payable by clubs under the Gaming and Betting (Poker 
Machines) Taxation Act, 1956; and to amend the 
Gaming and Betting Act, 1912, consequentially. 

[MR RE NsHAw-26 October, 1977.1 

BE 

36599 	266— 



Act No. 	, 1977. 	 2 

Gaming and Betting (Poker Machines) Further Amendment. 

BE it enacted by the Queen's Most Excellent Majesty, by and 
with the advice and consent of the Legislative Council and 
Legislative Assembly of New South Wales in Parliament 
assembled, and by the authority of the same, as follows :- 

	

5 	1. This Act may be cited as the "Gaming and Betting short 
(Poker Machines) Further Amendment Act, 1977". 	tide. 

This Act contains the following Schedules :— 	Schedules. 

SCHEDULE 1.—AMENDMENTS TO THE GAMING AND 
BETTING (POKER MACHINES) TAXATION ACT, 

	

10 	1956. 
SCHEDULE 2.—AMENDMENTS TO THE GAMING AND 

BETTING ACT, 1912. 

The Gaming and Betting (Poker Machines) Taxation Amendment 
Act, 1956, is amended in the manner set forth in Schedule 1. %% 1'1'6  

	

15 	4. The Gaming and Betting Act, 1912, is amended LI,  Amendment 
the manner set forth in Schedule 2. 	 of Act No. 

25, 1912. 

SCHEDULE 1. 	 Sec. 3. 

AMENDMENTS TO THE GAMING AND BETTING (POKER 
MACHINES) TAXATION ACT, 1956. 

20 (1) Section 6 (1), proviso— 
Omit "seventy-seven", insert instead "seventy-eight". 

(2) Section 6 (1), Schedule— 
Omit "2470" wherever occurring, insert instead "2%". 

SCHEDULE 



 
 

Act No. 	, 1977. 	 3 

 
      

 

Gaming and Betting (Poker Machines) Further Amendment. 

SCHEDULE 1—continued. 

AMENDMENTS TO THE GAMING AND BETTING (POKER 
MACHINES) TAXATION ACT, 1956—continued. 

Section 6 (1), Schedule- 

5 	Omit "5%" wherever occurring, insert instead "45". 

Section 6 (1), Schedule— 

Omit "10%" wherever occurring, insert instead "85". 

Section 6 (1), Schedule— 

Omit "11.67%", insert instead "9.33%". 

10 	 SCHEDULE 2. 	 Sec. 4. 

AMENDMENTS TO THE GAMING AND BETTING ACT, 1912. 

Tenth Schedule— 

Omit "21%", insert instead "2%". 

Tenth Schedule- 

15 	Omit "5%", insert instead "45". 

SCHEDULE 



Act No. , 1977. 4 

Gaming and Betting (Poker Machines) Further Amendment. 

SCHEDULE 2—continued. 

AMENDMENTS TO THE GAMING AND BETTING 
ACT, 1912—continued. 

Tenth Schedule- 

5 Omit "10%", insert instead "8%". 

Tenth Schedule— 
Omit "11.6770", insert instead "9.335". 

BY AUTHORITY 
D. WEST, GOVERNMENT PRINTER, NEW SOUTH WALES-1977 

6 



GAMING AND BETTING (POKER MACHINES) 
FURTHER AMENDMENT BILL, 1977 

No. , 1977. 

A BILL FOR 

An Act to reduce the additional supplementary license tax 
payable by clubs under the Gaming and Betting (Poker 
Machines) Taxation Act, 1956; and to amend the 
Gaming and Betting Act, 1912, consequentially. 

[MR RENSHAW-26 October, 1977.] 

BE 

36599 266— 



 
 

Act No. 	, 1977. 	 2 

 
 

 
  

 
 

 

Gaming and Betting (Poker Machines) Further Amendment. 

BE it enacted by the Queen's Most Excellent Majesty, by and 
with the advice and consent of the Legislative Council and 
Legislative Assembly of New South Wales in Parliament 
assembled, and by the authority of the same, as follows :- 

	

5 	1. This Act may be cited as the "Gaming and Betting Short 
(Poker Machines) Further Amendment Act, 1977". 

This Act contains the following Schedules :— 	Schedules. 

SCHEDULE 1.—AMENDMENTS TO THE GAMING AND 
BETTING (POKER MACHINES) TAXATION ACT, 

	

10 	1956. 

SCHEDULE 2.—AMENDMENTS TO THE GAMING AND 
BETTING ACT, 1912. 

The Gaming and Betting (Poker Machines) Taxation Amendment 
Act, 1956, is amended in the manner set forth in Schedule 1. (11 Alcg°. 

	

15 	4. The Gaming and Betting Act, 1912, is amended in Amendment 
the manner set forth in Schedule 2. 	 of Act No. 

25, 1912. 

SCHEDULE 1. 	 Sec. 3. 

AMENDMENTS TO THE GAMING AND BETTING (POKER 
MACHINES) TAXATION ACT, 1956. 

20 (1) Section 6 (1), proviso— 
Omit "seventy-seven", insert instead "seventy-eight". 

(2) Section 6 (1), Schedule— 
Omit "215" wherever occurring, insert instead "2' ; ". 

SCHEDULE 



 

Act No. 	, 1977. 	 3 

 

 
  

 
 

 
 

Gaming and Betting (Poker Machines) Further Amendment. 

SCHEDULE 1—continued. 

AMENDMENTS TO THE GAMING AND BETTING (POKER 
MACHINES) TAXATION ACT, 1956—continued. 

Section 6 (1), Schedule- 

5 	Omit "5%" wherever occurring, insert instead "45," 

Section 6 (1), Schedule— 

Omit "1079" wherever occurring, insert instead "870". 

Section 6 (1), Schedule— 

Omit "11.6770", insert instead "9.33%". 

10 
	

SCHEDULE 2. 	 Sec. 4. 

AMENDMENTS TO THE GAMING AND BETTING ACT, 1912. 

Tenth Schedule— 

Omit "2170", insert instead "2%". 

Tenth Schedule- 

15 	Omit "5%", insert instead "45". 

SCHEDULE 



Act No. , 1977. 4 

Gaming and Betting (Poker Machines) Further Amendment. 

SCHEDULE 2—continued. 

AMENDMENTS TO THE GAMING AND BETTING 

ACT, 1912—continued. 

Tenth Schedule- 

5 Omit "10%", insert instead "8%". 

Tenth Schedule— 

Omit "11.67%", insert instead "9.33%". 

BY AUTHORITY 
D. WEST, GOVERNMENT PRINTER, NEW SOUTH WALES-1977 

[8c] 



PROOF 

GAMING AND BETTING (POKER MACHINES) FURTHER 
AMENDMENT BILL, 1977 

EXPLANATORY NOTE 

(This Explanatory Note relates to this Bill as introduced into Parliament) 

THE objects of this Bill are— 

to reduce by one-fifth the rates of additional supplementary license tax 
payable by clubs in respect of the keeping, use and operation of poker 
machines in respect of the period of 12 months ending 31st May, 1978, 
and any subsequent period of 12 months; and 

to make other provisions of an ancillary or consequential character. 

36599 	266— 





PROOF 
GAMING AND BETTING (POKER MACHINES) 

FURTHER AMENDMENT BILL, 1977 

No. 	, 1977. 

A BILL FOR 

An Act to reduce the additional supplementary license tax 
payable by clubs under the Gaming and Betting (Poker 
Machines) Taxation Act, 1956; and to amend the 
Gaming and Betting Act, 1912, consequentially. 

[MR RENsHAw-26 October, 1977.1 

BE 

36599 	266— 



Act No. 	, 1977. 	 2 

Gaming and Betting (Poker Machines) Further Amendment. 

BE it enacted by the Queen's Most Excellent Majesty, by and 
with the advice and consent of the Legislative Council and 
Legislative Assembly of New South Wales in Parliament 
assembled, and by the authority of the same, as follows :- 

	

5 	1. This Act may be cited as the "Gaming and Betting Short 
(Poker Machines) Further Amendment Act, 1977". 

This Act contains the following Schedules :— 	Schedules. 

SCHEDULE 1.—AMENDMENTS TO THE GAMING AND 
BETTING (POKER MACHINES) TAXATION ACT, 

	

10 	1956. 
SCHEDULE 2.—AMENDMENTS TO THE GAMING AND 

BETTING ACT, 1912. 

The Gaming and Betting (Poker Machines) Taxation Amendment 
Act, 1956, is amended in the manner set forth in Schedule 1. (148AN5Is o.  

	

15 	4. The Gaming and Betting Act, 1912, is amended in Amendment 
the manner set forth in Schedule 2. 	 of Act No. 

25, 1912. 

SCHEDULE 1. 	 Sec. 3. 

AMENDMENTS TO THE GAMING AND BETTING (POKER 
MACHINES) TAXATION ACT, 1956. 

20 (1) Section 6 (1), proviso— 
Omit "seventy-seven", insert instead "seventy-eight". 

(2) Section 6 (1), Schedule— 
Omit "2i-%" wherever occurring, insert instead "2%". 

SCHEDULE 



 

Act No. , 1977. 3 

 
 

 
 

Gaming and Betting (Poker Machines) Further Amendment. 

SCHEDULE 1—continued. 

AMENDMENTS TO THE GAMING AND BETTING (POKER 
MACHINES) TAXATION ACT, 1956—continued. 

Section 6 (1), Schedule- 

5 Omit "55" wherever occurring, insert instead "45". 

Section 6 (1), Schedule— 

Omit "105" wherever occurring, insert instead "85". 

Section 6 (1), Schedule— 

Omit "11.675", insert instead "9.335". 

10 SCHEDULE 2. Sec. 4. 

AMENDMENTS TO THE GAMING AND BETTING ACT, 1912. 

Tenth Schedule— 

Omit "215", insert instead "25". 

Tenth Schedule- 

15 Omit "55", insert instead "45". 

SCHEDULE 



Act No. , 1977. 4 

Gaming and Betting (Poker Machines) Further Amendment. 

SCHEDULE 2—continued. 

AMENDMENTS TO THE GAMING AND BETTING 
ACT, 1912—continued. 

Tenth Schedule- 

5 Omit "10% ", insert instead "8% ". 

Tenth Schedule— 
Omit "11.67%", insert instead "9.33%". 

BY AUTHORITY 
D. WEST, GOVERNMENT PRINTER, NEW SOUTH WALES-1977 

• 



This PUBLIC BILL originated in the LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY, and, 
having this day passed, is now ready for presentation to the LEGISLATIVE 
COUNCIL for its concurrence. 

R. E. WARD, 
Clerk of the Legislative Assembly. 

Legislative Assembly Chamber, 
Sydney, 29 November, 1977. 

gap ipoutb tales 

ANNO VICESIMO SEXTO 

ELIZABETHIE II REGINLE 
* * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * 

Act No. 	, 1977. 

An Act to reduce the additional supplementary license tax 
payable by clubs under the Gaming and Betting (Poker 
Machines) Taxation Act, 1956; and to amend the 
Gaming and Betting Act, 1912, consequentially. 

BE 

36599 	266— 



Act No. 	, 1977. 	 2 

Gaming and Betting (Poker Machines) Further Amendment. 

BE it enacted by the Queen's Most Excellent Majesty, by and 
with the advice and consent of the Legislative Council and 
Legislative Assembly of New South Wales in Parliament 
assembled, and by the authority of the same, as follows :- 

	

5 	1. This Act may be cited as the "Gaming and Betting Short 
(Poker Machines) Further Amendment Act, 1977". 	title.  

This Act contains the following Schedules :— 	Schedules. 

SCHEDULE 1.—AMENDMENTS TO THE GAMING AND 
BETTING (POKER MACHINES) TAXATION ACT, 

	

10 	1956. 
SCHEDULE 2.—AMENDMENTS TO THE GAMING AND 

BETTING ACT, 1912. 

The Gaming and Betting (Poker Machines) Taxation Amendment 
Act, 1956, is amended in the manner set forth in Schedule 1. 7f8  

	

15 	4. The Gaming and Betting Act, 1912, is amended in Amendment 
the manner set forth in Schedule 2. 	 of Act No. 

25, 1912. 

SCHEDULE 1. 

AMENDMENTS TO THE GAMING AND BETTING (POKER 
MACHINES) TAXATION ACT, 1956. 

20 (1) Section 6 (1), proviso— 
Omit "seventy-seven", insert instead "seventy-eight". 

(2) Section 6 (1), Schedule— 
Omit "2170" wherever occurring, insert instead "2%". 

SCHEDULE 

Sec. 3. 



3 Act No. 	, 1977. 

Gaming and Betting (Poker Machines) Further Amendment. 

SCHEDULE 1—continued. 

AMENDMENTS TO THE GAMING AND BETTING (POKER 
MACHINES) TAXATION ACT, 1956—continued. 

( 3 ) Section 6 (1), Schedule— 

Omit "55" wherever occurring, insert instead "4`7," 

Section 6 (1), Schedule— 

Omit "1070" wherever occurring, insert instead "8 (;,". 

Section 6 (1), Schedule— 

Omit "11.67%", insert instead "9.33%". 

SCHEDULE 2. 	 Sec. 4. 

AMENDMENTS TO THE GAMING AND BETTING ACT, 1912. 

Tenth Schedule— 

Omit "215", insert instead "25". 

Tenth Schedule- 

15 	Omit "55", insert instead "45". 

SCHEDULE 

5 

10 



Act No. 	, 1977. 	 4 

Gaming and Betting (Poker Machines) Further Amendment. 

SCHEDULE 2—continued. 

AMENDMENTS TO THE GAMING AND BETTING 
ACT, 1912—continued. 

Tenth Schedule- 

5 	Omit "10%", insert instead "8%". 

Tenth Schedule— 

Omit "11.6770", insert instead "9.33%". 

BY AUTHORITY 
D. WEST, GOVERNMENT PRINTER, NEW SOUTH WALES-1977 

[8c] 



GAMING AND BETTING (POKER MACHINES) 
FURTHER AMENDMENT ACT, 1977 

ebn 6outb Wales 

ANNO VICESIMO SEXTO 

ELIZABETH/F. H REGIME 
* * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * 

Act No. 130, 1977. 

An Act to reduce the additional supplementary license tax 
payable by clubs under the Gaming and Betting (Poker 
Machines) Taxation Act, 1956; and to amend the 
Gaming and Betting Act, 1912, consequentially. 
[Assented to, 14th December, 1977.1 

P 43427K [8c] 



2 	 Act No. 130, 1977. 

Gaming and Betting (Poker Machines) Further Amendment. 

BE it enacted by the Queen's Most Excellent Majesty, by and 
with the advice and consent of the Legislative Council and 
Legislative Assembly of New South Wales in Parliament 
assembled, and by the authority of the same, as follows :— 

Short 	1. This Act may be cited as the "Gaming and Betting 
title. 	(Poker Machines) Further Amendment Act, 1977". 

Schedules. 2. This Act contains the following Schedules :— 

SCHEDULE 1.—AMENDMENTS TO THE GAMING AND 
BETTING (POKER MACHINES) TAXATION ACT, 
1956. 

SCHEDULE 2.—AMENDMENTS TO THE GAMING AND 
BETTING ACT, 1912. 

Amendment 3. The Gaming and Betting (Poker Machines) Taxation 
of Act No. Act, 1956, is amended in the manner set forth in Schedule 1. 18, 1956. 

Amendment 4. The Gaming and Betting Act, 1912, is amended in 
of Act No. 
25, 1912. 	the manner set forth in Schedule 2. 

Sec. 3. 	 SCHEDULE 1. 

AMENDMENTS TO THE GAMING AND BETTING (POKER 
MACHINES) TAXATION ACT, 1956. 

Section 6 (1), proviso— 

Omit "seventy-seven", insert instead "seventy-eight". 

Section 6 (1), Schedule— 

Omit "2170" wherever occurring, insert instead "270". 



3 Act No. 130, 1977. 

Gaming and Betting (Poker Machines) Further Amendment. 

SCHEDULE 1—continued. 

AMENDMENTS TO THE GAMING AND BETTING (POKER 
MACHINES) TAXATION ACT, 1956—continued. 

Section 6 (1), Schedule— 

Omit "5%" wherever occurring, insert instead "4%" 

Section 6 (1), Schedule— 

Omit "10%" wherever occurring, insert instead "8%". 

Section 6 (1), Schedule— 

Omit "11.67%", insert instead "9.33%". 

SCHEDULE 2. 	 Sec. 4. 

AMENDMENTS TO THE GAMING AND BETTING ACT, 1912. 

Tenth Schedule— 

Omit "21 5", insert instead "25". 

Tenth Schedule— 

Omit "5%", insert instead "4%". 



4 	 Act No. 130, 1977. 

Gaming and Betting (Poker Machines) Further Amendment. 

SCHEDULE 2—continued. 

AMENDMENTS TO THE GAMING AND BETTING 
ACT, 1912—continued. 

Tenth Schedule— 
Omit "10%", insert instead "8%". 

Tenth Schedule— 
Omit "11.67%", insert instead "9.33%". 

BY AUTHORITY 
D. WEST, GOVERNMENT PRINTER. NEW SOUTH WALES-1978 



I certify that this PUBLIC BILL, which originated in the LEGISLA-
TIVE ASSEMBLY, has finally passed the LEGISLATIVE COUNCIL and the 
LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY of NEW SOUTH WALES. 

R. E. WARD, 
Clerk of the Legislative Assembly. 

Legislative Assembly Chamber, 
Sydney, 1 December, 1977. 

ANNO VICESIMO SEXTO 

ELIZABETHIE II REGINIE 
* * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * 

Act No. 130, 1977. 

An Act to reduce the additional supplementary license tax 
payable by clubs under the Gaming and Betting (Poker 
Machines) Taxation Act, 1956; and to amend the 
Gaming and Betting Act, 1912, consequentially. 
[Assented to, 14th December, 1977.1 

BE 

I have examined this Bill, and find it to correspond in all respects 
with the Bill as finally passed by both Houses. 

T. J. CAHILL, 
Chairman of Committees of the Legislative Assembly. 



2 	 Act No. 130, 1977. 

Gaming and Betting (Poker Machines) Further Amendment. 

BE it enacted by the Queen's Most Excellent Majesty, by and 
with the advice and consent of the Legislative Council and 
Legislative Assembly of New South Wales in Parliament 
assembled, and by the authority of the same, as follows :— 

Short 	1. This Act may be cited as the "Gaming and Betting 
title. 	(Poker Machines) Further Amendment Act, 1977". 

Schedules. 2. This Act contains the following Schedules :— 
SCHEDULE 1.—AMENDMENTS TO THE GAMING AND 

BETTING (POKER MACHINES) TAXATION ACT, 
1956. 

SCHEDULE 2.—AMENDMENTS TO THE GAMING AND 
BETTING ACT, 1912. 

Amendment 3. The Gaming and Betting (Poker Machines) Taxation 
of Act No. Act, 1956, is amended in the manner set forth in Schedule 1. 18, 1956. 

Amendment 4. The Gaming and Betting Act, 1912, is amended in 
2
o

5
f

,
A

1
c
9
t
1
N
2.

o
. the manner set forth in Schedule 2. 

Sec. 3. 	 SCHEDULE 1. 

AMENDMENTS TO THE GAMING AND BETTING (POKER 
MACHINES) TAXATION ACT, 1956. 

Section 6 (1), proviso— 
Omit "seventy-seven", insert instead "seventy-eight". 

Section 6 (1), Schedule— 
Omit "215" wherever occurring, insert instead "2%". 

SCHEDULE 



3 Act No. 130, 1977. 

Gaming and Betting (Poker Machines) Further Amendment. 

SCHEDULE 1—continued. 

AMENDMENTS TO THE GAMING AND BETTING (POKER 
MACHINES) TAXATION ACT, 1956—continued. 

Section 6 (1), Schedule— 

Omit "5%" wherever occurring, insert instead "4', ," 

Section 6 (1), Schedule— 

Omit "10%" wherever occurring, insert instead "8%". 

Section 6 (1), Schedule— 

Omit "11.6770", insert instead "9.3370". 

SCHEDULE 2. 	 Sec. 4. 

AMENDMENTS TO THE GAMING AND BETTING ACT, 1912. 

Tenth Schedule— 

Omit "2410", insert instead "2%". 

Tenth Schedule— 

Omit "5%", insert instead "4%". 

SCHEDULE 



4 	 Act No. 130, 1977. 

Gaming and Betting (Poker Machines) Further Amendment. 

SCHEDULE 2—continued. 

AMENDMENTS TO THE GAMING AND BETTING 
ACT, 1912—continued. 

Tenth Schedule— 
Omit "10%", insert instead "8%". 

Tenth Schedule— 
Omit "11.675", insert instead "9.335". 

In the name and on behalf of Her Majesty I assent to this 
Act. 

A. R. CUTLER, 
Governor. 

Government House, 
Sydney, 14th December, 1977. 


