
This PUBLIC BILL originated in the LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY, and, 
having this day passed, is now ready for presentation to the LEGISLATIVE 
COUNCIL for its concurrence. 

R. E. WARD, 
Clerk of the Legislative Assembly. 

Legislative Assembly Chamber, 
Sydney, 19 November, 1975. 

gap *outb Mateo 

ANNO VICESIMO QUARTO 

ELIZABETHJE II REGINJE 
* * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * 

Act No. 	, 1975. 

An Act to amend the Totalizator Act, 1916, in relation to 
the age at which persons may wager on a racecourse 
totalizator and to the inspection of totalizator records. 

BE 

2320 	523— 



Act No. , 1975. 2 

Totalizator (Amendment). 

BE it enacted by the Queen's Most Excellent Majesty, by 
and with the advice and consent of the Legislative 

Council and Legislative Assembly of New South Wales in 
Parliament assembled, and by the authority of the same, as 

5 follows:- 

This Act may be cited as the "Totalizator (Amend- title. 
ment) Act, 1975". 

2. The Totalizator Act, 1916, is amended in the manner Amend- 
set forth in Schedule 1. ment of 

Act No. 75, 
1916. 

10 SCHEDULE 1. 

AMENDMENTS TO THE TOTALIZATOR ACT, 1916. 

Section 12— 

Omit "twenty-one years", insert instead "18 years". 

(2) (a) Section 13- 

15 Omit "an infant" wherever occurring, insert 
instead "under the age of 18 years". 

(b) Section 13— 

Omit "such infant", insert instead "a person 
under the age of 18 years". 

20 (3) Sections 18A, 18B, 18c— 

After section 18, insert :- 

18A. A racing club and any person having the Keeping 

SCHEDULE 

control or possession of any record relating to the refcords. use by a racing club of a totalizator under this Act  



Act No. 	, 1975. 

Totalizator (Amendment). 

  

   

SCHEDULE 1—con tin u ed. 

AMENDMENTS TO THE TOTALIZATOR ACT, 1916—continued. 
shall keep, or arrange for the keeping of, that 
record in the manner and for the time prescribed 

5 

	

	in relation to that record or, where not so pre- 
scribed, in such a manner that it can be examined 
and audited by an inspector. 

18B. Without limiting the generality of section Produc-
18, any person who has the custody of any record re rds 

10 

	

	relating to the use of a totalizator under this Act 
shall, at all reasonable times (whether or not during 
a race-meeting), on demand being made by an 
inspector, produce that record to that inspector for 
examination or audit. 

15 	 18c. A reference in section 18A or 18B to a 	Defining 
record relating to the use of a totalizator shall— of records. 

not include a reference to a ticket issued 
as the result of an investment on a totaliza-
tor that is not a ticket in respect of which 

20 

	

	 a dividend or refund has been paid or a 
cancelled ticket; and 
be deemed to include a reference to any 
other document, matter or thing that is 
prescribed for the purposes of sections 18A 

25 	 and 18B as a record relating to the use of 
a totalizator. 

(4) Section 19— 

After "information", insert "or produce any record". 

BY AUTHORITY 
D, WEST, GOVERNMENT PRINTER, NEW SOUTH WALES-19'75 

[8c] 





No. 	, 1975. 

A BILL 
To amend the Totalizator Act, 1916, in relation to 

the age at which persons may wager on a racecourse 
totalizator and to the inspection of totalizator records. 

[MR COLEMAN-18 November, 1975.] 

BE 

2320 	523— 



Act No. 	, 1975. 	 2 

Totalizator (Amendment). 

BE it enacted by the Queen's Most Excellent Majesty, by 
and with the advice and consent of the Legislative 

Council and Legislative Assembly of New South Wales in 
Parliament assembled, and by the authority of the same, as 

5 follows:- 

This Act may be cited as the "Totalizator (Amend- Short 
ment) Act, 1975". 	 title. 

 

2. The Totalizator Act, 1916, is amended in the manner Amend- 
set forth in Schedule 1. 	 ment of 

Act No. 75, 
1916. 

10 
	 SCHEDULE 1. 

AMENDMENTS TO THE TOTALIZATOR ACT, 1916. 

Section 12— 

Omit "twenty-one years", insert instead "18 years". 

(2) (a) Section 13- 

15 	 Omit "an infant" wherever occurring, insert 
instead "under the age of 18 years". 

(b) Section 13— 

Omit "such infant", insert instead "a person 
under the age of 18 years". 

20 (3) Sections 18A, 18B, 18c— 

After section 18, insert :- 

18A. A racing club and any person having the Keeping 
control or possession of any record relating to the 

SCHEDULE 

roefcords. 
use by a racing club of a totalizator under this Act  



Act No. 	, 1975. 	 3 

Totalizator (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE 1—continued. 

AMENDMENTS TO THE TOTALIZATOR ACT, 1916—continued. 

shall keep, or arrange for the keeping of, that 
record in the manner and for the time prescribed 

5 	in relation to that record or, where not so pre- 
scribed, in such a manner that it can be examined 
and audited by an inspector. 

18B. Without limiting the generality of section Produc- 
18, any person who has the custody of any record rtTcnols. 

10 	relating to the use of a totalizator under this Act 
shall, at all reasonable times (whether or not during 
a race-meeting), on demand being made by an 
inspector, produce that record to that inspector for 
examination or audit. 

15 	 18c. A reference in section 18A or 18B to a 	Defining  
record relating to the use of a totalizator shall— ormfords. 

not include a reference to a ticket issued 
as the result of an investment on a totaliza-
tor that is not a ticket in respect of which 

20 

	

	 a dividend or refund has been paid or a 
cancelled ticket ; and 
be deemed to include a reference to any 
other document, matter or thing that is 
prescribed for the purposes of sections 18A 

25 

	

	 and 18B as a record relating to the use of 
a totalizator. 

(4) Section 19— 

After "information", insert "or produce any record". 

BY AUTHORITY 
D. WEST, GOVERNMENT PRINTER, NEW SOUTH WALES-1975 

[8c] 





PROOF 

TOTALIZATOR (AMENDMENT) BILL, 1975 

EXPLANATORY NOTE 

THE objects of this Bill are— 

to reduce the age at which persons may wager on a racecourse totaliza-
tor from 21 years to 18 years; and 

to extend the provisions relating to the examination or audit of 
totalizator records. 

I 

Ir 

ii 

2320 	523— 



1 

A 



PROOF 

i 

No. 	, 1975. 

A BILL 
To amend the Totalizator Act, 1916, in relation to 

the age at which persons may wager on a racecourse 
totalizator and to the inspection of totalizator records. 

[MR COLEMAN-18 November, 1975.] 

BE 

2320 	523— 



2 Act No. , 1975. 

Totalizator (Amendment). 

DE it enacted by the Queen's Most Excellent Majesty, by 
and with the advice and consent of the Legislative 

Council and Legislative Assembly of New South Wales in 
Parliament assembled, and by the authority of the same, as 

5 follows:- 

This Act may be cited as the "Totalizator (Amend- Short 
ment) Act, 1975". title. 

2. The Totalizator Act, 1916, is amended in the manner Amend- 
set forth in Schedule 1. ment of 

Act No. 75, 
1916. 

10 SCHEDULE 1. 

AMENDMENTS TO THE TOTALIZATOR ACT, 1916. 

Section 12— 

Omit "twenty-one years", insert instead "18 years". 

(2) (a) Section 13- 

15 Omit "an infant" wherever occurring, insert 
instead "under the age of 18 years". 

(b) Section 13— 

Omit "such infant", insert instead "a person 
under the age of 18 years". 

20 (3) Sections 18A, 18B, 18c— 

After section 18, insert :- 

18A. A racing club and any person having the Keeping 
control or possession of any record relating to the 
use by a racing club of a totalizator under this Act records. 

of 

SCHEDULE 



Act No. 	, 1975. 	 3 

Totalizator (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE 1—continued. 
AMENDMENTS TO THE TOTALIZATOR ACT, 1916—continued. 

shall keep, or arrange for the keeping of, that 
record in the manner and for the time prescribed 

5 	 in relation to that record or, where not so pre- 
scribed, in such a manner that it can be examined 
and audited by an inspector. 

18B. Without limiting the generality of section Produc- 
18, any person who has the custody of any record reno as.  10 	relating to the use of a totalizator under this Act 
shall, at all reasonable times (whether or not during 
a race-meeting), on demand being made by an 
inspector, produce that record to that inspector for 
examination or audit. 

15 	 18c. A reference in section 18A or 18B to a 	Defining  
record relating to the use of a totalizator shall— of records. 

not include a reference to a ticket issued 
as the result of an investment on a totaliza-
tor that is not a ticket in respect of which 

20 

	

	 a dividend or refund has been paid or a 
cancelled ticket ; and 
be deemed to include a reference to any 
other document, matter or thing that is 
prescribed for the purposes of sections 18A 

25 

	

	 and 18B as a record relating to the use of 
a totalizator. 

(4) Section 19— 

After "information", insert "or produce any record". 

BY AUTHORITY 
D. WEST, GOVERNMENT PRINTER, NEW SOUTH WALES-197S 



4 



ANNO VICESIMO QUARTO 

ELIZABETHJE H REGINJE 
* * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * • * 

Act No. 90, 1975. 

An Act to amend the Totalizator Act, 1916, in relation to 
the age at which persons may wager on a racecourse 
totalizator and to the inspection of totalizator records. 
[Assented to, 10th December, 1975.1 

BE 

P 4150 	[Sc] 



2 Act No. 90, 1975. 

Totalizator (Amendment). 

DE it enacted by the Queen's Most Excellent Majesty, by 
and with the advice and consent of the Legislative 

Council and Legislative Assembly of New South Wales in 
Parliament assembled, and by the authority of the same, as 
follows t— 

Short 1. This Act may be cited as the "Totalizator (Amend- 
title. ment) Act, 1975". 

Amend- 2. The Totalizator Act, 1916, is amended in the manner 
ment of set forth in Schedule 1. Act No. 75, 
1916. 

SCHEDULE 1. 

AMENDMENTS TO THE TOTALIZATOR ACT, 1916. 

Section 12— 

Omit "twenty-one years", insert instead "18 years". 

(2) (a) Section 13— 

Omit "an infant" wherever occurring, insert 
instead "under the age of 18 years". 

(b) Section 13— 
Omit "such infant", insert instead "a person 

under the age of 18 years". 

Keeping 
of 
records. 

Sections 18A, 18B, 18c— 

After section 18, insert :- 
18A. A racing club and any person having the 

control or possession of any record relating to the 
use by a racing club of a totalizator under this Act 

SCHEDULE 



Act No. 90, 1975. 	 3 

Totalizator (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE 1—continued. 
AMENDMENTS TO THE TOTALIZATOR ACT, 1916—continued. 

shall keep, or arrange for the keeping of, that 
record in the manner and for the time prescribed 
in relation to that record or, where not so pre-
scribed, in such a manner that it can be examined 
and audited by an inspector. 

18B. Without limiting the generality of section Produc- 
18, any person who has the custody of any record rtwni.1 
relating to the use of a totalizator under this Act 
shall, at all reasonable times (whether or not during 
a race-meeting), on demand being made by an 
inspector, produce that record to that inspector for 
examination or audit. 

18c. A reference in section 18A or 18B to a Defining 
record relating to the use of a totalizator shall— reef  ords. 

not include a reference to a ticket issued 
as the result of an investment on a totaliza-
tor that is not a ticket in respect of which 
a dividend or refund has been paid or a 
cancelled ticket ; and 
be deemed to include a reference to any 
other document, matter or thing that is 
prescribed for the purposes of sections 18A 
and 18B as a record relating to the use of 
a totalizator. 

(4) Section 19— 

After "information", insert "or produce any record". 

BY AUTHORITY 
D. WEST, GOVERNMENT PRINTER, NEW SOUTH WALES-1975 





I certify that this PUBLIC BILL, which originated in the LEGISLA-
TIVE ASSEMBLY, has finally passed the LEGISLATIVE COUNCIL and the 
LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY Of NEW SOUTH WALES. 

R. E. WARD, 
Clerk of the Legislative Assembly. 

Legislative Assembly Chamber, 
Sydney, 26 November, 1975. 

pebi iftoutb ZEILIatet 

ANNO VICESIMO QUARTO 

ELIZABETILE II REGINJE 
* * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * 

Act No. 90, 1975. 

An Act to amend the Totalizator Act, 1916, in relation to 
the age at which persons may wager on a racecourse 
totalizator and to the inspection of totalizator records. 
[Assented to, 10th December, 1975.1 

BE 

1 have examined this Bill, and find it to correspond in all respects 
with the Bill as finally passed by both Houses. 

J. H. BROWN, 
Chairman of Committees of the Legislative Assembly. 



2 	 Act No. 90, 1975. 

Totalizator (Amendment). 

BE it enacted by the Queen's Most Excellent Majesty, by 
and with the advice and consent of the Legislative 

Council and Legislative Assembly of New South Wales in 
Parliament assembled, and by the authority of the same, as 
follows:— 

Short 	1. This Act may be cited as the "Totalizator (Amend- 
title. 	ment) Act, 1975". 

Amend- 	2. The Totalizator Act, 1916, is amended in the manner 
ment of 	set forth in Schedule 1. Act No. 75, 
1916. 

SCHEDULE 1. 

AMENDMENTS TO THE TOTALIZATOR ACT, 1916. 

( 1 ) Section 12— 

Omit "twenty-one years", insert instead "18 years". 

(2) (a) Section 13— 

Omit "an infant" wherever occurring, insert 
instead "under the age of 18 years". 

(b) Section 13— 
Omit "such infant", insert instead "a person 

under the age of 18 years". 

Keeping 
of 
records. 

 Sections 18A, 18B, 18c— 
After section 18, insert :- 

18A. A racing club and any person having the 
control or possession of any record relating to the 
use by a racing club of a totalizator under this Act 

SCHEDULE 



Act No. 90, 1975. 	 3 

Totalizator (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE 1—continued. 

AMENDMENTS TO THE TOTALIZATOR ACT, 1916—continued. 

shall keep, or arrange for the keeping of, that 
record in the manner and for the time prescribed 
in relation to that record or, where not so pre-
scribed, in such a manner that it can be examined 
and audited by an inspector. 

18B. Without limiting the generality of section Produc- 
18, any person who has the custody of any record rt lecro 
relating to the use of a totalizator under this Act 
shall, at all reasonable times (whether or not during 
a race-meeting), on demand being made by an 
inspector, produce that record to that inspector for 
examination or audit. 

18c. A reference in section 18A or 18B to a Defining 
record relating to the use of a totalizator shall— reicords. 

not include a reference to a ticket issued 
as the result of an investment on a totaliza-
tor that is not a ticket in respect of which 
a dividend or refund has been paid or a 
cancelled ticket ; and 
be deemed to include a reference to any 
other document, matter or thing that is 
prescribed for the purposes of sections 18A 
and 18B as a record relating to the use of 
a totalizator. 

(4) Section 19— 

After "information", insert "or produce any record". 

In the name and on behalf of Her Majesty I assent to this 
Act. 

A. R. CUTLER, 
Governor. 

Government House, 
Sydney, 10th December, 1975. 





ANNO VICESIMO QUARTO 

ELIZABETHJE H REGINJE 
* * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * • * 

Act No. 90, 1975. 

An Act to amend the Totalizator Act, 1916, in relation to 
the age at which persons may wager on a racecourse 
totalizator and to the inspection of totalizator records. 
[Assented to, 10th December, 1975.1 

BE 

P 4150 	[Sc] 



2 Act No. 90, 1975. 

Totalizator (Amendment). 

DE it enacted by the Queen's Most Excellent Majesty, by 
and with the advice and consent of the Legislative 

Council and Legislative Assembly of New South Wales in 
Parliament assembled, and by the authority of the same, as 
follows t— 

Short 1. This Act may be cited as the "Totalizator (Amend- 
title. ment) Act, 1975". 

Amend- 2. The Totalizator Act, 1916, is amended in the manner 
ment of set forth in Schedule 1. Act No. 75, 
1916. 

SCHEDULE 1. 

AMENDMENTS TO THE TOTALIZATOR ACT, 1916. 

Section 12— 

Omit "twenty-one years", insert instead "18 years". 

(2) (a) Section 13— 

Omit "an infant" wherever occurring, insert 
instead "under the age of 18 years". 

(b) Section 13— 
Omit "such infant", insert instead "a person 

under the age of 18 years". 

Keeping 
of 
records. 

Sections 18A, 18B, 18c— 

After section 18, insert :- 
18A. A racing club and any person having the 

control or possession of any record relating to the 
use by a racing club of a totalizator under this Act 

SCHEDULE 



Act No. 90, 1975. 	 3 

Totalizator (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE 1—continued. 
AMENDMENTS TO THE TOTALIZATOR ACT, 1916—continued. 

shall keep, or arrange for the keeping of, that 
record in the manner and for the time prescribed 
in relation to that record or, where not so pre-
scribed, in such a manner that it can be examined 
and audited by an inspector. 

18B. Without limiting the generality of section Produc- 
18, any person who has the custody of any record rtwni.1 
relating to the use of a totalizator under this Act 
shall, at all reasonable times (whether or not during 
a race-meeting), on demand being made by an 
inspector, produce that record to that inspector for 
examination or audit. 

18c. A reference in section 18A or 18B to a Defining 
record relating to the use of a totalizator shall— reef  ords. 

not include a reference to a ticket issued 
as the result of an investment on a totaliza-
tor that is not a ticket in respect of which 
a dividend or refund has been paid or a 
cancelled ticket ; and 
be deemed to include a reference to any 
other document, matter or thing that is 
prescribed for the purposes of sections 18A 
and 18B as a record relating to the use of 
a totalizator. 

(4) Section 19— 

After "information", insert "or produce any record". 

BY AUTHORITY 
D. WEST, GOVERNMENT PRINTER, NEW SOUTH WALES-1975 





I certify that this PUBLIC BILL, which originated in the LEGISLA-
TIVE ASSEMBLY, has finally passed the LEGISLATIVE COUNCIL and the 
LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY Of NEW SOUTH WALES. 

R. E. WARD, 
Clerk of the Legislative Assembly. 

Legislative Assembly Chamber, 
Sydney, 26 November, 1975. 

pebi iftoutb ZEILIatet 

ANNO VICESIMO QUARTO 

ELIZABETILE II REGINJE 
* * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * 

Act No. 90, 1975. 

An Act to amend the Totalizator Act, 1916, in relation to 
the age at which persons may wager on a racecourse 
totalizator and to the inspection of totalizator records. 
[Assented to, 10th December, 1975.1 

BE 

1 have examined this Bill, and find it to correspond in all respects 
with the Bill as finally passed by both Houses. 

J. H. BROWN, 
Chairman of Committees of the Legislative Assembly. 



2 	 Act No. 90, 1975. 

Totalizator (Amendment). 

BE it enacted by the Queen's Most Excellent Majesty, by 
and with the advice and consent of the Legislative 

Council and Legislative Assembly of New South Wales in 
Parliament assembled, and by the authority of the same, as 
follows:— 

Short 	1. This Act may be cited as the "Totalizator (Amend- 
title. 	ment) Act, 1975". 

Amend- 	2. The Totalizator Act, 1916, is amended in the manner 
ment of 	set forth in Schedule 1. Act No. 75, 
1916. 

SCHEDULE 1. 

AMENDMENTS TO THE TOTALIZATOR ACT, 1916. 

( 1 ) Section 12— 

Omit "twenty-one years", insert instead "18 years". 

(2) (a) Section 13— 

Omit "an infant" wherever occurring, insert 
instead "under the age of 18 years". 

(b) Section 13— 
Omit "such infant", insert instead "a person 

under the age of 18 years". 

Keeping 
of 
records. 

 Sections 18A, 18B, 18c— 
After section 18, insert :- 

18A. A racing club and any person having the 
control or possession of any record relating to the 
use by a racing club of a totalizator under this Act 

SCHEDULE 



Act No. 90, 1975. 	 3 

Totalizator (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE 1—continued. 

AMENDMENTS TO THE TOTALIZATOR ACT, 1916—continued. 

shall keep, or arrange for the keeping of, that 
record in the manner and for the time prescribed 
in relation to that record or, where not so pre-
scribed, in such a manner that it can be examined 
and audited by an inspector. 

18B. Without limiting the generality of section Produc- 
18, any person who has the custody of any record rt lecro 
relating to the use of a totalizator under this Act 
shall, at all reasonable times (whether or not during 
a race-meeting), on demand being made by an 
inspector, produce that record to that inspector for 
examination or audit. 

18c. A reference in section 18A or 18B to a Defining 
record relating to the use of a totalizator shall— reicords. 

not include a reference to a ticket issued 
as the result of an investment on a totaliza-
tor that is not a ticket in respect of which 
a dividend or refund has been paid or a 
cancelled ticket ; and 
be deemed to include a reference to any 
other document, matter or thing that is 
prescribed for the purposes of sections 18A 
and 18B as a record relating to the use of 
a totalizator. 

(4) Section 19— 

After "information", insert "or produce any record". 

In the name and on behalf of Her Majesty I assent to this 
Act. 

A. R. CUTLER, 
Governor. 

Government House, 
Sydney, 10th December, 1975. 




