This PuBLIC BILL originated in the LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY, and,
having this day passed, is now ready for presentation to the LEGISLATIVE
CoOuUNCIL for its concurrence.

R. E. WARD,
Clerk of the Legislative Assembly.

Legislative Assembly Chamber,
Sydney, 19 November, 1975.

Hew South THales

ANNO VICESIMO QUARTO

ELIZABETHZ I1 REGINZAE

%k 3k %k sk ok ok sk ook ok sk ok ok sk %k ok %k sk %k sk ok ok sk ook ok %k %k %k ok %k %k ok ok

Act No. , 1975.

An Act to amend the Totalizator Act, 1916, in relation to
the age at which persons may wager on a racecourse
totalizator and to the inspection of totalizator records.

BE

2320 523—




Act No. , 1975.

Totalizator (Amendment).

E it enacted by the Queen’s Most Excellent Majesty, by
and with the advice and consent of the Legislative
Council and Legislative Assembly of New South Wales in
Parliament assembled, and by the authority of the same, as

5  follows:—

1. This Act may be cited as the “Totalizator (Amend- Short
ment) Act, 1975”. title.

2. The Totalizator Act, 1916, is amended in the manner Amend-

set forth in Schedule 1. Rgl ;Iocf. 75,
1916.
10 SCHEDULE 1.

AMENDMENTS TO THE TOTALIZATOR AcT, 1916.

(1) Section 12—

Omit “twenty-one years”, insert instead “18 years”.

(2) (a) Section 13—

15 Omit “an infant” wherever occurring, insert
instead “under the age of 18 years”.
(b) Section 13—

Omit “such infant”, insert instead “a person
under the age of 18 years”.

20 (3) Sections 18a, 188, 18c—
After section 18, insert :—

18A. A racing club and any person having the Keeping
control or possession of any record relating to the ;’gcor e
use by a racing club of a totalizator under this Act '

SCHEDULE




10

15

20

25

Act No. , 1975.

Totalizator (Amendment).

SCHEDULE 1—continued.

AMENDMENTS TO THE TOTALIZATOR AcCT, 1916—continued.

shall keep, or arrange for the keeping of, that
record in the manner and for the time prescribed
in relation to that record or, where not so pre-
scribed, in such a manner that it can be examined
and audited by an inspector.

188. Without limiting the generality of section Produc-

18, any person who has the custody of any record tion of

2 5 . records.
relating to the use of a totalizator under this Act
shall, at all reasonable times (whether or not during
a race-meeting), on demand being made by an
inspector, produce that record to that inspector for

examination or audit.

18c. A reference in section 18A or 18B tO a Defining

record relating to the use of a totalizator shall— of
records.

(a) not include a reference to a ticket issued
as the result of an investment on a totaliza-
tor that is not a ticket in respect of which
a dividend or refund has been paid or a
cancelled ticket; and

(b) be deemed to include a reference to any
other document, matter or thing that is
prescribed for the purposes of sections 18A
and 188 as a record relating to the use of
a totalizator.

(4) Section 19—

After “information”, insert “or produce any record”.

BY AUTHORITY
D. WEST, GOVERNMENT PRINTER, NEW SOUTH WALES—1975

[8¢]







No. , 1975.

A BILL

To amend the Totalizator Act, 1916, in relation to
the age at which persons may wager on a racecourse
totalizator and to the inspection of totalizator records.

[MrR CoLEMAN—I18 November, 1975.]

BE

2320 523—



Act No. , 1975.

Totalizator (Amendment).

E it enacted by the Queen’s Most Excellent Majesty, by
and with the advice and consent of the Legislative
Council and Legislative Assembly of New South Wales in
Parliament assembled, and by the authority of the same, as

5 follows:—

1. This Act may be cited as the “Totalizator (Amend- Short
ment) Act, 1975”. title.

2. The Totalizator Act, 1916, is amended in the manner Amend-

. ment of
set forth in Schedule 1. 'ﬁgclt 5N°' 75,

10 SCHEDULE 1.

AMENDMENTS TO THE TOTALIZATOR AcT, 1916.

(1) Section 12—

Omit “twenty-one years”, insert instead “18 years”.

(2) (a) Section 13—

15 Omit “an infant” wherever occurring, insert
instead “under the age of 18 years”.
(b) Section 13—

Omit “such infant”, insert instead “a person
under the age of 18 years”.

20 (3) Sections 18A, 188, 18c—
After section 18, insert :—
18A. A racing club and any person having the Keeping

control or possession of any record relating to the of
records.

use by a racing club of a totalizator under this Act

SCHEDULE



10

15

20

25

Act No. , 1975.

Totalizator (Amendment).

SCHEDULE 1—continued.

AMENDMENTS TO THE TOTALIZATOR ACT, 1916—continued.

shall keep, or arrange for the keeping of, that
record in the manner and for the time prescribed
in relation to that record or, where not so pre-
scribed, in such a manner that it can be examined
and audited by an inspector.

18B. Without limiting the generality of section Produc-

18, any person who has the custody of any record tion of

" 4 " records.
relating to the use of a totalizator under this Act
shall, at all reasonable times (whether or not during
a race-meeting), on demand being made by an
inspector, produce that record to that inspector for

examination or audit.

18c. A reference in section 18A or 18B t0 a Defining

record relating to the use of a totalizator shall— of
records.

(a) not include a reference to a ticket issued
as the result of an investment on a totaliza-
tor that is not a ticket in respect of which
a dividend or refund has been paid or a
cancelled ticket; and

(b) be deemed to include a reference to any
other document, matter or thing that is
prescribed for the purposes of sections 18A
and 18B as a record relating to the use of
a totalizator.

(4) Section 19—

After “information”, insert “or produce any record”.

BY AUTHORITY
D. WEST, GOVERNMENT PRINTER, NEW SOUTH WALES—1975

[8c¢]







PROOF

TOTALIZATOR (AMENDMENT) BILL, 1975

EXPLANATORY NOTE

THE objects of this Bill are—

(a) to reduce the age at which persons may wager on a racecourse totaliza-
tor from 21 years to 18 years; and

(b) to extend the provisions relating to the examination or audit of
totalizator records.

2320 523—






No. , 1975.

A BILL

To amend the Totalizator Act, 1916, in relation to
the age at which persons may wager on a racecourse
totalizator and to the inspection of totalizator records.

[Mr CoLEMAN—I18 November, 1975.]

BE

2320 523—

PROOF




Act No. s 1975,

Totalizator (Amendment).

BE it enacted by the Queen’s Most Excellent Majesty, by
and with the advice and consent of the Legislative
Council and Legislative Assembly of New South Wales in
Parliament assembled, and by the authority of the same, as
5 follows:—

1. This Act may be cited as the “Totalizator (Amend- Short
ment) Act, 1975”. title.

2. The Totalizator Act, 1916, is amended in the manner Amend-

set forth in Schedule 1. Xcetn }q%f, 75,
1916.
10 SCHEDULE 1.

AMENDMENTS TO THE TOTALIZATOR AcT, 1916.

(1) Section 12—

Omit “twenty-one years”, insert instead “18 years”.

(2) (a) Section 13—

15 Omit “an infant” wherever occurring, insert
instead “under the age of 18 years”.

(b) Section 13—

Omit “such infant”, insert instead “a person
under the age of 18 years”.

20 (3) Sections 18a, 18B, 18c—
After section 18, insert :(—

18A. A racing club and any person having the Keeping
control or possession of any record relating to the of
. ’ : records.

use by a racing club of a totalizator under this Act

SCHEDULE



Act No. , 1975.

Totalizator (Amendment).

SCHEDULE 1—continued.
AMENDMENTS TO THE TOTALIZATOR AcT, 1916—continued.

shall keep, or arrange for the keeping of, that
record in the manner and for the time prescribed

5 in relation to that record or, where not so pre-
scribed, in such a manner that it can be examined
and audited by an inspector.

188. Without limiting the generality of section Produc-
18, any person who has the custody of any record tion of
g . i records.
10 relating to the use of a totalizator under this Act
shall, at all reasonable times (whether or not during
a race-meeting), on demand being made by an
inspector, produce that record to that inspector for

examination or audit.

15 18c. A reference in section 18A or 18B to a Defining
record relating to the use of a totalizator shall— ?gcor o

(a) not include a reference to a ticket issued
as the result of an investment on a totaliza-
tor that is not a ticket in respect of which

20 a dividend or refund has been paid or a
cancelled ticket; and

(b) be deemed to include a reference to any
other document, matter or thing that is
prescribed for the purposes of sections 18A

25 and 18B as a record relating to the use of
a totalizator.

(4) Section 19—

After “information”, insert “or produce any record”.

BY AUTHORITY
D. WEST, GOVERNMENT PRINTER, NEW SOUTH WALES—1975







 Porie At (\§
O3 X
NP,
S0ET 30N 5>

ANNO VICESIMO QUARTO

ELIZABETHZA 11 REGINZE

AR R R R R R R R R R R E E E RN Y

Act No. 90, 1975.

An Act to amend the Totalizator Act, 1916, in relation to
the age at which persons may wager on a racecourse
totalizator and to the inspection of totalizator records.
[Assented to, 10th December, 1975.]

BE

P4150  [8q)



Short
title.

Amend-
ment of
Act No. 75,
1916.

Act No. 90, 1975.

Totalizator (Amendment).

BE it enacted by the Queen’s Most Excellent Majesty, by
and with ‘the advice and consent of the Legislative
Council and Legislative Assembly of New South Wales in
Parliament assembled, and by the authority of the same, as
follows i—

1. This Act may be cited as the “Totalizator (Amend-
ment) Act, 1975”.

2. The Totalizator Act, 1916, is amended in the manner
set forth in Schedule 1.

SCHEDULE 1.

AMENDMENTS TO THE TOTALIZATOR AcT, 1916.

(1) Section 12—

Omit “twenty-one years”, insert instead “18 years”.

(2) (a) Section 13—

Omit “an infant” wherever occurring, insert
instead “under the age of 18 years”.

(b) Section 13—

Omit “such infant”, insert instead “a person
under the age of 18 years”.

(3) Sections 18a, 188, 18c—
After section 18, insert :—

18A. A racing club and any person having the
control or possession of any record relating to the
use by a racing club of a totalizator under this Act

SCHEDULE



Act No. 90, 1975.

Totalizator (Amendment).

SCHEDULE 1—continued.
AMENDMENTS TO THE TOTALIZATOR AcCT, 1916—continued.

shall keep, or arrange for the keeping of, that
record in the manner and for the time prescribed
in relation to that record or, where not so pre-
scribed, in such a manner that it can be examined
and audited by an inspector.

188. Without limiting the generality of section Produc-
18, any person who has the custody of any record 8 of
relating to the use of a totalizator under this Act
shall, at all reasonable times (whether or not during
a race-meeting), on demand being made by an
inspector, produce that record to that inspector for

examination or audit.

18c. A reference in section 18A or 18B to a Defining
record relating to the use of a totalizator shall— Secords.

(a) not include a reference to a ticket issued
as the result of an investment on a totaliza-
tor that is not a ticket in respect of which
a dividend or refund has been paid or a
cancelled ticket; and

(b) be deemed to include a reference to any
other document, matter or thing that is
prescribed for the purposes of sections 18A
and 18B as a record relating to the use of
a totalizator.

(4) Section 19—

After “information”, insert “or produce any record”.

BY AUTHORITY
D. WEST, GOVERNMENT PRINTER, NEW SOUTH WALES—1975






I certify that this PuBLIiC BILL, which originated in the LEGISLA-
TIVE ASSEMBLY, has finally passed the LEGISLATIVE COUNCIL and the
LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY of NEW SOUTH WALES.

R. E. WARD,

Clerk of the Legislative Assembly.

Legislative Assembly Chamber,
Sydney, 26 November, 1975.

Pew South TWHales

ANNO VICESIMO QUARTO

ELIZABETHZA 11 REGINZE

%ok ok Kk ok kok ok ok ok ko kok ok ok ok kokkk ok ok okokokk ok ok ok kK

Act No. 90, 1975.

An Act to amend the Totalizator Act, 1916, in relation to
the age at which persons may wager on a racecourse
totalizator and to the inspection of totalizator records.
[Assented to, 10th December, 1975.1

BE

I have examined this Bill, and find it to correspond in all respects
with the Bill as finally passed by both Houses.

J. H. BROWN,
Chairman of Committees of the Legislative Assembly.



Short
title.

Amend-
ment of
Act No. 75,
1916.

Keeping
of

records.

Act No. 90, 1975.

Totalizator (Amendment).

BE it enacted by the Queen’s Most Excellent Majesty, by
and with the advice and consent of the Legislative
Council and Legislative Assembly of New South Wales in
Parliament assembled, and by the authority of the same, as
follows:—

1. This Act may be cited as the ‘“Totalizator (Amend-
ment) Act, 1975”.

2. The Totalizator Act, 1916, is amended in the manner
set forth in Schedule 1.

SCHEDULE 1.

AMENDMENTS TO THE TOTALIZATOR AcT, 1916.

(1) Section 12—

Omit “twenty-one years”, insert instead “18 years”.

(2) (a) Section 13—

Omit “an infant” wherever occurring, insert
instead “under the age of 18 years”.
(b) Section 13—

Omit “such infant”, insert instead “a person
under the age of 18 years”.

(3) Sections 184, 188, 18c—
After section 18, insert :—

18A. A racing club and any person having the
control or possession of any record relating to the
use by a racing club of a totalizator under this Act

SCHEDULE



Act No. 90, 1975. 3

Totalizator (Amendment).

SCHEDULE 1—continued.
AMENDMENTS TO THE TOTALIZATOR AcCT, 1916—continued.

shall keep, or arrange for the keeping of, that
record in the manner and for the time prescribed
in relation to that record or, where not so pre-
scribed, in such a manner that it can be examined
and audited by an inspector.

18B. Without limiting the generality of section Produc-
18, any person who has the custody of any record Hon of
relating to the use of a totalizator under this Act
shall, at all reasonable times (whether or not during
a race-meeting), on demand being made by an
inspector, produce that record to that inspector for

examination or audit.

18c. A reference in section 18A or 18B to a Defining
record relating to the use of a totalizator shall— pecords.

(a) not include a reference to a ticket issued
as the result of an investment on a totaliza-
tor that is not a ticket in respect of which
a dividend or refund has been paid or a
cancelled ticket; and

(b) be deemed to include a reference to any
other document, matter or thing that is
prescribed for the purposes of sections 18a
and 188 as a record relating to the use of
a totalizator.

(4) Section 19—

After “information”, insert “or produce any record”.

In the name and on behalf of Her Majesty I assent to this
Act.

A. R. CUTLER,
Governor.

Government House,
Sydney, 10th December, 1975.







 Porie At (\§
O3 X
NP,
S0ET 30N 5>

ANNO VICESIMO QUARTO

ELIZABETHZA 11 REGINZE

AR R R R R R R R R R R E E E RN Y

Act No. 90, 1975.

An Act to amend the Totalizator Act, 1916, in relation to
the age at which persons may wager on a racecourse
totalizator and to the inspection of totalizator records.
[Assented to, 10th December, 1975.]

BE

P4150  [8q)



Short
title.

Amend-
ment of
Act No. 75,
1916.

Act No. 90, 1975.

Totalizator (Amendment).

BE it enacted by the Queen’s Most Excellent Majesty, by
and with ‘the advice and consent of the Legislative
Council and Legislative Assembly of New South Wales in
Parliament assembled, and by the authority of the same, as
follows i—

1. This Act may be cited as the “Totalizator (Amend-
ment) Act, 1975”.

2. The Totalizator Act, 1916, is amended in the manner
set forth in Schedule 1.

SCHEDULE 1.

AMENDMENTS TO THE TOTALIZATOR AcT, 1916.

(1) Section 12—

Omit “twenty-one years”, insert instead “18 years”.

(2) (a) Section 13—

Omit “an infant” wherever occurring, insert
instead “under the age of 18 years”.

(b) Section 13—

Omit “such infant”, insert instead “a person
under the age of 18 years”.

(3) Sections 18a, 188, 18c—
After section 18, insert :—

18A. A racing club and any person having the
control or possession of any record relating to the
use by a racing club of a totalizator under this Act

SCHEDULE



Act No. 90, 1975.

Totalizator (Amendment).

SCHEDULE 1—continued.
AMENDMENTS TO THE TOTALIZATOR AcCT, 1916—continued.

shall keep, or arrange for the keeping of, that
record in the manner and for the time prescribed
in relation to that record or, where not so pre-
scribed, in such a manner that it can be examined
and audited by an inspector.

188. Without limiting the generality of section Produc-
18, any person who has the custody of any record 8 of
relating to the use of a totalizator under this Act
shall, at all reasonable times (whether or not during
a race-meeting), on demand being made by an
inspector, produce that record to that inspector for

examination or audit.

18c. A reference in section 18A or 18B to a Defining
record relating to the use of a totalizator shall— Secords.

(a) not include a reference to a ticket issued
as the result of an investment on a totaliza-
tor that is not a ticket in respect of which
a dividend or refund has been paid or a
cancelled ticket; and

(b) be deemed to include a reference to any
other document, matter or thing that is
prescribed for the purposes of sections 18A
and 18B as a record relating to the use of
a totalizator.

(4) Section 19—

After “information”, insert “or produce any record”.

BY AUTHORITY
D. WEST, GOVERNMENT PRINTER, NEW SOUTH WALES—1975






I certify that this PuBLIiC BILL, which originated in the LEGISLA-
TIVE ASSEMBLY, has finally passed the LEGISLATIVE COUNCIL and the
LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY of NEW SOUTH WALES.

R. E. WARD,

Clerk of the Legislative Assembly.

Legislative Assembly Chamber,
Sydney, 26 November, 1975.

Pew South TWHales

ANNO VICESIMO QUARTO

ELIZABETHZA 11 REGINZE

%ok ok Kk ok kok ok ok ok ko kok ok ok ok kokkk ok ok okokokk ok ok ok kK

Act No. 90, 1975.

An Act to amend the Totalizator Act, 1916, in relation to
the age at which persons may wager on a racecourse
totalizator and to the inspection of totalizator records.
[Assented to, 10th December, 1975.1

BE

I have examined this Bill, and find it to correspond in all respects
with the Bill as finally passed by both Houses.

J. H. BROWN,
Chairman of Committees of the Legislative Assembly.



Short
title.

Amend-
ment of
Act No. 75,
1916.

Keeping
of

records.

Act No. 90, 1975.

Totalizator (Amendment).

BE it enacted by the Queen’s Most Excellent Majesty, by
and with the advice and consent of the Legislative
Council and Legislative Assembly of New South Wales in
Parliament assembled, and by the authority of the same, as
follows:—

1. This Act may be cited as the ‘“Totalizator (Amend-
ment) Act, 1975”.

2. The Totalizator Act, 1916, is amended in the manner
set forth in Schedule 1.

SCHEDULE 1.

AMENDMENTS TO THE TOTALIZATOR AcT, 1916.

(1) Section 12—

Omit “twenty-one years”, insert instead “18 years”.

(2) (a) Section 13—

Omit “an infant” wherever occurring, insert
instead “under the age of 18 years”.
(b) Section 13—

Omit “such infant”, insert instead “a person
under the age of 18 years”.

(3) Sections 184, 188, 18c—
After section 18, insert :—

18A. A racing club and any person having the
control or possession of any record relating to the
use by a racing club of a totalizator under this Act

SCHEDULE



Act No. 90, 1975. 3

Totalizator (Amendment).

SCHEDULE 1—continued.
AMENDMENTS TO THE TOTALIZATOR AcCT, 1916—continued.

shall keep, or arrange for the keeping of, that
record in the manner and for the time prescribed
in relation to that record or, where not so pre-
scribed, in such a manner that it can be examined
and audited by an inspector.

18B. Without limiting the generality of section Produc-
18, any person who has the custody of any record Hon of
relating to the use of a totalizator under this Act
shall, at all reasonable times (whether or not during
a race-meeting), on demand being made by an
inspector, produce that record to that inspector for

examination or audit.

18c. A reference in section 18A or 18B to a Defining
record relating to the use of a totalizator shall— pecords.

(a) not include a reference to a ticket issued
as the result of an investment on a totaliza-
tor that is not a ticket in respect of which
a dividend or refund has been paid or a
cancelled ticket; and

(b) be deemed to include a reference to any
other document, matter or thing that is
prescribed for the purposes of sections 18a
and 188 as a record relating to the use of
a totalizator.

(4) Section 19—

After “information”, insert “or produce any record”.

In the name and on behalf of Her Majesty I assent to this
Act.

A. R. CUTLER,
Governor.

Government House,
Sydney, 10th December, 1975.







