
This PUBLIC BILL originated in the LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY, and, 
having this day passed, is now ready for presentation to the LEGISLATIVE 
COUNCIL for its concurrence. 

R. E. WARD, 
Clerk of the Legislative Assembly. 

Legislative Assembly Chamber, 
Sydney, 20 November, 1975. 

Petv ipoutb Ulate5 

ANNO VICESIMO QUARTO 

ELIZABETWE II REGIME 
* * * * * * 	* 	* * * * * 	 * 	* * * * * * * 

Act No. 	, 1975. 

An Act to alter the incidence of land tax in certain 
respects and to revise the level at which the general 
exemption from land tax applies; for these and other 
purposes to amend the Land Tax Management Act, 
1956. 

4 	 BE 

2277 	5 2 1—A 



Act No. 	, 1975. 	 2 

Land Tax Management (Amendment). 

BE it enacted by the Queen's Most Excellent Majesty, by 
and with the advice and consent of the Legislative 

Council and Legislative Assembly of New South Wales in 
Parliament assembled, and by the authority of the same, as 

5 follows:- 

This Act may be cited as the "Land Tax Management Short 
(Amendment) Act, 1975". 	 title.  

(1) Section 1 and this section commence on the date Commence- 
of assent to this Act. 	 ment.  

10 	(2) Section 3 shall be deemed to have commenced on 
31st December, 1974. 

(3) Section 4 commences on 31st December, 1975. 

The Land Tax Management Act, 1956, is amended Amend-ment of in the manner specified in Schedule 1. 	 Act No. 26, 
1956. 

amend- amended 
15 4. The Land Tax Management Act, 1956, is further Fur 

in the manner specified in Schedules 2-6, both ment of 
inclusive. 	 Act No. 26, 

1956. 

SCHEDULE 1. 	 Sec. 3. 

AMENDMENT OF LAND TAX MANAGEMENT ACT, 1956. 

20 (1) Section 10 (1) (s)— 
Omit "declared.", insert instead :— 

declared; 
(t) with respect to taxation leviable or payable in 

respect of the year commencing on 1st January, 
25 	 1975, cr any succeeding year, land owned by a 

rural society registered under the Co-operation 
SCHEDULE 



Act No. 	, 1975. 	 3 

Land Tax Management (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE 1—continued. 

AMENDMENT OF LAND TAX MANAGEMENT ACT, 
1956—continued. 

Act, 1923, other than land in respect of which 
5 
	 the society is jointly assessable with a public 

company that is not a company to which a 
declaration under paragraph (s) relates; 

Section 10 (1B)— 

After "1961", insert ", or is a recognised company 
10 	within the meaning of that Act". 

Section 10 (1c)— 

Omit "paragraphs (q) and (s) of subsection (1)", 
insert instead "subsection (1) (q), (s) and (t)". 

SCHEDULE 2. 	 Sec. 4. 

15 AMENDMENTS TO PART I OF THE LAND TAX MANAGEMENT 
ACT, 1956. 

(1) Section 3 (1), definition of "Flat"— 

After "dwelling", insert "whether the room or suite 
is a detached building or forms part of a building". 

20 (2) Section 3 (1), definition of "Land used for primary 
production"— 

Omit "or" where fourthly occurring. 

SCHEDULE 



Act No. 	, 1975. 	 4 

Land Tax Management (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE 2—continued. 

AMENDMENTS TO PART I OF THE LAND TAX MANAGEMENT 
ACT, 1956—continued. 

(3) Section 3 (1), definition of "Land used for primary 
5 	production"— 

Omit "honey,", insert instead :— 
honey; 
a nursery within the meaning of the Horticultural 
Stock and Nurseries Act, 1969, being a nursery 10 

	

	 in respect of which a person is registered under 
that Act as a nurseryman ; or 
the propagation for sale of mushrooms, orchids 
or flowers, 

(4) Section 3 (1), definition of "Residential unit"- 

15 	Omit "for residential purposes", insert instead "as his 
principal place of residence". 

(5) Section 3 (2)— 

Omit "for residential purposes" where firstly and 
secondly occurring, insert instead "as his principal place 

20 	of residence". 

(6) Section 3 (3)— 

After section 3 (2), insert :— 
(3) For the purposes of this Act, in respect of 

any year in respect of which taxation is leviable or 
25 

	

	payable, land is not used or occupied as the 
principal place of residence of a person unless— 

(a) that land and no other land has, since before 
the first day of July that last preceded the 

SCHEDULE 



Act No. 	, 1975. 	 5 

Land Tax Management (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE 2—continued. 

AMENDMENTS TO PART I OF THE LAND TAX MANAGEMENT 
ACT, 1956—continued. 

commencement of that year, been con- 
5 	 tinuously used and occupied by that person 

for residential purposes and for no other 
purpose; or 

(b) in any other case, the Commissioner is 
satisfied that the land is used and occupied 

10 	 by that person as his principal place of 
residence. 

SCHEDULE 3. 	 Sec. 4. 

AMENDMENTS TO PART III OF THE LAND TAX MANAGEMENT 
ACT, 1956. 

15 (1) (a) Section 9 (3) (b)— 
Omit "twenty-one thousand dollars" wherever 

occurring, insert instead "thirty thousand dollars". 

Section 9 (3) (b)— 
Omit "twenty-eight thousand dollars", insert in- 

20 	stead "sixty thousand dollars". 

Section 9 (3) (b)— 
Omit "three dollars", insert instead "one dollar". 

(d) Section 9 (3) (c)— 
Omit "twenty-one thousand dollars" wherever 

25 	occurring, insert instead "thirty thousand dollars". 

SCHEDULE 



Act No. 	, 1975. 	 6 

Land Tax Management (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE 3—continued. 

AMENDMENTS TO PART III OF THE LAND TAX MANAGEMENT 
ACT, 1956—continued. 

(2) (a) Section 10 (1)- 

5 	 Omit "shall be exempt", insert instead "shall, 
subject to sections 10B, 10c, 10D and 10E, be 
exempt". 

Section 10 (1) (b)— 

Omit "as amended by subsequent Acts", insert 
10 

	

	instead "or a pastures protection board constituted 
under the Pastures Protection Act, 1934". 

Section 10 (1) (c)— 

Omit ", or any private hospital or rest home 
licensed under the Private Hospitals Act, 1908, as 

15 	amended by subsequent Acts". 

Section 10 (1) (f)— 

After "land" wherever occurring, insert :— 
(not being land used to make a pecuniary 
profit). 

20 	(e) Section 10 (1) (g)— 

After section 10 (1) (g) (vii), insert :— 
(viii) a private hospital or nursing home within 

the meaning of the Private Hospitals Act, 
1908, not carried on for pecuniary profit; 

25 	(ix) an authorised hospital within the meaning 
of the Mental Health Act, 1958, not carried 
on for pecuniary profit; 

SCHEDULE 



Act No. , 1975. 7 

Land Tax Management (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE 3—continued. 

AMENDMENTS TO PART III OF THE LAND TAX MANAGEMENT 
ACT, 1956—continued. 

Section 10 (1) (r)- 

5 Omit "1974", insert instead "1976". 

(g) Section 10 (1) (r)— 

Omit "for residential purposes" wherever occur-
ring, insert instead "as his principal place of 
residence". 

10 (h) Section 10 (1) (r)— 

Omit "for those purposes" wherever occurring, 
insert instead "as his principal place of residence". 

(i) Section 10 (1)— 

After section 10 (1) (t), insert :- 

15 (u) with respect to taxation leviable or payable 
in respect of the year commencing on 1st 
January, 1976, or any succeeding year—a 
parcel of land exceeding 2,100 square 
metres in area, but not exceeding 2 hectares 

20 in area, where— 
paragraph (r) (ii) would apply to 
the land if it did not exceed 2,100 
square metres in area ; and 

subdivision of the land is, imme- 
25 diately before the commencement 

of that year, prevented by a planning 
scheme authorised by or under an 
Act. 

(j) Section 10 (1D) (b) (i)- 

30 Omit "strata lots", insert instead "lots under the 
Strata Titles Act, 1973,". 

SCHEDULE 



8 Act No. , 1975. 

Land Tax Management (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE 3—continued. 

AMENDMENTS TO PART III OF THE LAND TAX MANAGEMENT 
ACT, 1956—continued. 

(k) Section 10 (1E), (1EA)- 

5 Omit section 10 (1E ), insert instead- 

(1E) In subsection (1) (r) "strata lot" 
means a lot under the Strata Titles Act, 1973, 
not being a lot that— 

(a) is owned by a company ; 

10 (b) is owned by or on behalf of a company 
and is land of which a mortgagee or 
person by way cf security for money is 
in possession ; 

is held by a trustee for or on behalf of 
15 a company ; or 

in respect of which a company is jointly 
assessed with any other person. 

(1EA ) In subsections (1D) and ( 1E) 
"company" does not include a trustee company 

20 acting in its representative capacity. 

(1) Section 10 (1F)— 

Omit "owner for residential purposes", insert 
instead "owner as his principal place of residence". 

(m) Section 10 (1F)- 

25 Omit "for those purposes", insert instead "as his 
principal place of residence". 

SCHEDULE 



9 Act No. 	, 1975. 

Land Tax Management (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE 3—continued. 

AMENDMENTS TO PART III OF THE LAND TAX MANAGEMENT 
ACT, 1956—continued. 

(n) Section 10 (2)- 

5 	 Omit section 10 (2), insert instead :—

(2) Where— 

a building is erected on land to which 
the provisions of subsection (1) (g) 
(iii) or of section 10B (2), 10c (a) or 

10 

	

	 10D (2) would apply if the building 
were solely occupied by the persons or 
bodies referred to in those provisions ; 
and 

the building is partly used or occupied, 
15 	 or is intended to be partly used or 

occupied, by persons other than those 
persons or bodies, 

the unimproved value of that land shall, for 
the purposes of the assessment of those persons 

20 

	

	 or bodies, be reduced to an amount which 
bears the same proportion to that unimproved 
value as the rental value of the part so used or 
occupied, or intended to be so used or 
occupied, by those other persons bears to the 

2 5 	 total rental value of the building. 

(o) Section 10 (5)— 

After section 10 (4), insert— 
(5) Where a parcel of land would, but for 

the fact that it exceeds 2 hectares in area, be 
3 0 	 exempted under subsection (1) (u), the unim- 

proved value of that parcel shall, for assess-
ment purposes, be reduced by an amount that 

SCHEDULE 



Act No. 	, 1975. 	 10 

Land Tax Management (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE 3—continued. 

AMENDMENTS TO PART III OF THE LAND TAX MANAGEMENT 
ACT, 1956—continued. 

bears to that unimproved value the same 
5 	 proportion as 2 hectares bears to the area of 

that parcel. 

(3) Sections 10A-10E— 

After section 10, insert- 

10A. (1) In this section— 	 Refund of 
stamp duty 

10 	 "convey" includes transfer ; 	 on certain 
con- 

"corporation" has the same meaning as it has veYances' 
in the Companies Act, 1961 ; 

"prescribed shareholder" in relation to a corpora-
tion means- 

15 	 (a) a shareholder (not being a corpora- 
tion) in the corporation who, dis-
regarding any proxies or other 
authorities to vote held by him, is 
entitled at general meetings of the 

20 

	

	 corporation to exercise voting 
rights that together amount to 
more than one-half of the total 
voting rights of all shareholders 
entitled to vote at general meetings 

25 	 of the corporation; 
(b) a shareholder (not being a corpora-

tion) in the corporation where, if 
no proxies or other authorities to 
vote are allowed, no shareholder in 

30 

	

	 the corporation is entitled at general 
meetings of the corporation to 
exercise more voting rights than 
any other shareholder in the 
corporation. 

SCHEDULE 



Act No. 	, 1975. 	 11 

Land Tax Management (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE 3—continued. 

AMENDMENTS TO PART III OF THE LAND TAX MANAGEMENT 
ACT, 1956—continued. 

(2) This section applies to a person in 
5 	respect of land where— 

(a) at the time the conveyance referred to in 
paragraph (b) took effect that person was 
a prescribed shareholder in the corporation 
so referred to; 

10 	 (b) the land was owned by a corporation on 
31st December, 1975, and was conveyed 
after that date by the corporation to that 
person as equitable owner, or to that 
person and any other prescribed shareholder 

15 

	

	 or shareholders in the corporation jointly 
as equitable owners, after that date; and 

the land was, at all times during the period 
that commenced on 31st December, 1975, 
and ended when the conveyance took effect, 

20 

	

	 used and occupied by that person as his 
principal place of residence and for no 
other purpose; and 

if the conveyance had taken effect on the 
thirty-first day of December that last pre- 

25 

	

	 ceded the date on which it actually took 
effect— 

the land conveyed would, by the 
operation of section 10 (1) (r) or 
(u) be exempt from land tax in 

30 
	 respect of the year in which the con- 

veyance actually took effect; or 
land tax that, but for section 10 
(4) or (5), would be leviable or 
payable in respect of the land for 

SCHEDULE 



Act No. 	, 1975. 	 12 

Land Tax Management (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE 3—continued. 

AMENDMENTS TO PART III OF THE LAND TAX MANAGEMENT 
ACT, 1956—continued. 

the year in which the conveyance 
5 	 actually took effect would be 

reduced by the operation of section 
10 (4) or (5). 

For the purpose of assessing land tax 
in respect of land referred to in subsection (2) that 

10 

	

	is conveyed on or before 31st December, 1976, the 
conveyance of that land so referred to shall be 
deemed to have taken effect on 31st December, 
1975. 

On application made by a person to 
15 

	

	whom this section applies, the Commissioner shall, 
out of money provided by Parliament, pay to that 
person an amount certified by the Commissioner of 
Stamp Duties to be the difference between— 

(a) the amount of duty under the Stamp Duties 
20 	 Act, 1920, paid and not refunded— 

on the agreement for the conveyance 
to that person of the land in respect 
of which this section applies ; or 

where there is no such agreement 
25 	 —on that conveyance; and 

('b) the amount of duty that would have been 
payable under that Act had that agreement 
or conveyance, as the case may be, been an 
agreement under seal referred to in para- 

30 

	

	 graph (2) of the matter relating to an 
Agreement or Memorandum of an Agree-
ment in the Second Schedule to the Stamp 
Duties Act, 1920. 

SCHEDULE 



Act No. 	, 1975. 	 13 

Land Tax Management (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE 3—continued. 

the State Superannuation Board; 
the Local Government Superannuation 
Board ; 
the Transport Retirement Board; 

10 	 (d) the New South Wales Retirement Board ; 
and 

(e) the Builders Licensing Board. 

(2) Nothing in this Act operates to 
exempt from taxation under this Act any land 

15 	owned by a prescribed authority that is not land 
solely occupied by the authority as offices from 
which to exercise and perform its powers, authori-
ties, duties and functions. 

10c. Nothing in this Act operates to exempt from Taxation 
20 	taxation under this Act any building site re- Vag 

developed in accordance with a scheme under Part by 
IV of the Sydney Cove Redevelopment Authority Sydney 
Act, 1968, that is not— 	 Redevelop- 

ment 
Authority, 

a building site solely occupied by the Sydney 
25 	 Cove Redevelopment Authority as offices 

from which to exercise and perform its 
powers, authorities, duties and functions ; or 

a building site that— 
(i) was so redeveloped by that Auth- 

30 	 ority ; or 
SCHEDULE 

AMENDMENTS TO PART III OF THE LAND TAX MANAGEMENT 
ACT, 1956—continued. 

10B. (1) In this section "prescribed authority" Taxation 
of land 5 	means— 	 owned by 
certain 
authorities. 



Act No. 	, 1975. 	 14 

Land Tax Management (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE 3—continued. 

AMENDMENTS TO PART III OF THE LAND TAX MANAGEMENT 
ACT, 1956—continued. 

(ii) was so redeveloped by a lessee from 
5 	 that Authority and would be exempt 

from taxation under this Act if it 
were owned by that lessee, 

and, as so redeveloped, is used solely for 
residential purposes. 

10 	 10D. (1) In this section "prescribed authority" Taxation 
means— 	 of land 

owned 
by 
certain the Albury—Wodonga (New South Wales) statutory Corporation; 	 corpora- 
tions. 

a corporation constituted under section 4 
15 	 of the Growth Centres (Development Cor-

porations) Act, 1974; or 

the New South Wales Planning and 
Environment Commission in respect of the 
development of the Sydney South West 
Sector. 

(2) Nothing in this Act operates to exempt 
from taxation under this Act any land owned by 
a prescribed authority that is— 

occupied by the authority as offices from 
25 	 which to exercise and perform its powers, 

authorities, duties and functions unless the 
land is solely so occupied ; or 

land leased by the authority for commercial 
or industrial purposes. 

SCHEDULE 

20 



Act No. 	, 1975. 	 15 

Land Tax Management (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE 3—continued. 
AMENDMENTS TO PART III OF THE LAND TAX MANAGEMENT 

ACT, 1956—continued. 
10E. Nothing in this Act operates to exempt Taxation 

5 	 from taxation under this Act any land owned by Liage('  
The Housing Commission of New South Wales or for 
the New South Wales Planning and Environment L1:,ncr 
Commission or any other corporation for the pur _ Council. 
poses of the Urban Land Council being land (other 

10 	than land held for open space purposes) held for 
development. 

SCHEDULE 4. 	 Sec. 4. 
AMENDMENTS OF PART IV OF THE LAND TAX MANAGEMENT 

ACT, 1956. 
15 (1) Section 27 (3A)— 

After "unit" where firstly occurring, insert ", or a 
flat that is not a residential unit,". 

(2) Section 27 (3A) (a)— 
After "1956", insert ", or in respect of that flat under 

20 	section 3c of that Act". 

SCHEDULE 5. 	 Sec. 4. 
AMENDMENTS OF PART VI OF THE LAND TAX MANAGEMENT 

ACT, 1956. 
Section 50 (1A)—(1D)- 

25 After section 50 (1), insert : — 
(1A) Where section 10 (1) (u) or 10 (5) ceases to 

apply to or in respect of land by reason only that section 
10 (1) (u) (ii) ceases to apply and the Board is satisfied 

SCHEDULE 



Act No. 	, 1975. 	 16 

Land Tax Management (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE 5—continued. 

AMENDMENTS OF PART VI OF THE LAND TAX MANAGEMENT 
ACT, 1956—continued. 

that the owner of the land is justified in not proceeding 
5 

	

	to subdivide the land, the Board may defer payment of 
the amount of any land tax leviable or payable in respect 
of that land in excess of the amount that would have been 
payable had section 10 (1) (u) (ii) not ceased to apply 
to and in respect of the land. 

10 	(1B) Subsection (1A) ceases to apply in respect of 
any land if— 

(a) the Board is satisfied that the owner of the land 
is no longer justified in not proceeding to sub-
divide the land; or 

15 	(b) any part of the land is sold or otherwise disposed 
of. 

(1c) Where, pursuant to subsection (1B) (b), an 
owner of land ceases to be entitled to a postponement 
of land tax he shall, within one month after ceasing to 

20 	be so entitled, notify the Commissioner accordingly. 

(1D) Where a parcel of land would, but for exceeding 
2,100 square metres in area, be exempted by the opera-
tion of section 10 (1) (r) from taxation under this Act, 
the Board may, if it is satisfied that the owner, while 

25 

	

	not prevented by a planning scheme authorised by or 
under an Act from subdividing the land, is prevented 
from doing so by other circumstances beyond his control 
that are of a permanent character, waive payment of 
the land tax wholly or in part. 

SCHEDULE 



Act No. 	, 1975. 	 17 

Land Tax Management (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE 6. 	 Sec. 4• 

AMENDMENTS TO PART VII OF THE LAND TAX MANAGE-
MENT ACT, 1956. 

Section 54 (1)- 

5 	Omit "For the purposes of this Act", insert instead 
"For the purposes of this Act, but subject to this sec-
tion,". 

Section 54 (1AA), (lAB)— 

After section 54 (1), insert :- 

10 	 (1AA) Notwithstanding subsection (1), but 
subject to subsection (1D), where— 

a supplementary valuation of land to which 
subsection (1) (d) applies has been made 
by the Valuer-General on or after the first 

15 

	

	 day of a year for which land tax is being 
levied; 

that valuation is included in a supplemen-
tary list which includes in relation to that 
land an amount referred to in section 61A 

20 

	

	 of the Valuation of Land Act, 1916, as a 
rating and taxing basis ; and 

the amount of that rating and taxing basis 
was determined as at the first day of the 
year in which the last general valuation was 

521—B 	 SCHEDULE 



 

Act No. 	, 1975. 	 18 

 
 

 
  

  
 

 
 

 
  

  
 

Land Tax Management (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE 6—continued. 

AMENDMENTS TO PART VII OF THE LAND TAX MANAGEMENT 
ACT, 1956—continued. 

furnished prior to the first day of a year 
5 	 for which land tax is being levied, 

the unimproved value of the land for the purposes 
of this Act is, in respect of the year referred to in 
paragraph (a), the amount of the rating and taxing 
basis referred to in paragraph (b). 

10 	 (1AB) Notwithstanding subsection (1), but sub-
ject to subsection (1D), where— 

a supplementary valuation of land to which 
subsection (1) (d) applies has been made 
by the Valuer-General on or after the first 

15 	 day of a year for which land tax is being 
levied; 

the unimproved value of the land included 
in that valuation was determined under 
section 14A of the Valuation of Land Act, 

20 	 1916; and 

that unimproved value was determined as 
at the first day of the year in which the 
last general valuation commenced before 
the first day of a year for which land tax 

25 	 is being levied, 

the unimproved value of the land for the purposes 
of this Act is, in respect of the year referred to in 
paragraph (a), the unimproved value referred to in 
paragraph (b). 

30 (3) Section 54 (1B) (b)— 

After "Valuer-General", insert "as at a date earlier 
than 1st January, 1973". 

SCHEDULE 



Act No. , 1975. 19 

Land Tax Management (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE 6—continued. 

AMENDMENTS TO PART VII OF THE LAND TAX MANAGEMENT 
ACT, 1956—continued. 

Section 54 (1B)- 

5 After section 54 (1B) (b), insert :— 

(ba) where the valuation is made by the Valuer-
General as at 1st January, 1973, or a later 
date— 

(i) an unimproved value determined pur- 
1 0 suant to section 14A (1) (b) (iv) of the 

Valuation of Land Act, 1916, as if the 
land valued had been sold, conveyed or 
resumed on the date as at which the 
valuation is made ; and 

15 (ii) any allowance referred to in paragraph 
(b) (ii) ; 

Section 54 (1c) (a)— 

Omit "or" where secondly occurring. 

Section 54 (1c) (b)- 
20 Omit "land.", insert instead :— 

land; or 

(c) an unimproved value has been furnished pursuant 
to subsection ( 1B) (ba) (i), that unimproved 
value shall, subject to subsection (1D), be 

25 deemed, for the purposes of this Act, to be the 
unimproved value of the land. 

Section 54 (1D)— 
After "(1)" where secondly and thirdly occurring, 

insert "(1AA), (1AB ),". 

SCHEDULE 



Act No. 	, 1975. 	 20 

Land Tax Management (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE 6—continued. 

AMENDMENTS TO PART VII OF THE LAND TAX MANAGEMENT 
ACT, 1956—continued. 

Section 54 (4A)- 
5 	After section 54 (4A) (b), insert :— 

(ba) of an unimproved value under subsection (1B) 
(ba) (i) shall be subject to objection in the same 
manner as if it had been determined in accord-
ance with section 14A (1) (b) (iv) of the 

10 	 Valuation of Land Act, 1916; 

Section 54 (4A) (c)— 
Omit "subparagraph (ii) of paragraph (b) of sub-

section (1B)", insert instead "subsection (1B) (b) (ii) 
or (1B) (ba) (ii)". 

BY AUTHORITY 
D. WEST, GOVERNMENT PRINTER, NEW SOUTH WALES-1975 

[24c] 



No. , 1975. 

A BILL 
To alter the incidence of land tax in certain 

respects and to revise the level at which the general 
exemption from land tax applies ; for these and other 
purposes to amend the Land Tax Management Act, 
1956. 

[MR COLEMAN-18 November, 1975.] 

BE 

2277 521—A 



Act No. 	, 1975. 	 2 

Land Tax Management (Amendment). 

BE it enacted by the Queen's Most Excellent Majesty, by 
and with the advice and consent of the Legislative 

Council and Legislative Assembly of New South Wales in 
Parliament assembled, and by the authority of the same, as 

5 follows:- 

This Act may be cited as the "Land Tax Management Short 
(Amendment) Act, 1975". 	 title.  

(1) Section 1 and this section commence on the date Commence- 
of assent to this Act. 	 ment.  

10 	(2) Section 3 shall be deemed to have commenced on 
31st December, 1974. 

(3) Section 4 commences on 31st December, 1975. 

The Land Tax Management Act, 1956, is amended Amend-ment of in the manner specified in Schedule 1. 	 Act No. 26, 
1956. 

15 	4. The Land Tax Management Act, 1956, is further Further 
amended in the manner specified in Schedules 2-6, both menet of inclusive. 	 Act No. 26, 

1956. 

SCHEDULE 1. 	 Sec. 3. 

AMENDMENT OF LAND TAX MANAGEMENT ACT, 1956. 
20 (1) Section 10 (1) (s)— 

Omit "declared.", insert instead :— 
declared; 

(t) with respect to taxation leviable or payable in 
respect of the year commencing on 1st January, 

25 	 1975, or any succeeding year, land owned by a 
rural society registered under the Co-operation 

SCHEDULE 



Act No. 	, 1975. 	 3 

Land Tax Management (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE 1—continued. 

AMENDMENT OF LAND TAX MANAGEMENT ACT, 
1956—continued. 

Act, 1923, other than land in respect of which 
5 
	 the society is jointly assessable with a public 

company that is not a company to which a 
declaration under paragraph (s) relates; 

Section 10 ( 1B)— 

After "1961", insert ", or is a recognised company 
10 	within the meaning of that Act". 

Section 10 (1c)— 

Omit "paragraphs (q) and (s) of subsection (1)", 
insert instead "subsection (1) (q), (s) and (t)". 

SCHEDULE 2. 	 Sec. 4. 

15 AMENDMENTS TO PART I OF THE LAND TAX MANAGEMENT 
ACT, 1956. 

(1) Section 3 (1), definition of "Flat"— 

After "dwelling", insert "whether the room or suite 
is a detached building or forms part of a building". 

20 (2) Section 3 (1), definition of "Land used for primary 
production"— 

Omit "or" where fourthly occurring. 

SCHEDULE 



Act No. , 1975. 4 

Land Tax Management (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE 2—continued. 

AMENDMENTS TO PART I OF THE LAND TAX MANAGEMENT 
ACT, 1956—continued. 

(3) Section 3 (1), definition of "Land used for primary 
5 production"— 

Omit "honey,", insert instead :— 

honey; 
a nursery within the meaning of the Horticultural 
Stock and Nurseries Act, 1969, being a nursery 

10 in respect of which a person is registered under 
that Act as a nurseryman ; or 

the propagation for sale of mushrooms, orchids 
or flowers, 

(4) Section 3 (1), definition of "Residential unit"- 

15 Omit "for residential purposes", insert instead "as his 
principal place of residence". 

(5) Section 3 (2)— 

Omit "for residential purposes" where firstly and 
secondly occurring, insert instead "as his principal place 

20 of residence". 

(6) Section 3 (3 )— 

After section 3 (2), insert :— 

(3) For the purposes of this Act, in respect of 
any year in respect of which taxation is leviable or 

25 payable, land is not used or occupied as the 
principal place of residence of a person unless— 

(a) that land and no other land has, since before 
the first day of July that last preceded the 

SCHEDULE 



Act No. 	, 1975. 	 5 

Land Tax Management (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE 2—continued. 

AMENDMENTS TO PART I OF THE LAND TAX MANAGEMENT 
ACT, 1956—continued. 

commencement of that year, been con- 
5 	 tinuously used and occupied by that person 

for residential purposes and for no other 
purpose; or 

(b) in any other case, the Commissioner is 
satisfied that the land is used and occupied 

10 	 by that person as his principal place of 
residence. 

SCHEDULE 3. 	 Sec. 4. 

AMENDMENTS TO PART III OF THE LAND TAX MANAGEMENT 
ACT, 1956. 

15 (1) (a) Section 9 (3) (b)— 
Omit "twenty-one thousand dollars" wherever 

occurring, insert instead "thirty thousand dollars". 

Section 9 (3) (b)— 
Omit "twenty-eight thousand dollars", insert in- 

20 	stead "sixty thousand dollars". 

Section 9 (3) (b)— 

Omit "three dollars", insert instead "one dollar". 

(d) Section 9 (3) (c)— 
Omit "twenty-one thousand dollars" wherever 

25 	occurring, insert instead "thirty thousand dollars". 

SCHEDULE 



6 Act No. 	, 1975. 

Land Tax Management (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE 3—continued. 

AMENDMENTS TO PART III OF THE LAND TAX MANAGEMENT 
ACT, 1956—continued. 

(2) (a) Section 10 (1)- 

5 	 Omit "shall be exempt", insert instead "shall, 
subject to sections 10B, 10c, lOn and 10E, be 
exempt". 

Section 10 (1) (b)— 

Omit "as amended by subsequent Acts", insert 
10 	instead "or a pastures protection board constituted 

under the Pastures Protection Act, 1934". 

Section 10 (1) (c)— 

Omit ", or any private hospital or rest home 
licensed under the Private Hospitals Act, 1908, as 

15 	amended by subsequent Acts". 

Section 10 (1) (f)— 

After "land" wherever occurring, insert :— 
(not being land used to make a pecuniary 
profit). 

20 	(e) Section 10 (1) (g)— 

After section 10 (1) (g) (vii), insert :— 
(viii) a private hospital or nursing home within 

the meaning of the Private Hospitals Act, 
1908, not carried on for pecuniary profit; 

25 	 (ix) an authorised hospital within the meaning 
of the Mental Health Act, 1958, not carried 
on for pecuniary profit; 

SCHEDULE 



Act No. , 1975. 7 

Land Tax Management (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE 3—continued. 

AMENDMENTS TO PART III OF THE LAND TAX MANAGEMENT 
ACT, 1956—continued. 

Section 10 (1) (r)- 

5 Omit "1974", insert instead "1976". 

(g) Section 10 (1) (r)— 
Omit "for residential purposes" wherever occur-

ring, insert instead "as his principal place of 
residence". 

10 (h) Section 10 (1) (r)— 
Omit "for those purposes" wherever occurring, 

insert instead "as his principal place of residence". 

(i) Section 10 (1)-- 

After section 10 (1) (t), insert :- 
15 (u) with respect to taxation leviable or payable 

in respect of the year commencing on 1st 
January, 1976, or any succeeding year—a 
parcel of land exceeding 2,100 square 
metres in area, but not exceeding 2 hectares 

20 in area, where— 
paragraph (r) (ii) would apply to 
the land if it did not exceed 2,100 
square metres in area ; and 
subdivision of the land is, imme- 

25 diately before the commencement 
of that year, prevented by a planning 
scheme authorised by or under an 
Act. 

(j) Section 10 (1D) (b) (i)- 

30 Omit "strata lots", insert instead "lots under the 
Strata Titles Act, 1973,". 

SCHEDULE 



8 Act No. , 1975. 

Land Tax Management (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE 3—continued. 

AMENDMENTS TO PART III OF THE LAND TAX MANAGEMENT 
ACT, 1956—continued. 

(k) Section 10 (1E), (lEA)- 

5 Omit section 10 (1E), insert instead— 

(1E) In subsection (1) (r) "strata lot" 
means a lot under the Strata Titles Act, 1973, 
not being a lot that— 

(a) is owned by a company; 

10 (b) is owned by or on behalf of a company 
and is land of which a mortgagee or 
person by way of security for money is 
in possession; 

is held by a trustee for or on behalf of 
15 a company ; or 

in respect of which a company is jointly 
assessed with any other person. 

(1EA) In subsections (1D) and (1E) 
"company" does not include a trustee company 

20 acting in its representative capacity. 

(1) Section 10 (1E)— 

Omit "owner for residential purposes", insert 
instead "owner as his principal place of residence". 

(m) Section 10 (1E)- 

25 Omit "for those purposes", insert instead "as his 
principal place of residence". 

SCHEDULE 



Act No. 	, 1975. 	 9 

Land Tax Management (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE 3—continued. 

AMENDMENTS TO PART III OF THE LAND TAX MANAGEMENT 
ACT, 1956—continued. 

(n) Section 10 (2)- 

5 	 Omit section 10 (2), insert instead :- 

(2) Where— 

a building is erected on land to which 
the provisions of subsection ( 1 ) (g) 
(iii) or of section 10B (2), 10c (a) or 

10 

	

	
10D (2) would apply if the building 
were solely occupied by the persons or 
bodies referred to in those provisions ; 
and 

the building is partly used or occupied, 
15 	 or is intended to be partly used or 

occupied, by persons other than those 
persons or bodies, 

the unimproved value of that land shall, for 
the purposes of the assessment of those persons 

20 

	

	 or bodies, be reduced to an amount which 
bears the same proportion to that unimproved 
value as the rental value of the part so used or 
occupied, or intended to be so used or 
occupied, by those other persons bears to the 

25 	 total rental value of the building. 

(o) Section 10 (5)— 

After section 10 (4), insert— 
(5) Where a parcel of land would, but for 

the fact that it exceeds 2 hectares in area, be 
30 	 exempted under subsection (1) (u), the unim- 

proved value of that parcel shall, for assess-
ment purposes, be reduced by an amount that 

SCHEDULE 



Act No. 	, 1975. 	 10 

Land Tax Management (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE 3—continued. 

AMENDMENTS TO PART III OF THE LAND TAX MANAGEMENT 
ACT, 1956—continued. 

bears to that unimproved value the same 
5 

	

	 proportion as 2 hectares bears to the area of 
that parcel. 

(3) Sections 10A-10E— 

After section 10, insert- 

10A. (1) In this section— 	 Refund of 
stamp duty 

10 	 "convey" includes transfer ; 	 on certain 
con- 

"corporation" has the same meaning as it has veYances' 
in the Companies Act, 1961; 

"prescribed shareholder" in relation to a corpora-
tion means- 

15 	 (a) a shareholder (not being a corpora- 
tion) in the corporation who, dis-
regarding any proxies or other 
authorities to vote held by him, is 
entitled at general meetings of the 

20 

	

	 corporation to exercise voting 
rights that together amount to 
more than one-half of the total 
voting rights of all shareholders 
entitled to vote at general meetings 

25 	 of the corporation ; 
(b) a shareholder (not being a corpora-

tion) in the corporation where, if 
no proxies or other authorities to 
vote are allowed, no shareholder in 

30 

	

	 the corporation is entitled at general 
meetings of the corporation to 
exercise more voting rights than 
any other shareholder in the 
corporation. 

SCHEDULE 



Act No. 	, 1975. 	 11 

Land Tax Management (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE 3—continued. 

AMENDMENTS TO PART III OF THE LAND TAX MANAGEMENT 
ACT, 1956—continued. 

(2) This section applies to a person in 
5 	 respect of land where— 

(a) at the time the conveyance referred to in 
paragraph (b) took effect that person was 
a prescribed shareholder in the corporation 
so referred to; 

10 	 (b) the land was owned by a corporation on 
31st December, 1975, and was conveyed 
after that date by the corporation to that 
person as equitable owner, or to that 
person and any other prescribed shareholder 

15 

	

	 or shareholders in the corporation jointly 
as equitable owners, after that date; and 

the land was, at all times during the period 
that commenced on 31st December, 1975, 
and ended when the conveyance took effect, 

20 

	

	 used and occupied by that person as his 
principal place of residence and for no 
other purpose; and 

if the conveyance had taken effect on the 
thirty-first day of December that last pre- 

25 

	

	 ceded the date on which it actually took 
effect- 

the land conveyed would, by the 
operation of section 10 (1) (r) or 
(u) be exempt from land tax in 

30 
	 respect of the year in which the con- 

veyance actually took effect; or 
land tax that, but for section 10 
(4) or (5), would be leviable or 
payable in respect of the land for 

SCHEDULE 



Act No. 	,1975. 	 1 2 

Land Tax Management (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE 3—continued. 
AMENDMENTS TO PART III OF THE LAND TAX MANAGEMENT 

ACT, 1956—continued. 

the year in which the conveyance 
actually took effect would be 
reduced by the operation of section 
10 (4) or (5). 

For the purpose of assessing land tax 
in respect of land referred to in subsection (2) that 

10 

	

	is conveyed on or before 31st December, 1976, the 
conveyance of that land so referred to shall be 
deemed to have taken effect on 31st December, 
1975. 

On application made by a person to 
15 

	

	whom this section applies, the Commissioner shall, 
out of money provided by Parliament, pay to that 
person an amount certified by the Commissioner of 
Stamp Duties to be the difference between— 

(a) the amount of duty under the Stamp Duties 
20 	 Act, 1920, paid and not refunded— 

on the agreement for the conveyance 
to that person of the land in respect 
of which this section applies; or 

where there is no such agreement 
25 	 —on that conveyance; and 

(b) the amount of duty that would have been 
payable under that Act had that agreement 
or conveyance, as the case may be, been an 
agreement under seal referred to in para- 

30 

	

	 graph (2) of the matter relating to an 
Agreement or Memorandum of an Agree-
ment in the Second Schedule to the Stamp 
Duties Act, 1920. 

SCHEDULE 



Act No. 	, 1975. 	 13 

Land Tax Management (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE 3—continued. 

AMENDMENTS TO PART III OF THE LAND TAX MANAGEMENT 
ACT, 1956--continued. 

10B. (1) In this section "prescribed authority" Taxation 
5 	means— 	 of land

owned by 
certain 
authorities. 

(2) Nothing in this Act operates to 
exempt from taxation under this Act any land 

15 	owned by a prescribed authority that is not land 
solely occupied by the authority as offices from 
which to exercise and perform its powers, authori-
ties, duties and functions. 

10c. Nothing in this Act operates to exempt from Taxation 
20 	taxation under this Act any building site re- °a owned 

developed developed in accordance with a scheme under Part by 
IV of the Sydney Cove Redevelopment Authority Codnve" 
Act, 1968, that is not— 	 Redevelop- 

ment 
Authority, 

a building site solely occupied by the Sydney 
25 	 Cove Redevelopment Authority as offices 

from which to exercise and perform its 
powers, authorities, duties and functions ; or 

a building site that— 
(i) was so redeveloped by that Auth- 

30 	 ority ; or 
SCHEDULE 

the State Superannuation Board; 
the Local Government Superannuation 
Board ; 
the Transport Retirement Board; 

10 	 (d) the New South Wales Retirement Board; 
and 

(e) the Builders Licensing Board. 



Act No. 	, 1975. 	 14 

Land Tax Management (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE 3—continued. 

AMENDMENTS TO PART III OF THE LAND TAX MANAGEMENT 
ACT, 1956—continued. 

(ii) was so redeveloped by a lessee from 
5 	 that Authority and would be exempt 

from taxation under this Act if it 
were owned by that lessee, 

and, as so redeveloped, is used solely for 
residential purposes. 

10 	 10D. (1) In this section "prescribed authority" Taxation 
means— 	 of land 

owned 
by 
certain the Albury—Wodonga (New South Wales) statutory Corporation ; 	 corpora- 
tions. 

a corporation constituted under section 4 
15 of the Growth Centres (Development Cor-

porations) Act, 1974; or 

the New South Wales Planning and 
Environment Commission in respect of the 
development of the Sydney South West 
Sector. 

(2) Nothing in this Act operates to exempt 
from taxation under this Act any land owned by 
a prescribed authority that is not— 

land solely occupied by the authority as 
25 	 offices from which to exercise and perform 

its powers, authorities, duties and functions ; 
or 

land held or used by the authority for resi-
dential purposes. 

SCHEDULE 

20 



Act No. 	, 1975. 	 15 

Land Tax Management (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE 3—continued. 
AMENDMENTS TO PART III OF THE LAND TAX MANAGEMENT 

ACT, 1956—continued. 
10E. Nothing in this Act operates to exempt Taxation 

5 	from taxation under this Act any land owned by Lif inded  
The Housing Commission of New South Wales or for 
the New South Wales Planning and Environment ab, 
Commission or any other corporation for the pur- Council 
poses of the Urban Land Council being land (other 

10 	than land held for open space purposes) held for 
development. 

SCHEDULE 4. 	 Sec. 4. 
AMENDMENTS OF PART IV OF THE LAND TAX MANAGEMENT 

ACT, 1956. 
15 ( 1 ) Section 27 (3A)— 

After "unit" where firstly occurring, insert ", or a 
flat that is not a residential unit,". 

(2) Section 27 (3A) (a)— 
After "1956", insert ", or in respect of that flat under 

20 	section 3c of that Act". 

SCHEDULE 5. 	 Sec. 4. 
AMENDMENTS OF PART VI OF THE LAND TAX MANAGEMENT 

ACT, 1956. 
Section 50 (1A)—(1D)- 

25 	After section 50 (1), insert : — 
(1A) Where section 10 (1) (u) or 10 (5) ceases to 

apply to or in respect of land by reason only that section 
10 (1) (u) (ii) ceases to apply and the Board is satisfied 

SCHEDULE 



Act No. 	, 1975. 	 16 

Land Tax Management (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE 5—continued. 

AMENDMENTS OF PART VI OF THE LAND TAX MANAGEMENT 
ACT, 1956—continued. 

that the owner of the land is justified in not proceeding 
5 

	

	to subdivide the land, the Board may defer payment of 
the amount of any land tax leviable or payable in respect 
of that land in excess of the amount that would have been 
payable had section 10 (1) (u) (ii) not ceased to apply 
to and in respect of the land. 

10 	(1B) Subsection (1A) ceases to apply in respect of 
any land if— 

(a) the Board is satisfied that the owner of the land 
is no longer justified in not proceeding to sub-
divide the land ; or 

15 	(b) any part of the land is sold or otherwise disposed 
of. 

(1c) Where, pursuant to subsection (1B) (b), an 
owner of land ceases to be entitled to a postponement 
of land tax he shall, within one month after ceasing to 

20 	be so entitled, notify the Commissioner accordingly. 

(1D) Where a parcel of land would, but for exceeding 
2,100 square metres in area, be exempted by the opera-
tion of section 10 (1) (r) from taxation under this Act, 
the Board may, if it is satisfied that the owner, while 

25 

	

	not prevented by a planning scheme authorised by or 
under an Act from subdividing the land, is prevented 
from doing so by other circumstances beyond his control 
that are of a permanent character, waive payment of 
the land tax wholly or in part. 

SCHEDULE 

• 



Act No. 	, 1975. 	 17 

Land Tax Management (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE 6. 	 Sec. 4. 

AMENDMENTS TO PART VII OF THE LAND TAX MANAGE-
MENT ACT, 1956. 

Section 54 (1)- 

5 	Omit "For the purposes of this Act", insert instead 
"For the purposes of this Act, but subject to this sec-
tion,". 

Section 54 (1AA), (1AB)— 

After section 54 (1), insert :- 

10 	 ( 1AA) Notwithstanding subsection (1), but 
subject to subsection (1D), where— 

a supplementary valuation of land to which 
subsection (1) (d) applies has been made 
by the Valuer-General on or after the first 

15 

	

	 day of a year for which land tax is being 
levied; 

that valuation is included in a supplemen-
tary list which includes in relation to that 
land an amount referred to in section 61A 

20 

	

	 of the Valuation of Land Act, 1916, as a 
rating and taxing basis ; and 

the amount of that rating and taxing basis 
was determined as at the first day of the 
year in which the last general valuation was 

521—B 	 SCHEDULE 



Act No. 	, 1975. 	 18 

Land Tax Management (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE 6—continued. 

AMENDMENTS TO PART VII OF THE LAND TAX MANAGEMENT 
ACT, 1956—continued. 

furnished prior to the first day of a year 
5 	 for which land tax is being levied, 

the unimproved value of the land for the purposes 
of this Act is, in respect of the year referred to in 
paragraph (a), the amount of the rating and taxing 
basis referred to in paragraph (b). 

10 	 (1AB) Notwithstanding subsection (1), but sub-
ject to subsection (1D), where— 

a supplementary valuation of land to which 
subsection (1) (d) applies has been made 
by the Valuer-General on or after the first 

15 	 day of a year for which land tax is being 
levied; 

the unimproved value of the land included 
in that valuation was determined under 
section 14A of the Valuation of Land Act, 

20 	 1916; and 

that unimproved value was determined as 
at the first day of the year in which the 
last general valuation commenced before 
the first day of a year for which land tax 

25 	 is being levied, 

the unimproved value of the land for the purposes 
of this Act is, in respect of the year referred to in 
paragraph (a), the unimproved value referred to in 
paragraph (b). 

30 (3) Section 54 (1B) (b)— 

After "Valuer-General", insert "as at a date earlier 
than 1st January, 1973". 

SCHEDULE 



Act No. 	, 1975. 	 19 

Land Tax Management (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE 6—continued. 

AMENDMENTS TO PART VII OF THE LAND TAX MANAGEMENT 
ACT, 1956—continued. 

Section 54 (1B)- 

5 	After section 54 (1B) (b), insert :— 

(ba) where the valuation is made by the Valuer-
General as at 1st January, 1973, or a later 
date— 

(i) an unimproved value determined pur- 
1 0 	 suant to section 14A (1) (b) (iv) of the 

a 
	 Valuation of Land Act, 1916, as if the 

land valued had been sold, conveyed or 
resumed on the date as at which the 
valuation is made; and 

15 	 (ii) any allowance referred to in paragraph 
(b) (ii) ; 

Section 54 (1c) (a)— 
Omit "or" where secondly occurring. 

Section 54 (1c) (b)- 
20 	Omit "land.", insert instead :— 

land; or 

(c) an unimproved value has been furnished pursuant 
to subsection (1B ) (ba) (i), that unimproved 
value shall, subject to subsection (1D), be 

25 

	

	 deemed, for the purposes of this Act, to be the 
unimproved value of the land. 

Section 54 (1D)— 
After "(1)" where secondly and thirdly occurring, 

insert "(1AA), (lAB),". 

SCHEDULE 



Act No. 	, 1975. 	 20 

Land Tax Management (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE 6—continued. 
AMENDMENTS TO PART VII OF THE LAND TAX MANAGEMENT 

ACT, 1956—continued. 

Section 54 (4A)- 
5 	After section 54 (4A) (b), insert :— 

(ba) of an unimproved value under subsection (1B) 
(ba) (i) shall be subject to objection in the same 
manner as if it had been determined in accord-
ance with section 14A (1) (b) (iv) of the 

10 	 Valuation of Land Act, 1916; 

Section 54 (4A) (c)— 
Omit "subparagraph (ii) of paragraph (b) of sub-

section (1B )", insert instead "subsection (1B) (b) (ii) 
or (1B) (ba) (ii)". 

BY AUTHORITY 
D. WEST, GOVERNMENT PRINTER, NEW SOUTH WALES-1975 

[24c] 

4 

a 



PROOF 

LAND TAX MANAGEMENT (AMENDMENT) BILL, 1975 

EXPLANATORY NOTE 

THE objects of this Bill are— 

to provide for the total exemption from liability for land tax of a rural 
society registered under the Co-operation Act, 1923, and a pastures pro-
tection board constituted under the Pastures Protection Act, 1934; 
to make an amendment consequential on the introduction pursuant to 
the Interstate Corporate Affairs Agreement of the concept of "recognised" 
companies; 

to include as land used for primary production land primarily used as 
a plant nursery or for the propagation for sale, otherwise than by 
cultivating the land, of mushrooms, orchids and flowers; 
to limit land tax exemptions and concessions relating to residential land 
to land used as the principal place of residence of the owner of the 
land; 

to increase from $21,000 to $30,000 the value below which there is a 
general exemption from liability for land tax; 
to provide in respect of land valued at $30,000 or more a graduated 
partial exemption from liability for land tax terminating at a value of 
$60,000; 
to limit the exemption from land tax for private hospitals and nursing 
homes and authorised mental hospitals to those not carried on for 
pecuniary profit; 
where land exceeds 2 100 square metres (1 acre) in area but does not 
exceed 2 hectares (5 acres) in area and is occupied by the owner as 
his principal place of residence, to give an exemption from land tax if 
subdivision of the land is precluded by a planning scheme and a partial 
exemption in such a case if the land exceeds 2 hectares (5 acres) in area; 
to provide for a refund of stamp duty in excess of a nominal amount 
where— 

the duty is charged on a conveyance of land owned by a cor-
poration incorporated before 31st December, 1975, and used 
as his principal place of residence by a majority or equal share-
holder in the corporation; and 
the conveyance is to that shareholder who thereby becomes en-
titled to an exemption from, or a concession in respect of, land 
tax; 

2277 	521— 



2 

(i) to impose liability for land tax in respect of land held by various statutory bodies for investment purposes or for industrial or commercial development; 

(k) to enable the Land Tax Hardship Board to defer or waive land tax in 	 A 
certain cases not involving hardship; 

(1) to make amendments consequential on the changes in the system of valuing land in the State; 

(m) to make amendments consequential upon or ancillary to the foregoing. 

s 



PROOF 

4 

No. 	, 1975. 

A BILL 
To alter the incidence of land tax in certain 

respects and to revise the level at which the general 
exemption from land tax applies ; for these and other 
purposes to amend the Land Tax Management Act, 
1956. 

[MR COLEMAN-18 November, 1975.] 

BE 

2277 	521—A 



Act No. 	, 1975. 	 2 

Land Tax Management (Amendment). 

BE it enacted by the Queen's Most Excellent Majesty, by 
and with the advice and consent of the Legislative 

Council and Legislative Assembly of New South Wales in 
Parliament assembled, and by the authority of the same, as 

5 follows:- 

This Act may be cited as the "Land Tax Management Short 
(Amendment) Act, 1975". 	 title.  

(1) Section 1 and this section commence on the date Commence- 
of assent to this Act. 	 ment.  

10 	(2) Section 3 shall be deemed to have commenced on 
31st December, 1974. 

(3) Section 4 commences on 31st December, 1975. 

The Land Tax Management Act, 1956, is amended Amend-
ment of in the manner specified in Schedule 1. 	 Act No. 26, 
1956. 

15 	4. The Land Tax Management Act, 1956, is further Further 
amended in the manner specified in Schedules 2-6, both mamen

en
tdo-f 

inclusive. 	 Act No. 26, 
1956. 

SCHEDULE 1. 	 Sec. 3. 

AMENDMENT OF LAND TAX MANAGEMENT ACT, 1956. 

20 (1) Section 10 (1) (s)— 
Omit "declared.", insert instead :— 

declared; 
(t) with respect to taxation leviable or payable in 

respect of the year commencing on 1st January, 
25 	 1975, or any succeeding year, land owned by a 

rural society registered under the Co-operation 
SCHEDULE 



Act No. 	, 1975. 	 3 

Land Tax Management (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE 1—continued. 

AMENDMENT OF LAND TAX MANAGEMENT ACT, 
195 6—continued. 

Act, 1923, other than land in respect of which 
5 
	 the society is jointly assessable with a public 

company that is not a company to which a 
declaration under paragraph (s) relates; 

Section 10 (113)— 

After "1961", insert ", or is a recognised company 
10 	within the meaning of that Act". 

Section 10 (1c)— 

Omit "paragraphs (q) and (s) of subsection (1)", 
insert instead "subsection (1) (q), (s) and (t)". 

SCHEDULE 2. 	 Sec. 4. 

15 AMENDMENTS TO PART I OF THE LAND TAX MANAGEMENT 
ACT, 1956. 

(1) Section 3 (1), definition of "Flat"— 

After "dwelling", insert "whether the room or suite 
is a detached building or forms part of a building". 

20 (2) Section 3 (1), definition of "Land used for primary 
production"— 

Omit "or" where fourthly occurring. 

SCHEDULE 



Act No. , 1975. 4 

Land Tax Management (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE 2—continued. 

AMENDMENTS TO PART I OF THE LAND TAX MANAGEMENT 
ACT, 1956—continued. 

(3) Section 3 (1), definition of "Land used for primary 
5 production"— 

Omit "honey,", insert instead :— 
honey; 
a nursery within the meaning of the Horticultural 
Stock and Nurseries Act, 1969, being a nursery 

10 in respect of which a person is registered under 
that Act as a nurseryman ; or 
the propagation for sale of mushrooms, orchids 
or flowers, 

(4) Section 3 (1), definition of "Residential unit"- 

15 Omit "for residential purposes", insert instead "as his 
principal place of residence". 

(5) Section 3 (2)— 

Omit "for residential purposes" where firstly and 
secondly occurring, insert instead "as his principal place 

20 of residence". 

(6) Section 3 (3)— 

After section 3 (2), insert :— 
(3) For the purposes of this Act, in respect of 

any year in respect of which taxation is leviable or 
25 payable, land is not used or occupied as the 

principal place of residence of a person unless— 
(a) that land and no other land has, since before 

the first day of July that last preceded the 

SCHEDULE 



Act No. 	, 1975. 	 5 

Land Tax Management (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE 2—continued. 

AMENDMENTS TO PART I OF THE LAND TAX MANAGEMENT 
ACT, 1956—continued. 

commencement of that year, been con- 
5 	 tinuously used and occupied by that person 

for residential purposes and for no other 
purpose; or 

(b) in any other case, the Commissioner is 
satisfied that the land is used and occupied 

10 	 by that person as his principal place of 
residence. 

SCHEDULE 3. 	 Sec. 4. 

AMENDMENTS TO PART III OF THE LAND TAX MANAGEMENT 
ACT, 1956. 

15 (1) (a) Section 9 (3) (b)— 
Omit "twenty-one thousand dollars" wherever 

occurring, insert instead "thirty thousand dollars". 

Section 9 (3) (b)— 
Omit "twenty-eight thousand dollars", insert in- 

20 	stead "sixty thousand dollars". 

Section 9 (3) (b)— 
Omit "three dollars", insert instead "one dollar". 

(d) Section 9 (3) (c)— 
Omit "twenty-one thousand dollars" wherever 

25 	occurring, insert instead "thirty thousand dollars". 

SCHEDULE 



 

Act No. 	, 1975. 

 
  

6 

 

     
 

   

Land Tax Management (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE 3—continued. 

AMENDMENTS TO PART III OF THE LAND TAX MANAGEMENT 
ACT, 1956—continued. 

(2) (a) Section 10 (1)- 

5 	 Omit "shall be exempt", insert instead "shall, 
subject to sections 10B, 10c, 10D and 10E, be 
exempt". 

Section 10 (1) (b)— 

Omit "as amended by subsequent Acts", insert 
10 

	

	instead "or a pastures protection board constituted 
tinder the Pastures Protection Act, 1934". 

Section 10 (1) (c)— 

Omit ", or any private hospital or rest home 
licensed under the Private Hospitals Act, 1908, as 

15 	amended by subsequent Acts". 

Section 10 (1) (f)— 

After "land" wherever occurring, insert :— 

(not being land used to make a pecuniary 
profit). 

20 	(e) Section 10 (1) (g)— 

After section 10 (1) (g) (vii), insert :— 

(viii) a private hospital or nursing home within 
the meaning of the Private Hospitals Act, 
1908, not carried on for pecuniary profit; 

25 	 (ix) an authorised hospital within the meaning 
of the Mental Health Act, 1958, not carried 
on for pecuniary profit ; 

SCHEDULE 



Act No. , 1975. 7 

Land Tax Management (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE 3—continued. 

AMENDMENTS TO PART III OF THE LAND TAX MANAGEMENT 
ACT, 1956—continued. 

Section 10 (1) (r)- 

5 Omit "1974", insert instead "1976". 

(g) Section 10 (1) (r)— 

Omit "for residential purposes" wherever occur-
ring, insert instead "as his principal place of 
residence". 

10 (h) Section 10 (1) (r)— 

Omit "for those purposes" wherever occurring, 
insert instead "as his principal place of residence". 

(i) Section 10 (1)— 

After section 10 (1) (t), insert :- 

15 (u) with respect to taxation leviable or payable 
in respect of the year commencing on 1st 
January, 1976, or any succeeding year—a 
parcel of land exceeding 2,100 square 
metres in area, but not exceeding 2 hectares 

20 in area, where— 

paragraph (r) (ii) would apply to 
the land if it did not exceed 2,100 
square metres in area ; and 

subdivision of the land is, imme- 
25 diately before the commencement 

of that year, prevented by a planning 
scheme authorised by or under an 
Act. 

(j) Section 10 (1D) (b) (i)- 

30 Omit "strata lots", insert instead "lots under the 
Strata Titles Act, 1973,". 

SCHEDULE 



Act No. , 1975. 8 

Land Tax Management (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE 3—continued. 

AMENDMENTS TO PART III OF THE LAND TAX MANAGEMENT 
ACT, 1956—continued. 

(k) Section 10 (1E), (lEA)- 

5 Omit section 10 (1E), insert instead- 

(1E) In subsection (1) (r) "strata lot" 
means a lot under the Strata Titles Act, 1973, 
not being a lot that— 

(a) is owned by a company ; 

10 (b) is owned by or on behalf of a company 
and is land of which a mortgagee or 
person by way of security for money is 
in possession ; 

is held by a trustee for or on behalf of 
15 a company ; or 

in respect of which a company is jointly 
assessed with any other person. 

(1EA) In subsections (1D) and ( 1E ) 
"company" does not include a trustee company 

20 acting in its representative capacity. 

(1) Section 10 (1E)— 

Omit "owner for residential purposes", insert 
instead "owner as his principal place of residence". 

(m) Section 10 (1E)- 

25 Omit "for those purposes", insert instead "as his 
principal place of residence". 

SCHEDULE 



Act No. 	, 1975. 	 9 

Land Tax Management (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE 3—continued. 
AMENDMENTS TO PART III OF THE LAND TAX MANAGEMENT 

ACT, 1956—continued. 

(n) Section 10 (2)- 

5 	 Omit section 10 (2), insert instead :- 

(2) Where— 

a building is erected on land to which 
the provisions of subsection (1) (g) 
(iii) or of section 10B (2), 10c (a) or 

10 

	

	
10D (2) would apply if the building 
were solely occupied by the persons or 
bodies referred to in those provisions ; 
and 

the building is partly used or occupied, 
15 	 or is intended to be partly used or 

occupied, by persons other than those 
persons or bodies, 

the unimproved value of that land shall, for 
the purposes of the assessment of those persons 

20 

	

	 or bodies, be reduced to an amount which 
bears the same proportion to that unimproved 
value as the rental value of the part so used or 
occupied, or intended to be so used or 
occupied, by those other persons bears to the 

25 	 total rental value of the building. 

(o) Section 10 (5)— 

After section 10 (4), insert— 
(5) Where a parcel of land would, but for 

the fact that it exceeds 2 hectares in area, be 
30 	 exempted under subsection (1) (u), the unim- 

proved value of that parcel shall, for assess-
ment purposes, be reduced by an amount that 

SCHEDULE 



Act No. 	, 1975. 	 10 

Land Tax Management (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE 3—continued. 

AMENDMENTS TO PART III OF THE LAND TAX MANAGEMENT 

ACT, 1956—continued. 

bears to that unimproved value the same 
5 

	

	 proportion as 2 hectares bears to the area of 
that parcel. 

(3) Sections 10A-10E— 

After section 10, insert- 

10A. (1) In this section— 	 Refund of 
stamp duty 

10 	 "convey" includes transfer; 	 on certain 
con- 

"corporation" has the same meaning as it has  veyances. 

in the Companies Act, 1961 ; 

"prescribed shareholder" in relation to a corpora-
ion means- 

15 	 (a) a shareholder (not being a corpora- 
tion) in the corporation who, dis-
regarding any proxies or other 
authorities to vote held by him, is 
entitled at general meetings of the 

20 

	

	 corporation to exercise voting 
rights that together amount to 
more than one-half of the total 
voting rights of all shareholders 
entitled to vote at general meetings 

2 5 	 of the corporation ; 
(b) a shareholder (not being a corpora-

tion) in the corporation where, if 
no proxies or other authorities to 
vote are allowed, no shareholder in 

30 

	

	 the corporation is entitled at general 
meetings of the corporation to 
exercise more voting rights than 
any other shareholder in the 
corporation. 

SCHEDULE 



Act No. 	, 1975. 	 11 

Land Tax Management (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE 3—continued. 

AMENDMENTS TO PART III OF THE LAND TAX MANAGEMENT 
ACT, 1956—continued. 

( 2 ) This section applies to a person in 
5 	respect of land where— 

( a) at the time the conveyance referred to in 
paragraph (b) took effect that person was 
a prescribed shareholder in the corporation 
so referred to; 

10 	 (b) the land was owned by a corporation on 
31st December, 1975, and was conveyed 
after that date by the corporation to that 
person as equitable owner, or to that 
person and any other prescribed shareholder 

15 

	

	 or shareholders in the corporation jointly 
as equitable owners, after that date; and 

the land was, at all times during the period 
that commenced on 31st December, 1975, 
and ended when the conveyance took effect, 

20 

	

	 used and occupied by that person as his 
principal place of residence and for no 
other purpose; and 

if the conveyance had taken effect on the 
thirty-first day of December that last pre- 

25 

	

	 ceded the date on which it actually took 
effect— 

the land conveyed would, by the 
operation of section 10 (1) (r) or 
(u) be exempt from land tax in 

30 	 respect of the year in which the con- 
veyance actually took effect ; or 

land tax that, but for section 10 
(4) or (5), would be leviable or 
payable in respect of the land for 

SCHEDULE 



Act No. 	, 1975. 	 12 

Land Tax Management (Amendment). 

 

SCHEDULE 3—continued. 

AMENDMENTS TO PART III OF THE LAND TAX MANAGEMENT 
ACT, 1956—continued. 

the year in which the conveyance 
5 	 actually took effect would be 

reduced by the operation of section 
10 (4) or (5). 

For the purpose of assessing land tax 
in respect of land referred to in subsection (2) that 

10 

	

	is conveyed on or before 31st December, 1976, the 
conveyance of that land so referred to shall be 
deemed to have taken effect on 31st December, 
1975. 

On application made by a person to 
15 

	

	whom this section applies, the Commissioner shall, 
out of money provided by Parliament, pay to that 
person an amount certified by the Commissioner of 
Stamp Duties to be the difference between— 

(a) the amount of duty under the Stamp Duties 
20 	 Act, 1920, paid and not refunded— 

on the agreement for the conveyance 
to that person of the land in respect 
of which this section applies; or 

where there is no such agreement 
25 	 —on that conveyance; and 

(b) the amount of duty that would have been 
payable under that Act had that agreement 
or conveyance, as the case may be, been an 
agreement under seal referred to in para- 

30 

	

	 graph (2) of the matter relating to an 
Agreement or Memorandum of an Agree-
ment in the Second Schedule to the Stamp 
Duties Act, 1920. 

SCHEDULE 



Act No. 	, 1975. 	 13 

Land Tax Management (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE 3—continued. 

the State Superannuation Board ; 
the Local Government Superannuation 
Board ; 
the Transport Retirement Board; 

10 	 (d) the New South Wales Retirement Board; 
and 

(e) the Builders Licensing Board. 

(2) Nothing in this Act operates to 
exempt from taxation under this Act any land 

15 	owned by a prescribed authority that is not land 
solely occupied by the authority as offices from 
which to exercise and perform its powers, authori-
ties, duties and functions. 

10c. Nothing in this Act operates to exempt from Taxation 
20 	taxation under this Act any building site re-11:1  

developed in accordance with a scheme under Part by 
IV of the Sydney Cove Redevelopment Authority Coey  
Act, 1968, that is not— 	 Redevelop- ment 

Authority. 
a building site solely occupied by the Sydney 

25 	 Cove Redevelopment Authority as offices 
from which to exercise and perform its 
powers, authorities, duties and functions ; or 

a building site that— 
(i) was so redeveloped by that Auth- 

30 	 ority ; or 
SCHEDULE 

AMENDMENTS TO PART III OF THE LAND TAX MANAGEMENT 
ACT, 1956—continued. 

10B. (1) In this section "prescribed authority" Taxation 
5 	 means— 	 of land 

owned by 
certain 
authorities. 



Act No. 	, 1975. 	 14 

Land Tax Management (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE 3—continued. 

AMENDMENTS TO PART III OF THE LAND TAX MANAGEMENT 
ACT, 1956—continued. 

(ii) was so redeveloped by a lessee from 
5 
	 that Authority and would be exempt 

from taxation under this Act if it 
were owned by that lessee, 

and, as so redeveloped, is used solely for 
residential purposes. 

10 	 101). (1) In this section "prescribed authority" Taxation 
means— 	 of land 

owned 
by 

the Albury—Wodonga (New South Wales) cestatutory Corporation ; 	 corpora- 
tions. 

a corporation constituted under section 4 
15 of the Growth Centres (Development Cor-

porations) Act, 1974; or 

the New South Wales Planning and 
Environment Commission in respect of the 
development of the Sydney South West 
Sector. 

(2) Nothing in this Act operates to exempt 
from taxation under this Act any land owned by 
a prescribed authority that is not— 

land solely occupied by the authority as 
25 	 offices from which to exercise and perform 

its powers, authorities, duties and functions ; 
or 

land held or used by the authority for resi-
dential purposes. 

SCHEDULE 

20 



Act No. 	, 1975. 	 15 

Land Tax Management (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE 3—continued. 

AMENDMENTS TO PART III OF THE LAND TAX MANAGEMENT 
ACT, 1956—continued. 

10E. ( 1 ) Nothing in this Act operates to exempt Taxation 
5 	from taxation under this Act any land owned by any e 

The Housing Commission of New South Wales or for 
the New South Wales Planning and Environment atr 
Commission or any other corporation for the pur- council. 
poses of the Urban Land Council being land (other 

10 	than land held for open space purposes) held for 
development. 

SCHEDULE 4. 	 Sec. 4. 
AMENDMENTS OF PART IV OF THE LAND TAX MANAGEMENT 

ACT, 1956. 

15 (1) Section 27 (3A)— 
After "unit" where firstly occurring, insert ", or a 

flat that is not a residential unit,". 

(2) Section 27 (3A) (a)— 
After "1956", insert ", or in respect of that flat under 

20 	section 3c of that Act". 

SCHEDULE 5. 	 Sec. 4. 
AMENDMENTS OF PART VI OF THE LAND TAX MANAGEMENT 

ACT, 1956. 
Section 50 (1A)—(1D)- 

25 	After section 50 (1), insert : — 
(1A) Where section 10 (1) (u) or 10 (5) ceases to 

apply to or in respect of land by reason only that section 
10 (1) (u) (ii) ceases to apply and the Board is satisfied 

SCHEDULE 



Act No. 	, 1975. 	 16 

Land Tax Management (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE 5—continued. 

AMENDMENTS OF PART VI OF THE LAND TAX MANAGEMENT 
ACT, 1956—continued. 

that the owner of the land is justified in not proceeding 
5 

	

	to subdivide the land, the Board may defer payment of 
the amount of any land tax leviable or payable in respect 
of that land in excess of the amount that would have been 
payable had section 10 (1) (u) (ii) not ceased to apply 
to and in respect of the land. 

10 	(1B) Subsection (1A) ceases to apply in respect of 
any land if— 

(a) the Board is satisfied that the owner of the land 
is no longer justified in not proceeding to sub-
divide the land ; or 

15 	(b) any part of the land is sold or otherwise disposed 
of. 

(1c) Where, pursuant to subsection (1B) (b), an 
owner of land ceases to be entitled to a postponement 
of land tax he shall, within one month after ceasing to 

20 	be so entitled, notify the Commissioner accordingly. 

( 1D) Where a parcel of land would, but for exceeding 
2,100 square metres in area, be exempted by the opera-
tion of section 10 (1) (r) from taxation under this Act, 
the Board may, if it is satisfied that the owner, while 

25 

	

	not prevented by a planning scheme authorised by or 
under an Act from subdividing the land, is prevented 
from doing so by other circumstances beyond his control 
that are of a permanent character, waive payment of 
the land tax wholly or in part. 

SCHEDULE 



Act No. 	, 1975. 	 17 

Land Tax Management (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE 6. 	 sec. 4. 

AMENDMENTS TO PART VII OF THE LAND TAX MANAGE-
MENT ACT, 1956. 

Section 54 (1)- 

5 	Omit "For the purposes of this Act", insert instead 
"For the purposes of this Act, but subject to this sec-
tion,". 

Section 54 (1AA), (lAB)— 

After section 54 (1), insert :- 

10 	 ( IAA) Notwithstanding subsection (1), but 
subject to subsection (1D), where— 

a supplementary valuation of land to which 
subsection (1) (d) applies has been made 
by the Valuer-General on or after the first 

15 

	

	 day of a year for which land tax is being 
levied ; 

that valuation is included in a supplemen-
tary list which includes in relation to that 
land an amount referred to in section 61A 

20 

	

	 of the Valuation of Land Act, 1916, as a 
rating and taxing basis ; and 

the amount of that rating and taxing basis 
was determined as at the first day of the 
year in which the last general valuation was 

521—B 	 SCHEDULE 

• 



Act No. 	, 1975. 	 18 

Land Tax Management (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE 6—continued. 
AMENDMENTS TO PART VII OF THE LAND TAX MANAGEMENT 

ACT, 1956—continued. 
furnished prior to the first day of a year 

5 	 for which land tax is being levied, 

the unimproved value of the land for the purposes 
of this Act is, in respect of the year referred to in 
paragraph (a), the amount of the rating and taxing 
basis referred to in paragraph (b). 

10 	 (1AB) Notwithstanding subsection (1), but sub-
ject to subsection (1D) , where— 

a supplementary valuation of land to which 
subsection (1) (d) applies has been made 
by the Valuer-General on or after the first 

15 	 day of a year for which land tax is being 
levied; 

the unimproved value of the land included 
in that valuation was determined under 
section 14A of the Valuation of Land Act, 

20 	 1916; and 

that unimproved value was determined as 
at the first day of the year in which the 
last general valuation commenced before 
the first day of a year for which land tax 

25 	 is being levied, 

the unimproved value of the land for the purposes 
of this Act is, in respect of the year referred to in 
paragraph (a), the unimproved value referred to in 
paragraph (b). 

30 (3) Section 54 (1B) (b) — 

After "Valuer-General", insert "as at a date earlier 
than 1st January, 1973". 

SCHEDULE 



Act No. 	, 1975. 	 19 

Land Tax Management (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE 6—continued. 

AMENDMENTS TO PART VII OF THE LAND TAX MANAGEMENT 
ACT, 1956—continued. 

Section 54 (1B)- 

5 	After section 54 (1B) (b), insert :— 

(ba) where the valuation is made by the Valuer-
General as at 1st January, 1973, or a later 
date— 

(i) an unimproved value determined pur- 
1 0 

	

	 suant to section 14A (1) (b) (iv) of the 
Valuation of Land Act, 1916, as if the 
land valued had been sold, conveyed or 
resumed on the date as at which the 
valuation is made ; and 

15 	 (ii) any allowance referred to in paragraph 
(b) (ii) ; 

Section 54 (1c) (a)— 
Omit "or" where secondly occurring. 

Section 54 (1c) (b)- 
20 	Omit "land.", insert instead :— 

land ; or 

(c) an unimproved value has been furnished pursuant 
to subsection (1B) (ba) (i), that unimproved 
value shall, subject to subsection (1D), be 

25 

	

	 deemed, for the purposes of this Act, to be the 
unimproved value of the land. 

Section 54 (1D)— 
After "(1)" where secondly and thirdly occurring, 

insert "(1AA), (1AB),". 

SCHEDULE 



Act No. 	, 1975. 	 20 

Land Tax Management (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE 6—continued. 

AMENDMENTS TO PART VII OF THE LAND TAX MANAGEMENT 
ACT, 1956—continued. 

Section 54 (4A)- 

5 	After section 54 (4A) (b), insert :— 
(ba) of an unimproved value under subsection (1B) 

(ba) (i) shall be subject to objection in the same 
manner as if it had been determined in accord-
ance with section 14A (1) (b) (iv) of the 

10 	 Valuation of Land Act, 1916; 

Section 54 (4A) (c)— 
Omit "subparagraph (ii) of paragraph (b) of sub-

section (1B)", insert instead "subsection (1B) (b) (ii) 
or (1B) (ba) (ii)". 

BY AUTHORITY 
D. WEST, GOVERNMENT PRINTER, NEW SOUTH WALES-1975 



• 

PEW fi)outb late. 

ANNO VICESIMO QUARTO 

ELIZABETILE II REGINJE 
* * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * 

Act No. 97, 1975. 

An Act to alter the incidence of land tax in certain 
respects and to revise the level at which the general 
exemption from land tax applies; for these and other 
purposes to amend the Land Tax Management Act, , 
1956. [Assented to, 17th December, 1975.1 

BE 

• 

P 4926—A 	[24cJ 



2 	 Act No. 97, 1975. 

 

Land Tax Management (Amendment). 

 

 

BE it enacted by the Queen's Most Excellent Majesty, by 
and with the advice and consent of the Legislative 

Council and Legislative Assembly of New South Wales in 
Parliament assembled, and by the authority of the same, as 
follows:- 

 

Short 
title. 

Commence-
meat. 

This Act may be cited as the "Land Tax Management 
(Amendment) Act, 1975". 

(1) Section 1 and this section commence on the date 
of assent to this Act. 

Section 3 shall be deemed to have commenced on 
31st December, 1974. 

Section 4 commences on 31st December, 1975. 

Amend-
ment of 
Act No. 26, 
1956. 

Further 
amend-
ment of 
Act No. 26, 
1956. 

The Land Tax Management Act, 1956, is amended 
in the manner specified in Schedule 1. 

The Land Tax Management Act, 1956, is further 
amended in the manner specified in Schedules 2-6, both 
inclusive. 

Sec. 3. 	 SCHEDULE 1. 

AMENDMENT OF LAND TAX MANAGEMENT ACT, 1956. 

(1) Section 10 (1) (s)— 
Omit "declared.", insert instead :— 

declared ; 
(t) with respect to taxation leviable or payable in 

respect of the year commencing on 1st January, 
1975, or any succeeding year, land owned by a 
rural society registered under the Co-operation 

SCHEDULE 



3 Act No. 97, 1975. 

Land Tax Management (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE 1—continued. 

AMENDMENT OF LAND TAX MANAGEMENT ACT, 
1956—continued. 

Act, 1923, other than land in respect of which 
the society is jointly assessable with a public 
company that is not a company to which a 
declaration under paragraph (s) relates; 

Section 10 (113)— 

After "1961", insert ", or is a recognised company 
within the meaning of that Act". 

Section 10 (1c)— 

Omit "paragraphs (q) and (s) of subsection (1)", 
insert instead "subsection (1) (q), (s) and (t)". 

SCHEDULE 2. 	 Sec. 4. 
AMENDMENTS TO PART I OF THE LAND TAX MANAGEMENT 

ACT, 1956. 

Section 3 (1), definition of "Flat"— 

After "dwelling", insert "whether the room or suite 
is a detached building or forms part of a building". 

Section 3 (1), definition of "Land used for primary 
production"— 

Omit "or" where fourthly occurring. 

SCHEDULE 



4 	 Act No. 97, 1975. 

Land Tax Management (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE 2—continued. 

AMENDMENTS TO PART I OF THE LAND TAX MANAGEMENT 
AcT, 1956—continued. 

(3) Section 3 (1), definition of "Land used for primary 
production"— 

Omit "honey,", insert instead :— 
honey; 
a nursery within the meaning of the Horticultural 
Stock and Nurseries Act, 1969, being a nursery 
in respect of which a person is registered under 
that Act as a nurseryman ; or 
the propagation for sale of mushrooms, orchids 
or flowers, 

(4) Section 3 (1), definition of "Residential unit"— 

Omit "for residential purposes", insert instead "as his 
principal place of residence". 

(5) Section 3 (2)— 

Omit "for residential purposes" where firstly and 
secondly occurring, insert instead "as his principal place 
of residence". 

(6) Section 3 (3)— 

After section 3 (2), insert :— 
(3) For the purposes of this Act, in respect of 

any year in respect of which taxation is leviable or 
payable, land is not used or occupied as the 
principal place of residence of a person unless— 

(a) that land and no other land has, since before 
the first day of July that last preceded the 

SCHEDULE 



Act No. 97, 1975. 	 5 

Land Tax Management (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE 2—continued. 

AMENDMENTS TO PART I OF THE LAND TAX MANAGEMENT 
ACT, 1956—continued. 

commencement of that year, been con-
tinuously used and occupied by that person 
for residential purposes and for no other 
purpose; or 

(b) in any other case, the Commissioner is 
satisfied that the land is used and occupied 
by that person as his principal place of 
residence. 

SCHEDULE 3. 	 Sec. 4. 

AMENDMENTS TO PART III OF THE LAND TAX MANAGEMENT 
ACT, 1956. 

(1) (a) Section 9 (3) (b)— 
Omit "twenty-one thousand dollars" wherever 

occurring, insert instead "thirty thousand dollars". 

Section 9 (3) (b)— 
Omit "twenty-eight thousand dollars", insert in-

stead "sixty thousand dollars". 

Section 9 (3) (b)— 
Omit "three dollars", insert instead "one dollar". 

(d) Section 9 (3) (c)— 
Omit "twenty-one thousand dollars" wherever 

occurring, insert instead "thirty thousand dollars". 

SCHEDULE 



6 	 Act No. 97, 1975. 

Land Tax Management (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE 3—continued. 

AMENDMENTS TO PART III OF THE LAND TAX MANAGEMENT 
ACT, 1956—continued. 

(2) (a) Section 10 (1)— 

Omit "shall be exempt", insert instead "shall, 
subject to sections 10B, 10c, 10D and 10E, be 
exempt". 

Section 10 (1) (b)— 

Omit "as amended by subsequent Acts", insert 
instead "or a pastures protection board constituted 
under the Pastures Protection Act, 1934". 

Section 10 (1) (c)— 

Omit ", or any private hospital or rest home 
licensed under the Private Hospitals Act, 1908, as 
amended by subsequent Acts". 

Section 10 (1) (f)— 

After "land" wherever occurring, insert :— 
(not being land used to make a pecuniary 
profit). 

Section 10 (1) (g)— 

After section 10 (1) (g) (vii), insert :— 
a private hospital or nursing home within 
the meaning of the Private Hospitals Act, 
1908, not carried on for pecuniary profit; 
an authorised hospital within the meaning 
of the Mental Health Act, 1958, not carried 
on for pecuniary profit; 

SCHEDULE 



7 Act No. 97, 1975. 

Land Tax Management (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE 3—continued. 

AMENDMENTS TO PART III OF THE LAND TAX MANAGEMENT 
ACT, 1956—continued. 

(f) Section 10 (1) (r)— 
Omit "1974", insert instead "1976". 

(g) Section 10 (1) (r)— 
Omit "for residential purposes" wherever occur-

ring, insert instead "as his principal place of 
residence". 

(h) Section 10 (1) (r)— 
Omit "for those purposes" wherever occurring, 

insert instead "as his principal place of residence". 

(i) Section 10 (1)— 

After section 10 (1) (t), insert :— 
(u) with respect to taxation leviable or payable 

in respect of the year commencing on 1st 
January, 1976, or any succeeding year—a 
parcel of land exceeding 2,100 square 
metres in area, but not exceeding 2 hectares 
in area, where— 

paragraph (r) (ii) would apply to 
the land if it did not exceed 2,100 
square metres in area ; and 
subdivision of the land is, imme-
diately before the commencement 
of that year, prevented by a planning 
scheme authorised by or under an 
Act. 

(j) Section 10 (1D) (b) (i)— 
Omit "strata lots", insert instead "lots under the 

Strata Titles Act, 1973,". 
SCHEDULE 



Act No. 97, 1975. 

  

 

  
  

Land Tax Management (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE 3—continued. 
AMENDMENTS TO PART III OF THE LAND TAX MANAGEMENT 

ACT, 1956—continued. 

(k) Section 10 (1E), (lEA)— 

Omit section 10 (1E), insert instead— 

(1E) In subsection (1) (r) "strata lot" 
means a lot under the Strata Titles Act, 1973, 
not being a lot that— 

is owned by a company; 

is owned by or on behalf of a company 
and is land of which a mortgagee or 
person by way of security for money is 
in possession ; 

is held by a trustee for or on behalf of 
a company; or 

in respect of which a company is jointly 
assessed with any other person. 

(l EA) In subsections (1D) and (1E) 
"company" does not include a trustee company 
acting in its representative capacity. 

(1) Section 10 (1F)— 

Omit "owner for residential purposes", insert 
instead "owner as his principal place of residence". 

(m) Section 10 (1F)— 

Omit "for those purposes", insert instead "as his 
principal place of residence". 

SCHEDULE 



9 Act No. 97, 1975. 

Land Tax Management (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE 3—continued. 

AMENDMENTS TO PART III OF THE LAND TAX MANAGEMENT 
ACT, 1956—continued. 

(n) Section 10 (2)— 

Omit section 10 (2), insert instead :—

(2) Where— 

a building is erected on land to which 
the provisions of subsection (1) (g) 
(iii) or of section 10B (2), 10c (a) or 
10D (2) would apply if the building 
were solely occupied by the persons or 
bodies referred to in those provisions ; 
and 

the building is partly used or occupied, 
or is intended to be partly used or 
occupied, by persons other than those 
persons or bodies, 

the unimproved value of that land shall, for 
the purposes of the assessment of those persons 
or bodies, be reduced to an amount which 
bears the same proportion to that unimproved 
value as the rental value of the part so used or 
occupied, or intended to be so used or 
occupied, by those other persons bears to the 
total rental value of the building. 

(o) Section 10 (5)— 

After section 10 (4), insert— 
(5) Where a parcel of land would, but for 

the fact that it exceeds 2 hectares in area, be 
exempted under subsection (1) (u), the unim-
proved value of that parcel shall, for assess-
ment purposes, be reduced by an amount that 

SCHEDULE 



10 

  

Act No. 97, 1975. 

    

Refund of 
stamp duty 
on certain 
con-
veyances. 

Land Tax Management (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE 3—continued. 

AMENDMENTS TO PART III OF THE LAND TAX MANAGEMENT 
ACT, 1956—continued. 

bears to that unimproved value the same 
proportion as 2 hectares bears to the area of 
that parcel. 

(3) Sections 10A-10E— 

After section 10, insert- 

10A. (1) In this section— 

"convey" includes transfer; 

"corporation" has the same meaning as it has 
in the Companies Act, 1961 ; 

"prescribed shareholder" in relation to a corpora-
tion means— 

a shareholder (not being a corpora-
tion) in the corporation who, dis-
regarding any proxies or other 
authorities to vote held by him, is 
entitled at general meetings of the 
corporation to exercise voting 
rights that together amount to 
more than one-half of the total 
voting rights of all shareholders 
entitled to vote at general meetings 
of the corporation ; 
a shareholder (not being a corpora-
tion) in the corporation where, if 
no proxies or other authorities to 
vote are allowed, no shareholder in 
the corporation is entitled at general 
meetings of the corporation to 
exercise more voting rights than 
any other shareholder in the 
corporation. 

SCHEDULE 



Act No. 97, 1975. 	 11 

Land Tax Management (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE 3—continued. 

AMENDMENTS TO PART III OF THE LAND TAX MANAGEMENT 
ACT, 1956—continued. 

(2) This section applies to a person in 
respect of land where— 

at the time the conveyance referred to in 
paragraph (b) took effect that person was 
a prescribed shareholder in the corporation 
so referred to; 

the land was owned by a corporation on 
31st December, 1975, and was conveyed 
after that date by the corporation to that 
person as equitable owner, or to that 
person and any other prescribed shareholder 
or shareholders in the corporation jointly 
as equitable owners, after that date; and 

the land was, at all times during the period 
that commenced on 31st December, 1975, 
and ended when the conveyance took effect, 
used and occupied by that person as his 
principal place of residence and for no 
other purpose; and 

if the conveyance had taken effect on the 
thirty-first day of December that last pre-
ceded the date on which it actually took 
effect— 

the land conveyed would, by the 
operation of section 10 (1) (r) or 
(u) be exempt from land tax in 
respect of the year in which the con-
veyance actually took effect ; or 

land tax that, but for section 10 
(4) or (5), would be leviable or 
payable in respect of the land for 

SCHEDULE 



12 	 Act No. 97, 1975. 

Land Tax Management (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE 3—continued. 

AMENDMENTS TO PART III OF THE LAND TAX MANAGEMENT 
ACT, 1956—continued. 

the year in which the conveyance 
actually took effect would be 
reduced by the operation of section 
10 (4) or (5). 

For the purpose of assessing land tax 
in respect of land referred to in subsection (2) that 
is conveyed on or before 31st December, 1976, the 
conveyance of that land so referred to shall be 
deemed to have taken effect on 31st December, 
1975. 

On application made by a person to 
whom this section applies, the Commissioner shall, 
out of money provided by Parliament, pay to that 
person an amount certified by the Commissioner of 
Stamp Duties to be the difference between— 

(a) the amount of duty under the Stamp Duties 
Act, 1920, paid and not refunded— 

on the agreement for the conveyance 
to that person of the land in respect 
of which this section applies ; or 

where there is no such agreement 
—on that conveyance; and 

(b) the amount of duty that would have been 
payable under that Act had that agreement 
or conveyance, as the case may be, been an 
agreement under seal referred to in para-
graph (2) of the matter relating to an 
Agreement or Memorandum of an Agree-
ment in the Second Schedule to the Stamp 
Duties Act, 1920. 

SCHEDULE 



Act No. 97, 1975. 	 13 

Land Tax Management (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE 3—continued. 

AMENDMENTS TO PART III OF THE LAND TAX MANAGEMENT 
ACT, 1956—continued. 

10B. (1) In this section "prescribed authority" Taxation 
of land means— 	 owned by 
certain 

the State Superannuation Board ; 	authorities.  

the Local Government Superannuation 
Board ; 
the Transport Retirement Board; 
the New South Wales Retirement Board; 
and 
the Builders Licensing Board. 

(2) Nothing in this Act operates to 
exempt from taxation under this Act any land 
owned by a prescribed authority that is not land 
solely occupied by the authority as offices from 
which to exercise and perform its powers, authori-
ties, duties and functions. 

10c. Nothing in this Act operates to exempt from Taxation 
taxation under this Act any building site re- Vire' 
developed in accordance with a scheme under Part by 
IV of the Sydney Cove Redevelopment Authority Sydney 

Act, 1968, that is not— 	 Redevelop- 
ment 
Authority. 

a building site solely occupied by the Sydney 
Cove Redevelopment Authority as offices 
from which to exercise and perform its 
powers, authorities, duties and functions ; or 

a building site that— 
(i) was so redeveloped by that Auth- 

ority ; or 
SCHEDULE 



14 	 Act No. 97, 1975. 

Land Tax Management (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE 3—continued. 

AMENDMENTS TO PART III OF THE LAND TAX MANAGEMENT 
ACT, 1956—continued. 

(ii) was so redeveloped by a lessee from 
that Authority and would be exempt 
from taxation under this Act if it 
were owned by that lessee, 

and, as so redeveloped, is used solely for 
residential purposes. 

Taxation 
of land 
owned 
by 
certain 
statutory 
corpora- 
tions. 

10D. (1) In this section "prescribed authority" 
means— 

the Albury—Wodonga (New South Wales) 
Corporation; 

a corporation constituted under section 4 
of the Growth Centres (Development Cor-
porations) Act, 1974; or 

the New South Wales Planning and 
Environment Commission in respect of the 
development of the Sydney South West 
Sector. 

(2) Nothing in this Act operates to exempt 
from taxation under this Act any land owned by 
a prescribed authority that is— 

occupied by the authority as offices from 
which to exercise and perform its powers, 
authorities, duties and functions unless the 
land is solely so occupied; or 

land leased by the authority for commercial 
or industrial purposes. 

SCHEDULE 



Act No. 97, 1975. 	 15 

Land Tax Management (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE 3—continued. 

AMENDMENTS TO PART III OF THE LAND TAX MANAGEMENT 
ACT, 1956—continued. 

10E. Nothing in this Act operates to exempt Taxation 
from taxation under this Act any land owned by oacq

f lad;l
ed  

The Housing Commission of New South Wales or for 
the New South Wales Planning and Environment urbr 
Commission or any other corporation for the pur- council. 
poses of the Urban Land Council being land (other 
than land held for open space purposes) held for 
development. 

SCHEDULE 4. 	 sec. 4. 

AMENDMENTS OF PART IV OF THE LAND TAX MANAGEMENT 
ACT, 1956. 

Section 27 (3A)— 

After "unit" where firstly occurring, insert ", or a 
flat that is not a residential unit,". 

Section 27 (3A) (a)— 

After "1956", insert ", or in respect of that flat under 
section 3c of that Act". 

SCHEDULE 5. 	 Sec. 4. 
AMENDMENTS OF PART VI OF THE LAND TAX MANAGEMENT 

ACT, 1956. 

Section 50 (1A)—(1D)— 

After section 50 (1), insert :— 

(1A) Where section 10 (1) (u) or 10 (5) ceases to 
apply to or in respect of land by reason only that section 
10 (1) (u) (ii) ceases to apply and the Board is satisfied 

SCHEDULE 



16 	 Act No. 97, 1975. 

Land Tax Management (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE 5—continued. 

AMENDMENTS OF PART VI OF THE LAND TAX MANAGEMENT 
ACT, 1956—continued. 

that the owner of the land is justified in not proceeding 
to subdivide the land, the Board may defer payment of 
the amount of any land tax leviable or payable in respect 
of that land in excess of the amount that would have been 
payable had section 10 (1) (u) (ii) not ceased to apply 
to and in respect of the land. 

(1B) Subsection (1A) ceases to apply in respect of 
any land if— 

the Board is satisfied that the owner of the land 
is no longer justified in not proceeding to sub-
divide the land ; or 

any part of the land is sold or otherwise disposed 
of. 

(1c) Where, pursuant to subsection (1B) (b), an 
owner of land ceases to be entitled to a postponement 
of land tax he shall, within one month after ceasing to 
be so entitled, notify the Commissioner accordingly. 

(1D) Where a parcel of land would, but for exceeding 
2,100 square metres in area, be exempted by the opera-
tion of section 10 (1) (r) from taxation under this Act, 
the Board may, if it is satisfied that the owner, while 
not prevented by a planning scheme authorised by or 
under an Act from subdividing the land, is prevented 
from doing so by other circumstances beyond his control 
that are of a permanent character, waive payment of 
the land tax wholly or in part. 

SCHEDULE 



Act No. 97, 1975. 	 17 

Land Tax Management (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE 6. 	 Sec. 4. 

AMENDMENTS TO PART VII OF THE LAND TAX MANAGE- 
MENT ACT, 1956. 

Section 54 (1)— 

Omit "For the purposes of this Act", insert instead 
"For the purposes of this Act, but subject to this sec-
tion,". 

Section 54 (1AA), (1AB)— 

After section 54 (1), insert :— 

(IAA) Notwithstanding subsection (1), but 
subject to subsection (1D), where— 

(a) a supplementary valuation of land to which 
subsection (1) (d) applies has been made 
by the Valuer-General on or after the first 
day of a year for which land tax is being 
levied; 

w 	 (b) that valuation is included in a supplemen- 
tary list which includes in relation to that 
land an amount referred to in section 61A 

i 	 of the Valuation of Land Act, 1916, as a 
rating and taxing basis ; and 

(c) the amount of that rating and taxing basis 
was determined as at the first day of the 
year in which the last general valuation was 

B 	 SCHEDULE 



18 	 Act No. 97, 1975. 

Land Tax Management (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE 6—continued. 
AMENDMENTS TO PART VII OF THE LAND TAX MANAGEMENT 

ACT, 1956—continued. 
furnished prior to the first day of a year 
for which land tax is being levied, 

the unimproved value of the land for the purposes 
of this Act is, in respect of the year referred to in 
paragraph (a), the amount of the rating and taxing 
basis referred to in paragraph (b). 

( lAB) Notwithstanding subsection (1), but sub-
ject to subsection (1D), where— 

a supplementary valuation of land to which 
subsection (1) (d) applies has been made 
by the Valuer-General on or after the first 
day of a year for which land tax is being 
levied; 

the unimproved value of the land included 
in that valuation was determined under 
section 14A of the Valuation of Land Act, 
1916; and 

that unimproved value was determined as 
at the first day of the year in which the 
last general valuation commenced before 
the first day of a year for which land tax 
is being levied, 

the unimproved value of the land for the purposes 
of this Act is, in respect of the year referred to in 
paragraph (a), the unimproved value referred to in 
paragraph (b). 

(3) Section 54 (1B) (b)— 

After "Valuer-General", insert "as at a date earlier 
than 1st January, 1973". 

SCHEDULE 



Act No. 97, 1975. 	 19 

Land Tax Management (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE 6—continued. 

AMENDMENTS TO PART VII OF THE LAND TAX MANAGEMENT 
ACT, 1956—continued. 

(4) Section 54 (1B)— 

After section 54 (1B) (b), insert :— 

(ba) where the valuation is made by the Valuer-
General as at 1st January, 1973, or a later 
date— 

an unimproved value determined pur-
suant to section 14A (1) (b) (iv) of the 
Valuation of Land Act, 1916, as if the 
land valued had been sold, conveyed or 
resumed on the date as at which the 
valuation is made; and 

any allowance referred to in paragraph 
(b) (ii) ; 

(5) Section 54 (1c) (a)— 
Omit "or" where secondly occurring. 

(6) Section 54 (1c) (b)— 
Omit "land.", insert instead :— 

land; or 

(c) an unimproved value has been furnished pursuant 
to subsection (1B) (ba) (i), that unimproved 
value shall, subject to subsection (1D), be 
deemed, for the purposes of this Act, to be the 
unimproved value of the land. 

(7) Section 54 (1D)— 
After "(1)" where secondly and thirdly occurring, 

insert "(1AA), (1AB),". 

SCHEDULE 



20 	 Act No. 97, 1975. 

Land Tax Management (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE 6—continued. 

AMENDMENTS TO PART VII OF THE LAND TAX MANAGEMENT 
ACT, 1956—continued. 

Section 54 (4A)— 
After section 54 (4A) (b), insert :— 

(ba) of an unimproved value under subsection (1B) 
(ba) (i) shall be subject to objection in the same 
manner as if it had been determined in accord-
ance with section 14A (1) (b) (iv) of the 
Valuation of Land Act, 1916; 

Section 54 (4A) (c)— 
Omit "subparagraph (ii) of paragraph (b) of sub-

section (1B)", insert instead "subsection (1B) (b) (ii) 
or (1B) (ba) (ii)". 

BY AUTHORITY 
D. WEST, GOVERNMENT PRINTER, NEW SOUTH WALES-1976 

1 

• 

t 



I certify that this PUBLIC BILL, which originated in the LEGISLA-
TIVE ASSEMBLY, has finally passed the LEGISLATIVE COUNCIL and the 
LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY Of NEW SOUTH WALES. 

R. E. WARD, 
Clerk of the Legislative Assembly. 

Legislative Assembly Chamber, 
Sydney, 27 November, 1975. 

Delp *otttb V.Ziate5 

ANNO VICESIMO QUARTO 

ELIZABETHJE 11 
* * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * 

Act No. 97, 1975. 

An Act to alter the incidence of land tax in certain 
respects and to revise the level at which the general 
exemption from land tax applies; for these and other 
purposes to amend the Land Tax Management Act, 
1956. [Assented to, 17th December, 1975.1 

BE 

I have examined this Bill, and find it to correspond in all respects 
with the Bill as finally passed by both Houses. 

J. H. BROWN, 
Chairman of Committees of the Legislative Assembly. 



2 	 Act No. 97, 1975. 

 

Land Tax Management (Amendment). 

 

 

BE it enacted by the Queen's Most Excellent Majesty, by 
and with the advice and consent of the Legislative 

Council and Legislative Assembly of New South Wales in 
Parliament assembled, and by the authority of the same, as 
follows:- 

 

Short 
title. 

Commence-
ment. 

This Act may be cited as the "Land Tax Management 
(Amendment) Act, 1975". 

(1) Section 1 and this section commence on the date 
of assent to this Act. 

Section 3 shall be deemed to have commenced on 
31st December, 1974. 

Section 4 commences on 31st December, 1975. 

Amend- 	3. The Land Tax Management Act, 1956, is amended ment of 	in the manner specified in Schedule 1. Act No. 26, 
1956. 

Further 	4. The Land Tax Management Act, 1956, is further amend- 	amended in the manner specified in Schedules 2-6, both ment of 
Act No. 26, inclusive. 
1956. 

Sec. 3. 	 SCHEDULE 1. 
AMENDMENT OF LAND TAX MANAGEMENT ACT, 1956. 

(1) Section 10 (1) (s)— 
Omit "declared.", insert instead :— 

declared ; 
(t) with respect to taxation leviable or payable in 

respect of the year commencing on 1st January, 
1975, or any succeeding year, land owned by a 
rural society registered under the Co-operation 

SCHEDULE 



Act No. 97, 1975. 	 3 

Land Tax Management (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE 1—continued. 

AMENDMENT OF LAND TAX MANAGEMENT ACT, 
1956—continued. 

Act, 1923, other than land in respect of which 
the society is jointly assessable with a public 
company that is not a company to which a 
declaration under paragraph (s) relates; 

Section 10 (1B)— 

After "1961", insert ", or is a recognised company 
within the meaning of that Act". 

Section 10 (1c)— 

Omit "paragraphs (q) and (s) of subsection (1)", 
insert instead "subsection (1) (q), (s) and (t)". 

SCHEDULE 2. 	 Sec. 4. 
AMENDMENTS TO PART I OF THE LAND TAX MANAGEMENT 

ACT, 1956. 

Section 3 (1), definition of "Flat"— 

After "dwelling", insert "whether the room or suite 
is a detached building or forms part of a building". 

Section 3 (1), definition of "Land used for primary 
production"— 

Omit "or" where fourthly occurring. 

SCHEDULE 



4 	 Act No. 97, 1975. 

Land Tax Management (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE 2—continued. 

AMENDMENTS TO PART I OF THE LAND TAX MANAGEMENT 
ACT, 1956—continued. 

(3) Section 3 (1), definition of "Land used for primary 
production"— 

Omit "honey,", insert instead :— 
honey; 
a nursery within the meaning of the Horticultural 
Stock and Nurseries Act, 1969, being a nursery 
in respect of which a person is registered under 
that Act as a nurseryman ; or 
the propagation for sale of mushrooms, orchids 
or flowers, 

(4) Section 3 (1), definition of "Residential unit"— 

Omit "for residential purposes", insert instead "as his 
principal place of residence". 

(5) Section 3 (2)— 

Omit "for residential purposes" where firstly and 
secondly occurring, insert instead "as his principal place 
of residence". 

(6) Section 3 (3)— 

After section 3 (2), insert :— 
(3) For the purposes of this Act, in respect of 

any year in respect of which taxation is leviable or 
payable, land is not used or occupied as the 
principal place of residence of a person unless— 

(a) that land and no other land has, since before 
the first day of July that last preceded the 

SCHEDULE 



5 Act No. 97, 1975. 

Land Tax Management (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE 2—continued. 

AMENDMENTS TO PART I OF THE LAND TAX MANAGEMENT 
ACT, 1956—continued. 

commencement of that year, been con-
tinuously used and occupied by that person 
for residential purposes and for no other 
purpose; or 

(b) in any other case, the Commissioner is 
satisfied that the land is used and occupied 
by that person as his principal place of 
residence. 

SCHEDULE 3. 	 Sec. 4. 

AMENDMENTS TO PART III OF THE LAND TAX MANAGEMENT 
ACT, 1956. 

(1) (a) Section 9 (3) (b)— 
Omit "twenty-one thousand dollars" wherever 

occurring, insert instead "thirty thousand dollars". 

Section 9 (3) (b)— 
Omit "twenty-eight thousand dollars", insert in-

stead "sixty thousand dollars". 

Section 9 (3) (b)— 
Omit "three dollars", insert instead "one dollar". 

(d) Section 9 (3) (c)— 
Omit "twenty-one thousand dollars" wherever 

occurring, insert instead "thirty thousand dollars". 

SCHEDULE 



6 	 Act No. 97, 1975. 

Land Tax Management (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE 3—continued. 

AMENDMENTS TO PART III OF THE LAND TAX MANAGEMENT 
ACT, 1956—continued. 

(2) (a) Section 10 (1)— 

Omit "shall be exempt", insert instead "shall, 
subject to sections 10B, 10c, 10D and 10E, be 
exempt". 

Section 10 (1) (b)— 

Omit "as amended by subsequent Acts", insert 
instead "or a pastures protection board constituted 
under the Pastures Protection Act, 1934". 

Section 10 (1) (c)— 

Omit ", or any private hospital or rest home 
licensed under the Private Hospitals Act, 1908, as 
amended by subsequent Acts". 

Section 10 (1) (f)— 

After "land" wherever occurring, insert :— 
(not being land used to make a pecuniary 
profit). 

Section 10 (1) (g)— 

After section 10 (1) (g) (vii), insert :— 
a private hospital or nursing home within 
the meaning of the Private Hospitals Act, 
1908, not carried on for pecuniary profit; 
an authorised hospital within the meaning 
of the Mental Health Act, 1958, not carried 
on for pecuniary profit; 

SCHEDULE 



7 Act No. 97, 1975. 

Land Tax Management (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE 3—continued. 

AMENDMENTS TO PART III OF THE LAND TAX MANAGEMENT 
ACT, 1956—continued. 

(f) Section 10 (1) (r)— 
Omit "1974", insert instead "1976". 

(g) Section 10 (1) (r)— 
Omit "for residential purposes" wherever occur-

ring, insert instead "as his principal place of 
residence". 

(h) Section 10 (1) (r)— 
Omit "for those purposes" wherever occurring, 

insert instead "as his principal place of residence". 

(i) Section 10 (1)— 

After section 10 (1) (t), insert :— 
(u) with respect to taxation leviable or payable 

in respect of the year commencing on 1st 
January, 1976, or any succeeding year—a 
parcel of land exceeding 2,100 square 
metres in area, but not exceeding 2 hectares 
in area, where— 

paragraph (r) (ii) would apply to 
the land if it did not exceed 2,100 
square metres in area; and 
subdivision of the land is, imme-
diately before the commencement 
of that year, prevented by a planning 
scheme authorised by or under an 
Act. 

(j) Section 10 (1D) (b) (i)— 
Omit "strata lots", insert instead "lots under the 

Strata Titles Act, 1973,". 
SCHEDULE 



8 	 Act No. 97, 1975. 

Land Tax Management (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE 3—continued. 

AMENDMENTS TO PART III OF THE LAND TAX MANAGEMENT 
ACT, 1956—continued. 

(k) Section 10 (1E), (1EA)— 

Omit section 10 (1E), insert instead— 

(1E) In subsection (1) (r) "strata lot" 
means a lot under the Strata Titles Act, 1973, 
not being a lot that— 

is owned by a company; 

is owned by or on behalf of a company 
and is land of which a mortgagee or 
person by way of security for money is 
in possession ; 

is held by a trustee for or on behalf of 
a company; or 

in respect of which a company is jointly 
assessed with any other person. 

(1EA) In subsections (1D) and (1E) 
"company" does not include a trustee company 
acting in its representative capacity. 

(1) Section 10 (1F)— 

Omit "owner for residential purposes", insert 
instead "owner as his principal place of residence". 

(m) Section 10 (1F)— 

Omit "for those purposes", insert instead "as his 
principal place of residence". 

SCHEDULE 



9 Act No. 97, 1975. 

Land Tax Management (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE 3—continued. 

AMENDMENTS TO PART III OF THE LAND TAX MANAGEMENT 
ACT, 1956—continued. 

(n) Section 10 (2)— 

Omit section 10 (2), insert instead :—

(2) Where— 

a building is erected on land to which 
the provisions of subsection (1) (g) 
(iii) or of section 10B (2), 10c (a) or 
10D (2) would apply if the building 
were solely occupied by the persons or 
bodies referred to in those provisions ; 
and 

the building is partly used or occupied, 
or is intended to be partly used or 
occupied, by persons other than those 
persons or bodies, 

the unimproved value of that land shall, for 
the purposes of the assessment of those persons 
or bodies, be reduced to an amount which 
bears the same proportion to that unimproved 
value as the rental value of the part so used or 
occupied, or intended to be so used or 
occupied, by those other persons bears to the 
total rental value of the building. 

(o) Section 10 (5)— 

After section 10 (4), insert— 
(5) Where a parcel of land would, but for 

the fact that it exceeds 2 hectares in area, be 
exempted under subsection (1) (u), the unim-
proved value of that parcel shall, for assess-
ment purposes, be reduced by an amount that 

SCHEDULE 



10 	 Act No. 97, 1975. 

Land Tax Management (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE 3—continued. 

AMENDMENTS TO PART III OF THE LAND TAX MANAGEMENT 
ACT, 1956—continued. 

bears to that unimproved value the same 
proportion as 2 hectares bears to the area of 
that parcel. 

(3) Sections 10A-10E— 

After section 10, insert- 

Refund of 
stamp duty 
on certain 
con-
veyances. 

10A. (1) In this section— 
"convey" includes transfer ; 
"corporation" has the same meaning as it has 

in the Companies Act, 1961; 
"prescribed shareholder" in relation to a corpora-

tion means— 
a shareholder (not being a corpora-
tion) in the corporation who, dis-
regarding any proxies or other 
authorities to vote held by him, is 
entitled at general meetings of the 
corporation to exercise voting 
rights that together amount to 
more than one-half of the total 
voting rights of all shareholders 
entitled to vote at general meetings 
of the corporation ; 
a shareholder (not being a corpora-
tion) in the corporation where, if 
no proxies or other authorities to 
vote are allowed, no shareholder in 
the corporation is entitled at general 
meetings of the corporation to 
exercise more voting rights than 
any other shareholder in the 
corporation. 

SCHEDULE 



Act No. 97, 1975. 	 11 

Land Tax Management (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE 3—continued. 

AMENDMENTS TO PART III OF THE LAND TAX MANAGEMENT 
ACT, 1956—continued. 

(2) This section applies to a person in 
respect of land where— 

at the time the conveyance referred to in 
paragraph (b) took effect that person was 
a prescribed shareholder in the corporation 
so referred to; 

the land was owned by a corporation on 
31st December, 1975, and was conveyed 
after that date by the corporation to that 
person as equitable owner, or to that 
person and any other prescribed shareholder 
or shareholders in the corporation jointly 
as equitable owners, after that date; and 

the land was, at all times during the period 
that commenced on 31st December, 1975, 
and ended when the conveyance took effect, 
used and occupied by that person as his 
principal place of residence and for no 
other purpose; and 

if the conveyance had taken effect on the 
thirty-first day of December that last pre-
ceded the date on which it actually took 
effect— 

the land conveyed would, by the 
operation of section 10 (1) (r) or 
(u) be exempt from land tax in 
respect of the year in which the con-
veyance actually took effect ; or 

land tax that, but for section 10 
(4) or (5), would be leviable or 
payable in respect of the land for 

SCHEDULE 



12 	 Act No. 97, 1975. 

Land Tax Management (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE 3—continued. 

AMENDMENTS TO PART III OF THE LAND TAX MANAGEMENT 
ACT, 1956—continued. 

the year in which the conveyance 
actually took effect would be 
reduced by the operation of section 
10 (4) or (5). 

For the purpose of assessing land tax 
in respect of land referred to in subsection (2) that 
is conveyed on or before 31st December, 1976, the 
conveyance of that land so referred to shall be 
deemed to have taken effect on 31st December, 
1975. 

On application made by a person to 
whom this section applies, the Commissioner shall, 
out of money provided by Parliament, pay to that 
person an amount certified by the Commissioner of 
Stamp Duties to be the difference between— 

the amount of duty under the Stamp Duties 
Act, 1920, paid and not refunded— 

(i) on the agreement for the conveyance 
to that person of the land in respect 
of which this section applies; or 

where there is no such agreement 
—on that conveyance ; and 

the amount of duty that would have been 
payable under that Act had that agreement 
or conveyance, as the case may be, been an 
agreement under seal referred to in para-
graph (2) of the matter relating to an 
Agreement or Memorandum of an Agree-
ment in the Second Schedule to the Stamp 
Duties Act, 1920. 

SCHEDULE 



Act No. 97, 1975. 	 13 

Land Tax Management (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE 3—continued. 

AMENDMENTS TO PART III OF THE LAND TAX MANAGEMENT 
ACT, 1956—continued. 

10B. (1) In this section "prescribed authority" Taxation 
means— 	 of land 

owned by 
certain 
authorities. 

(2) Nothing in this Act operates to 
exempt from taxation under this Act any land 
owned by a prescribed authority that is not land 
solely occupied by the authority as offices from 
which to exercise and perform its powers, authori-
ties, duties and functions. 

10c. Nothing in this Act operates to exempt from Taxation 
taxation under this Act any building site re- Virel 
developed in accordance with a scheme under Part by 
IV of the Sydney Cove Redevelopment Authority cove" 
Act, 1968, that is not— 	 Redevelop- 

ment 
Authority. 

a building site solely occupied by the Sydney 
Cove Redevelopment Authority as offices 
from which to exercise and perform its 
powers, authorities, duties and functions ; or 
a building site that— 

(i) was so redeveloped by that Auth- 
ority ; or 

SCHEDULE 

the State Superannuation Board; 
the Local Government Superannuation 
Board ; 
the Transport Retirement Board; 
the New South Wales Retirement Board ; 
and 
the Builders Licensing Board. 



14 	 Act No. 97, 1975. 

Land Tax Management (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE 3—continued. 

AMENDMENTS TO PART III OF THE LAND TAX MANAGEMENT 
ACT, 1956—continued. 

(ii) was so redeveloped by a lessee from 
that Authority and would be exempt 
from taxation under this Act if it 
were owned by that lessee, 

and, as so redeveloped, is used solely for 
residential purposes. 

Taxation 
of land 
owned 
by 
certain 
statutory 
corpora- 
tions. 

10D. (1) In this section "prescribed authority" 
means— 

the Albury—Wodonga (New South Wales) 
Corporation ; 

a corporation constituted under section 4 
of the Growth Centres (Development Cor-
porations) Act, 1974; or 

the New South Wales Planning and 
Environment Commission in respect of the 
development of the Sydney South West 
Sector. 

(2) Nothing in this Act operates to exempt 
from taxation under this Act any land owned by 
a prescribed authority that is— 

occupied by the authority as offices from 
which to exercise and perform its powers, 
authorities, duties and functions unless the 
land is solely so occupied; or 

land leased by the authority for commercial 
or industrial purposes. 

SCHEDULE 



Act No. 97, 1975. 	 15 

Land Tax Management (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE 3—continued. 
AMENDMENTS TO PART III OF THE LAND TAX MANAGEMENT 

ACT, 1956—continued. 
10E. Nothing in this Act operates to exempt Taxation 

from taxation under this Act any land owned by =d 
The Housing Commission of New South Wales or for 
the New South Wales Planning and Environment 11arnbr  
Commission or any other corporation for the pur- Council. 
poses of the Urban Land Council being land (other 
than land held for open space purposes) held for 
development. 

SCHEDULE 4. 
AMENDMENTS OF PART IV OF THE LAND TAX MANAGEMENT 

ACT, 1956. 

Section 27 (3A)— 

After "unit" where firstly occurring, insert ", or a 
flat that is not a residential unit,". 

Section 27 (3A) (a)— 

After "1956", insert ", or in respect of that flat under 
section 3c of that Act". 

SCHEDULE 5. 

AMENDMENTS OF PART VI OF THE LAND TAX MANAGEMENT 
ACT, 1956. 

Section 50 (1A)—(1D)-- 

After section 50 (1), insert :— 

(1A) Where section 10 (1) (u) or 10 (5) ceases to 
apply to or in respect of land by reason only that section 
10 (1) (u) (ii) ceases to apply and the Board is satisfied 

SCHEDULE 

Sec. 4. 

Sec. 4. 



16 	 Act No. 97, 1975. 

Land Tax Management (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE 5—continued. 

AMENDMENTS OF PART VI OF THE LAND TAX MANAGEMENT 
ACT, 1956—continued. 

that the owner of the land is justified in not proceeding 
to subdivide the land, the Board may defer payment of 
the amount of any land tax leviable or payable in respect 
of that land in excess of the amount that would have been 
payable had section 10 (1) (u) (ii) not ceased to apply 
to and in respect of the land. 

(1B) Subsection (1A) ceases to apply in respect of 
any land if— 

the Board is satisfied that the owner of the land 
is no longer justified in not proceeding to sub-
divide the land ; or 

any part of the land is sold or otherwise disposed 
of. 

(1c) Where, pursuant to subsection (1B) (b), an 
owner of land ceases to be entitled to a postponement 
of land tax he shall, within one month after ceasing to 
be so entitled, notify the Commissioner accordingly. 

(1D) Where a parcel of land would, but for exceeding 
2,100 square metres in area, be exempted by the opera-
tion of section 10 (1) (r) from taxation under this Act, 
the Board may, if it is satisfied that the owner, while 
not prevented by a planning scheme authorised by or 
under an Act from subdividing the land, is prevented 
from doing so by other circumstances beyond his control 
that are of a permanent character, waive payment of 
the land tax wholly or in part. 

SCHEDULE 

sir 



Act No. 97, 1975. 	 17 

Land Tax Management (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE 6. 	 Sec. 4. 

AMENDMENTS TO PART VII OF THE LAND TAX MANAGE-
MENT ACT, 1956. 

Section 54 (1)— 

Omit "For the purposes of this Act", insert instead 
"For the purposes of this Act, but subject to this sec-
tion,". 

Section 54 (1AA), (lAB)— 

After section 54 (1), insert :— 

(1AA) Notwithstanding subsection (1), but 
subject to subsection (1D), where— 

a supplementary valuation of land to which 
subsection (1) (d) applies has been made 
by the Valuer-General on or after the first 
day of a year for which land tax is being 
levied ; 

that valuation is included in a supplemen-
tary list which includes in relation to that 
land an amount referred to in section 61A 
of the Valuation of Land Act, 1916, as a 
rating and taxing basis ; and 

the amount of that rating and taxing basis 
was determined as at the first day of the 
year in which the last general valuation was 

SCHEDULE 



18 	 Act No. 97, 1975. 

Land Tax Management (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE 6—continued. 

AMENDMENTS TO PART VII OF THE LAND TAX MANAGEMENT 
ACT, 1956—continued. 

furnished prior to the first day of a year 
for which land tax is being levied, 

the unimproved value of the land for the purposes 
of this Act is, in respect of the year referred to in 
paragraph (a), the amount of the rating and taxing 
basis referred to in paragraph (b). 

(1AB) Notwithstanding subsection (1), but sub- 
ject to subsection (1D), where— 

a supplementary valuation of land to which 
subsection (1) (d) applies has been made 
by the Valuer-General on or after the first 
day of a year for which land tax is being 
levied; 

the unimproved value of the land included 
in that valuation was determined under 
section 14A of the Valuation of Land Act, 
1916; and 

that unimproved value was determined as 
at the first day of the year in which the 
last general valuation commenced before 
the first day of a year for which land tax 
is being levied, 

the unimproved value of the land for the purposes 
of this Act is, in respect of the year referred to in 
paragraph (a), the unimproved value referred to in 
paragraph (b). 

(3) Section 54 (1B) (b)— 

After "Valuer-General", insert "as at a date earlier 
than 1st January, 1973". 

SCHEDULE 



Act No. 97, 1975. 	 19 

Land Tax Management (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE 6—continued. 

AMENDMENTS TO PART VII OF THE LAND TAX MANAGEMENT 
ACT, 1956—continued. 

(4) Section 54 (1B)— 

After section 54 (1B) (b), insert :— 

(ba) where the valuation is made by the Valuer-
General as at 1st January, 1973, or a later 
date— 

an unimproved value determined pur-
suant to section 14A (1) (b) (iv) of the 
Valuation of Land Act, 1916, as if the 
land valued had been sold, conveyed or 
resumed on the date as at which the 
valuation is made; and 

any allowance referred to in paragraph 
(b) (ii) ; 

(5) Section 54 (1c) (a)— 
Omit "or" where secondly occurring. 

(6) Section 54 (1c) (b)— 
Omit "land.", insert instead :— 

land ; or 

(c) an unimproved value has been furnished pursuant 
to subsection (1B) (ba) (i), that unimproved 
value shall, subject to subsection (1D), be 
deemed, for the purposes of this Act, to be the 
unimproved value of the land. 

(7) Section 54 (1D)— 
After "(1)" where secondly and thirdly occurring, 

insert "(1AA), (lAB),". 

SCHEDULE 



20 	 Act No. 97, 1975. 

    

 
     

           

 
    

Land Tax Management (Amendment). 

 

 
     

           

SCHEDULE 6—continued. 

AMENDMENTS TO PART VII OF THE LAND TAX MANAGEMENT 
ACT, 1956—continued. 

Section 54 (4A)— 
After section 54 (4A) (b), insert :— 

(ba) of an unimproved value under subsection (la) 
(ba) (i) shall be subject to objection in the same 
manner as if it had been determined in accord-
ance with section 14A (1) (b) (iv) of the 
Valuation of Land Act, 1916; 

Section 54 (4A) (c)— 
Omit "subparagraph (ii) of paragraph (b) of sub-

section (1B)", insert instead "subsection (1B) (b) (ii) 
or (1B) (ba) (ii)". 

In the name and on behalf of Her Majesty I assent to this 
Act. 

A. R. CUTLER, 
Governor. 

Government House, 
Sydney, 17th December, 1975. 


