This PuBLIC BILL originated in the LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY, and,
having this day passed, is now ready for presentation to the LEGISLATIVE
COUNCIL for its concurrence.

R. E. WARD,
Clerk of the Legislative Assembly.

Legislative Assembly Chamber,
Sydney, 19 November, 1975.

Hetw South TWHales

ANNO VICESIMO QUARTO

ELIZABETHZ 11 REGINZE

% %k ok ok ok ok ok sk ok sk ok sk %k %k ok %k ok ok 3k sk ok ok ok %k %k %k %k ok K ok % ok %

Act No. , 1975.

An Act to amend the Gaming and Betting Act, 1912, in
relation to the age at which persons may make a bet
or wager and to remove a restriction on the publication
of information concerning certain totalizator dividends.

BE

2317 525—




Act No. ,» 1975. 2

Gaming and Betting (Amendment).

BE it enacted by the Queen’s Most Excellent Majesty, by
and with the advice and consent of the Legislative
Council and Legislative Assembly of New South Wales in
Parliament assembled, and by the authority of the same, as
3 follows ;:—

1. This Act may be cited as the “Gaming and Betting Short
(Amendment) Act, 1975”. title.

2. The Gaming and Betting Act, 1912, is amended in Amend-
ment of

the manner set forth in Schedule 1. Act No. 25,
1912.

10 SCHEDULE 1.

AMENDMENTS TO THE GAMING AND BETTING AcT, 1912.

(1) Section 1—
Omit “infants”, insert instead “persons under the age
of 18 years”.
15 (2) (a) Section 10, short heading—

Omit “infants”, insert instead “persons under
the age of 18 years”.

(b) Section 10 (a)—

Omit “twenty-one years”, insert instead “18

20 years”.
SCHEDULE




Act No. « 1975: 3

Gaming and Betting (Amendment).

SCHEDULE 1—continued.

AMENDMENTS TO THE GAMING AND BETTING AcT, 1912—
continued.

(3) Section 12—

5 Omit “twenty-one years” wherever occurring, insert
instead “18 years”.

(4) Section 13—

Omit “twenty-one years” wherever occurring, insert
instead “18 years”.

10 (5) Section 14—

Omit “twenty-one years”, insert instead “18 years”.

(6) (a) Section 47F—

Omit “, at any time after an event or contingency
on which bets have been made through the
15 Totalizator Agency Board under and in accordance
with the Totalizator (Off-course Betting) Act,
1964, has taken place or been decided,”.

(b) Section 47F—

Omit “payable in respect of such bets made on
20 such event or contingency”, insert instead “or prob-
able totalizator dividends payable in respect of bets
made through the Totalizator Agency Board under
and in accordance with the Totalizator (Off-course
Betting) Act, 1964, on an event or contingency”.

BY AUTHORITY
D. WEST, GOVERNMENT PRINTER, NEW SOUTH WALES—1975

[8c]







No. , 1975.

To amend the Gaming and Betting Act, 1912, in
relation to the age at which persons may make a bet

or wager and to remove a restriction on the publication
of information concerning certain totalizator dividends.

[MrR CoLEMAN—18 November, 1975.]

BE

2317 525—



Act No. , 1975. 2

Gaming and Betting (Amendment).

BE it enacted by the Queen’s Most Excellent Majesty, by
and with the advice and consent of the Legislative
Council and Legislative Assembly of New South Wales in
Parliament assembled, and by the authority of the same, as

* follows :—
1. This Act may be cited as the “Gaming and Betting Short
(Amendment) Act, 1975”. title.
2. The Gaming and Betting Act, 1912, is amended in Amendf-
the manner set forth in Schedule 1. Acty No. 25,
1912.
10 SCHEDULE 1.

AMENDMENTS TO THE GAMING AND BETTING Act, 1912.

(1) Section 1—

Omit “infants”, insert instead “persons under the age
of 18 years”.

15 (2) (a) Section 10, short heading—

Omit “infants”, insert instead ‘“‘persons under
the age of 18 years”.

(b) Section 10 (a)—

Omit “twenty-one years”, insert instead “18

20 years”.
SCHEDULE



Act No. , 1975.

Gaming and Betting (Amendment).

SCHEDULE 1—continued.

AMENDMENTS TO THE GAMING AND BETTING AcT, 1912—

(3)

(4)

10 (5)

(6)

15

20

continued.

Section 12—

Omit “twenty-one years” wherever occurring, insert
instead “18 years”.

Section 13—

Omit “twenty-one years” wherever occurring, insert
instead “18 years”.

Section 14—

Omit “twenty-one years”, insert instead “18 years”.

(a)

(b)

Section 47F—

Omit “, at any time after an event or contingency
on which bets have been made through the
Totalizator Agency Board under and in accordance
with the Totalizator (Off-course Betting) Act,
1964, has taken place or been decided,”.

Section 47F—

Omit “payable in respect of such bets made on
such event or contingency”, insert instead “or prob-
able totalizator dividends payable in respect of bets
made through the Totalizator Agency Board under
and in accordance with the Totalizator (Off-course
Betting) Act, 1964, on an event or contingency”.

BY AUTHORITY

D. WEST, GOVERNMENT PRINTER, NEW SOUTH WALES—1975
[8c]






GAMING AND BETTING (AMENDMENT) BILL, 1975

EXPLANATORY NOTE

THE objects of this Bill are—

(a) to reduce the age at which persons may bet or wager from 21 years
N to 18 years; and

(b) to remove a restriction on the publication, before an event or con-
tingency on which bets have been made through the Totalizator Agency
% Board has taken place or been decided, of information concerning
totalizator dividends or probable totalizator dividends payable in respect
of those bets.

2317 525—







No. , 1975.

To amend the Gaming and Betting Act, 1912, in
relation to the age at which persons may make a bet

or wager and to remove a restriction on the publication
of information concerning certain totalizator dividends.

[Mr CoLEMAN—18 November, 1975.]

BE

2317 525—

PROOF




Act No. , 1975. 2

Gaming and Betting (Amendment).

BE it enacted by the Queen’s Most Excellent Majesty, by
and with the advice and consent of the Legislative
Council and Legislative Assembly of New South Wales in
Parliament assembled, and by the authority of the same, as

5 follows :—

1. This Act may be cited as the “Gaming and Betting Short
(Amendment) Act, 1975”. title.

2. The Gaming and Betting Act, 1912, is amended in Amendf-
the manner set forth in Schedule 1. ‘XS{‘ 111% 25,
1912.

10 SCHEDULE 1.

AMENDMENTS TO THE GAMING AND BETTING AcT, 1912.

(1) Section 1—

Omit “infants”, insert instead “persons under the age
of 18 years”.

15 (2) (a) Section 10, short heading—
Omit “infants”, insert instead “persons under
the age of 18 years”.
(b) Section 10 (a)—
Omit “twenty-one years”, insert instead “18

20 years”.
SCHEDULE




Act No. , 1975.

Gaming and Betting (Amendment).

SCHEDULE 1—continued.

AMENDMENTS TO THE GAMING AND BETTING AcT, 1912—
continued.

(3) Section 12—

Omit “twenty-one years” wherever occurring, insert

instead “18 years”.

(4) Section 13—

Omit “twenty-one years” wherever occurring, insert
instead “18 years”.

10 (5) Section 14—

15

20

Omit “twenty-one years”, insert instead “18 years”.

(6) (a) Section 47F—

Omit “, at any time after an event or contingency
on which bets have been made through the
Totalizator Agency Board under and in accordance
with the Totalizator (Off-course Betting) Act,
1964, has taken place or been decided,”.

(b) Section 47F—

Omit “payable in respect of such bets made on
such event or contingency”, insert instead “or prob-
able totalizator dividends payable in respect of bets
made through the Totalizator Agency Board under
and in accordance with the Totalizator (Off-course
Betting) Act, 1964, on an event or contingency”.

BY AUTHORITY
D. WEST, GOVERNMENT PRINTER, NEW SOUTH WALES—1975







ANNO VICESIMO QUARTO

ELIZABETHA 11 REGINA

Xk Kk k kR kR k ok ok koK kokokok ok kokokokok ok ok ok ok ok ok kok ok ok

Act No. 81, 1975.

An Act to amend the Gaming and Betting Act, 1912, in
relation to the age at which persons may make a bet
or wager and to remove a restriction on the publication
of information concerning certain totalizator dividends.
[Assented to, 10th December, 1975.]

BE

P4141  [8¢]




Short
title.

Amend-
ment of
Act No. 25,
1912.

Act No. 81, 1975.

Gaming and Betting (Amendment).

BE it enacted by the Queen’s Most Excellent Majesty, by
and with the advice and consent of the Legislative
Council and Legislative Assembly of New South Wales in
Parliament assembled, and by the authority of the same, as
follows:—

1. This Act may be cited as the “Gaming and Betting
(Amendment) Act, 1975”.

2. The Gaming and Betting Act, 1912, is amended in
the manner set forth in Schedule 1.

SCHEDULE 1.

AMENDMENTS TOo THE GAMING AND BETTING AcT, 1912.

(1) Section 1—

Omit “infants”, insert instead “persons under the age
of 18 years”.

(2) (a) Section 10, short heading—

Omit “infants”, insert instead ‘“‘persons under
the age of 18 years”.

(b) Section 10 (a)—

Omit “twenty-one years”, insert instead “18
years”.

SCHEDULE




Act No. 81, 1975.

Gaming and Betting (Amendment).

SCHEDULE 1—continued.

AMENDMENTS TO THE GAMING AND BETTING AcT, 1912—

(3)

(4)

(5)

(6)

continued.

Section 12—

Omit “twenty-one years” wherever occurring, insert
instead “18 years”.

Section 13—

Omit “twenty-one years” wherever occurring, insert
instead “18 years”.

Section 14—

Omit “twenty-one years”, insert instead “18 years”.

(a) Section 47F—

(b)

Omit “, at any time after an event or contingency
on which bets have been made through the
Totalizator Agency Board under and in accordance
with the Totalizator (Off-course Betting) Act,
1964, has taken place or been decided,”.

Section 47Fr—

Omit “payable in respect of such bets made on
such event or contingency”, insert instead “or prob-
able totalizator dividends payable in respect of bets
made through the Totalizator Agency Board under
and in accordance with the Totalizator (Off-course
Betting) Act, 1964, on an event or contingency”.

BY AUTHORITY

D. WEST, GOVERNMENT PRINTER, NEW SOUTH WALES—1975







I certify that this PuBLic BILL, which originated in the LEGISLA-
TIVE ASSEMBLY, has finally passed the LEGISLATIVE COUNCIL and the

LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY of NEW SOoUTH WALES.

R. E. WARD,
Clerk of the Legislative Assembly.

Legislative Assembly Chamber,
Sydney, 26 November, 1975.

et South Wales

ANNO VICESIMO QUARTO

ELIZABETHZ 11 REGINA

LE R EREREREEEEEEEE R E EEE R EEE R EEREEEEEE
Act No. 81, 1975.

An Act to amend the Gaming and Betting Act, 1912, in
relation to the age at which persons may make a bet
or wager and to remove a restriction on the publication
of information concerning certain totalizator dividends.
[Assented to, 10th December, 1975.1

BE

I have examined this Bill, and find it to correspond in all respects
with the Bill as finally passed by both Houses.

J. H. BROWN,
Chairman of Committees of the Legislative Assembly.



Short
title.

Amend-
ment of
Act No. 25,
1912.

Act No. 81, 1975.

Gaming and Betting (Amendment).

E it enacted by the Queen’s Most Excellent Majesty, by

and with the advice and consent of the Legislative
Council and Legislative Assembly of New South Wales in
Parliament assembled, and by the authority of the same, as
follows:—

1. This Act may be cited as the “Gaming and Betting
(Amendment) Act, 1975”.

2. The Gaming and Betting Act, 1912, is amended in
the manner set forth in Schedule 1.

SCHEDULE 1.

AMENDMENTS TO THE GAMING AND BETTING Act, 1912.

(1) Section 1—
Omit “infants”, insert instead “persons under the age
of 18 years”.
(2) (a) Section 10, short heading—

Omit “infants”, insert instead “persons under
the age of 18 years”.

(b) Section 10 (a)—

Omit “twenty-one years”, insert instead “18
years”.

SCHEDULE




Act No. 81, 1975. 3

Gaming and Betting (Amendment).

SCHEDULE 1—continued.

AMENDMENTS TO THE GAMING AND BETTING AcT, 1912—
continued.

(3) Section 12—

Omit “twenty-one years” wherever occurring, insert
instead “18 years”.

(4) Section 13—

Omit “twenty-one years” wherever occurring, insert
instead “18 years”.

(5) Section 14—

Omit “twenty-one years”, insert instead “18 years”.

(6) (a) Section 47F—

Omit “, at any time after an event or contingency
on which bets have been made through the
Totalizator Agency Board under and in accordance
with the Totalizator (Off-course Betting) Act,
1964, has taken place or been decided,”.

(b) Section 47F—

Omit “payable in respect of such bets made on
such event or contingency”, insert instead “or prob-
able totalizator dividends payable in respect of bets
made through the Totalizator Agency Board under
and in accordance with the Totalizator (Off-course
Betting) Act, 1964, on an event or contingency”.

In the name and on behalf of Her Majesty 1 assent to this
Act.
A. R. CUTLER,
Governor.
Government House,
Sydney, 10th December, 1975.






