
This PUBLIC BILL originated in the LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY, and, 
having this day passed, is now ready for presentation to the LEGISLATIVE 
COUNCIL for its concurrence. 

ALLAN PICKERING, 
Clerk of the Legislative Assembly. 

Legislative Assembly Chamber, 
Sydney, 1 December, 1965. 

Rely 'outtj 

ANNO QUARTO DECIMO 

ELIZABETILE II REGIME 
* * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * 

	

Act No. 	, 1965. 

An Act to make further provision with respect to 
the radiological examination of persons for 
tuberculosis; to increase the penalties for offences 
under the Public Health Act, 1902, as amended 
by subsequent Acts; for these and other purposes 
to amend that Act, as so amended; and for 
purposes connected therewith. 

BE it enacted by the Queen's Most Excellent Majesty, by 
and with the advice and consent of the Legislative 

Council and Legislative Assembly of New South Wales in 
Parliament assembled, and by the authority of the same, as 

5 follows : — 
1. 	(1) This Act may be cited as the "Public Health Short title 

	

(Amendment) Act, 1965". 	 and 
citation. 

29341 	117— 
(2) 



Act No. 	, 1965. 	 2 

Public Health (Amendment). 

The Public Health Act, 1902, as amended by 
subsequent Acts and by this Act, may be cited as the Public 
Health Act, 1902-1965. 

2. (1) The Public Health Act, 1902, as amended by Amendment 
5 subsequent Acts, is amended by inserting at the end of section of Act No. 

30, 1902. seven the following new subsection : — 	 Sec. 7. 
(Constitu- 
tion of 
Board.) 

The members of the Board appointed pursuant Term of 
to subsection two of this section shall, subject to that office. 
subsection, hold office for such period not exceeding five 

10 

	

	years as may be specified in the instrument of appoint- 
ment and shall be eligible for reappointment. 

The members of the Board of Health appointed 
pursuant to subsection two of section seven of the Public 
Health Act, 1902-1961, and holding office immediately before 

15 the appointed day shall on that day cease to hold office 
as such members. 

(a) A person, including a person referred to in 
subsection two of this section, may be appointed before the 
appointed day to fill any vacant office on the Board created 

20 by the operation of subsection two of this section, and the 
provisions of subsection three of section seven of the Public 
Health Act, 1902-1961, as amended by this Act, shall be 
deemed to be in force for the purpose of, and shall apply to 
and in respect of, any such appointment. 

25 	 (b) A person appointed pursuant to paragraph 
(a) of this subsection shall assume office as a member of the 
Board on the appointed day. 

Subsection one of this section shall commence 
upon a day to be appointed by the Governor and notified by 

30 proclamation published in the Gazette, which day is, in this 
section, referred to as the "appointed day". 

3. 



Act No. 	, 1965. 	 3 

Public Health (Amendment). 

3. The Public Health Act, 1902, as amended by subse- Further 
quent Acts, is further amended— 	 amendment 

of Act No. 
30, 1902. 

(a) by omitting from section 29A the words "over the Sec. 29A. 
age of fourteen years"; 	 (Governor 

may direr) 
examination 
for tuber- 
culosis.) 

5 	(b) by omitting from subsection (1A) of section one Sec. 107. 
hundred and seven the words "in any particular (Recovery 
case" and by inserting in lieu thereof the words Penalties.) 
"either generally or in any particular case or class 
of cases". 

10 4. (1) Each provision of the Public Health Act, 1902, Further 
as amended by subsequent Acts, specified in the first column alIncdasront 
of the Schedule to this Act is amended as specified opposite 30, 1902. 
that provision in the second column of that Schedule. 

(2) The amendments, referred to in subsection one of 
15 this section, to subsection three of section fifty-five and sub-

section four of section 63c of the Public Health Act, 1902, 
as amended by subsequent Acts, shall commence respectively 
upon the days appointed by the Governor pursuant to sub-
section two of section six and subsection two of section seven 

20 of the Public Health (Amendment) Act, 1944. 

SCHEDULE. Soc. 4. 

First column. 	 Second column. 

Provision of the Public 
Health Act, 1902, as 

25 amended by subsequent 
Acts. 

Amendment. 

Section 29 (2) 

Section 30A (2) 
30 	Section 32A 

Section 32B (5) 

Omit " five pounds ", insert " twenty-five 
pounds ". 

Omit " ten pounds ", insert " fifty pounds ". 
Omit " ten pounds " wherever occurring, 

insert " fifty pounds ". 
Omit " fifty pounds ", insert " two hundred 

and fifty pounds ". 
SCHEDULE 



Act No. 	, 1965. 	 4 

Public Health (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE—continued. 

  

First column. Second column. 

  

Provision of the Public 
Health Act, 1902, as 

5 amended by subsequent 
Acts. 

Amendment. 

Omit " five pounds " wherever occurring, 
insert " twenty-five pounds ". 

Omit " one pound " wherever occurring, 
insert " five pounds ". 

Omit " ten pounds ", insert " fifty pounds ". 
Omit " ten pounds ", insert " fifty pounds ". 
Omit " five pounds ", insert " twenty-five 

pounds ". 
Omit " ten pounds ", insert " fifty pounds ". 
Omit " twenty pounds ", insert " one 

hundred pounds ' . 
Omit " five pounds ", insert " twenty-five 

pounds ". 
Omit " five pounds ", insert " twenty-five 

pounds ". 
Omit " fifty pounds ", insert " two hundred 

and fifty pounds ". 
Omit " of not less than ten nor more than 

twenty pounds ", insert " not exceeding 
one hundred pounds ". 

Omit " five pounds ", insert " twenty-five 
pounds ". 

Omit " twenty pounds ", insert " one 
hundred pounds ' . 

Omit " ten pounds ", insert " fifty pounds ". 
Omit " two hundred pounds ", insert " one 

thousand pounds ". 
Omit " twenty pounds ", insert " one 

hundred pounds ' . 
Omit " fifty pounds ", insert " two hundred 

and fifty pounds ". 
Omit " five pounds ", insert " twenty-five 

pounds ". 
Omit " two pounds ", insert " ten pounds". 
Omit " five pounds nor less than ten 

shillings ", insert " twenty-five pounds ". 
Omit " twenty shillings ", insert " three 

pounds ". 

Section 32c 

10 
Section 32D (1) 
Section 37 (1) 
Section 38 (1) 

15 	Section 38 (2) 
Section 39 

Section 42 

20 	Section 43 (1) 

Section 43A (2) 

Section 48 (3) 
25 

Section 49A 

Section 50 
30 

Section 50A (2) 
Section 51 (5) 

35 
Section 51B (1) 

Section 55 (2) 

40 	Section 55 (3) 
Section 58 (3) 

Section 60 (1) 

SCHEDULE 



Act No. 	, 1965.    	 5 

Public Health (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE—continued. 

First column. Second column. 

  

Provision of the Public 
Health Act, 1902, as 

5 amended by subsequent 
Acts. 

Amendment. 

Omit " twenty pounds ", insert " fifty 
pounds ". 

Omit " two pounds ", insert " six pounds ". 
Omit " twenty pounds ", insert " fifty 

pounds ". 
Omit " twenty shillings ", insert " three 

pounds ". 
Omit " forty shillings ", insert " six 

pounds ". 
Omit " twenty pounds ", insert " one 

hundred pounds ' . 
Omit " five pounds ", insert " twenty-five 

pounds ". 
Omit " five pounds " wherever occurring, 

insert " twenty-five pounds ". 
Omit " five pounds ' , insert " twenty-five 

pounds ". 
Omit " twenty pounds ", insert " one 

hundred pounds ' . 
Omit " two pounds ", insert " ten pounds ". 
Omit " twenty pounds ", insert " one 

hundred pounds ". 
Omit " two pounds ", insert " ten pounds ". 
Omit " five pounds " wherever occurring, 

insert " twenty-five pounds ". 
Omit " twenty pounds ", insert " one 

hundred pounds . 
Omit " two pounds ", insert " ten pounds ". 
Omit " twenty pounds ", insert " one 

hundred pounds ". 
Omit " twenty pounds ", insert " one 

hundred pounds ' . 
Omit " two pounds ", insert " ten pounds ". 

Section 63c (4) 

10 	Section 66 (2) 

Section 66 (3) (a) 

Section 66 (3) (b) 
15 

Section 718 (2) 

Section 72 (3) 

20 	Section 74 

Section 96 (1) (b) 

Section 96 (3) 
25 

Section 97 

30 	Section 98 

Section 102 

35 	Section 104 

Section 106 

BY AUTHORITY: 
V. C. N. BLIGHT. GOVERNMENT PRINTER, SYDNEY, NEW SOUTH WALES-1965 

[6d. (5c)) 



g. 

.) 

n 



a 

I 

A 



a 

A 



No. , 1965. 

A BILL 
To make further provision with respect to 

the radiological examination of persons for 
tuberculosis; to increase the penalties for offences 
under the Public Health Act, 1902, as amended 
by subsequent Acts; for these and other purposes 
to amend that Act, as so amended; and for 
purposes connected therewith. 

[MR. JAGo ;-18 November, 1965.1 

BE it enacted by the Queen's Most Excellent Majesty, by 
and with the advice and consent of the Legislative 

Council and Legislative Assembly of New South Wales in 
Parliament assembled, and by the authority of the same, as 

5 follows : — 
1. (1) This Act may be cited as the "Public Health Short title 

(Amendment) Act, 1965". and 
citation.  

29341 1 17— 
(2) 



Act No. 	, 1965. 	 2 

Public Health (Amendment). 

(2) The Public Health Act, 1902, as amended by 
subsequent Acts and by this Act, may be cited as the Public 
Health Act, 1902-1965. 

2. (1) The Public Health Act, 1902, as amended by Amendment 
5 subsequent Acts, is amended by inserting at the end of section 30f AN01•21°. 

seven the following new subsection : — 	 Sec. 7. 
(Constitu-
tion of 
Board.) 

( 3 ) The members of the Board appointed pursuant Term of 
to subsection two of this section shall, subject to that office. 
subsection, hold office for such period not exceeding five 

10 

	

	years as may be specified in the instrument of appoint- 
ment and shall be eligible for reappointment. 

The members of the Board of Health appointed 
pursuant to subsection two of section seven of the Public 
Health Act, 1902-1961, and holding office immediately before 

15 the appointed day shall on that day cease to hold office 
as such members. 

(a) A person, including a person referred to in 
subsection two of this section, may be appointed before the 
appointed day to fill any vacant office on the Board created 

20 by the operation of subsection two of this section, and the 
provisions of subsection three of section seven of the Public 
Health Act, 1902-1961, as amended by this Act, shall be 
deemed to be in force for the purpose of, and shall apply to 
and in respect of, any such appointment. 

25 	 (b) A person appointed pursuant to paragraph 
(a) of this subsection shall assume office as a member of the 
Board on the appointed day. 

Subsection one of this section shall commence 
upon a day to be appointed by the Governor and notified by 

30 proclamation published in the Gazette, which day is, in this 
section, referred to as the "appointed day". 

3. 



Act No. 	, 1965. 	 3 

Public Health (Amendment). 

3. The Public Health Act, 1902, as amended by subse- Further 
quent Acts, is further amended— 	 amendment

of Act No. 
30, 1902. 

(a) by omitting from section 29A the words "over the Sec. 29A. 
age of fourteen years"; 	 (Governor 

may direct 
examination 
for tuber-
culosis.) 

5 	(b) by omitting from subsection (1A) of section one Sec. 107. 
hundred and seven the words "in any particular (Recovery 
case" and by inserting in lieu thereof the words penalties.) 
"either generally or in any particular case or class 
of cases". 

10 4. (1) Each provision of the Public Health Act, 1902, Further 
as amended by subsequent Acts, specified in the first column of 

amendmen
t 
mitt 

of the Schedule to this Act is amended as specified opposite 30, 1902. 
that provision in the second column of that Schedule. 

(2) The amendments, referred to in subsection, one of 
15 this section, to subsection three of section fifty-five and sub- 

section four of section 63c of the Public Health Act, 1902, 
as amended by subsequent Acts, shall commence respectively 
upon the days appointed by the Governor pursuant to sub- 
section two of section six and subsection two of section seven 

20 of the Public Health (Amendment) Act, 1944. 

SCHEDULE. Sec. 4. 

First column. 	 Second column. 

Provision of the Public 
Health Act, 1902, as 

25 amended by subsequent 
Acts. 

Amendment. 

Section 29 (2) 

Section 30A (2) 
30 	Section 32A 

Section 32B (5) 

Omit " five pounds ", insert " twenty-five 
pounds ". 

Omit " ten pounds ", insert " fifty pounds ". 
Omit " ten pounds " wherever occurring, 

insert " fifty pounds ". 
Omit " fifty pounds ", insert " two hundred 

and fifty pounds ". 
SCHEDULE 



Act No. 	, 1965. 	 4 

Public Health (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE—continued. 

First column. Second column. 

 
 

Provision of the Public 
Health Act, 1902, as 

5 amended by subsequent 
Acts. 

Amendment. 

Omit " five pounds " wherever occurring, 
insert " twenty-five pounds ". 

Omit " one pound " wherever occurring, 
insert " five pounds ". 

Omit " ten pounds ", insert " fifty pounds ". 
Omit " ten pounds ", insert " fifty pounds ". 
Omit " five pounds ", insert " twenty-five 

pounds ". 
Omit " ten pounds ", insert " fifty pounds ". 
Omit " twenty pounds ", insert " one 

hundred pounds ". 
Omit " five pounds ", insert " twenty-five 

pounds ". 
Omit " five pounds ", insert " twenty-five 

pounds ". 
Omit " fifty pounds ", insert " two hundred 

and fifty pounds ". 
Omit " of not less than ten nor more than 

twenty pounds ", insert " not exceeding 
one hundred pounds ". 

Omit " five pounds ", insert " twenty-five 
pounds ". 

Omit " twenty pounds ", insert " one 
hundred pounds ". 

Omit " ten pounds ", insert " fifty pounds ". 
Omit " two hundred pounds ", insert " one 

thousand pounds ". 
Omit " twenty pounds ", insert " one 

hundred pounds ". 
Omit " fifty pounds ", insert " two hundred 

and fifty pounds ". 
Omit " five pounds ", insert " twenty-five 

pounds ". 
Omit " two pounds ", insert "ten pounds ". 
Omit " five pounds nor less than ten 

shillings ", insert " twenty-five pounds ". 
Omit " twenty shillings ", insert " three 

pounds ". 

Section 32c 

10 
Section 32D (1) 
Section 37 (1) 
Section 38 (1) 

15 	Section 38 (2) 
Section 39 

Section 42 

20 	Section 43 (1) 

Section 43A (2) 

Section 48 (3) 
25 

Section 49A 

Section 50 
30 

Section 50A (2) 
Section 51 (5) 

35 
Section 51B (1) 

Section 55 (2) 

40 	Section 55 (3) 
Section 58 (3) 

Section 60 (1) 

SCHEDULE 



I 

Act No. 	, 1965. 	 5 

Public Health (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE—continued. 

First column. Second column. 

 
 

Provision of the Public 
Health Act, 1902, as 

5 amended by subsequent 
Acts. 

Amendment. 

Omit " twenty pounds ", insert " fifty 
pounds ". 

Omit " two pounds ", insert " six pounds ". 
Omit " twenty pounds ", insert " fifty 

pounds ". 
Omit " twenty shillings ", insert " three 

pounds ". 
Omit " forty shillings ", insert " six 

pounds ". 
Omit " twenty pounds ", insert " one 

hundred pounds ". 
Omit " five pounds ", insert " twenty-five 

pounds ". 
Omit " five pounds " wherever occurring, 

insert " twenty-five pounds ". 
Omit " five pounds ", insert " twenty-five 

pounds ". 
Omit " twenty pounds ", insert " one 

hundred pounds ". 
Omit " two pounds ", insert " ten pounds ". 
Omit " twenty pounds ", insert " one 

hundred pounds ". 
Omit " two pounds ", insert " ten pounds ". 
Omit " five pounds " wherever occurring, 

insert " twenty-five pounds ". 
Omit " twenty pounds ", insert " one 

hundred pounds ". 
Omit " two pounds ", insert " ten pounds ". 
Omit " twenty pounds ", insert " one 

hundred pounds ". 
Omit " twenty pounds ", insert " one 

hundred pounds ". 
Omit " two pounds ", insert " ten pounds ". 

Section 63c (4) 

10 	Section 66 (2) 

Section 66 (3) (a) 

Section 66 (3) (b) 
15 

Section 71B (2) 

Section 72 (3) 

20 	Section 74 

Section 96 (1) (b) 

Section 96 (3) 
25 

Section 97 

30 	Section 98 

Section 102 

3 5 	Section 104 

Section 106 

BY AUTHORITY: 
V. C. N. BLIGHT, GOVERNMENT PRINTER, SYDNEY, NEW SOUTH WALES-1965 

[6d. (5c)] 



r 
1 



I 

5 
I 



E 
i 



PUBLIC HEALTH (AMENDMENT) BILL, 1965. 

EXPLANATORY NOTE. 

THE objects of this Bill are— 

(a) to amend the Public Health Act, 1902, as amended by subsequent Acts— 
to provide that the appointed members of the Board of Health shall 
hold office for a period not exceeding five years; 
to make more flexible the power of the Governor to direct cate-
gories of persons to submit to radiological examination for 
tuberculosis; 
to enable certain officers to be authorised to lay or make informa-
tions or complaints under that Act, as so amended, either generally 
or in any particular case or class of cases; and 
to increase the penalties imposed under that Act; and 

(b) to make other provisions of a minor or consequential character. 

29341 	1 17— 



6. 

• 



PROOF 

No. 	, 1965. 

A BILL 
To make further provision with respect to 

the radiological examination of persons for 
tuberculosis; to increase the penalties for offences 
under the Public Health Act, 1902, as amended 
by subsequent Acts; for these and other purposes 
to amend that Act, as so amended; and for 
purposes connected therewith. 

[MR. JAGO ;-18 November, 1965.] 

HE it enacted by the Queen's Most Excellent Majesty, by 
and with the advice and consent of the Legislative 

Council and Legislative Assembly of New South Wales in 
Parliament assembled, and by the authority of the same, as 

5 follows : — 
1. (1) This Act may be cited as the "Public Health 

(Amendment) Act, 1965". 
(2) 

29341 	1 1 7— 

Short title 
and 
citation. 



Act No. 	, 1965. 	 2 

Public Health (Amendment). 

The Public Health Act, 1902, as amended by 
subsequent Acts and by this Act, may be cited as the Public 
Health Act, 1902-1965. 

2. (1) The Public Health Act, 1902, as amended by Amendment 
5 subsequent Acts, is amended by inserting at the end of section of Act No. 

30,  
seven the following new subsection : — Se1902. 

c. 7. 
(Constitu-
tion of 
Board. 

 The members of the Board appointed pursuant Term   of 
to subsection two of this section shall, subject to that office. 
subsection, hold office for such period not exceeding five 

10 

	

	years as may be specified in the instrument of appoint- 
ment and shall be eligible for reappointment. 

The members of the Board of Health appointed 
pursuant to subsection two of section seven of the Public 
Health Act, 1902-1961, and holding office immediately before 

15 the appointed day shall on that day cease to hold office 
as such members. 

(a) A person, including a person referred to in 
subsection two of this section, may be appointed before the 
appointed day to fill any vacant office on the Board created 

20 by the operation of subsection two of this section, and the 
provisions of subsection three of section seven of the Public 
Health Act, 1902-1961, as amended by this Act, shall be 
deemed to be in force for the purpose of, and shall apply to 
and in respect of, any such appointment. 

25 

	

	 (b) A person appointed pursuant to paragraph 
(a) of this subsection shall assume office as a member of the 
Board on the appointed day. 

Subsection one of this section shall commence 
upon a day to be appointed by the Governor and notified by 

30 proclamation published in the Gazette, which day is, in this 
section, referred to as the "appointed day". 

3. 



Act No. 	, 1965. 	 3 

Public Health (Amendment). 

3. The Public Health Act, 1902, as amended by subse- Further 
quent Acts, is further amended— 	 amendment 

of Act No. 
30, 1902. 

(a) by omitting from section 29A the words "over the Sec. 29A. 
age of fourteen years" ; 

	

5 	(b) by omitting from subsection (1A) of section one Sec. 107. 
hundred and seven the words "in any particular (Recovery 
case" and by inserting in lieu thereof the words penalties.) "either generally or in any particular case or class 
of cases". 

	

10 	4. ( 1 ) Each provision of the Public Health Act, 1902, Further 
mNe 

o
nt as amended by subsequent Acts, specified in the first column 7Inc`: of the Schedule to this Act is amended as specified opposite 30, 1902. 

that provision in the second column of that Schedule. 
(2) The amendments, referred to in subsection one of 

15 this section, to subsection three of section fifty-five and sub-
section four of section 63c of the Public Health Act, 1902, 
as amended by subsequent Acts, shall commence respectively 
upon the days appointed by the Governor pursuant to sub-
section two of section six and subsection two of section seven 

20 of the Public Health (Amendment) Act, 1944. 

SCHEDULE. Sec. 4. 

First column. Second column. 

(Governor 
may direct 
examination 
for tuber-
culosis.) 

Provision of the Public 
Health Act, 1902, as 25 amended by subsequent 

Acts. 
Amendment. 

Section 29 (2) 

Section 30A (2) 
3 0 	Section 32A 

Section 32B (5) 

Omit " five pounds ", insert " twenty-five 
pounds ". 

Omit " ten pounds ", insert " fifty pounds ". 
Omit " ten pounds " wherever occurring, 

insert " fifty pounds ". 
Omit " fifty pounds ", insert " two hundred 

and fifty pounds ". 

SCHEDULE 



Act No. 	, 1965. 	 4 

Public Health (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE—continued. 

First column. 	 Second column. 

Provision of the Public 
Health Act, 1902, as 

5 amended by subsequent 
Acts. 

Amendment. 

Omit " five pounds " wherever occurring, 
insert " twenty-five pounds ". 

Omit " one pound " wherever occurring, 
insert " five pounds ". 

Omit " ten pounds ", insert " fifty pounds ". 
Omit " ten pounds ", insert " fifty pounds ". 
Omit " five pounds ", insert " twenty-five 

pounds ". 
Omit " ten pounds ", insert " fifty pounds ". 
Omit " twenty pounds ", insert " one 

hundred pounds ". 
Omit " five pounds ", insert " twenty-five 

pounds ". 
Omit " five pounds ", insert " twenty-five 

pounds ". 
Omit " fifty pounds ", insert " two hundred 

and fifty pounds ". 
Omit " of not less than ten nor more than 

twenty pounds ", insert " not exceeding 
one hundred pounds ". 

Omit " five pounds ", insert " twenty-five 
pounds ". 

Omit " twenty pounds ", insert " one 
hundred pounds ". 

Omit " ten pounds ", insert " fifty pounds ". 
Omit " two hundred pounds ", insert " one 

thousand pounds ". 
Omit " twenty pounds ", insert " one 

hundred pounds ". 
Omit " fifty pounds ", insert " two hundred 

and fifty pounds ". 
Omit " five pounds ", insert " twenty-five 

pounds ". 
Omit " two pounds ", insert " ten pounds ". 
Omit " five pounds nor less than ten 

shillings ", insert " twenty-five pounds ". 
Omit " twenty shillings ", insert " three 

pounds ". 

Section 32c 

10 
Section 32D (1) 
Section 37 (1) 
Section 38 (1) 

15 	Section 38 (2) 
Section 39 

Section 42 

20 	Section 43 (1) 

Section 43A (2) 

Section 48 (3) 
25 

Section 49A 

Section 50 
30 

Section 50A (2) 
Section 51 (5) 

35 
Section 51B (1) 

Section 55 (2) 

40 	Section 55 (3) 
Section 58 (3) 

Section 60 (1) 

SCHEDULE 



Act No. 	, 1965. 	 5 

Public Health (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE—continued. 

First column. Second column. 

  

Provision of the Public 
Health Act, 1902, as 

5 amended by subsequent 
Acts. 

Amendment. 

Omit " twenty pounds ", insert " fifty 
pounds ". 

Omit " two pounds ", insert " six pounds ". 
Omit " twenty pounds ", insert " fifty 

pounds ". 
Omit " twenty shillings ", insert " three 

pounds ". 
Omit " forty shillings ", insert " six 

pounds ". 
Omit " twenty pounds ", insert " one 

hundred pounds ". 
Omit " five pounds ", insert " twenty-five 

pounds ". 
Omit " five pounds " wherever occurring, 

insert " twenty-five pounds ". 
Omit " five pounds ", insert " twenty-five 

pounds ". 
Omit " twenty pounds ", insert " one 

hundred pounds ". 
Omit " two pounds ", insert " ten pounds ". 
Omit " twenty pounds ", insert " one 

hundred pounds ". 
Omit " two pounds ", insert " ten pounds ". 
Omit " five pounds " wherever occurring, 

insert " twenty-five pounds ". 
Omit " twenty pounds ", insert " one 

hundred pounds ". 
Omit " two pounds ", insert " ten pounds ". 
Omit " twenty pounds ", insert " one 

hundred pounds ". 
Omit " twenty pounds ", insert " one 

hundred pounds ". 
Omit " two pounds ", insert " ten pounds ". 

Section 63c (4) 

10 	Section 66 (2) 

Section 66 (3) (a) 

Section 66 (3) (b) 
15 

Section 71B (2) 

Section 72 (3) 

20 	Section 74 

Section 96 (1) (b) 

Section 96 (3) 
25 

Section 97 

30 	Section 98 

Section 102 

3 5 	Section 104 

Section 106 

BY AUTHORITY: 
V. C. N. BLIGHT, GOVERNMENT PRINTER, SYDNEY, NEW SOUTH WALES-1965 



A 



b 

Y 

-• 



4 

r 



griv inutb Mkt; 

ANNO QUARTO DECIMO 

ELIZABETH AE II REGINJE 
* * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * 

Act No. 22, 1965. 

An Act to make further provision with respect to 
the radiological examination of persons for 
tuberculosis; to increase the penalties for offences 
under the Public Health Act, 1902, as amended 
by subsequent Acts; for these and other purposes 
to amend that Act, as so amended; and for 
purposes connected therewith. [Assented to, 
13th December, 1965.] 

nE it enacted by the Queen's Most Excellent Majesty, by 
and with the advice and consent of the Legislative 

Council and Legislative Assembly of New South Wales in 
Parliament assembled, and by the authority of the same, as 
follows — 

1. 	(1) This Act may be cited as the "Public Health Short title 
(Amendment) Act, 1965". 	 and 

citation. 

P 36677 	[6(.1. (5c)] 
(2),  



2 	 Act No. 22, 1965. 

Amendment 
of Act No. 
30, 1902. 
Sec. 7. 
(Constitu-
tion of 
Board.) 

Term of 
office. 

Public Health (Amendment). 

The Public Health Act, 1902, as amended by 
subsequent Acts and by this Act, may be cited as the Public 
Health Act, 1902-1965. 

2. (1) The Public Health Act, 1902, as amended by 
subsequent Acts, is amended by inserting at the end of section 
seven the following new subsection : — 

The members of the Board appointed pursuant 
to subsection two of this section shall, subject to that 
subsection, hold office for such period not exceeding five 
years as may be specified in the instrument of appoint-
ment and shall be eligible for reappointment. 

The members of the Board of Health appointed 
pursuant to subsection two of section seven of the Public 
Health Act, 1902-1961, and holding office immediately before 
the appointed day shall on that day cease to hold office 
as such members. 

(a) A person, including a person referred to in 
subsection two of this section, may be appointed before the 
appointed day to fill any vacant office on the Board created 
by the operation of subsection two of this section, and the 
provisions of subsection three of section seven of the Public 
Health Act, 1902-1961, as amended by this Act, shall be 
deemed to be in force for the purpose of, and shall apply to 
and in respect of, any such appointment. 

(b) A person appointed pursuant to paragraph 
(a) of this subsection shall assume office as a member of the 
Board on the appointed day. 

Subsection one of this section shall commence 
upon a day to be appointed by the Governor and notified by 
proclamation published in the Gazette, which day is, in this 
section, referred to as the "appointed day". 

3. 



Provision of the Public 
Health Act, 1902, as 

amended by subsequent 
Acts. 

Amendment. 

First column. 	 Second column. 

Omit " five pounds ", insert " twenty-five 
pounds ". 

Omit " ten pounds ", insert " fifty pounds ". 
Omit " ten pounds " wherever occurring, 

insert " fifty pounds ". 
Omit " fifty pounds ", insert " two hundred 

and fifty pounds ". 

Section 29 (2) 

Section 30A (2) 
Section 32A 

Section 32B (5) 

Act No. 22, 1965. 	 3 

Public Health (Amendment). 

3. The Public Health Act, 1902, as amended by subse- Further 
quent Acts, is further amended— 	 amendment 

of Act No. 
30, 1902. 

by omitting from section 29A the words "over the Sec. 29A. 
age of fourteen years"; 	 (Governor 

may direct 
examination 
for tuber-
culosis.) 

by omitting from subsection (1A) of section one Sec. 107. 
hundred and seven the words "in any particular (Recovery
case" and by inserting in lieu thereof the words ;enalties.) 
"either generally or in any particular case or class 
of cases". 

4. (1) Each provision of the Public Health Act, 1902, Further 
as amended by subsequent Acts, specified in the first column Oancd

t rlisleon t 
of the Schedule to this Act is amended as specified opposite 30, 1902. . 
that provision in the second column of that Schedule. 

(2) The amendments, referred to in subsection one of 
this section, to subsection three of section fifty-five and sub-
section four of section 63c of the Public Health Act, 1902, 
as amended by subsequent Acts, shall commence respectively 
upon the days appointed by the Governor pursuant to sub-
section two of section six and subsection two of section seven 
of the Public Health (Amendment) Act, 1944. 

SCHEDULE. 	 Sec. 4. 

SCHEDULE 



Act No. 22, 1965. 

Public Health (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE—continued. 

First column. 	 Second column. 

Provision of the Public 
Health Act, 1902, as 

amended by subsequent 
Acts. 

Amendment. 

Omit " five pounds " wherever occurring, 
insert " twenty-five pounds ". 

Omit " one pound " wherever occurring, 
insert " five pounds ". 

Omit " ten pounds ", insert " fifty pounds ". 
Omit " ten pounds ", insert " fifty pounds ". 
Omit " five pounds ", insert " twenty-five 

pounds ". 
Omit " ten pounds ", insert " fifty pounds ". 
Omit " twenty pounds ", insert " one 

hundred pounds ". 
Omit " five pounds ", insert " twenty-five 

pounds ". 
Omit " five pounds ", insert " twenty-five 

pounds ". 
Omit " fifty pounds ", insert " two hundred 

and fifty pounds ". 
Omit " of not less than ten nor more than 

twenty pounds ", insert " not exceeding 
one hundred pounds ". 

Omit " five pounds ", insert " twenty-five 
pounds ". 

Omit " twenty pounds ", insert " one 
hundred pounds ". 

Omit " ten pounds ", insert " fifty pounds ". 
Omit " two hundred pounds ", insert " one 

thousand pounds ". 
Omit " twenty pounds ", insert " one 

hundred pounds ". 
Omit " fifty pounds ", insert " two hundred 

and fifty pounds ". 
Omit " five pounds ", insert " twenty-five 

pounds ". 
Omit " two pounds ", insert " ten pounds ". 
Omit " five pounds nor less than ten 

shillings ", insert " twenty-five pounds ". 
Omit " twenty shillings ", insert " three 

pounds ". 

Section 32c 

Section 32D (1) 
Section 37 (1) 
Section 38 (1) 

Section 38 (2) 
Section 39 

Section 42 

Section 43 (1) 

Section 43A (21 

Section 48 (3) 

Section 49A 

Section 50 

Section 50A (2) 
Section 51 (5) 

Section 51B (1) 

Section 55 (2) 

Section 55 (3) 
Section 58 (3) 

Section 60 (1) 

SCHEDULE 



5 Act No. 22, 1965. 

Public Health (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE—continued. 

First column. Second column. 

 
 

Provision of the Public 
Health Act, 1902, as 

amended by subsequent 
Acts. 

Amendment. 

 
 

Section 63c (4) 
	

Omit " twenty pounds ", insert " fifty 
pounds ". 

Omit " two pounds ", insert " six pounds ". 
Section 66 (2) 

	
Omit " twenty pounds ", insert " fifty 

pounds ". 
Section 66 (3) (a) Omit " twenty shillings ", insert " three 

pounds ". 
Section 66 (3) (b) Omit " forty shillings ", insert " six 

pounds ". 
Section 71B (2) 

	Omit " twenty pounds ", insert " one 
hundred pounds ". 

Section 72 (3) 
	

Omit " five pounds ", insert " twenty-five 
pounds ". 

Section 74 	Omit " five pounds " wherever occurring, 
insert " twenty-five pounds ". 

Section 96 (1) (b) Omit " five pounds ", insert " twenty-five 
pounds ". 

Section 96 (3) 
	

Omit " twenty pounds ", insert " one 
hundred pounds ". 

Omit " two pounds ", insert " ten pounds ". 
Section 97 
	

Omit " twenty pounds ", insert " one 
hundred pounds ". 

Omit " two pounds ", insert " ten pounds ". 
Section 98 
	Omit " five pounds " wherever occurring, 

insert " twenty-five pounds ". 
Section 102 
	

Omit " twenty pounds ", insert " one 
hundred pounds ". 

Omit " two pounds ", insert " ten pounds ". 
Section 104 
	Omit " twenty pounds ", insert " one 

hundred pounds ". 
Section 106 
	

Omit " twenty pounds ", insert " one 
hundred pounds ". 

Omit " two pounds ", insert " ten pounds ". 

BY AUTHORITY: 
V. C. N. BLIGHT, GOVERNMENT PRINTER, SYDNEY, NEW SOUTH WALES-1966 



r 

. 

op 





• 

I 



I certify that this PUBLIC BILL, which originated in the LEGISLATIVE 
ASSEMBLY, has finally passed the LEGISLATIVE COUNCIL and the LEGIS-
LATIVE ASSEMBLY of NEW SOUTH WALES. 

ALLAN PICKERING, 
Clerk of the Legislative Assembly. 

Legislative Assembly Chamber, 
Sydney, 7 December, 1965. 

,feu ipoutb 'titbits; 

ANNO QUARTO DECIMO 

ELIZABETHIE II REGIME 
* * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * ** * * 

Act No. 22, 1965. 

An Act to make further provision with respect to 
the radiological examination of persons for 
tuberculosis; to increase the penalties for offences 
under the Public Health Act, 1902, as amended 
by subsequent Acts; for these and other purposes 
to amend that Act, as so amended; and for 
purposes connected therewith. [Assented to, 
13th December, 1965.] 

BE it enacted by the Queen's Most Excellent Majesty, by 
and with the advice and consent of the Legislative 

Council and Legislative Assembly of New South Wales in 
Parliament assembled, and by the authority of the same, as 
:ollows :- 

1. 	(1) This Act may be cited as the "Public Health Short title 
(Amendment) Act, 1965". 	 and 

citation. 

I have examined this Bill, and find it to correspond in all respects 
with the Bill as finally passed by both Houses. 

G. R. CRAWFORD, 
Chairman of Committees of the Legislative Assembly. 

(2) 



2 	 Act No. 22, 1965. 

Amendment 
of Act No. 
30, 1902. 
Sec. 7. 
(Constitu-
tion of 
Board.) 
Term of 
office. 

Public Health (Amendment). 

The Public Health Act, 1902, as amended by 
subsequent Acts and by this Act, may be cited as the Public 
Health Act, 1902-1965. 

2. (1) The Public Health Act, 1902, as amended by 
subsequent Acts, is amended by inserting at the end of section 
seven the following new subsection : — 

The members of the Board appointed pursuant 
to subsection two of this section shall, subject to that 
subsection, hold office for such period not exceeding five 
years as may be specified in the instrument of appoint-
ment and shall be eligible for reappointment. 

The members of the Board of Health appointed 
pursuant to subsection two of section seven of the Public 
Health Act, 1902-1961, and holding office immediately before 
the appointed day shall on that day cease to hold office 
as such members. 

(a) A person, including a person referred to in 
subsection two of this section, may be appointed before the 
appointed day to fill any vacant office on the Board created 
by the operation of subsection two of this section, and the 
provisions of subsection three of section seven of the Public 
Health Act, 1902-1961, as amended by this Act, shall be 
deemed to be in force for the purpose of, and shall apply to 
and in respect of, any such appointment. 

(b) A person appointed pursuant to paragraph 
(a) of this subsection shall assume office as a member of the 
Board on the appointed day. 

Subsection one of this section shall commence 
upon a day to be appointed by the Governor and notified by 
proclamation published in the Gazette, which day is, in this 
section, referred to as the "appointed day". 

3. 



Provision of the Public 
Health Act, 1902, as 

amended by subsequent 
Acts. 

Amendment. 

First column. Second column. 

Omit " five pounds ", insert " twenty-five 
pounds ". 

Omit " ten pounds ", insert " fifty pounds ". 
Omit " ten pounds " wherever occurring, 

insert " fifty pounds ". 
Omit " fifty pounds ", insert " two hundred 

and fifty pounds ". 

Section 29 (2) 

Section 30A (2) 
Section 32A 

Section 32B (5) 

Act No. 22, 1965. 	 3 

Public Health (Amendment). 

3. The Public Health Act, 1902, as amended by subse-
quent Acts, is further amended— 

by omitting from section 29A the words "over the 
age of fourteen years"; 

by omitting from subsection (1A) of section one 
hundred and seven the words "in any particular 
case" and by inserting in lieu thereof the words 
"either generally or in any particular case or class 
of cases". 

Further 
amendment 
of Act No. 
30, 1902. 
Sec. 29A. 
(Governor 
may direct 
examination 
for tuber-
culosis.) 
Sec. 107. 
(Recovery 
of 
penalties.) 

4. 	( 1 ) Each provision of the Public Health Act, 1902, 
as amended by subsequent Acts, specified in the first column 
of the Schedule to this Act is amended as specified opposite 
that provision in the second column of that Schedule. 

(2) The amendments, referred to in subsection one of 
this section, to subsection three of section fifty-five and sub-
section four of section 63c of the Public Health Act, 1902, 
as amended by subsequent Acts, shall commence respectively 
upon the days appointed by the Governor pursuant to sub-
section two of section six and subsection two of section seven 
of the Public Health (Amendment) Act, 1944. 

Further 
amendment 
of Act No. 
30, 1902. 

SCHEDULE. 	 Sec. 4. 

SCHEDULE 



Provision of the Public 
Health Act, 1902, as 

amended by subsequent 
Acts. 

Amendment. 

Public Health (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE—continued. 

  

First column. Second column. 

  

Omit " five pounds " wherever occurring, 
insert " twenty-five pounds ". 

Omit " one pound " wherever occurring, 
insert " five pounds ". 

Omit " ten pounds ", insert " fifty pounds ". 
Omit " ten pounds ", insert " fifty pounds ". 
Omit " five pounds ", insert " twenty-five 

pounds ". 
Omit " ten pounds ", insert " fifty pounds ". 
Omit " twenty pounds ", insert " one 

hundred pounds ". 
Omit " five pounds ", insert " twenty-five 

pounds ". 
Omit " five pounds ", insert " twenty-five 

pounds ". 
Omit " fifty pounds ", insert " two hundred 

and fifty pounds ". 
Omit " of not less than ten nor more than 

twenty pounds ", insert " not exceeding 
one hundred pounds ". 

Omit " five pounds ", insert " twenty-five 
pounds ". 

Omit " twenty pounds ", insert " one 
hundred pounds ". 

Omit " ten pounds ", insert " fifty pounds ". 
Omit " two hundred pounds ", insert " one 

thousand pounds ". 
Omit " twenty pounds ", insert " one 

hundred pounds ". 
Omit " fifty pounds ", insert " two hundred 

and fifty pounds ". 
Omit " five pounds ", insert " twenty-five 

pounds ". 
Omit " two pounds ", insert " ten pounds ". 
Omit " five pounds nor less than ten 

shillings ", insert " twenty-five pounds ". 
Omit " twenty shillings ", insert " three 

pounds ". 

Section 32c 

Section 32D (1) 
Section 37 (1) 
Section 38 (1) 

Section 38 (2) 
Section 39 

Section 42 

Section 43 (1) 

Section 43A (2) 

Section 48 (3) 

Section 49A 

Section 50 

Section 50A (2) 
Section 51 (5) 

Section 51B (1) 

Section 55 (2) 

Section 55 (3) 
Section 58 (3) 

Section 60 (1) 

4 	 Act No. 22, 1965.. 

SCHEDULE 



Act No. 22, 1965. 	 5 

Public Health (Amendment). 

SCHEDULE—continued. 

First column. Second column. 

  

Provision of the Public 
Health Act, 1902, as 

amended by subsequent 
Acts. 

Amendment. 

Section 63c (4) 
	Omit " twenty pounds ", insert " fifty 

pounds ". 
Omit " two pounds ", insert " six pounds ". 

Section 66 (2) 
	Omit " twenty pounds ", insert " fifty 

pounds ". 
Section 66 (3) (a) Omit " twenty shillings ", insert " three 

pounds ". 
Section 66 (3) (b) Omit " forty shillings ", insert " six 

pounds ". 
Section 71B (2) 

	Omit " twenty pounds ", insert " one 
hundred pounds ". 

Section 72 (3) 
	Omit " five pounds ", insert " twenty-five 

pounds ". 
Section 74 
	Omit " five pounds " wherever occurring, 

insert " twenty-five pounds ". 
Section 96 (1) (b) Omit " five pounds ", insert " twenty-five 

pounds ". 
Section 96 (3) 

	Omit " twenty pounds ", insert " one 
hundred pounds ". 

Omit " two pounds ", insert " ten pounds ". 
Section 97 	Omit " twenty pounds ", insert " one 

hundred pounds ". 
Omit " two pounds ", insert " ten pounds ". 

Section 98 
	Omit " five pounds " wherever occurring, 

insert " twenty-five pounds ". 
Section 102 
	Omit " twenty pounds ", insert " one 

hundred pounds ". 
Omit " two pounds ", insert " ten pounds ". 

Section 104 
	Omit " twenty pounds ", insert " one 

hundred pounds ". 
Section 106 
	

Omit " twenty pounds ", insert " one 
hundred pounds ". 

Omit " two pounds ", insert " ten pounds ". 

In the name and on behalf of Her Majesty I assent to 
this Act. 

K. W. STREET, 
Lieutenant-Governor. 

Government House, 
Sydney, 13th December, 1965. 



, 



. 

s 




