
• 
I certify that this PUBLIC BILL, which originated in the LEGIS-

LATIVE ASSEMBLY, has finally passed the LEGISLATIVE COUNCIL and 
the LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY Of NEW SOUTH WALES. 

W. S. MOWLE, 
Clerk of the Legislative Assembly. 

Legislative Assembly Chamber, 
Sydney, 3 May, 1922. 

.3,/eu  6outt) WElateA, 

ANNO DUODECIMO 

GEORGII V REGIS. 
* * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * • *•* * * * * * * * * * * •* 

Act No. 2, 1922. 
An Act to reduce the allowances to members of 

the Legislative Assembly and the salaries of 
Ministers of the Crown and of certain other 
persons ; to amend the Constitution Act, 
1902, the Ministers' Salaries Act, 1908, the 
Parliamentary Representatives Allowance 
Act, 1912, the Parliamentary Representatives 
Allowance and Ministers' Salaries (Amend-
ment) Act, 1920, and certain other Acts ; and 
for other purposes. [Assented to, 6th May, 
1922.) 

BE it enacted by the King's Most Excellent Majesty, 
by and with the advice and consent of the Legis-

lative Council and Legislative Assembly of New South 
Wales in Parliament assembled, and by the authority of 
the same, as follows :- 

1. (1) This Act may be cited as the " Parliamentary Short title 
Allowances and Salaries Act, 1922." 	 and com- 

mencement. 

I have examined this Bill, and find it to correspond in all respects with 
the Bill as finally passed by both Houses. 

R. B. WALKER, 
Chairman of Committees of the Legislative Assembly. 

(2) 



• 

2 Act No. 2, 1922. 

Parliamentary Allowances and Salaries. 

The Constitution Act, 1902, as amended by 
subsequent Acts, is in this Act referred to as the 
Principal Act. 

This Act shall come into operation on, and 
shall take effect from, the first day of July, one thousand 
nine hundred and twenty-two. 

Amendment 2. Section twenty-eight of the Principal Act is 
of

rincip 
. 28 o

al Act.p amended by omitting the words " eight hundred and 
seventy-five " and substituting therefor the words 
" six hundred." 

Amendment 3. Subsection one of section forty-one of the Principal 
of s. 41 of 
Principal Act. Act is amended by omitting the words " twenty-one 

thousand two hundred and forty-five" and substituting 
therefor the words " twenty thousand three hundred." 

Amendment 4. The Third Schedule to the Principal Act is 
of Sch. 3 of 
Principal Act. amended— 

by omitting the figures " 1,945 0 0 " and 
substituting therefor the figures " 1,000 0 0 " ; 
by omitting the figures " 13,195 0 0 " and 
substituting therefor the figures "12,250 0 0." 

Amendment of 5. Section six of the Parliamentary Representatives a 6 of Parlia- 
mentary Rep's- Allowance and Ministers' Salaries (Amendment) Act, sentatives 
Allowance and 1920, is amended by omitting all the words and figures Ministers 
Salaries after the words " as follows ' and substituting therefor 
Act 1920.ent) the following words and figures :— 
Appropria-
tion for 
salaries of 
Ministers. 

3. There is hereby specially appropriated out of 
the Consolidated Revenue Fund an annual amount 
for the payment, as from the first day of July, one 
thousand nine hundred and twenty-two, of the 
salaries of the Ministers of the Crown being members 
of the Executive Council, as hereinafter mentioned 
at the rate of eighteen thousand pounds per 
annum :— 

The Premier ... ....22,000 0 0 
The Attorney-General ... 1,600 0 0 
The Vice-President of the 

Executive Council ... 900 0 0 
Nine other Ministers of the 

Crown, i',1,000 each ...13,500 0 0 
6. 



Act No. 2, 1922. 	 3 

Parliamentary Allowances and Salaries. 

6. The Parliamentary Representatives Allowance Amendment of 

and Ministers' Salaries (Amendment) Act, 1920, is t: ° _ Li.afmentary 
Mr

w
e
a
se
n
n
ee
ta

a
t
n
i vdes further amended by omitting section seven, and sub- 

Ministers' stituting therefor the following new section :— 	Salaries 
(Amendment) 
Act, 1920. 

7. There is hereby specially appropriated out of Appropria- 
the Consolidated Revenue Fund an annual amount salariesti ic  of for the payment, as from the first day of July, President, 
one thousand nine hundred and twenty-two, of the ,iphe..:ffier:irj 
salaries of the persons hereinafter mentioned at the Committees. 
rate of three thousand six hundred and sixty-five 
pounds per annum :— 

The President of the Legisla- 
tive Council 	.., 	... £925 0 0 

The Speaker of the Legislative 
Assembly 	... 	• •• 1,400 0 0 

The Chairman of Committees 
of the Legislative Council... 500 0 0 

The Chairman of Committees 
of the Legislative Assembly 840 0 0 

In the name and on behalf of _His Majesty I assent 
to this Act. 

W. E. DAVIDSON, 
Government House, 	 Governor. 

Sydney, 6th May, 1922. 





This PUBLIC BILL originated in the LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY, 
and, having this day passed, is now ready for presentation to the 
LEGISLATIVE COUNCIL for its concurrence. 

W . S. .MOWLE, 
Cleric of the Legislative Assembly. 

Legislative Assembly Chamber, 
Sydney, 3 May, 1922, A.M. 

pelt fpoutb Wake, 

ANNO DUODECIM".) 

GEORGH V REGIS. 
* * * 4 * * * * * * * * * *  * * * * * * * * * * * 

Act No. 	, 1922. 
An Act to reduce the allowances to members of 

the Legislative Assembly and the salaries of 
Ministers of the Crown and of certain other 
persons ; to amend the Constitution Act, 
1902, the Ministers' Salaries Act, 1908, the 
Parliamentary Representatives Allowance. 
Act, 1912, the Parliamentary Representatives. 
Allowance and Ministers' Salaries (Amend-
ment) Act, 1920, and certain other Acts.; and 
for other purposes. 

BE it enacted by the'King's Most Excellent Majesty, 
by and with the acivice and consent of the Legis-

lative Council and Legislative Assembly of New South 
Wales in Parlianaent laaSembled; and by the auttority of 

5 the same, as follows :— 	 •  

1. (1) This Act may be cited as the " Parliamentary Short title 
Allowances and Salaries Act, 1922." 	 and oona- 

inencement. 
588N 	 3— 	 (2) 



Act No. , 1922. 	 2 

Parliamentary Allowances and Salaries. 

The Constitution Act, 1902, as amended by 
subsequent Acts, is in this Act referred to as the 
Principal Act. • 

This Act shall come into operation on, and 
5 shall take effect from, the first day of July, one thousand 

nine hundred and twenty-two. 
Section twenty-eight of the Principal Act is Amendment 

amended by omitting the words " eight hundred and Vi.,!'n• crpgAct. 
seventy-five " and substituting therefor the words 

10 " six hundred." 
Subsection one of section forty-one of the Principal Amendment 

Act is amended by omitting  the words " twenty-one Vripa 
a. 41 

°1f Act. 
thousand two hundred and forty-five" and substituting 
therefor the words " twenty thousand three hundred." 

15 	4. The Third Schedule to the Principal Act is Amendment 
amended— 	 of Sch. 3 of 

Principal Act. 
by omitting the figures " 1,945 0 0 " and 
substituting therefor the figures " 1,000 0 0 " ; 
by omitting the figures " 13,195 0 0 " and 

20 	substituting therefor the figures "12,250 0 0." 
5. Section six of the Parliamentary Representatives Amendment of 

Allowance and Ministers' Salaries (Amendment) Act, aine6nottarPyarRr-pre- 
;el 

o
ta

vv
t
a
iv
n
es
ee and 1920, is amended by omitting all the words and figures 

after the words " as follows " and substitutinc,  therefor tlnates" (Amendment) 
25 the following words and figures :— 	 Act, 1920. 

3. There is hereby specially appropriated out of Appropria-

the Consolidated Revenue Fund an annual amount tsr...rlesor  of 
for the payment, as from the first day of July, one Ministers. 

thousand nine hundred and twenty-two, of the 
30 

	

	salaries of the Ministers of the Crown being members 
of the Executive Council, as hereinafter mentioned 
at the rate of eighteen thousand pounds per 
annum :— 

The Premier ... 	...Z2,000 0 0 
35 	The Attorney-General 	... 1,600 0 0 

The Vice-President of the 
Executive Council 	900 0 0 

Nine other Ministers of the 
Crown, £1,500 each _13,500 0 0 



Act No. , 1922. 	 3 

Parliamentary Allowances and Salaries. 

6. The Parliamentary Representatives Allowance Amendment of 

and Ministers' Salaries (Amendment) Act, 1920, is :: ° _ar71.sf mentary 
es e n  

and 
s
a
t 
n
i s 

further amended by omitting section seven, and sub- Allowance 
  

Ministers' 
stituting therefor the following new section :— Salaries

Act, 1920. 

	

5 	7. There is hereby specially appropriated out of Aypropria- 

the Consolidated Revenue Fund an annual amount stlairt of  
for the payment, as from the first day of July, President, 

Chairmen
ea ke r,ano 

of one thousand nine hundred and twenty-two, of the 
salaries of the persons hereinafter mentioned. at the Committees. 

	

10 	rate of three thousand six hundred and sixty-five 
pounds per annum :— 

The President of the Legisla- 
tive Council 	... 	... 

The Speaker of the Legislative 

	

15 	Assembly 	... 	... 
The Chairman of Committees 

of the Legislative Council... 
The Chairman of Committees 

of the Legislative Assembly 

Sydney : Donald Campbell, Superintendent, Government Printing Office.-1922, 
[4d.] 

£925 0 0 

1,400 0 0 

500 0 0 

840 0 0 



• 



No. , 1922. 

A BILL 
To reduce the allowances to members of the 

Legislative Assembly and the salaries of 
Ministers of the Crown and of certain other 
persons ; to amend the Constitution Act, 
1902, the Ministers' Salaries Act, 1908, the 
Parliamentary Representatives Allowance 
Act, 1912, the Parliamentary Representatives 
Allowance and Ministers' Salaries (Amend-
ment) Act, 1920, and certain other Acts ; and 
for other purposes. 

[MR. COCKS ;-27 April, 1922.] 

BE it enacted by the King's Most Excellent Majesty. 
by and with the advice and consent of the Legis-

lative Council and Legislative Assembly of New South 
Wales in Parliament assembled, and by the authority of 

5 the same, as follows :- 
1. (1) This Act may be cited as the " Parliamentary Short title 

Allowances and Salaries Act, 1922." and com- 
mencement. 

8998 	 3--- (2) 



2 	 Parliamentary Allowances and Salaries. 

The Constitution Act, 1902, as amended by 
subsequent Acts, is in this Act referred to as the 
Principal Act. 

This Act shall come into operation on, and 
shall take effect from, the first day of July, one thousand 5 
nine hundred and twenty-two. 

Amendment 	2. Section twenty-eight of the Principal Act is of s. 28 of principal Att.  amended— 
by omitting the words " eight hundred and 
seventy-five " and substituting therefor the 10 
words " six hundred " ; 
by omitting the words " or where Parliament 
has been dissolved or has expired by effluxion 
of time until the day appointed for taking 
the poll for the next general election," and 15 
substituting therefor the words " or until 
Parliament is dissolved or expires by effluxion 
of time." 

Amendment 	3. Subsection one of section forty-one of the Principal 
pr
of

in
8.

c
4
ip

1
a
o
1
f
Act. Act is amended by omitting the words " twenty-one 20 

thousand two hundred and forty-five " and substituting 
therefor the words " twenty thousand nine hundred and 
seventy." 

Amendment 	4. The Third Schedule to the Principal Act is of Sch. 3 of amended— 	 25 Principal Act. 
by omitting the figures " 1,945 0 0 " and 
substituting therefor the figures "1,670 0 0 " ; 
by omitting the figures " 13,195 0 0 " and 
substituting therefor the figures "12,920 0 0." 

Amendment of 
s. 6 of Parlia-
mentary Repre-
sentatives 
Allowance and 
Ministers' 
Salaries 
(Amendment) 
Act, 1920. 

Appropria-
tion for 
salaries of 
Ministers. 

5. Section six of the Parliamentary Representatives 30 
Allowance and Ministers' Salaries (Amendment) Act, 
1920, is amended by omitting all the words and figures 
after the words " as follows " and substituting therefor 
the following words and figures :- 

3. There is hereby specially appropriated out of 35.  
the Consolidated Revenue Fund an annual amount 
for the payment, as from the first day of July, one 
thousand nine hundred and twenty-two, of the 
salaries of the Ministers of the Crown being members 

of 



Parliamentary Allowances and Salaries. 

of the Executive Council, as hereinafter mentioned 
at the rate of twenty thousand one hundred and 
twenty pounds per annum :— 

The Premier ... ...£2,170 0 0 
5 The Attorney-General ... 1,820 0 0 

The Vice-President of the 
Executive Council ... 1,100 0 0 

Nine other Ministers of the 
Crown, £1,670 each ...15,030 0 0 

10 6. The Parliamentary Representatives Allowance sAirontdment of 

and Ministers' Salaries (Amendment) Act, 1920, is Itaerplriaes=es 
Allowance and further amended by omitting section seven, and sub- Ministers' stituting therefor the following new section :— Salaries 
(Amendment) 
Act, 1920. 

7. There is hereby specially appropriated out of Appropria- 
15 the Consolidated Revenue Fund an annual amount f 

for the payment, as from the first day of July, Eresieent, 
er
e
,: z1 one thousand nine hundred and twenty-two, of the chairmen  

salaries of the persons hereinafter mentioned at the Committees. 
rate of three thousand six hundred and sixty-five 

20 pounds per annum :— 
The President of the Legisla- 

5 

Sydney William Applegate Uu.ilek.  liuvet Hewitt Printer-1922. 

tive Council ... 
The Speaker of the Legislative 

£925 0 0 

Assembly ... 
The Chairman of Committees 

of the Legislative Council... 
The Chairman of Committees 

1,400 

500 

0 

0 

0 

0 

' of the Legislative Assembly 840 0 0 



N 

[ 


