
iletv 6outt) 

ANNO UNDECIMO 

GEORGII V REGIS. 
* * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * *********** r  

Act No. 20, 1920. 
An Act to make further provision with regard to 

the allowances to members of the Legislative 
Assembly and the salaries of Ministers of the 
Crown and of certain other persons; to amend 
the Constitution Act, 1902, the Ministers' 
Salaries Act, 1908, the Parliamentary Repre-
sentatives Allowance Act, 1912, and certain 
other Acts; and for other purposes. [Assented 
to, 21st December, 1920.] 

-DE it enacted by the King's Most Excellent Majesty, 
by and with the advice and consent of the Legis-

lative Council and Legislative Assembly of New South 
Wales in Parliament assembled, and by the authority of 
the same, as follows :- 

1. This Act shall commence on the first day of 
November, one thousand nine hundred and twenty, and 
may be cited as the " Parliamentary Representatives 
Allowance and Ministers' Salaries (Amendment) Act, 
1920." 	 2. 

Commence-
ment and 
short title. 



2 Act No. 20, 1920. 

 

Parliamentary Representatives Allowance and 
Ministers' Salaries (Amendment). 

  

2. Section twenty-eight of the Constitution Act, 
1902, as amended by section two of the Parliamen-
tary Representatives Allowance Act, 1912, is further 
amended— 

by omitting the words " five hundred " and by 
inserting in lieu thereof the words " eight 
hundred and seventy-five " ; and 
by omitting the words " or until Parliament is 
dissolved or expires by effluxion of time," and 
by inserting in lieu thereof the words " or, 
where Parliament has been dissolved or has 
expired by effiuxion of time, until the day 
appointed for taking the poll for the next 
general election." 

3. Subsection one of section forty-one of the Con-
stitution Act, 1902, as amended by subsection one of 
section two of the Ministers' Salaries Act, 1908, is 
further amended by omitting the words " twenty 
thousand three hundred " and by inserting in lieu 
thereof the words "twenty-one thousand two hundred 
and forty-five." 

Amendment, 4. The Second Schedule to the Constitution Act, 
Schedules'nd  1902, as amended by section four of the Ministers' 

Salaries Act, 1908, is further amended by omitting all 
words after the words " Second Schedule," and by 
inserting in lieu thereof the following words :— 

The Premier ; 
The Attorney-General ; 
Nine other Ministers of the Crown, being members 

of the Executive Council. 
5. The Third Schedule to the Constitution Act, 1902, 

as amended by subsection two of section two of the 
Ministers' Salaries Act, 1908, is further amended— 

by omitting the figures " 1,000 0 0 " and 
by inserting in lieu thereof the figures 
" 1,945 0 0 " ; and 
by omitting the figures " 12,250 0 0 " and 
by inserting in lieu thereof the figures 
" 13,195 0 0." 

6. 

Amendment 
of Constitu-

,,tion Act, 
1902, a. 28. 

Amendment, 
Ibid.,s. 41(1). 

Amendment, 
Ibici ,  Third 
Schedule. 



Act No. 20, 1920. 3 

Parliamentary Representatives Allowance and 
Ministers' Salaries (Amendment). 

Section three of the Ministers' Salaries Act, 1908,  ptircesZi.1,;7 
is amended by omitting the section and by inserting in Einzt

e
e
s
r t3i

c 
 t 

lieu thereof a new section as follows :— 1908. 
Appropriation 3. There is hereby specially appropriated out of 
icii:lastr of the Consolidated Revenue Fund an annual amount 

for the payment, as from the commencement of the 
Parliamentary Representatives Allowance and 
Ministers' Salaries (Amendment) Act, 1920, of the 
salaries of the Ministers of the Crown, being 
members of the Executive Council, as hereinafter 
mentioned, at the rate of twenty-three thousand 
four hundred and twenty pounds per annum— 

The Premier ... £2,445 0 0 
The Attorney-General ... 2,095 0 0 
The Vice-President of the 

Executive Council ... 1,375 0 0 
Nine other Ministers of the 

Crown, £1,945 each ... 17,505 0 0 
There is hereby specially appropriated out of the Appropriation 

Consolidated Revenue Fund an annual amount for the for salar 
President,

ies  of 

payment, as from the commencement of the Parlia- Speaker, and 
Chairmen of mentary Representatives Allowance and Ministers Committees. 

Salaries (Amendment) Act, 1920, of the salaries of the 
persons hereinafter mentioned, at the rate of four 
thousand six hundred and ninety pounds per annum:—

The President of the Legislative 
Council ... £1,200 0 0 

The Speaker of the Legislative 
Assembly ... 1,675 0 0 

The Chairman of Committees of 
the Legislative Council ... 700 0 0 

The Chairman of Committees of 
the Legislative Assembly ... 1,115 0 0 



4 Act No. 20, 1920. 

. Parliamentary Representatives Allowance and 
Ministers' Salaries (Amendment). 

INDEX. 

Parliamentary Representatives Allowance and 
Ministers' Salaries (Amendment) Act, 1920, 
No. 20. 

Act— 
date of commencement of 
short title of 

Amendments and repeals— 
Constitution Act, 1902, No. 32, s. 28, as amended 

by Parliamentary Representatives Allow- 
ance Act, 1912, No. 19, s. 2, amended ... 

s. 41 (1) as amended by s. 2 (1) of Ministers' 
Salaries Act, 1908, No. 1, amended 

Second Schedule as amended by s. 4 of Ministers' 
Salaries Act, 1908, No. 2, amended 

Third Schedule as amended by s. 2 (2) of 
Ministers' Salaries Act,1908, No. 2, amended 

Ministers' Salaries Act, 1908, No. 2, new s. 3 
Commencement of Act 
Ministers' Salaries Act, 1908, No. 2—insertion of 

new s. 3, salaries of Ministers 
Salaries— 

appropriation for Ministers 
President, Speaker, Chairman of Committees ... 
of members 

Title, short ... ••• 

Section. Page. 

1 
1 

2 2 

3 2 

4 2 

5 2 
6 3 
1 1 

6 3 

6 3 
7 3 
2 2 
1 1 

By Authority : 
WILLIAM APPLEGATE GIILLICK, Government Printer, Sydney, 1921. 

1.3d1 



I certify that this PUBLIC BILL, which originated in the LEGIS-
LATIVE ASSEMBLY, has finally passed the LEGISLATIVE cOUNCIL and 
the LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY Of NEW SOUTH WALES. 

W. S. MOWLE, 
Clerk of the Legislative Assembly. 

Legislative Assembly Chamber, 
Sydney, 9 December, 1920. 

apoutli Watts, 

ANNO FNDECIMO 

GEORGH V REGIS. 
******* * *********** * * 	* * * * * * * * * 

Act No. 20, 1920. 
An Act to make further provision with regard to 

the allowances to members of the Legislative 
Assembly and the salaries of Ministers of the 
Crown and of certain other persons; to amend 
the Constitution Act, 1902, the Ministers' 
Salaries Act, 1908, the Parliamentary Repre-
sentatives Allowance Act, 1912, and certain 
other Acts; and for other purposes. [Assented 
to, 21st December, 1920.] 	 BE 

I have examined this Bill, and find it to correspond in all respects with 
the Bill as finally passed by both Houses. 

R. J. STUART—ROBERTSON, 
Chairman of Committees of the Legislative Assembly. 



'1 Act No. 20, 1920. 

 

 

Parliamentary Representatives Allowance and 
Ministers' Salaries (Amendment). 

 

  

 

BE it enacted by the King's Most Excellent Majesty, 
by and with the advice and consent 'of the Legis-

lative Council and Legislative Assembly of New South 
Wales in Parliament assembled, and by the authority of 
the same, as follows :— 

Commence. 1. This Act shall commence on the first day of 
ment and 
short title.  November, one thousand nine hundred and twenty, and 

may be cited as the " Parliamentary Representatives 
Allowance and Ministers' Salaries (Amendment) Act, 
1920." 

Amendment 2. Section twenty-eight of the Constitution Act, 
of Constitu-  1902, as amended by section two of the Parliamen- tion Act, 
1902, s. zs.  tary Representatives Allowance Act, 1912, is further 

amended— 
by omitting the words " five hundred " and by 
insertinc,  in lieu thereof the words " eight 
hundred and seventy-five " ; and 
by omitting the words " or until Parliament is 
dissolved or expires by effluxion of time," and 
by inserting in lieu thereof the words " or, 
where Parliament has been dissolved or has 
expired by effiuxion of time, until the day 
appointed for taking the poll for the next 
general election." 

Amen linen( , 3. Subsection one of section forty-one of the Con-
s. 41(1). stitution Act, 1902, as amended by subsection one of 

section two of the Ministers' Salaries Act, 190S is 
further amended by omitting the - words " twenty 
thousand three hundred " and by inserting in lieu 
thereof the words " twenty-one thousand two hundred 
and forty-five." 

Amendment, 4. The Second Schedule to the Constitution Act, 
ke
tifide.autcond 1N2, as amended by section four of the Ministers' 

Salaries Act, 1908, is further amended by omitting all 
words after the words " Second Schedule," and by 
inserting in lieu thereof the following words :— 

The Premier ; 
The Attorney-General ; 
Nine other Ministers of the Crown, being members 

of the Executive Council. 
5. 



Act No. 20, 1920. 	 3 

Parliamentary Representatives Allowance and 
Ministers' Salaries (Amendment). 

5. The Third Schedule to the Constitution Act, 1902, Amendment 
Constitu- as amended by subsection two of section two of the tion Act, 

Ministers' Salaries Act, 1908 is further amended— 	1902, Third 

by omitting the figures " 1000 0 0 " and Schedule. 

by inserting in lieu thereof the figures 
" 1,945 0 0 " ; and 
by omitting the figures " 12,250 0 0 " and 
by . inserting in lieu thereof the figures 
" 13,195 0 0." 

6. Section three of the Ministers' Salaries Act, 1908, place 
Ministers' is amended by omitting the section and by inserting in Salaries Act, 

lieu thereof a new section as follows :— 	 1908. 

3. There is hereby specially appropriated out of Appropriation 

i‘oirin
sia
s
Ita
e
r
r
i
s
e of 
.
s the Consolidated Revenue Fund an annual amount 

for the payment, as from the commencement of the 
Parliamentary Representatives Allowance and 
Ministers' Salaries (Amendment) Act, 1920, of the 
salaries of the Ministers of the Crown, being 
members of the Executive Council, as hereinafter 
mentioned, at the rate of twenty-three thousand 
four hundred and twenty pounds per annum— 

The Premier 	 ... £2,445 0 0 
The Attorney-General 	... 2,095 0 0 
The 	Vice-President of 	the 

Executive Council 	... 1,375 0 0 
Nine other Ministers of the 

Crown, £1,945 each 	... 17,505 0 0 
7. There is hereby specially appropriated out of the Appropriation 

for salaries of 
President, es Consolidated Revenue Fund an annual amount for the 

payment, as from the commencement of the Parlia.. Speaker, and 

n
ai

i
r
i
:tiitetn

ee
o
s
f
. 
 mentary Representatives Allowance and Ministers' a 

 
Salaries (Amendment) Act, 1920, of the salaries of the 
persons hereinafter mentioned, at the rate of four 
thousand six hundred and ninety pounds per annum:—

The President of the Legislative 
Council 	... £1,200 0 0 

The Speaker of the Legislative 
Assembly 	... 	... 1,675 0 0 

The Chairman of Committees of 
the Legislative Council 700 0 0 

The Chairman of Committees of 
the Legislative Assembly ... 1,115 0 0 

In the name and on behalf of His Majesty I assent 
to this Act. 

W. E. DAVIDSON, 
Government House, 	 Governor. 

Sydney, 21st December, 1920. 



..... 



This PUBLIC BILL originated in the LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY, 
and, having this day passed, is now recto for presentation to the 
LEGISLATIVE COUNCIL for its concurrence. 

W. S. MOWLE, 
Clerk of the Legislative Assembly. 

Legislative Assembly Chamber, 
Sydney, 8 December, 1920. 

Deb) *nth Watts 

ANNO UNDECIMO 

GEORGI 1 V REGIS. 
* * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * 

Act No. , 1920. 

An Act to make further provision with regard to 
the allowances to members of the Legislative 
Assembly and the salaries of Ministers of the 
Crown and of certain other persons; to amend.  
the Constitution Act, 1902, the Ministers' 
Salaries Act, 1908, the Parliamentary Repre-
sentatives Allowance Act, 1912, and certain 
other Acts ; and for other purposes. 

1260i 226— BE 



Act No. , 1920. 

 

2 

Parliamentary Representatives Allowance and 
Ministers' Salaries (Amendment). 

  

   

BE it enacted by the King's Most Excellent Majesty, 
by and with the advice and consent of the Legis-

lative Council and Legislative Assembly of New South 
Wales in Parliament assembled, and by the authority of 

5 the same, as follows :— 
IL. This Act shall commence on the first day of commence-

November, one thousand nine hundred and twenty, and Tat rge. 
may be cited as the " Parliamentary Representatives 
Allowance and Ministers' Salaries- (Amendment) Act, 

10 1920." 
2. Section twenty-eight of the Constitution Act, Amendment 

1902, as amended by section two of the Parliamen- zfonCoLsttru-

tary Representatives Allowance Act, 1912, is further 1902, s. N. 
amended- 

15 (a) by omitting the words " five hundred " and by 
inserting in lieu thereof the words " eight 
hundred and seventy-five " ; and 

(b) by omitting the words " or until Parliament is 
dissolved or expires by effiuxion of time," and 

20 by inserting in lieu thereof the words " or, 
where Parliament has been dissolved or has 
expired by eilluxion of time, until the day 
appointed for taking the poll for the next 
general election." 

.25 3. Subsection one of section forty-one of the Con- Amendment, 
stitution Act, 1902, as amended by subsection one of Mid.0.41(1). 
section two of the Ministers' Salaries,  Act, 1908 is 
further amended by omitting the words " twenty 
thousand three hundred " and by inserting in lieu 

.30 thereof the words " twenty-one thousand two hundred 
and forty-five." . 

4. The Second Schedule to the Constitution Act, Amendment, 
1902, as amended 'by section four of the Ministers' Mautcond 
Salaries Act, 1908, is further amended by omitting all 

35 words after the words " Second Schedule," and by 
inserting in lieu thereof the following words :— 

The Premier ; 
The Attorney-General ; 
Nine other Ministers of the Crown, being members 

-40 of the Executive Council. 
5. 



Act No. , 1920. 3 

Parliamentary Representatives Allowance and 
Ministers' Salaries (Amendment). 

as amended by subsection two of section two of the iori  
Ministers' Salaries Act, 1908 is further amended— 1902, Third 

5. The Third Schedule to the Constitution Act, 1902, Amendment 

by omitting the figures " 1000 0 and Schedule. 
Lion ceLet

t,
itn- 

.5 by inserting in lieu thereof the figures 
" 1,945 0 0 " ; and 
by omitting the figures " 12,250 0 0 " and 
by inserting in lieu thereof the figures 
" 13,195 0 0." 

1.0 6. Section three of the Ministers' Salaries Act, 1908, New section in 
oP 

is amended by omitting the section and by inserting in Viacnies1',: Salaries Act, 
lieu thereof a new section as follows :— 1908. 

3. There is hereby specially appropriated out of Appropriation 

the Consolidated Revenue Fund an annual amount for salaries ofminiders. 
15 for the payment, as from the commencement of the 

Parliamentary Representatives Allowance and 
Ministers' Salaries (Amendment) Act, 1920, of the 
salaries of the Ministers of the Crown, being 
members of the Executive Council, as hereinafter 

20 mentioned, at the rate of twenty-three thousand 
four hundred and twenty pounds per annum— 

... £2,445 0 0 The Premier 
The Attorney-General ... 
The Vice-President of the 

2,095 0 0 

Executive Council ... 
Nine other Ministers of the 

1,375 0 0 

Crown, £1,945 each ... 17,505 0 0 
7. There is hereby specially appropriated out of the Appropriation 

Consolidated Revenue Fund an annual amount for the kre:tir 
30 payment, as from the commencement of the Parlia- Speaker, and 

Chairmen
mm ttee

o
s
f
. 

 mentary Representatives Allowance and Ministers' 
Salaries (Amendment) Act, 1920, of the salaries of the 
persons hereinafter mentioned, at the rate of four 
thousand six hundred and ninety pounds per annum:- 

-35 The President of the Legislative 

40 

25 

Council ... ... £1,200 0 0 
The Speaker of the Legislative 

Assembly ... ... 1,675 0 0 
The Chairman of Committees of 

the Legislative Council ... 700 0 0 
The Chairman of Committees of 

the Legislative Assembly ... 1,115 0 0 
Sydney: William Applegate Guillek, Government Printer-1920. 




