Received by: e
Date: | §/11/ 1§

Time: (07SGan—
LEGISLATIVE COUNCIL

c2015-171
CDP--Christian Democratic Party (Fred Nile Group)

LEGISLATIVE COUNCIL

Betting Tax Legislation Amendment Bill 2015

First print

Proposed amendments to Shooters and Fishers Party amendments on sheet c2015-166

No. 1 Amendment No 1 (proposed section 70 (2) (a)) is amended by omitting “65.3%” and inserting
instead “71.3%”.

No. 2 Amendment No 1 (proposed section 70 (2) (¢)) is amended by omitting “22%” and inserting
instead “16%”.

c2015-171 18/11/15 9:46 am Page 1



